No.

UNITED INDEPENDENT ScHOOL DISTRICT

S et AGENDA ACTION ITEM

TOPIC: CONSIDERATION FOR APPROVAL OF AWARDING OF BIDS, PROPOSALS AND QUALIFICATIONS

SUBMITTED BY: MS. CORDELIA FLORES-JACKSON OF: PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
APPROVED FOR TRANSMITTAL TO SCHOOL BOARD: JANUARY 23, 2008
RECOMMENDATIONS:

STAFF RECOMMENDS THE UISD BOARD OF TRUSTEES APPROVE THE FOLLOWING BIDS, PROPOSALS, &
QUALIFICATIONS AS PRESENTED:

BIDS/PROPOSALS/QUALIFICATIONS
FOOD SERVICE DEPT:
RFP (71-2007 FOOD SERVICE KITCHEN PARTS & SUPPLIES

TECHNOLOGY DEPT:
RFP (74-2007 EMAIL & WEB HOSTING SERVICES

RENEWALS
RFP 2006-077 EMPLOYEE BENEFITS INSURANCE CONSULTING SERVICES

RATIONALE:

STAFF HAS COMPLIED WITH ALL APPLICABLE FEDERAL, STATE AND LOCAL PURCHASING POLICIES AND
PROCEDURES IN OBTAINING PRICING INFORMATION FOR THE ITEMS LISTED ABOVE. STAFF IS
RECOMMENDING THE AWARDS BASED ON BEING THE BEST VALUE TO THE DISTRICT.

BUDGETARY INFORMATION:
THE BUDGET INCLUDES THE FUNDS FOR THESE PURCHASES

BOARD POLICY REFERENCE AND COMPLIANCE
CH LOCAL - Purchasing and Acquisition
Texas Education Code 44.031




SUMMARY OF RECOMMENDATION(S)

RECOMMENDED VENDORS

BIDS/ PROPOSALS/ QUALIFICATIONS

PRIMARY VENDOR (S)
ECOLAB
SECONDARY VENDOR (S)
KITCHEN REPAIR CO.
SEE ATTACHED TABULATION

" eChalk
|EMAIL & WEB HOSTING SERVICES EST. AMOUNT
. .. $409,775.00

RECOMMENDED FIRM

RFP 2006-077
EMPLOYEE BENEFITS INSURANCE CONSULTING SERVICES WETHE & ASSOCIATES
ﬂ SEE ATTACHED TABULATION




BOARD APPROVAL
AWARDING OF BIDS/PROPOSALS
JANUARY 23, 2008

RFP NO. 071-2007 FOOD SERVICE KITCHEN PARTS & SUPPLIES

RECOMMENDATION:
REQUESTING APPROVAL TO PURCHASE FROM THE BEST BIDDER(S)/ OFFER(S) MEETING
SPECIFICATIONS AS FOLLOWS:

PRIMARY VENDOR EST, ANNUAL AMOUNT
ECO-LAB SEE ATTACHED TABULATION
SECONDARY VENDOR

KITCHEN REPAIR CO.

ADMINISTRATION DISTRIBUTED SIXTEEN (16) PROPOSALS AND ADVERTISED ON NOVEMBER 18,
2007 AND NOVEMBER 25, 2007. TWO (2) PROPOSALS WERE RECEIVED ON DECEMBER 11,2007 @
3:00 P.M. AT THE UISD SERVICE CENTER PURCHASING DEPARTMENT.

BUDGET INFORMATION:
2007-2008 FOOD SERVICE DEPT

RESOURCE PERSONNEL.:

ADALBERTO RAMIREZ, DIRECTOR OF FOOD SERVICE
CORDELIA JACKSON, DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING
HECTOR CAVAZOS, PURCHASING MANAGER
VENESSA NAVARRO, PROCUREMENT OFFICER




ENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

Adalberto Ramirez.
Director of Food Service

MEMORANDUM

TO : Cordelia Flores
Director of Purchasing
United ISD

FROM : Adalberto Ramirez
Director of Fo ice
SUBJECT : RFP 071-2007 FOOD SERVICE
KITCHEN PARTS & REPAIRS
DATE : January 8, 2008

I have reviewed the tabulation of RFP 071-2007 for Food Service Kitchen Parts and
Repairs provided by the Purchasing Department.

Based on the Tabulation sheet, I recommend that the RFP 071-2007 be awarded to Eco-
Lab as the primary vendor and Commercial Kitchen Repair Co. as the secondary vendor,
as the best competitive proposals meeting specifications.

These parts and repair services will be used by our maintenance department to repair the
various pieces of equipment at the central kitchen and at the campuses.

Justification for these purchases is because the campuses and the central kitchen will
require repairs to their equipment in order to serve meals to the students.

If you have any questions, please contact me.

XC: Eduardo Zuiiiga, Assoc. Supt. for Support Services

201 Lindenwood Drive — Laredo, Texas — (956) 473-6556 — Fax (956) 473-6595




UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

KITCHEN PARTS & REPAIRS
RFP 071-2007

DESCRIPTION

COMMERCIAL KITCHEN REPAIR

ECOLAB

% off CATALOG PRICE

0%

% off LIST PRICE

0-31%

1% off SHELF PRICE

0%

DESCRIPTION

EST QUANTITY

UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE

UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE

GASKETS 20 x 47 3/4

60

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

GASKETS
IMODEL/PART #: GROE 110898
BRAND PROPOSED:

$407.84 $4,078.40

$358.90 $3,589.00

GROEN

GROEN

BAND BLADE

25

NO BID | NO BID

NO BID I NO BID

BALANK 17414 SPINDLE
|MODEL/PART #: BLAK 17514
BRAND PROPOSED:

$128.65 $385.95

$99.88 $299.64

BLAKESLEE

BLAKESLEE

THERMOSTAT FOR KETTLE
{MODEL/PART #: VULC 833220
BRAND PROPOSED:

$124.94 $374.82

$114.23 $342.69

VULCAN-HART

VULCAN-HART

VALVE
MODEL/PART #: VULC 841496-1
BRAND PROPOSED:

$157.54 $628.62

$143.67 $574.68

VULCAN-HART

VULCAN-HART

THERMOSTAT FOR STEAM TABLE
IMODEL/PART #: DUKE 2081-2
BRAND PROPOSED:

20

$122.60 $2,452.00

$122.60 $2,452.00

DUKE

DUKE

ROTOR SINGLE LOBE
MODEL/PART #: GROE 027179
BRAND PROPOSED:

$1,343.07 $2,686.14

$1,181.40 $2,362.80

GREON

GROEN

O-RING
BRAND PROPOSED:

NO BID I NO BID

NO BID | NO BID

N/A

N/A

AIR ACUTATOR
IMODEL/PART #: GROE N75442
BRAND PROPOSED:

$4,623.11 $18,492.44

$4,068.34 $16,273.36

GREON

GREON

HIGH LIMIT SWITCHES
MODEL/PART #: VULC 346358-2
BRAND PROPOSED:

10

$51.85 $518.47

$47.40 $474.00

VULCAN-HART

VULCAN-HART

ROUND LENS
MODEL/PART #: VULC 357036-3
BRAND PROPOSED:

48

$32.83 $1,575.84

$54.37 $2,609.76

VULCAN-HART

VULCAN-HART

DRAW OFF VALVE
MODEL/PART #: GROE 9046
BRAND PROPOSED:

$544.97 $1,634.91

$479.57 $1,438.71

GREON

GREON

STEM 2"
MODEL/PART #: GROE 9048
BRAND PROPQSED:

$116.47 $349.41

$116.47 $349.41

GREON

GREON

HANDLE 3"
JMODEL/PART # GROE 9029
BRAND PROPOSED:

$14.36 $43.08

$14.36 $43.08

GREON

GREON

DOOR STRIKE KIT
{MODEL/PART # GROE 423014-G1
BRAND PROPOSED:

$104.05 | $416.20

$95.12 $380.48

GREON

GREON

BEARINGS
PART #: 347080-2
BRAND PROPOSED:

$8.69 $34.76

$8.15 I $32.60

ORIGINAL EQUIP. MANUFACTUER

ORIGINAL EQUIP. MANUFACTUER

WASHER
PART #: 343143-1
BRAND PROPOSED:

15

$32.29 $484.35

$5.90 [ $88.50

ORIGINAL EQUIP. MANUFACTUER

ORIGINAL EQUIP. MANUFACTUER

SWITCH DPST
PART #: 340324-6
BRAND PROPOSED:

$32.83 $164.15

$30.01 $150.05

ORIGINAL EQUIP. MANUFACTUER

ORIGINAL EQUIP. MANUFACTUER




VENGOR _

T COMMERCIAL RITCHEN REPAIR

—ECOLAB ]

DESCRIPTION

EST QUANTITY

UNIT PRICE

EXT PRICE

UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE

PUMP MOTOR
MODEL/PART #: BLAK 8337
BRAND PROPOSED:

$479.40

$1,438.20

$359.55 $1,078.65

BLAKESLEE

BLAKESLEE

COLLAR
|MODEL/PART #: BLAK 7562
BRAND PROPQSED:

$98.17

$294.51

$76.22 $228.66

BLAKESLEE

BLAKESLEE

BRACKET PUMP CASE MOTOR
MODEL/PART #: BLAK 13087
BRAND PROPOSED:

$309.66

$928.98

$232.24 $696.72

BLAKESLEE

BLAKESLEE

IMFELLAR SPINGLE
MODEL/PART #: BLAK 8551
BRAND PROPOSED:

$129.73

$389.19

NO BID NO BID

BLAKESLEE

N/A

DRAIN SEAL RING
MODEL/PART #: BLAK 9551
BRAND PROPQOSED:

$63.70

$254.80

$49.46 $197.84

BLAKESLEE

BLAKESLEE

CAM SHAFT
MODEL/PART #: BLAK 13898
BRAND PROPOSED:

$241.25

$723.75

$211.43 $634.29

BLAKESLEE

BLAKESLEE

DOOR
MODEL/PART #: BLAK 14795
BRAND PROPOSED:

$431.54

$1,294.62

$323.66 $970.98

BLAKESLEE

BLAKESLEE

IMPELLER P TANK
|MODEL/PART #: BLAK 95682
BRAND PROPQSED:

$365.65

$1,096.95

$274.24 $822.72

BLAKESLEE

BLAKESLEE

IMPELLER
|MODEL/PART #: BLAK 95673
BRAND PROPOSED:

$119.65

$358.95

$92.91 $278.73

BLAKESLEE

BLAKESLEE

BRACKET PUMP
MODEL/PART #: BLAK 4667
BRAND PROPOSED:

$456.59

$1,369.77

$342.44 $1,027.32

BLAKESLEE

BLAKESLEE

ELEMENTS - SKILLETS
IMODEL/PART #: 2FE
BRAND PROPOSED:

NO BID

| NO BID

NO BID | NO BID

N/A

N/A

ELEMENTS - KETTLES
MODEL/PART #: 2FE
BRAND PROPOQOSED:

NO BID

i NO BID

NO BID NO BID

N/A

N/A

ELEMENTS - OVENS
IMODEL/PART #: 2FE
BRAND PROPOQSED:

NO BID

| NQ BID

NO BID | NO BID

N/A

N/A

ELEMENTS - WARMERS
|MODEL/PART #: 2FE
BRAND PROPOSED:

NO BID

| NO BID

NO BID l NO BID

N/A

N/A

PROBE - CONVECTION OVEN
MODEL/PART #: 353589-1
BRAND PROPQOSED:

$66.97

$559.70

$51.17 $511.70

ORIGINAL EQUIP. MANUFACTUER

ORIGINAL EQUIP. MANUFACTUER

MICRO SWITCH - OVENS
IMODEL/PART #: CRES 808-116
BRAND PROPOSED:

$29.60

$88.80

$29.60 $88.80

CRES-COR

CRES-COR

RELEIF VALUE - KETTLE
MODEL/PART #: KE54941-2
BRAND PROPOSED:

$93.78

$562.68

$86.04

$516.24

ORIGINAL EQUIP. MANUFACTUER

ORIGINAL EQUIP. MANUFACTUER

BLOWER WHEELS -
CONVECTION OVENS

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

INFINITE SWITCH -
WELLS STEAM TABLES

12

$12.42

I $149.04

NO BID

NO BID

CONVECTION OVENS

ELECTRONIC CONTROL BOARD -

NO BID

| NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

OVEN TIMERS

|
|
|

[ NoBID

| NO BID

NO BID |

NO BID




UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
KITCHEN PARTS & SUPPLIES
RFP 071-2007

MAILING LIST

ACE MART RESTAURANT SUPPLY CO. HERITAGE FOOD SERVICE EQUIP.

P.O. Box 18100

San Antonio, TX 78218-0100
Phone: 210-323-4426

Fax: 210-323-4683

Ron Keene
www.acemart.com

CALISCO INDUSTRIES INC.

P.O. Box 2005

Annapolis Junction, MD 20701-2005
Phone: 301-470-3100

Fax: 301-498-2056
calico@calicoindustries.com
www.calicoindustries.com

CINTAK INC

11901 Toepperwein Suite 1105
San Antonio, TX 78233

Phone: 210-967-9600

Fax: 210-967-9676

Tony Gomez
taomez@cinpak.com

www.cinpak.com

COMMERCIAL KITCHEN REPAIRS
1377 N. Brazos Street

San Antonio, Texas 78283

Phone: 210-735-2811

Fax: 210-735-7421

Wayne Helire

Personal Fax line: 210-733-3884

wayne@ckps.com
randy@ckps.com

DELTA RESTAURANT SUPPLY CO.
510 Staples St.

Corpus Chrisit, TX 78401

Phone; 361-883-9319

Fax: 361-883-5146

Jack Cooper

5130 Executive Blvd

Fort Wayne, IN 46808-1149
Phone: 800-458-5593

Fax: 800-800-4981

Mac Routen

info@hfse.com

JEANS RESTAURANT SUPPLY
426 S. Staples

Corpus Christi, TX 78413

Phone: 361-884-9800

Fax: 361-888-7602

Evan Neff
evan@jeansrestaurantsupply.com

KITCHEN RESOURCES
806 West Harrison
Harlingen, Texas 78550
Phone: 956-423-2491

Fax: 956-423-3088

Bill Youngbiood
bill@kitchenresources.com

MARSHALL WEBB CO.
606 Tulip St

Corpus Christi, TX 78408
Phone: 361-887-1813

Fax: 361-887-0575

Janice Fischer
janicef@marshallwebb.com

MISSION RESTAURANT SUPPLY
1227 S. St. Mary's St

San Antonio, TX 78210

Phone: 210-534-7976

Fax: 210-534-3583

Jim Riedel

imr@missionrs.com

Judith Zimmerman

judithz@missionrs.com




NORTHERN PARTS & SERVICE
21 Northern Ave :
Plattsburgh, NY 12903

Phone; 800-634-5005

Fax: 800-782-5424

John Gerry

PASCO BROKERAGE INC.
P.O. Box 260399

Plano, Texas 75076

Phone: 972-596-3350

Fax: 972-596-2817

Kasey P. Hollon
khollon@pascoinc.net

REPCO REPLACEMENT PARTS INC.

1021 W. Enon Ave
Everman, TX 76140
Phone: 800-433-7146
Fax: 817-293-7213
Sarah Jones

sjones@erepco.com

STRATEGIC EQUIPMENT & SUPPLY
640 W. Sixth Street

Houston, Texas 77007,

Phone: 1-800-777-0314 or 713-861-4455
Fax: 713-861-3759

Chris Wiggins

cwiggins@isi-texas.com

TEXAS FOOD SERVICE EQUIP. INC
P.O. Box 1449

Manvel, TX 77578

Phone: 877-282-3637

Fax; 713-926-9300

Daniel Roessler

dan@texasfoodservice.com

WHALEY FOODSERVICE PARTS & REPAIRS
P.O. Box 615

Lexington, SC 29071

Phone: 800-877-2662

Fax: 888-877-2660

Jim Glickman

james.glickman@whaleyfoodservice.com




BOARD APPROVAL
AWARDING OF BIDS/PROPOSALS
JANUARY 23, 2008

RFP NO. 074-2007 E MAIL & WEB HOSTING SERVICES

RECOMMENDATION:
REQUESTING APPROVAL TO PURCHASE FROM THE BEST BIDDER(S)/ OFFER(S) MEETING
SPECIFICATIONS AS FOLLOWS:

EST. ANNUAL AMOUNT
E CHALK $409,755.00

ADMINISTRATION DISTRIBUTED ONE HUNDRED FOURTEEN (114) PROPOSALS AND ADVERTISED
ON DECEMBER 9, 2007 AND DECEMBER 16, 2007. FIVE (5) PROPOSALS WERE RECEIVED ON
JANUARY 8, 2008 @ 3:00 P.M. AT THE UISD SERVICE CENTER PURCHASING DEPARTMENT.

BUDGET INFORMATION:

E MAIL & WEB HOSTING

E RATE 11 PROCEEDS

TECHNOLOGY DEPARTMENT MATCHING FUNDS
LESSON PLANNER

TITLE 2 PART D

INSTRUCTIONAL DEPT

EVALUATION COMMITTEE:

JUDITH GARCIA, DISTRICT COORDINATOR INSTRUCTIONAL TECH. & ONLINE CURRICULUM
BELINDA MANNING, PROGRAM COORDINATOR

CHRISTINE ROMANELLI, PROGRAM COORDINATOR

VERONICA GARCIA, PROGRAM COORDINATOR

ALEIDA SANCHEZ, PROGRAM COORDINATOR

HECTOR PEREZ, EXECUTIVE DIRECTOR OF TECHNOLOGY AND M.I.S.
JUDITH ESCAMILLA, DIRECTOR OF TECHNOLOGY SERVICES
HECTOR ZARATE, COMPUTER SUPPORT SPECIALIST

FRANK GONZALEZ, COMPUTER SUPPORT SPECIALIST

JESSICA GARZA, TECHNOLOGY TRAINERS

MIGUEL MARTINEZ, TECHNOLOGY TRAINERS

CORDELIA JACKSON, DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING

HECTOR CAVAZOS, PURCHASING MANAGER




FOR CHILDREN

ITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

Pamela R. Juarez
Associate Superintendent for Curriculum and Instruction

To: Hector Perez, tive Director of Informational Technology

From: Pamela R. Juarez Asdociate Superintendent for Curriculum & Instruction
Subject: Recommendation As Requested

Date: January 10, 2008

Attached please find the recommendation of the Instructional Department members participating
in the Technology Bid Committee. After reviewing their input, [ support the recommendation as
written and look forward to future option reviews.

4410 State Hwy. 359 - Laredo, TX 78043 - (956)473-5241 - Fax (956) 473-5259




FOR CHILDREN

To: Pamela R. Juarez
Assaciate Superintendent Curriculum & Instruction

From: Judith M. Gareé
District Coordinatgr, Instructional Technology & Online Curriculum

Subject: Recommendation for Student Email and Web Hosting Services

Date: January 10, 2008

Copy: Juanita Lozano, Executive Director Secondary Education
Ann Mc Donald, Executive Director Elementary Education
Hector Perez, Executive Director, Information Technology
Cordy Flores-Jackson, Director of Purchasing

On January, 8, 2008, the Technology Bid Review Committee met to review potential
vendors for providing Student Email and Web Hosting Services as described in RFP
074-2007. Five submissions were eligible for review given the criteria.

Due to the substantial cost of preparation and training required to change systems, it is
best to continue researching different software options using various campus pilot
initiatives. The committee members representing Instructional Technology will continue
to actively research all available options for electronic communities to ensure that
services selected meet the growing needs of the district. At this time, the Instructional
Technology members of the committee find that it is most beneficial to award RFP 074-
2007 for Student Email and Web Hosting Services to eChalk the existing provider.

Juanita Lozano
Executive Director, Secondary Education

4410 Hwy 359 ~ Laredo, TX 78043 - (956)473-2022 -  Fax (956) 473-2095




UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
E MAIL & WEB HOSTING SERVICES

RFP 074-2007

Email & Web Hosting Services

VENDOR

DESCRIPTION *GAGGLE.NET SCHOOLCENTER **E CHALK SHARP SCHOOL SCHOOL IN SITES
Installation INCLUDED INCLUDED $2,000.00 INCLUDED $15,750.00
Annual Maintenance INCLUDED INCLUDED $74,250.00 INCLUDED INCLUDED
Annual License Charge $108,000.00 $144,500.00 $405,000.00 $99,000.00 $28,800.00
Training NO BiD INCLUDED $13,200.00 $4,500.00 $5,000.00
Project Management INCLUDED INCLUDED $3,300.00 INCLUDED INCLUDED
Implementation Savings $0.00 $0.00 ($78,750.00) $0.00 $0.00
Discount $0.00 $0.00 ($90,000.00) $0.00 $0.00
Total for Email & Web
iHosﬁn Services $108,000.00 $144,500.00 $329,000.00 $103,500.00 $49,550.00
Online Lesson Planner Services

Instaliation NO BID NO BID $500.00 INCLUDED NO BID
Licenses (45) NO BID NO BID $81,000.00 INCLUDED NO BID
Training NO BID NO BID $8,250.00 INCLUDED NO BID
Discount NOBID NO BID {$8,975.00) INCLUDED NO BID
Total for Online Lesson| ) o)) NO BID $80,775.00 INCLUDED NO BID
Planner Services

Grand Total for E-mail &)

Web-Hosting Services

and Online Lesson $108,000.00 $144,500.00 $409,775.00 $103,500.00 $49,550.00
Planner Services

1 year, potential 5% price|
5 years increase in the foliowing 5 years 4 years 3 years

Contract Term years

Note: Pricing for E-mail * Web-Hosting Services is based on 45 sites and
45,000 accounts

* Company did not provide pricing for Web Hosting Services

** Pricing for Lesson Planner is for @ sites




UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
NETWORK EQUIFMENT AND DATA CABLING SERVICES
RFP 074-2007 E MAIL & WEB HOSTING SERVCIES

MAILING LIST

ABTECH SYSTEMS INC
2728 LOKER AVEW
CARLSBAD, CA 92008
PHONE: 760-827-5100
FAX: 760-603-0148
info@abtachsys.com

ACCLAIM PROFESSIONAL SERVICES
300 NW FREEWAY #320

HOUSTON, TX 77092

PHONE: 713-410-9265

FAX: 713-681-0057

webcontact@acclaimps.com

ACS DATALINE LP

1826 KRAMER LN STE M
AUSTIN, TX 78758
PHONE: 512-837-4400
FAX: 512-*837-6767
GLYNN BARKER

n.ba csdataline.

ADVANCED BUSINESS TECHNOLOGIES

P.O. BOX 689

LEAGUE CITY, TX 77573
PHONE: 281-898-1041
TIM O'NEILL
www.advancedbt com

ADVANCED COMMUNICATIONS & CABLING

120 MARKET ST

GEORGETOWN, TX 78626

PHONE: 512-869-4600/361-814-3041
FAX: 512-863-4762/361-244-3963
KENT TAYLOR

kenttaylor@ac-c.net

WWw.ac-c net

ADVANCED WIRELESS
P.0.BOX 7629
AMARILLO, TX 78114
PHONE: 806-468-7088
RAY MENDIOLA

|1 i et

AMER.COM

7259 BRYAN DAIRY RD.
LARGO, FL 33777
PHONE: 800.262.9703
FAX: 800.314.6805

LISA NAGY

Inegv@amer.com

ANIXTER

500 CENTER RIDGE DR STE 200
AUSTIN, TX 78753

PHONE: §12.252.8383

MIKE SHANNON

mike.shannon@anixter com

ANIXTER

6550 JADE MEADOW

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78249
PHONE: 210.696.0087

FAX: 210.641.5065

MIKE SHANNON

mike. shannon@anixter.com

AT & T GLOBAL SERVICES
5711 MCPHERSON RD STE 204
LAREDQ, TX 78041

PHONE: 966-721-5547

FAX: 956-857-3145

EDUARDO RODRIGUEZ
edrodriguez@att.com

JERRY CASTRO
2c9438@att.com

er. com

B8AFORD TECHNOLQGIES INC.
P.O. BOX 781362

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78278
PHONE: 210.863.7213

ASHISH D. KHAMKAR
akhamkar@yahoo.com

BORDERLAN

P.O. BOX 385

SAN MARCOS, CA 92079
PHONE: 760-736-8100
FAX: 208-237-2455
FALICIA SMITH

sal o

BUENO INTEGRATED TECHNOLOGIES INC

801 BUSINESS PARKWAY
RICHARDSON, TX 75081
PHONE: 972-235-9211
FAX: 972-235-3530

ED BUENO
inquiry@bitsales,com

trini. .Com

CALENCE LLC

2712 N. MCCOLL RD.,

MCALLEN, TX 78501

PHONE: 480-889-8500; 956-687-3794
FAX: 480-212-7400; 956-687-5428
DIANA BERGER

diana berger@calence.com
JIM TETER

Lim.teter om

WWw.calence.com

CENTRAL COMMAND INC

820 LAFAYETTE RD

MEDINA, OH 44258

PHONE: 330-723-2062

FAX: 330-722-6517

STEVE SUNDERMEIER

SSun i ntralcommand.com




cont mailing list 074-2007

CLEAR TECHNOLOGIES
1199 S BELTINE RD STE 120
COPELL, TX 75018

PHONE: 972-908-7500

FAX: 972-8067543

MIKE ULRICH

AVANT DATACOMM

400 CORPORATE CIRCLE STE H
GOLDEN COLORADO 80401
SCOTT BERGREN

sbergren@avantdata.com
JAMES MCGINNIS

meginnis@avantdata.com

CINGULAR WIRELESS

11710 BELTSVILLE DR. §THFL
BELTSVILLE. MD 21705

PHONE: 425-580-6000; 361-813-3413

NORMA AGUILAR
norma.l ilar@lcingular.com
www.cingular.com
aorna.aqui i r.com

CISCO SYSTEMS, INC.

85 N.E. LOOP 410, STE 500
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78216
PHONE: 210.357.2569

FAX: 210.357.2599

KURT SELL

kseli@ci

COMMUNICATION EXPERT
33711ADMIRAL STE A

EL PASOQ, TEXAS 78925
PHONE: 915.593.8765

FAX: 815.592.9372
PATRICIA PEDREGON
DANNY PEDREGON

drp452¢@aot com

CLEAR TEGHNOLOGIES
1189 S. BELTINE RD STE 120
COPPELL, TX 75019

PHONE: §72-906-7537

FAX: 972-906-7543

ANGELA THOMAS

athoma rtechnolgias net

COMM USA

P.C. BOX 1849

LAREDO, TEXA 78044-1848
PHONE: 717.2256

FAX: 722.1752

FERMIN ALFARO

fermin mm-ysa.com

COMPUTER COMMAND CORP.
708 E.GOODWIN

VICTORIA, TEXAS 77901
PHONE: 361.573.4305

FAX: 361.576.4259

HUGH HANES

hhanes@compytercommand.cont

COMPUTER SOLUTIONS !/ MICROAGE
7550 IH 10 WEST, STE. 120

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78229

PHONE: 1.800.531.3858 EXT. 35

FAX: 210 369.0389

MATT HARRIS
mharris@convergencecable com

CONVERGENCE CABLING
812 JUSTIN LANE

AUSTIN, TEXAS 78757
PHONE: 512.451.1716
FAX: §12.451.1164

JOHN LAWARENCE

: lawtence@convergencecable.com

C.D.l. TECHNOLOGY SERVICES
P.O. BOX 831146

SAN ANTONIO, TX 78283
PHONE: 210.488.9066

FAX: 210.488.9025

JOSEPH WEYEL

inf i-tech.net

CDW GOVERNMENT INC

230 N MILWAUKEE AVE
VERNON HILLS, IL 60061-9740
PHONE: 800-808-4239

FAX: 847-419-6200

MARK ELLIS

bids@cdwg.com
www.cdwg.com

CONTERRA ULTRA BROADBAND, LLC
2101 REXFORD RD STE 200E
CHARLOTTE, NC 28211

PHONE: 704.365.6701

FAX: 704.365.6702

STEVE PARRY

scparry@swhell. net
dindali@conterra.com

CsC

1010 WETMORE
SAN ANTONIO, TX
CQY CHRISTAL
cehristai@gocsc.com

DESERT COMMUNICATIONS, INC.
7355 REMCO CIRCLE, STE 102

EL PASO, TEXAS 78912

PHONE: 915.584.1287

FAX: 915.581.7697
wyatt@descominc.com

DIGITAL PRECISION

8200 PAT BOOKER RD. #359
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78233
PHONE: 210.573.9870

FAX: 210.662.8038

ROD TANNER
nanner@ineix.com

DIRECTRON.COM
10402 HARWIN DRIVE
HOUSTON, TEXAS
PHONE: 713.773.9898
FAX: 713.773.9393
MICHAEL CHANG, PH.D
mike@directron.com

DOCUDATA SOLUTIONS LLC
2601 KIPHEN RD BLDG 200
ROUND ROCK, TX 78664
PHONE: 512-246-1220

FAX: 512-246-1307

KEN HENSLEY

khensley@docudatasolutions.com
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ECHALK

199 WATER ST 16TH FLOOR
NEW YORK, NY 10038
PHONE: 212-809-8400

FAX: 212-809-8500
DARRELL STANLEY
dstaniey@echalk.com
kdowningfechatk.com

ELECTRA LINK INC
12217 WATER PARK RD
AUSTIN, TX 78759
PHONE: §12-835-6475
FAX: 512-835-6481
ROBERT DROSCHE

rdroschy link.com

EN POINTE TECHNOLOGIES
1120 CAPITAL HWY 220
AUSTIN, TEXAS 78746
PHONE: 512.330.3207

FAX: §12.306.7311
govsales@enpointe.com

ENTERASYS NETWORK, INC.
§0 MINUTEMAN ROD.
ANDOVER, MA 01810
PHONE: 978.684.1000

FAX: 978.684.1658

GREG BLUM

gblugr \(@enterasys.com

EXPANETS
6925 PORTWEST DR. STE 100
HOUSTON, TEXAS 77024
PHONE: 281.260.1000
FAX: 713.690.5674
CATHY HUNDLEY

i ts.com

FB8S

1550 NE LOOP

SAN ANTONIO, 410 SUITE 121
PHONE : 210.828.4966

FAX : 210.828.8599

TIME DANTONIO

tim. dantonio@sat. blackbox com

FIRST LINE COMMUNICATIONS
P.Q. BOX 104

25020 BLANCO RD.

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78258
NOE A ESPARZA

FISK TECHNOLOGIES
8964 BROADWAY

SAN ANTONIO, TX 78217
PHONE: 210.832,2489
CELL: 210.286.1348

FAX: 210.828.6434
ROBERT TRAMMELL
trammeli@fisk .com

hflechtner@fiskcorp com

FLAIR

6300 LA COLMA DR. STE 510
AUSTIN, TEXAS 78752
PHONE: 512.342.9990

FAX: 512.342.9992

RAY COMBS

rcombs@austin. flairdata.com

FONC, INC.

FIBER OPTIC & NETWORK CABLING
12 BURWOOD LANE

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78216
PHONE: 210.366.2599

FAX: 210.366.2562

HARTLEY F. KANE, RCOD

hkane@foncinc.com

GATEWAY DRIVE, INC.

610 GATEWAY DRIVE

P.O. BOX 2000

NORTH SIOUX CITY SD 67048
PHONE: 800.211.4952

FAX: 606.232.2701

KEITH J. FRAUENDORFER

proposais@aateway.com

GAGGLE NET
P.O. BOX 1361
BLOOMINGTON, IL 61702
PHONE: 800-288-7750
FAX: 309-663-5025
MARK ELDER
mark@aaggie.net
admin@gaqgle.net
mike{@igaggie.net
www.gaggle net

GENESIS NETWORKS INC
14220 NORTHBROOK DR

SAN ANTONIO, TX 78232
PHONE: 210-489-6644

FAX: 210-489-6612

MOBIL: 210-482-0077

RENE RODRIGUEZ

rene. rodrigue: sisnet.com

GLOBAL DATA SYSTEM

9430 RESEARCH BLVD. STE. 140
AUSTIN, TEXAS 78759

PHONE: 512.231.9802 x2102
FAX: 512.423.7007

DIANA BERGER
dianab s.com
[{ etqds.com

GPCNET INC/GLOBAL PG NET
6423 MCPHERSON SUITE 3
LAREDO, TX 78041

PHONE: 956-791-9999

FAX: 956-728-6305

EDUARDO CANAMAR
ecanamar@giobaipe. net

GREATER TEXAS CABLING

12407 N. MOPAC EXPWY #100-366
AUSTIN, TEXAS 78788

PHONE: 512.246.9551

FAX: 5§12.246.3999

JENNIFER NOONER

inf exas.net

HEWLETT PACKARD

301 S. ROCKRIMMON
COLORADO SPRINGS, CO 80919
PHONE: 800-888-3224 EXT15650
MATHEW BOLIN

mathew bokn@hp.com

INTECH SOUTHWEST SERVICES LLC
P.O. BOX 691364

SAN ANTONIO, TX 78269

PHONE: 210-690-0000

FAX: 210-690-0200

JUAN FLORES JR.

keeyher@intechsouthwest com

INTERCOM COMMUNICATIONS
1815 HOUSTON ST.

LAREDO, TEXAS 78040
PHONE: 856.724.3705

FAX: 956.717.1569

GISPSON

intercom@border.com
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INTERNETWORK EXPERTS M-1 NETWORKS INC
8200 PAT BOOKER RD. #359 6019 MCPHERSON RD #10
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78233 LAREDOQ, TEXAS 78041
PHONE: 210. 340.2009 PHONE 956.718.1005
FAX: 210. 348.6622 FAX: 956.718.1090
RODERICK D. TANNER, JR. M. SOUS
fanper@inetx.com marcos@minetworks.com
1BC NETWORK SERVICES , INC. MIDWEST INTERNET CONSULTING GROUP INC
124 WEST JOHN ST DBA SCHOOLCENTER
MATTHEWS, NC 28105 1075 REED STATION RD
PHONE: 877-919-4521 CARBONDALE, IL 62902
FAX: 704-844-2728 PHONE: 888-542-4448
sai ibccon .com FAX: 618-351-1996
KENDALL INMAN
1BM kinmangdschoolkcenter.com
7100 HIGHLANDS PKWY 016-08 MARY MECHLER
SMYRNA, GA 30082 marymf@schoolcenter.com
PHONE: 800-426-1751 EXT 2172
FAX: 800-242-6329 MORE DIRECT
RANDOLPH GRAHAM 2908 WISTERIA
grahamr@us.ibm.com MCALLEN, TX 78504
PHONE: 956-655-2545
INACOM FAX: 856-992-0577
911 W. ANDERSON LANE, STE 200 iiglesi [ix
AUSTIN, TEXAS 78757
PHONE: 512.266.7000 NETGINEER DATA SYSTEMS, INC
LAURIE HUNTER 6448 HWY 280 E. F-107
in infof@inacom.com AUSTIN, TX 78723
PHONE: §12.415.1522
INTEGRITY COMMUNICATIONS, LTD FAX: §12.453.1673
P.O. BOX 260154 SAM PEREZ JR
CORPUS CHRISTI, TEXAS 78426 sperez@netgineer.com
PHONE: 361.242.1000
FAX: 361.242.9300 NETSYNC NETWORK SOLUTIONS
JASON EVANS 2600 W. LOOP SOUTH SUITE 510
evans@integritycd com HOUSTON, TX 77027
PHONE: 713-218-5000 / 866-974-5959
INX INC FAX: 713-664-9964
1855 LAKEWAY DR STE 220 WAYNE RICHMOND
LEWISVILLE, TX 75057 sa n cnetwork.com
PHONE: 512-795-8811 www.netsyncnetwork.com
FAX: 512-795-8844
RODERICK TANNER JR NET VERSANT-TEXAS, INC.
panner@inxi.com 1421 WHALES STE. 303
www.inxi.com PSLUGERVILLE, TEXAS 78660
PHONE: 800.826.1979
K12 DISCOUNT FAX: 512.6156.0671
P.O. BOX 2558 JASON HOLLEN
1301 RIDGWAY RD :hollen@netversant. com
PINE BLUFF, AR 71603
PHONE: 877-512-3472 NETVIEW TECHNOLOGIES, INC.
FAX: 870-536-7949 7240 BRITTMOORE RD. STE 118
JAMES PASCALE HOUSTON, TEXAS 77041
amesp@k12discount. PHONE: 713.896.0500 X224
FAX: 713.515.8008
MANDDAREE ENTERPRISE BILL BLOCHER
10203 KOTZEBUE ST STE 231 bblocher@etinear.com
SAN ANTONIO, TX 78217
GARRY MQORE NEXTIRA QONE
gary.moore@mandares.com 2800 POST OAK BLVD. STE. 200
HOUSTON, TEXAS 77056
MICROGRAPHIC IMAGING, INC. PHONE: 713.307.4000
P.O. BOX 34417 FAX: 713.307.7270
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78265 CHARLOTTE ELLIOTT
PHONE: 210.656.0238 chariotte. elliott@blackbox-vs.com
FAX: 210.653.6226
MARIO A RAY NSX TECHNOLOGIES, INC.
mario@microgsaphic. DBA/MACEXCHANGE
27326 JEFFERSON AVE. #12
MICRO SYSTEM ENTERPRISES, INC. TEMECULA, CA 92690
3221 WEST ALBERTA PHONE: 888.650.4488
EDINBURG, TEXAS 78521 PHONE: 909.296.1000
PHONE: 956. 994-3033 FAX: 909.296.6333
FAX: 956-984-3381 WILLIAM T, MCKELVIE
ssanchez@mseng.com todd@macx.com
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PRESIDIO CORP.

2601 PELICAN AVE.
MCALLEN, TEXAS 78504
PHONE: 956.971.9292
FAX: 956.971.9293
BRIAN MITTEL
bmittei@@presidio.com
MARIO QUINTANILLA
mauintanila@presidio.com
FREEMAN JOHNSON
fohnso residio.com
JACKIE ARNETT

arneft@presidio.com

QA SYSTEMS, INC.
6620 MANOR RD.
AUSTIN, TEXAS 78723
PHONE: 1.800.331.4132
FAX: §12. 637.8811

lili asystems.

don@qasystems com

QUALITY FAST SERVICE
801 UNION PACIFIC STE 3
LAREDO, TX 78045
PHONE: 956.728.1550
FAX: 956.728.9819
HOMERQO SALDIVAR

RGG AND ASSOCIATES

115 TRAVIS ST.

STE 1500

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78205
PHONE: §30.229.5016

S.A. OFFICE 888.400.7422
RON CLONTZ

ron@rgca. net

relonf a.net

REXEL

2400 BROCKTON

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78217
PHONE: 210.352.1000

FAX: 210.824.0419

JERRY DOYLE

doyle@rex .com

RZ COMMUNICATIONS
1400 SMITH RO
AUSTIN, TX 78721
PHONE: 512-638-1929
FAX: 512-386-7350
JOE CHARRO
charro@szaustin.com
ANDREW RAMIREZ
aramire tin.com

RX TECHNOLOGY

3370 NACOGDOCHES. STE 136
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78217
PHONE: 210.828.6081

FAX: 210.828.8419

MARK RIZZO
mrizzo@rx-tech.com

1ikd imenez@satx.rr.com

SCANTRON CORPORATION
34 PARKER

IRVINE, CA 92618

PHONE: 800.722.6876 ext. 7537
FAX: 949.639.7710

KAREN MURRAY

karen murray@scantion.com

SHARP SCHOOL

201 AUTUMNVIEW RD
WILLIAMSVILLE, NY 14221
PHONE: 866-802-4447

FAX: 636-533-9045

STEVEN HALLETT

steven. hallett@sharpschoal.com
www.sharpschoal.com

SCHOOLINSITES

P.O. BOX 305
SARALAND, AL 36571
PHONE: 251-621-1385
FAX: 251-476-3083

JIM COX

: cox@schoolinsites.com
www.schoolinsites.com

SCHOOL SPAN
205 HALLENE RD STE A8
WARWICK, AR 02886
PHONE: 800-289-1622 EXT 697
BOB CHANEY

ane! . com
yww.sch an.com

SIGMA SYSTEMS INC

2201 MIDWAY RD #316

CARROLLTON, TX 75006

PHONE: 972-934-3300

FAX: 934-0090

MELISSA GREGORY
ray@si .com

SMART CABLING SOLUTIONS
428 W. NAKOMA

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS, 78216
PHONE: 210.930.4008

FAX: 210.930.4008

1 vontoussaint@thinkscs.com

SOUTHWESTERN BELL CORP
802 SAN EDUARDO RM #203
LAREDO, TEXAS 78040
PHONE: 956.727.6880

FAX: 956.727.6776

JERRY CASTRO
ec3438@sbc.com

ROBERT TENNYSON
19028@sbc.com

ED RODRIGUEZ
er5092@sbe.com

DAN OWEN

do794 1@sbc.com

ROGER ROCHA
{r5689@sbe.com

SOUTHWEST NETWORK, INC.
2442 BROCKTON

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78217
PHONE: 210.824.3918

FAX: 210.824.3143

WILLIAM CHRISTAL

william.christal@southwestnetworks.com

el.norris: uth networks com

SPRINT SOLUTIONS INC
6200 SPRINT PARKWAY
OVERLAND PARK, KS 66251

PHONE: 703-433-4000; 281-802-0045

TONY D'AGATA
PATTI MCKENNA

pattie. mckenna@sprint.com
SUPA TECH INC

17304 PRESTON RD SUITE 800 RMB 48

DALLAS, TX 75252

PHONE: 972-238-8958

FAX: §72-238-7842

SUE GLOVER; ERIC GLOVER

TECH DEPOT

6 CAMBRIDGE DR
TRUMBULL, CT 06611
PHONE: 800-625-9866
FAX: 203-615-7006
JOHN TARITIAN

nieai@techdepot.com

TRACE TECHNOLOGIES
PHONE: 918-510-0210
JIMMY DIXON

i dixon@tracetechnoloiges. com




TRILLION

9208 WATERFORD CENTRE BLVD., STE 150

AUSTIN, TEXAS 78758
PHONE: 512.334.4080
FAX: 512..334.4099
ANDY PILARCIK
andy.pilarcik@trillion. net
JEANNE MASSEY

eanne. ma trillion.net

TRI-COUNTY COMMUNICATION, LTD.
1421 EAST PIKE

WESLACO, TEXAS 78596

PHONE: 877.550.8440

FAX: 956.447.0622

CHARLES PARENT

cparent@tri-coun .com

TRUE TECHNOLOGY

8200 SPRINGWOOD DR., STE 260
IRVING, TEXAS 75063

PHONE: 972.432.0100

FAX: 972.432.0500

ini lachnol

TIGERDIRECT.COM

7795 W FLAGLER ST

MIAMI, FL 33144

PHONE: 888-768-4437

FAX: 305-415-4311

MARCOS MARTINEZ

marcos. martinez@tigerdirect.com

TGR COMMUNICATIONS
1416 HOUSTON
LAREDO, TEXAS 78040
PHONE: 966.724.5201
FAX: 956.726.3154
MARTIN RESENDEZ JR.

fercomm@yahoo.com

TRC COMPUTER SERVICES
11933 NETWORK BLVD.

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78243
PHONE: 210.696.8556

FAX: 210.696.5488

LUIS BARRAGAN
lisb@trees.com

TFE- TECHNOLOGY FOR EDUCATION
8225 CENTRAL PARK DRIVE

WACO, TEXAS 76712

PHONE: 254.776.5563

FAX: 254.299.1396

DANIEL KRONKE

daniel.kronk (m .

TECHNICAL LABORATORY SYSTEMS
1113 AVE. B.

KATY, TEXAS 77493

PHONE: 200.445.1088

FAX: 281.391.1113

EDGAR VILLARREAL
sherrig@dtech-labs.com

TELECORE DIGITAL
SOLUTION

PHONE: 956.661.0400
CHARLES JIMENEZ
dnstxi@aol.com

THE CABLING EXPERTS
2701 VINE

MCALLEN, TX 78508
PHONE: 856.638.4827
PEDRO E. GUADARRAMA

pauadarrama@hotmail.com

THE REAL DESIGN GRCUP
1101 GUADALUPE ST STE D
LAREDO, TX 78040

PHONE: 956.717.0998

FAX: 956.717.0152

JESUS GUAJARDO

esusqua ardo@sbeglobal.net

THE WIRE GUY

2418 BALTIMORE
LAREDO, TEXAS, 78041
PHONE: 956. 740.4049
CELL: 956. 744.0164
RAUL PATINO

wirea@yahoo.com

TYLER TECHNOLOGIES, INC.
5949 SHERRY LANE STE 1400
DALLAS, TX 75225

PHONE: 972-713-3700

FAX: 972-713-3741
info@tylerworks.com

brent.be. lertechnologies.com

TYLER TEGHNOLOGIES INC
370 US ROUTE ONE
FALMOUTH, ME 04105
PHONE: 800-772-2260

FAX: 207-781-2981

ADAM GRIFFITHS

adam griffiths@tyler-works.com

TIME WARNER CABLE
1313 W. CALTON ROAD
LAREDO, TX 78041
PHONE: 956.721.0600
FAX: 956.721.0609
CELL: 956.266.0896
KYLE RUDNICK

kyle.rudnick@tweable.com

TRC COMPUTER SERVICES
11933 NETWORK BLVD.

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78249
PHONE: 210.696.8556

FAX: 210.696.5488

LUIS BARRAGAN
{uish@troes.com

UNITED COMMUNICATIONS

6608 JOY RD.

EAST SYRACUSE, NY 13057-1108
PHONE: 315.463.5500

FAX: 315.463.7160

JERRY ADAMS

; adams{@uintedcos.com

VERIZON WIRELESS
7600 MONTPELLIER RD
LAUREL, MD 20723
MICHAEL MAIORANA

VIRA MONTES GROUP, INC.
1308 ROCKWELL CT.
AUSTIN, TEXAS 78726
PHONE: 512.249.9140
FAX: 512.249,9140
ARNY VIRAMONTES

¥ vira tesgroup.com

VIRA BUSINESS SOLUTIONS LLP
1649 WORLD TARDE CENTER LOOP
LAREDOQ, TX 78045

PHONE: 956-242-4554

JUAN VILLARREAL
juan@virebusiness com

WEST TECHNOLOGIES
10965 LONG BRANCH DR.
AUSTIN, TEXAS 78736-7448
PHONE: 512.301.1462

FAX: 512.301.1457

JAY THOMAS

. ay.thomas@buywest.com

linda@buywest com

WIRELESS CONNECTIONS
2411 NE LOOP 410 #106
SAN ANTONIO, TX 78217
PHONE: 210-590-3331

FAX: 210-590-1777

JUUIE FFENTON

wirelessconnection@stx.rr.com




XTREAM TECHS, INC

4315 PATRIOT DR
LAREDO, TX 78046
PHONE: 956.220.8032

FAX: 956.727.0768
MAGDALENA ADAME
hadame@extreamtechs com




BOARD APPROVAL
AWARDING OF BIDS/PROPOSALS
JANUARY 23,2008
RENEWAL

RFP NO. 2006-077 EMPLOYEE BENEFITS INSURANCE CONSULTING SERVICES

RECOMMENDATION:
REQUESTING APPROVAL TO PURCHASE FROM THE BEST BIDDER(S) OFFER(S) MEETING
SPECIFICATIONS AS FOLLOWS:

RECOMMENDED FIRM EST. ANNUAL AMOUNT
WETHE & ASSOCIATES . SEE ATTACHED TABULATION

ADMINISTRATION DISTRIBUTED SEVENTY TWO (72) PROPOSALS AND ADVERTISED ON
NOVEMBER 30, 2006 AND DECEMBER 6, 2006. SEVEN (7) PROPOSALS WERE RECEIVED ON
DECEMBER 18, 2006 @ 3:00 P.M. AT THE UISD SERVICE CENTER PURCHASING DEPARTMENT.

BUDGET INFORMATION:
2007-2008 RISK MANAGEMENT

RESOURCE PERSONNEL:

ROBERTO CHAPA, DIRECTOR OF RISK MANAGEMENT
CORDELIA FLORES, DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING
HECTOR CAVAZOS, PURCHASING MANAGER




FOR CHILDREN

TED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

Robert Chapa
Director of Risk Management

To:  Cordelia Flores Jackson
Purchasing Director

Re: RPF 2006-077 Employee Benefits Insurance Consulting Services

Ms. Jackson;

In the best interests of the United Ind egendent School District, I recommend the district award the
renewal of all employee benefits consulting services to Ken Wethe and Associates. This is the 2 2™ year
of a § year award, Employecs shall not be affected by the change of employee benefit consulting
services 3P vided herein. Please let me know if you have any guestions or comments.

20t Lindenwood Dr.  —  Laredo, TX 78045 - (956)473-6390 - Fax (956) 473-6410
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UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
EMPLOYEE BENEFITS INSURANCE CONSULTING SERVICES
RFP 2006-077

ALAMO INSURANCE GROUP, INC.
901 N.E. LOOP 410, STE. 700

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78209
PHONE: (210} 930-6665

OR 888-596-5504

FAX: (210) 930-1838

ATTN: MIKE GILPIN
mailpin@alamoinsgrp.com

geoldewey@alamoainsgrp.com

ALL STATE

201 W. DEL MAR STE 14
LAREDO, TEXAS 78041
PHONE: 856.725.4934
FAX: 956.725.5618
MARCOS MORENO

2a018898@alistate.com

AMERICAN FAMILY LIFE ASSURNACE CO
1932 WYNNTON RD

COLUMBUS, GEORGIA 31999

PHONE: 956-724-4011

FAX: 956-724-4011

GUSTAVO MARTINEZ

guda_49@hotmail.com

AMERICAN STOP LOSS

250 COMMERCIAL ST.

STE 200

WORCESTER, MA. 01608
PHONE: 800.944.7659 EXT 3009
FAX: 508.799.0161

DON BEAULAC
dbeaulac@americanstoploss.com

ARAG GROUP

400 LOCUS ST., STE 480
DES MOINES, |A 50309
PHONE: 800.888.4184
FAX: 515.246.8710

LIZ GEORGE
liz.george@araggroup.com

ARTHUR J. GALLAGHER & CO
14241 DALLAS PARKWAY

STE 300

DALLAS, TEXAS 75254
PHONE: 972.991.3700

FAX: 972.991.4061

SHERYL KELLEY

sheryl kelley@ajg.com

ASSOCIATED BENEFIT CONSULTANTS,
INC.

7272 WURZBACH RD. STE 104

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78240
PHONE: 210.614.1222

FAX: 210.614.2313

HECTOR E. VILLARREAL

ehv222@covad.net

ASSOCIATION MEMBER BENEFITS
ADVISORS

6034 WEST COURT YARD DR.
AUSTIN, TEXAS 78730

PHONE: 800.2558.7041

FAX: 512.241.0035

DAN BATTARBEE

dbattarbee@aol.com

BLAS M. MARTINEZ, JR.
4519 SAN BERNARDO
LAREDO, TEXAS 78041
PHONE: 956.724.9083
FAX: 956.726.1873
blasmartinez@yahoco.com

AMERICAN ADMISTRATIVE GROUP
ICON BENEFITS ADMINISTRATORS
P.0.BOX 53070

LUBBOCK, TX 79453-3070

PHONE: 800-658-9777

FAX: 806-473-3030

TERESA MCLAUGHLIN

teresa mclaughlin@aagco.com

CARLISLE INSURANCE
P.O. BOX DRAWER 3030
ALICE, TX 78333
PHONE: 361.664.4348
FAX: 361.664.1822
JOHNNY RIVERA

juanr@carlisleins.com

CARUTH & ASSOCIATES
P.O. BOX 4768

MCALLEN, TX, 78502
PHONE; 956.682.1023
FAX: 956.682.0165
DENNIS CARRUTH
Carruthandassoc@aol.com
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CATHOLIC LIFE INSURANCE

1635 N.E. LOOP 410

P.O. BOX 659527

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78265-9527
PHONE: 210.828.9921
FAX:210.828.4629 .

aalejandro@cliu.com

CLAIM ADMINISTRATIVE SERVICES
501 SHELLY DR -

TYLER, TX 75701

PHONE: 800.765.2412 / 903.509.8484
FAX: 903.509.1888

SHEILA DARLAND

sdarland@hhccas.com

CORPORATE HEALTH PLANS OF
AMERICA

5000 LEGACY DRIVE STE 100
PLANO, TEXAS 75024

PHONE: 972.739.6450

FAX: 972.739.6613

LLONA LYDE
flona.lyde@chpai.com

DELGADO INSURANCE AGENCY
4501 MCPHERSON RD. STE #5
LAREDO, TEXAS 78041

PHONE: 956.728.7377

FAX: 956.727.0612

JULIO DELGADO
delgadoinsurance@sbcglobal.net

EMPLOYEE BENEFITS

15455 DALLAS PARKWAY, STE 1250
ADDISON, TEXAS 75001

PHONE: 972.419.5766

FAX: 972.419.5781

JEFF FLANAGAN

Jeff Flanagan@us.ing.com

EMPLOYERS GENERAL
THANKSGIVING TOWER

1601 ELM ST. STE. 1600

PHONE: 214.665.6176

FAX: 214.665.6180

GENE FARNSWORTH, CPCU AIC

gfarnsworth@empgen.com

EMPLOYERS VISION PLAN
1010 EAST TYLER
HARLIGEN, TEXAS 78550
PHONE: 800.825.2306
SANDRA KAML

MARTHA RUSTEBERG

mrusteberg@sbcalobal.net

FIRST FINANCIAL GROUP OF AMERICA
3801 KIRBY, 7TH FLOOR
HOUSTON, TEXAS 77098

SUSAN KIRTELY

PHONE: 800-523-8422

susan.k@ffga.com

FIRST FINANCIAL

2300 W. PIKE STE 103
WESTLACO, TEXAS 78596
PHONE: 866.447 2654
FAX: 956.447.0447

DOUG BANKS

dibanks@ix.netcom.com
doug.banks@ffga.com

FRINGE BENEFITS MANAGEMENT CO.
314 BARATARIA ST.

LOCKPORT, LA 70374

PHONE: 985-856-0732

FAX: 985-532-64659

DAVID HANLEY

dhanley@fbmc-benefits.com
iritch@fbmc-benefits.com

GE FINANCIAL ASSURANCE
734 NORTH GETTY
UVALDE, TEXAS 78801
PHONE: 830.278.4800

FAX: 830.278.3000

KELLY KOEPP

kelly. koepp@gecapital.com

GOFF INSURANCE AGENCY

PREPAID LEGAL SERVIES, INC.

304 N. PASADENA

KINGSVILLE, TX 78363

PHONE: 361.592.1026
off@intcomm.net
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HARTFORD LIFE
PHONE: 281.877.3812
FAX: 281.877.3910
JOHN WEITZEL

john.weitzei@hartfordlife.com

HENRI KHAN INSURANCE
4810 MAHER

LAREDOQ, TEXAS 78041
PHONE: 956-725-3936
HENRI D. KAHN
hkahn@kins.com

hkahn@direcpc.com

HIGHMARK LIFE & CASUALTY
5856 SHERRY LANE, STE 1000
DALLAS, TEXAS 75225
PHONE: 888.282.9101

FAX: 281.379.4735

ALBERT LUCIO

Albert. lucio@highmarklife.com

HOLMES MURPHY & ASSOCIATES OF TEXAS INC.

5949 SHERRY LANE, STE 902 LB78
DALLAS, TEXAS 75225-4639
PHONE: 800.882.5949

FAX: 214.691.4639

PRESTON

ppomvykal@hotmesmurphy.com

HORACE MANN LIFE INSURANCE
ONE HORACE MANN PLAZA
SPRINGFIELD, ILLINOIS 62715-001
PHONE: 217.789.2500 X 5808

FAX: 800.217.7351

CHRIS DELONEY
deloneci@mail.horaceman.com

HUMANA

8431 FREDRICKS BERG
STE. 500

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78229
PHONE: 210.617.1265

FAX: 210.617.1077

agrove@humana.com
khill3@humana.com

INSCORP PARTNERS, L & H, LLC
5904 SAN BERNARDO

LAREDO, TEXAS 78044-1949
PHONE: 956.722.0566

FAX: 956.724.7734

GLEN
glenco@inscorpinsurance. net

idider@schogthealth.com

JEHA, INC./CC. & A. LLC
11211 O'CONNOR RD.

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78233
PHONE: 1-800-373-5343

FAX: (210) 653-8350

ATTN: JOHN P. WILSON
craurich@aol.com

JERRY JABCOBS INSURANCE AGENCY
P.O. BOX 183

PORT MANSFIELD, TEXAS 78598-0183
PHONE: 956.944.2312

riojake@vsta.com

LANCE HOPPES

14080 NOCADOCHES #329
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78247
PHONE: (210) 855-6151 OR
FAX: (210) 655-2850

lanceho agl.com

LAUREL INSURANCE
4519 SAN BERNARDO
LAREDOQ, TEXAS 78041
PHONE: (956) 724-9083
FAX: (956) 726-1873
ATTN: ROBERT LAUREL
bob@laurelassoc.com

LEGAL ACCESS PLANS

2401 FOUNTAIN VIEW, STE 300
HOUSTON, TEXAS 77050

PHONE: 410.788.4499

FAX: 410.788.9489

MARY SCHEELER
mary_scheeler@legalaccessplans.com

LIBERTY MUTUAL GROUP

13201 NORHWEST FRWY. #400
HOUSTON, TEXAS 77040-6080
PHONE: 713.460.4650. x 205

FAX: 713.460.3397

THOMAS RAUCH

Thomas. Rauch@legalaccessplans.com

LIFERE INSURANCE COMPANY
800 NW LOOP 41, STEGOO N
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78216
PHONE: 210-357-1000

FAX: 210-357-1020

JAMES C. BLACK, JR.




MAYNARD & ASSOCIATES
6201 ESCONDIDO STE 15A
P.C. BOX 221204

NATL PLAN ADMINSTRATORS, INC.

4606 CENTERVIEW STE. 100
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78228

EL PASO, TEXAS 79913-1204 PHONE: 210-7637-6143

PHONE: 915-585-1817 JORGE SHALL/LINDA
FAX: 915-584-1533 Istark@satx.rr com
annamaynard@shcglobal.net

NATL PLAN ADMINISTRATORS
MARNELL & ASSOCIATES 1101 CAPITAL OF TEX. HIGHWAY S. BLDG E
702 WYOMING AVE AUSTIN, TX 78746

EL PASO, TEXAS 79902
PHONE: 915-542-3531
FAX: 915-532-1426 PACIFIC CARE
www.marnellassociates.com 6200 NORTHWEST PARKWAY
SAN ANTONIO, TX 78249-3348

PHONE: 800-880-0776

MCNEESE & ASSOCIATES PHONE: 210.474.5000

9311 SAN PEDRO STE 1020 FAX; 210.474.56315

SAN ANTONIO, TX 78216 CINDY MILLER

PHONE: 210-349-8311 cindy.milier@phs.com

FAX: 210-349-0428

HILDA PERSYN PALMER & CAY OF TEXAS LLC

isdbenefits@mcneeseassoc.com 5956 SHERRY LANE STE 2000
DALLAS, TEXAS 75225

METLIFE PHONE: 214-365-9150

FAX: 214-365-9141
BOB BOOKHAMMER
bob bookhammer@palmercay.com

DANIEL KERKMAZ

iigreen@metlife.com
dkerkmaz@metlife.com

MILLIMAN PLAN COMPLIANCE GROUP

STUART RACHLIN 1850 MT. DIABLO BLVD.
3000 BAYPORT DRIVE SUITE 880 STE 470
TAMPA, FLORIDA 33607 WALNUT CREEK, CA. 94596

PHONE 813-282-9262
FAX 813-282-8276

stuart.rachlin@milliman.com

MULLEN PENSION & BENEFITS GROUP
4115 MEDICAL DR. STE 410

PHONE 888-256-2663
FAX. 877-783-8410

wreimers@piancompliancegroup.com

RISK MANAGEMENT SERVICES
4807 SPICEWOOD SPRINGS RD

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78229
PHONE: 210-949-0002

FAX: 210-949-0282
info@mullenpbg.com

diane@mullen-associates.com
www.mullenpbg.com

MUTUAL OF OMAHA

201 W. HILLSIDE RD., STE. 26
LAREDO, TEXAS 78041
PHONE: (956) 722-0056

FAX: (956) 722-6681

ATTN: FELIX J. GONZALEZ

carey.malek@mutualofomaha.com

BUILDING ONE STE 1150
AUSTIN, TEXAS 78759-8444
PHONE: 512-772-3602

FAX: 512-535-5308

MARK BIGGERS

mbiggers@rmstx.org

RISKMANAGERS.US

1010 EAST TYLRE
HARLINGEN, TEXAS 78550
PHONE: 800.825.2306
CELL: 856-343-8437

FAX: 956.425.6502

riskmanager@sbcglobal net
ROGER GARZA
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RWL GROUP

300 N COTT RD #810
RICHARDSON, TEXAS 75080
PHONE: 972-907-9095

FAX: 972-907-9198

ROBERT LAZARUS

rwigroup@rwigroup.com

SAFEGUARD

5495 BELTLINE RD STE 155
DALLAS, TEXAS 75240
PHONE: 972.364.500

FAX: 972.364.5015

TREI WILD

mollyh@safequard.net

SIGMA CONSULTING CORP
201 ST. CHARLES AVE
NEW ORLEAN, LA 70170
PHONE: 504-598-0100
FAX:504-598-0138

BRET CLESI
bclesi@sigmacorp.net

SMITH & ASSOCIATES
P.O. BOX 92398
SOUTHLAKE, TX 76092
PHONE: 817-310-3422
FAX: 817-310-3439

ERIC SMITH
www.smith-assocites.com

SOUTHWEST FINANCIAL GROUP
105 S. BENGE ST

MCKINNEY, TX 75069

PHONE: 972-562-0362

FAX: 214-726-0376

CHRIS ZAAL

czfleet@swfg.net

SOUTHWEST BUSINESS CORPORATION
9311 SAN PEDRO, SUITE 600

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78216

PHONE: 800.527.0066

FAX: 210.321.7454

GARY LINDNER

glindner@sebc.com

STATE FARM INSURANCE
5901 MCPHERSON STE 6B
LAREDO, TEXAS 78041
PHONE: 956.728.1828
FAX: 956.728.7478

RAUL PATINO, LUTCF

raul. patinol8ja@statefarm.com

SUMMIT FINANCIAL PLANNING
6108 MCPHERSON, STE #10
LAREDO, TEXAS 78041

PHONE: 956.724.9279

FAX: 956.724.4388

LUIS FERNANDO HERNANDEZ
luishdz 11@hotmail.com

SWANTNER & GORDON

500 N. SHORELINE, STE. 1200
CORPUS CHRISTI, TEXAS 78403
PHONE: (361) 883-1711

FAX: (361) 844-0122

ATTN: DAVE DENURE

ddenure@s-gins.com

TERRELL INSURANCE SERVICE
610 WHIPPOORWILL DR
CANYON LAKE, TX 781533
PHONE: 210.867.1128

FAX: 830.964.2312

JOAN TURRELL

TEXAS ASSOCIATION OF SCHOOL BOARD
P.O. BOX

AUSTIN, TEXAS 78767-0400

PHONE 800.482.7276

FAX: 512.467.3623

richard elizondo@tasb.org

THE ALLIANCE CORPORATION
734 N. GETTY

UVALDE, TEXAS 78801

PHONE: 830-591-7988

FAX: 830-278-7010

KELLY KOEPP/GARY HIXON
kellvkoe xramp.net
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THE SCIOL! GROUP
4412 74TH ST STE A-100
LUBBOCK, TX 79424
PHONE: 806-741-1050
FAX: 741-1160

REBECCA ALLAIRE, RHU

rebecca-allaire@sbcglobal.net

THE TEACHERS AGENCY
1414 A VISTA AVE.
MCALLEN, TEXAS 78501
PHONE: 956.630.1975
NORMA | VAN BOGANT
NSmiley2002@aol.com

UNICARE

1415 THIRD STREET STE 502
CORPUS CHRISTI, TX 78403
PHONE: 361.904.0394

FAX: 361.883.5092

JOHN WALKER

John.Walker@wellpoint.com

UNITED SPECIALTY BENEFITS
2201 HARWOQOD RD
BEDFORD, TX 76021

PHONE: 817-685-9888

FAX: 817-685-9889

GENE TYLER

gene@usbix.com

VALIC FINANCIAL ADVISOR, INC.

7550 |-10 WEST, STE 740
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78229
PHONE: 800-892-5558
OFFICE 956-727-8701

richard-noriega@aigvalic.com

VALLEY RISK CONSULTING
P.O. BOX 6436

MCcALLEN, TEXAS 78502
PHONE: 956.664.1430

FAX: 956.630.1984

ROGER GARZA

roger@valleyriskconsulting.com

VELA INSURANCE SERVICES
2701 FREEMONT

LAREDO, TEXAS 78043
PHONE: 956.726.8557

FAX: 956.726.8580
GUILLERMO (MEMO)VELA
mvela42@yahoo.com

WETHE & ASSOCIATES, INC

6434 MAPLE AVENUE, SUITE 450

DALLAS, TEXAS 75235
PHONE: 214.350.9570
CELL: 214.317.0262
FAX. 214-350-8745
KENNETH (KEN) WETHE
kenwethe@sbcglobal.net




