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East Lansing Public Schools
Bid Tabulation

Name: ELPS High School Addition
Date: March 4, 2026
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Section 27 10 00
Low Voltage Cabling

Section 27 13 23
Fiber Optic Cable Network

Section 27 41 16
Multimedia Systems

Section 27 51 13
Public Address System

TOTAL INCLDUDING
POST BID CLARIFICATIONS

1 TECHNOLOGY SOLUTIONS Y Y Y Y Y Y Y $38,998.00 $9,328.00 NO BID NO BID

2 THIRD COAST TECH Y Y Y Y Y Y Y NO BID NO BID $137,255.85 NO BID

3 ACORN SOUND Y Y Y Y Y Y Y $64,674.25 $15,038.66 $138,433.58 NO BID

4 FIBER LINK Y Y Y Y Y Y Y NO BID $13,753.42 NO BID NO BID

5 ELECTRO MEDIA Y Y Y Y Y Y Y $46,005.78 $5,899.98 NO BID $18,563.06

6 TELSYSTEMS Y Y Y Y Y Y Y NO BID NO BID $137,340.70 NO BID

7 AMCOMM Y Y Y Y Y Y Y $41,661.25 $11,553.60 NO BID $24,643.00

8 SOUND PLANNING Y Y Y Y Y Y Y NO BID NO BID $124,882.78 NO BID $123,360.36
Post Bid Clarification: Remove Screen: Deduct $4,589.94
Post Bid Clarification: Add Touch Screen and Management Software: Add $3,067.52

9 THE DATACOM GROUP Y Y Y Y Y Y Y $34,625.00 $5,675.00 NO BID $17,365.00 $57,665.00

10 MOSS Y Y Y Y Y Y Y $37,885.15 $8,966.99 $127,582.14 $18,819.21



Bid Review Report

EAST LANSING PUBLIC SCHOOLS -
HIGH SCHOOL ADDITION

TECHNOLOGY BID
Issued: February 18, 2026

Opened: March 4, 2026

Review Date April 13, 2026

Selected Bidders Sound Planning Communications

Contract $123,360.36
Designer Approval Communication By Design

Owner Approval Christian Palasty

IN REVIEW OF BID(S), THE FOLLOWING DUE DILIGENCE WAS PERFORMED:

A Reviewed all bids received for compliance with specifications and contract
provisions.

B Conducted post-bid interview with low bidder on March 12, 2026.
Requested and received bid clarifications from bidders on March 13, 2026.

C Evaluated equipment performance.

D Evaluated overall proposed design.

E Equalized bids to ensure adequate comparison.

F Evaluated the ability for Contractor to complete work within project timeline

G

During the post-bid interview, post bid clarifications were requested. Post-bid
clarifications determined a screen could be reused in the existing Student
Union resulting in a deduction of $4,589.94. Post-bid clarifications also
clarified that another touch screen panel with associated software was
needed in the New Addition resulting in an addition of $3,067.52. ELPS
accepts these two items and it is reflected in the Total Contract Amount.

H Contacted bidder references.

Recommendation Board Motion
To approve Sound Planning Communications of Redford, Michigan
(Multimedia) in the amount of $123,360.36 to be paid with funds
from bond proceeds.
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Bid Review Report

EAST LANSING PUBLIC SCHOOLS -
HIGH SCHOOL ADDITION

TECHNOLOGY BID
Issued: February 18, 2026

Opened: March 4, 2026

Review Date April 13, 2026

Selected Bidders The DataCom Group, Inc.

Contract $57,665.00
Designer Approval Communication By Design

Owner Approval Christian Palasty

IN REVIEW OF BID(S), THE FOLLOWING DUE DILIGENCE WAS PERFORMED:

A Reviewed all bids received for compliance with specifications and contract
provisions.

B Conducted post-bid interview with low bidder on March 5, 2026.

C Evaluated equipment performance.

D Evaluated overall proposed design.

E Equalized bids to ensure adequate comparison.

F Evaluated the ability for the Contractor to complete work within the project
timeline.

G Contacted bidder references.

Recommendation Board Motion
To approve DataCom Group, Inc. of East Lansing, Michigan (Low
Voltage Cabling) in the amount of $34,625.00, (Fiber Optical Cabling)
in the amount of $5,675.00 and (Public Address) in the amount of
$17,365.00 for a combined total of $57,665.00 to be paid with funds
from bond proceeds.
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