
                                     ECTOR COUNTY INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

                                            Bid #12-020  Print Shop Paper Supplies

                                                  7/20/2012 2:00:00 PM Central

                                                     Bid Tabulation per Line

Line Items

Line 1

8 1/2 x 11 - 67# White 

Vellum Bristol

Name QTY Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

WAGNER SUPPLY COMPANY 120 $31.75 $3,810.00

Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 120 $33.72 $4,046.40

QUILL CORPORATION 120 $48.32 $5,798.40

Line 2

8.5 x 11 - 20# Salmon


(Hammermill, G.P., 

Colorsource)

Name QTY Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

WAGNER SUPPLY COMPANY 40 $40.63 $1,625.20

Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 40 $40.95 $1,638.00

QUILL CORPORATION 40 No Bid

Line 3

8.5 x 11 - 20# Pink


(Hammermill, G.P., 

Colorsource)

Name QTY Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

QUILL CORPORATION 20 $38.10 $762.00

WAGNER SUPPLY COMPANY 20 $40.63 $812.60

Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 20 $40.95 $819.00

Line 4

8.5 x 11 - 67# Vellum 

Bristol Blue

Name QTY Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

WAGNER SUPPLY COMPANY 20 $33.54 $670.80

Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 20 $35.64 $712.80

QUILL CORPORATION 20 $54.72 $1,094.40

Line 5

8.5 x 11 - 67# Vellum 

Bristol Orchid

Name QTY Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

WAGNER SUPPLY COMPANY 20 $33.54 $670.80

Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 20 $35.64 $712.80

QUILL CORPORATION 20 No Bid

Line 6

8.5 x 11 - 67# Vellum 

Bristol Yellow

Name QTY Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

WAGNER SUPPLY COMPANY 20 $33.54 $670.80

Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 20 $35.64 $712.80

QUILL CORPORATION 20 $54.72 $1,094.40

Line 7

8.5 x 11 - 67# Vellum 

Bristol Green



Name QTY Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

WAGNER SUPPLY COMPANY 20 $33.54 $670.80

Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 20 $35.64 $712.80

QUILL CORPORATION 20 No Bid

Line 8

8.5 x 11 - 20# 

Green(Hammermill, G.P., 

Colorsource)

Name QTY Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

QUILL CORPORATION 40 $38.10 $1,524.00

WAGNER SUPPLY COMPANY 40 $40.63 $1,625.20

Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 40 $40.95 $1,638.00

Line 9

8.5 x 11 - 20# 

Blue(Hammermill, G.P., 

Colorsource)

Name QTY Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

QUILL CORPORATION 60 $38.10 $2,286.00

WAGNER SUPPLY COMPANY 60 $40.63 $2,437.80

Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 60 $40.95 $2,457.00

Line 10

8.5 x 11 - 65# Cover 

HOTS only


Lipstick

Name QTY Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

QUILL CORPORATION 16 No Bid

WAGNER SUPPLY COMPANY 16 No Bid

Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 16 No Bid

Line 11

8.5 x 11 - 65# Cover 

HOTS only


Lime

Name QTY Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

QUILL CORPORATION 16 No Bid

WAGNER SUPPLY COMPANY 16 No Bid

Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 16 No Bid

Line 12

8.5 x 11 - 65# Cover 

HOTS only


Lemon

Name QTY Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

QUILL CORPORATION 16 No Bid

WAGNER SUPPLY COMPANY 16 No Bid

Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 16 No Bid

Line 13

8.5 x 11 - 65# Cover 

HOTS only


Blue

Name QTY Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

QUILL CORPORATION 16 No Bid

WAGNER SUPPLY COMPANY 16 No Bid

Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 16 No Bid



Line 14

8.5 x 11 - 65# Cover 

HOTS only


Turquoise

Name QTY Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

QUILL CORPORATION 16 No Bid

WAGNER SUPPLY COMPANY 16 No Bid

Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 16 No Bid

Line 15

8.5 x 11 - 65# Cover 

HOTS only


Grape

Name QTY Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

QUILL CORPORATION 16 No Bid

WAGNER SUPPLY COMPANY 16 No Bid

Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 16 No Bid

Line 16

8.5 x 11 - 65# Cover 

HOTS only


Red

Name QTY Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

QUILL CORPORATION 16 No Bid

WAGNER SUPPLY COMPANY 16 No Bid

Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 16 No Bid

Line 17

8.5 x 11 - 65# Cover 

HOTS only


Orange

Name QTY Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

QUILL CORPORATION 16 No Bid

WAGNER SUPPLY COMPANY 16 No Bid

Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 16 No Bid

Line 18

8.5 x 11 - 20# 

Carbonless Reverse


4-Part (NCR or Imation 

only)

Name QTY Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 36 $74.00 $2,664.00

WAGNER SUPPLY COMPANY 36 $89.83 $3,233.88

QUILL CORPORATION 36 No Bid

Line 19

8.5 x 11 - 20# 

Carbonless Reverse


3-Part (NCR or Imation 

only)

Name QTY Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 36 $69.20 $2,491.20

WAGNER SUPPLY COMPANY 36 $84.04 $3,025.44

QUILL CORPORATION 36 No Bid



Line 20

8.5 x 11 - 20# 

Lilac/Orchid


(Hammermill, G.P., 

Colorsource)

Name QTY Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

WAGNER SUPPLY COMPANY 40 $40.63 $1,625.20

Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 40 $40.95 $1,638.00

QUILL CORPORATION 40 No Bid

Line 21

8.5 x 11 - 20# Gray 

(Hammermill, G.P., 

Colorsource)

Name QTY Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

QUILL CORPORATION 40 $38.10 $1,524.00

WAGNER SUPPLY COMPANY 40 $40.63 $1,625.20

Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 40 $40.95 $1,638.00

Line 22

8.5 x 11 - 20# Goldenrod 

(Hammermill, G.P., 

Colorsource)

Name QTY Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

QUILL CORPORATION 40 $38.10 $1,524.00

WAGNER SUPPLY COMPANY 40 $40.63 $1,625.20

Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 40 $40.95 $1,638.00

Line 23

8.5 x 11 - 67# Vellum 

Bristol Pink

Name QTY Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

WAGNER SUPPLY COMPANY 20 $33.54 $670.80

Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 20 $35.64 $712.80

QUILL CORPORATION 20 No Bid

Line 24

8.5 x 11 - 67# Vellum 

Bristol Salmon

Name QTY Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

WAGNER SUPPLY COMPANY 20 $33.54 $670.80

Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 20 $35.64 $712.80

QUILL CORPORATION 20 No Bid

Line 25

8.5 x 11 - 67# Vellum 

Bristol Gray

Name QTY Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

WAGNER SUPPLY COMPANY 20 $33.54 $670.80

Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 20 $35.64 $712.80

QUILL CORPORATION 20 $54.72 $1,094.40

Line 26

8.5 x 11 - 67# Vellum 

Bristol Goldenrod

Name QTY Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

WAGNER SUPPLY COMPANY 20 $33.54 $670.80

Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 20 $35.64 $712.80



QUILL CORPORATION 20 No Bid

Line 27

8.5 x 11 - 60# Text HOTS 

only


Lipstick

Name QTY Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

QUILL CORPORATION 32 No Bid

WAGNER SUPPLY COMPANY 32 No Bid

Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 32 No Bid

Line 28

8.5 x 11 - 60# Text HOTS 

only


Blue

Name QTY Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

QUILL CORPORATION 32 No Bid

WAGNER SUPPLY COMPANY 32 No Bid

Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 32 No Bid

Line 29

8.5 x 11 - 60# Text HOTS 

only


Red

Name QTY Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

QUILL CORPORATION 32 No Bid

WAGNER SUPPLY COMPANY 32 No Bid

Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 32 No Bid

Line 30

8.5 x 11 - 60# Text HOTS 

only


Orange

Name QTY Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

QUILL CORPORATION 32 No Bid

WAGNER SUPPLY COMPANY 32 No Bid

Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 32 No Bid

Line 31

8.5 x 11 - 60# Text HOTS 

only


Lemon

Name QTY Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

QUILL CORPORATION 32 No Bid

WAGNER SUPPLY COMPANY 32 No Bid

Line 32

8.5 x 11 - 60# Text HOTS 

only


Turquoise

Name QTY Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

QUILL CORPORATION 32 No Bid

Line 33

8.5 x 11 - 60# Text HOTS 

only


Lime

Name QTY Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

QUILL CORPORATION 32 No Bid



WAGNER SUPPLY COMPANY 32 No Bid

Line 34

8.5 x 11 - 60# Text HOTS 

only


Grape

Name QTY Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

QUILL CORPORATION 32 No Bid

WAGNER SUPPLY COMPANY 32 No Bid

Line 35

8.5 X 11 - 24# White 25% 

Cotton with 

WATERMARK paper/text

Name QTY Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

QUILL CORPORATION 5 $42.88 $214.40

WAGNER SUPPLY COMPANY 5 $136.03 $680.15

Line 36

2" X 8 5/8" x 11 1/8" 

White Stationary Boxes

Name QTY Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

WAGNER SUPPLY COMPANY 3 $53.36 $160.08

QUILL CORPORATION 3 No Bid

Line 37

4" X 8 5/8" x 11 1/8" 

White Stationary Boxes

Name QTY Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

QUILL CORPORATION 3 No Bid

WAGNER SUPPLY COMPANY 3 No Bid

Line 38 8.5 X 11 Chipboard

Name QTY Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

QUILL CORPORATION 3 No Bid

WAGNER SUPPLY COMPANY 3 No Bid


