
Organization Ector County Independent School District
Bid Request Number Bid #11-05
Title Copy Paper
Open Date 3/9/2011 7:00:00 AM Central
Close Date 4/4/2011 10:00:00 AM Central

Line 1

20# Bond, White, 8?? x 11" A. 
Paper Type: 20 lb. Bond B. 
Grade: No. 4 or better, long 
grain, factory cut C. Brightness: 
83 to 85 D. Caliper: .0041 to 
.0043 E. Opacity: 85 to 88 F. 
Packaging: Five hundred (500) 
sheets per package (ream) in 
moisture-resista

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co.* 5040 cases $25.45 $128,268.00
LIBERTY PAPER AND PRINTING 5040 cases $25.59 $128,973.60
Western Paper Company 5040 cases $25.65 $129,276.00
Xerox 5040 cases $26.95 $135,828.00
Graphic Equipment & Supply 5040 cases $27.50 $138,600.00

Line 2

20# Bond, White, 8?? x 14" A. 
Paper Type: 20 lb. bond B. 
Grade: No. 4 or better, long 
grain, factory cut C. Brightness: 
83 to 85 D. Caliper: .0041 to 
.0043 E. Opacity: 85 to 88 F. 
Packaging: Five hundred (500) 
sheets per package (ream) in 
moisture-resista

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
Xerox* 30 cases $41.30 $1,239.00
Western Paper Company 30 cases $43.14 $1,294.20
Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 30 cases $44.80 $1,344.00
Graphic Equipment & Supply 30 cases $48.85 $1,465.50
LIBERTY PAPER AND PRINTING 30 cases No Bid

Line 3

20# Bond, White, 8?? x 11", 3 
hole punched. A. Paper Type: 20 
lb. Bond B. Grade: No. 4 or 
better, long grain, factory cut C. 
Brightness: 83 to 85 D. Caliper: 
.0041 to .0043 E. Opacity: 85 to 
88 F. Packaging: Five hundred 
(500) sheets per package (ream) 
in

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co.* 20 cases $35.25 $705.00
Graphic Equipment & Supply 20 cases $35.55 $711.00
Western Paper Company 20 cases $36.63 $732.60
Xerox 20 cases $39.65 $793.00



LIBERTY PAPER AND PRINTING 20 cases No Bid

Line 4
 60# Paper - Hots

Lemon color
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
Graphic Equipment & Supply* 32 Cartons $60.65 $1,940.80
Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 32 Cartons $63.40 $2,028.80
Western Paper Company 32 Cartons $66.00 $2,112.00
Xerox 32 Cartons No Bid
LIBERTY PAPER AND PRINTING 32 Cartons No Bid

Line 5
 60# Paper - Hots

Lime color
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
Graphic Equipment & Supply 32 Cartons $60.65 $1,940.80
Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 32 Cartons $63.40 $2,028.80
Western Paper Company 32 Cartons $66.00 $2,112.00
Xerox 32 Cartons No Bid
LIBERTY PAPER AND PRINTING 32 Cartons No Bid

Line 6
 60# Paper - Hots

Blue color
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
Graphic Equipment & Supply* 32 Cartons $60.65 $1,940.80
Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 32 Cartons $63.40 $2,028.80
Western Paper Company 32 Cartons $66.00 $2,112.00
Xerox 32 Cartons No Bid
LIBERTY PAPER AND PRINTING 32 Cartons No Bid

Line 7
 60# Paper - Hots

Orange color
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
Graphic Equipment & Supply* 32 Cartons $60.65 $1,940.80
Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 32 Cartons $63.40 $2,028.80
Western Paper Company 32 Cartons $66.00 $2,112.00
Xerox 32 Cartons No Bid
LIBERTY PAPER AND PRINTING 32 Cartons No Bid

Line 8
8.5 x 11 White - 67# Vellum 
Bristol

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
Graphic Equipment & Supply* 40 Cartons $30.52 $1,220.80
Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 40 Cartons $33.40 $1,336.00
Western Paper Company 40 Cartons $35.62 $1,424.80
Xerox 40 Cartons No Bid
LIBERTY PAPER AND PRINTING 40 Cartons No Bid

Line 9 #10-24 White Regular Envelopes
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
Graphic Equipment & Supply* 36 Cartons $33.13 $1,192.68
Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 36 Cartons $35.12 $1,264.32
Western Paper Company 36 Cartons $37.93 $1,365.48
Xerox 36 Cartons No Bid
LIBERTY PAPER AND PRINTING 36 Cartons No Bid



Line 10

8.5 x 11 - 20# Carbonless 
Reverse 4-Part (NCR or Imation 
only)

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co.* 36 Cartons $66.25 $2,385.00
Western Paper Company 36 Cartons $78.02 $2,808.72
Xerox 36 Cartons $105.63 $3,802.68
Graphic Equipment & Supply 36 Cartons $174.60 $6,285.60
LIBERTY PAPER AND PRINTING 36 Cartons No Bid

Line 11
8.5 x 11 - 24# White 25% Cotton 
with watermark paper

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
Western Paper Company* 5 Cases $95.40 $477.00
Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 5 Cases $96.75 $483.75
Xerox 5 Cases $99.68 $498.40
Graphic Equipment & Supply 5 Cases $100.45 $502.25
LIBERTY PAPER AND PRINTING 5 Cases No Bid

Line 12

11 x 9 90# White Index, 10 
position tabs, Reverse 
Sequence

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
Xerox 5 Cases $49.42 $247.10
Western Paper Company 5 Cases $82.88 $414.40
Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 5 Cases $92.33 $461.65
Graphic Equipment & Supply 5 Cases No Bid
LIBERTY PAPER AND PRINTING 5 Cases No Bid

Line 13 8.5 x 11 Chipboard
Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co.* 5 Cartons $25.94 $129.70
Graphic Equipment & Supply 5 Cartons $27.22 $136.10
Western Paper Company 5 Cartons $53.34 $266.70
Xerox 5 Cartons No Bid
LIBERTY PAPER AND PRINTING 5 Cartons No Bid

Line 14
2" x 8 5/8" White Stationary 
Boxes

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
Graphic Equipment & Supply* 3 Cartons $32.24 $96.72
Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 3 Cartons $33.00 $99.00
Western Paper Company 3 Cartons $58.02 $174.06
Xerox 3 Cartons No Bid
LIBERTY PAPER AND PRINTING 3 Cartons No Bid

Line 15
4" x 8 5/8" X 11 1/8" White 
Stationary Boxes

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
Graphic Equipment & Supply* 3 Cartons $59.97 $179.91
Western Paper Company 3 Cartons $97.59 $292.77
Xerox 3 Cartons No Bid
LIBERTY PAPER AND PRINTING 3 Cartons No Bid
Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co. 3 Cartons No Bid



Line 16

11 x 17 - 54# Cover (HOTS 
 only)

 
Lipstick

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co.* 1 Cartons $56.35 $56.35
Graphic Equipment & Supply 1 Cartons $63.70 $63.70
Western Paper Company 1 Cartons $107.22 $107.22
LIBERTY PAPER AND PRINTING 1 Cartons No Bid

Line 17

11 x 17 - 54# Cover (HOTS 
 only)

 
Blue

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co.* 1 Cartons $56.35 $56.35
Graphic Equipment & Supply 1 Cartons $63.70 $63.70
Western Paper Company 1 Cartons $107.22 $107.22
Xerox 1 Cartons No Bid
LIBERTY PAPER AND PRINTING 1 Cartons No Bid

Line 18

11 x 17 - 54# Cover (HOTS 
 only)

 
Red

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co.* 1 Cartons $56.35 $56.35
Graphic Equipment & Supply 1 Cartons $63.70 $63.70
Western Paper Company 1 Cartons $107.22 $107.22
Xerox 1 Cartons No Bid
LIBERTY PAPER AND PRINTING 1 Cartons No Bid

Line 19

11 x 17 - 54# Cover (HOTS 
 only)

 
Orange

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co.* 1 Cartons $56.35 $56.35
Graphic Equipment & Supply 1 Cartons $63.70 $63.70
Western Paper Company 1 Cartons $107.22 $107.22
Xerox 1 Cartons No Bid
LIBERTY PAPER AND PRINTING 1 Cartons No Bid

Line 20

11 x 17 - 54# Cover (HOTS 
 only)

 
Green lemon

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co.* 1 Cartons $56.35 $56.35
Graphic Equipment & Supply 1 Cartons $63.70 $63.70
Western Paper Company 1 Cartons $107.22 $107.22
Xerox 1 Cartons No Bid
LIBERTY PAPER AND PRINTING 1 Cartons No Bid



Line 21

11 x 17 - 54# Cover (HOTS 
 only)

 
Periwinkle

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co.* 1 Cartons $56.35 $56.35
Graphic Equipment & Supply 1 Cartons $63.70 $63.70
Western Paper Company 1 Cartons $107.22 $107.22
Xerox 1 Cartons No Bid
LIBERTY PAPER AND PRINTING 1 Cartons No Bid

Line 22

11 x 17 - 54# Cover (HOTS 
 only)

 
Turquoise

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co.* 1 Cartons $56.35 $56.35
Western Paper Company 1 Cartons $199.69 $199.69
Xerox 1 Cartons No Bid
LIBERTY PAPER AND PRINTING 1 Cartons No Bid
Graphic Equipment & Supply 1 Cartons No Bid

Line 23

11 x 17 - 54# Cover (HOTS 
 only)

 
Lime

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co.* 1 Cartons $56.35 $56.35
Graphic Equipment & Supply 1 Cartons $63.70 $63.70
Western Paper Company 1 Cartons $107.22 $107.22
Xerox 1 Cartons No Bid
LIBERTY PAPER AND PRINTING 1 Cartons No Bid

Line 24

11 x 17 - 54# Cover (HOTS 
 only)

 
Grape

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification
Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co.* 1 Cartons $56.35 $56.35
Western Paper Company 1 Cartons $199.69 $199.69
Xerox 1 Cartons No Bid
LIBERTY PAPER AND PRINTING 1 Cartons No Bid
Graphic Equipment & Supply 1 Cartons No Bid

*Awarded Vendor


