PROPOSAL TABULATION FORM

Page 1 of 5
PROJECT NO.: 20160208-22
PROJECT NAME: STEPHENVILLE ISD - ROOF REPLACEMENT & ROOF RESTORATION/REPAIR PROJECT
PRE-BID DATE: MONDAY, FEBRUARY 15, 2016, 1:00 P.M. CDT
BID DATE: FRIDAY, MARCH 4, 2016, 2:00 P.M. CDT
0 al g § § o~ s BASE BASE BASE BASE PROPOSAL
% ﬁ 2 Zolgo Z}?)(I\DATI\(I)I:'?I:ETOI(-;I\I- PROPOSALNO.2 - | PROPOSAL NO. 3 - | PROPOSAL NO. 4 - NO.5-
E¥|l2|aZ|a=z CENTRAL ES CENTRAL ES CHAMBERLIN ES | CHAMBERLIN ES
1 o | o fa) BUILDING
BIDDERS < <
AA APPLICATORS N v v N NB NB $220,060.00 NB NB
ANCHOR ROOFING v N v N $190,000.00 $615,000.00 $330,000.00 $815,000.00 $340,000.00
BRI ROOFING v \/ V v NB $597,000.00 $319,000.00 $965,000.00 $412,000.00
CBS ROOFING v v v Y NB NB NB NB NB
J&J ROOFING \/ v v v $214,000.00 $684,000.00 $368,000.00 $1,098,000.00 $465,000.00
HERITAGE ONE v + N v NBS NBS NBS NBS NBS
SLAWSON ROOFING v v $104,350.00 $430,505.00 NBS $798,945.00 NBS
TRI-LAM ROOFING v \l N J $135,550.00 $338,500.00 $220,500.00 $590,500.00 $231,500.00

*1 Bid Proposal withdrawn from AA Applicators. Reference email from Steve Tutt

*NB=No Bid

*NB=No Bid Submitted
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PROJECT NO.: 20160208-22
PROJECT NAME: STEPHENVILLE ISD - ROOF REPLACEMENT & ROOF RESTORATION/REPAIR PROJECT
PRE-BID DATE: MONDAY, FEBRUARY 15, 2016, 1:00 P.M. CDT
BID DATE: FRIDAY, MARCH 4, 2016, 2:00 P.M. CDT
BASE PROPOSAL LUMP SUM
BASE PROPOSAL | BASE PROPOSAL BASE PROPOSAL | BASE PROPOSAL | BASE PROPOSAL NO. 11 - PROPOSAL NO. 1 -
NO. 6 - GILBERT IS NO. 7 - N@) 8 JHOSIAES NO. 9 - NO. 10 - CONCESSION ALL WORK ON ALL
HENDERSON JHS STEPHENVILLE HS | STEPHENVILLE HS | STAND BASEBALL SCHOOL
FIELDS FACILITIES
BIDDERS
AA APPLICATORS $170,100.00 $296,060.00 NBS NBS NBS NB NB
ANCHOR ROOFING $205,000.00 $410,000.00 $520,000.00 $1,200,000.00 $125,000.00 $35,000.00 $4,785,000.00
BRI ROOFING NB NB NB NB NB NB $2,293,000.00
CBS ROOFING $331,500.00 NB $599,940.00 NB NB NB NB
J&J ROOFING $252,000.00 $564,000.00 $614,500.00 NB NB NB NB
HERITAGE ONE NB NB NB $1,138,000.00 $98,700.00 $24,200.00 NB
SLAWSON ROOFING NBS NBS NBS NBS NBS $4,490.00 NBS
TRI-LAM ROOFING NB $366,400.00 NB NB $99,000.00 NB NB

*1 Bid Proposal withdrawn from AA Applicators. Reference email from Steve Tutt

*NB=No Bid

*NB=No Bid Submitted
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PROJECT NO.: 20160208-22
PROJECT NAME: STEPHENVILLE ISD - ROOF REPLACEMENT & ROOF RESTORATION/REPAIR PROJECT
PRE-BID DATE: MONDAY, FEBRUARY 15, 2016, 1:00 P.M. CDT
BID DATE: FRIDAY, MARCH 4, 2016, 2:00 P.M. CDT
REMOVE & REMOVE & REMOVE & REMOVE & ADDITIONAL COST
REPLACE REPLACE REPLACE REPLACE AISEE’TL%TI\? é \?VCI)E?'T REPLACING
DAMAGED STEEL |DAMAGED STEEL| DAMAGED 5/8" DAMAGED DAMAGED LW DAMAGED/ WET ISO
22-GAUGE TYPE | 22-GAUGE TYPE PLYWOOD GYPSUM CONCRETE FILL INSULATION (3"
BIDDERS F B SHEATHING DECKING THICKNESS)
PER SQFT PER SQFT PER SQ FT PER SQFT PERSQFT PER SQFT
AA APPLICATORS $6.40 $6.40 $3.20 $17.50 $17.50 $4.50
ANCHOR ROOFING $6.50 $6.50 $3.50 $24.00 $24.00 $3.50
BRI ROOFING $4.90 $4.90 $1.35 $6.75 $7.50 $2.10
CBS ROOFING $7.25 $7.75 $7.00 $11.00 $11.00 $4.00
J&J ROOFING $8.00 $8.00 $6.00 $8.00 $10.00 $5.00
HERITAGE ONE $8.00 $8.00 $5.00 $20.00 $8.00 $3.50
SLAWSON ROOFING $0.00 $0.00 $1.75 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
TRI-LAM ROOFING $5.25 $5.25 $5.00 $15.00 $9.00 $3.25

*1 Bid Proposal withdrawn from AA Applicators. Reference email from Steve Tutt

*NB=No Bid

*NB=No Bid Submitted
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PROJECT NO.: 20160208-22
PROJECT NAME: STEPHENVILLE ISD - ROOF REPLACEMENT & ROOF RESTORATION/REPAIR PROJECT
PRE-BID DATE: MONDAY, FEBRUARY 15, 2016, 1:00 P.M. CDT
BID DATE: FRIDAY, MARCH 4, 2016, 2:00 P.M. CDT

ADDR'-EI-:DOL’XA&IINCGOST REMOVE & REMOVE & REMOVE & REMOVE & REMOVE & REMOVE &

REPLACE REPLACE REPLACE REPLACE REPLACE REPLACE
DAMAGED/ WET
PERLITE OR WOOD 1x4 1x6 1x8 1x10 1x12 2x4
BIDDERS FIBER (1" THICKNESS) NAILERS NAILERS NAILERS NAILERS NAILERS NAILERS
PER SQFT PERLIN FT PERLIN FT PERLIN FT PER LIN FT PERLIN FT PERLIN FT

AA APPLICATORS $3.00 $2.75 $3.50 $4.45 $5.50 $6.00 $3.50
ANCHOR ROOFING $2.00 $1.75 $2.25 $2.75 $3.25 $3.75 $2.75
BRI ROOFING $1.25 $1.60 $1.90 $2.10 $2.55 $2.90 $3.45
CBS ROOFING $3.00 $2.25 $2.50 $2.75 $3.00 $3.25 $4.25
J&J ROOFING $0.00 $2.50 $2.50 $2.50 $2.75 $3.00 $3.25
HERITAGE ONE $2.50 $1.00 $2.00 $2.25 $2.50 $2.75 $3.00
SLAWSON ROOFING $0.00 $5.00 $5.25 $5.50 $5.75 $6.00 $0.00
TRI-LAM ROOFING $2.00 $1.25 $1.50 $1.75 $2.00 $2.75 $2.60

*1 Bid Proposal withdrawn from AA Applicators. Reference email from Steve Tutt
*NB=No Bid
*NB=No Bid Submitted
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PROJECT NO.: 20160208-22
PROJECT NAME: STEPHENVILLE ISD - ROOF REPLACEMENT & ROOF RESTORATION/REPAIR PROJECT
PRE-BID DATE: MONDAY, FEBRUARY 15, 2016, 1:00 P.M. CDT
BID DATE: FRIDAY, MARCH 4, 2016, 2:00 P.M. CDT
REMOVE & | REMOVE & | REMOVE & | REMOVE & INSTALL INSTALL ARE
REPLACE REPLACE REPLACE REPLACE | ADDITIONAL | ADDITIONAL | MATERIALS
2x6 2x8 2x10 2x12 4" ROOF |4" CAST IRON |BEING USED
NAILERS NAILERS NAILERS NAILERS DRAIN DRAIN LINE [APPROVED/
BIDDERS SPECIFIED?
PERLINFT | PERLINFT | PERLINFT | PERLINFT EACH PER LIN FT YES
AA APPLICATORS $4.40 $5.15 $5.85 $6.35 $2,500.00 $125.00 v
ANCHOR ROOFING $3.25 $3.75 $4.25 $4.75 $2,500.00 $110.00 v
BRI ROOFING $3.90 $4.25 $3.75 $4.90 $1,800.00 $125.00 v
CBS ROOFING $4.50 $5.00 $5.50 $6.00 $1,000.00 $50.00 v
J&J ROOFING $3.50 $3.75 $4.00 $4.50 $2,000.00 $100.00 N
HERITAGE ONE $3.25 $3.50 $3.75 $4.00 $2,500.00 $40.00 v
SLAWSON ROOFING $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 Y
TRI-LAM ROOFING $2.80 $3.00 $3.30 $3.45 $1,800.00 $90.00 \

*1 Bid Proposal withdrawn from AA Applicators. Reference email from Steve Tutt

*NB=No Bid

*NB=No Bid Submitted




