AGENDA ITEM

BOARD OF TRUSTEES
AGENDA
Workshop X Regular Special
(A) Report Only Recognition

Presenter(s):

Briefly describe the subject of the report or recognition presentation.

(B) X Action Item

Presenter(s): ISMAEL MIJARES, DEPUTY SUPERINTENDENT FOR BUSINESS AND FINANCE
LUIS VELEZ, PURCHASING DIRECTOR

Briefly describe the action required.

CONSIDER AND TAKE APPROPRIATE ACTION ON THE REQUEST TO AWARD SEALED PROPOSAL
NO. 170306 FOR OFFICE AND TEACHING SUPPLIES AND THE BOARD DELEGATES THE
SUPERINTENDENT OR DESIGNEE THE AUTHORITY TO MAKE RELATED BUDGETED PURCHASES
OF GOODS OR SERVICES AS PER BOARD POLICY CH.

(C) Funding source: Identify the source of funds if any are required.

BUDGETED FUNDS

(D) Clarification: Explain any question or issues that might be raised regarding
this item.

SEE ATTACHED MEMORANDUM




P EAGLE Pass INDEPENDENT ScHoOL DisTRICT

Hlusted frv Tecellence

To: Mr. Ismael Mijares, Deputy Superintendent for Business and Finance
Digitally signed by Luis A.

. : : : ; Vel

From: Luis A. Vélez, Purchasing Director % Daf:: .
-05'00'

Date: Thursday, June 30, 2016

Subject: Recommendation on Sealed Proposal Number 170306 for Office and

Teaching Supplies

Based on the submitted proposals, the Department of Purchasing recommends
that Sealed Proposal Number 170306 for Office and Teaching Supplies be
awarded in accordance with the specifications and requirements of the
proposal and as per the attached Tabulation Sheet.

If you have any questions or need more information regarding this matter, please
contact me at the purchasing department.

1420 Eipson Roap @ EaGLE Pass, Texas 78852 @ TeL (830) 773-5181 @  WWW.EAGLEPASSISD.NET

F-280

AN EquaL OrrorTuniTy EMPLOYER



EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 170306 - OFFICE AND TEACHING SUPPLIES
TABULATION SHEET

ACCO Brands Pyramid
e Description Estmated USA AFP Industries QST SeRices: M&M Office | Nolans Office School Quill Corp Sejioo] —
No. Quantity Inc. Prodicts Specialty Worldwide

1 | AD45|CHALK, COLORED 250 NO BID s 0.39 NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 0.98| % 0.40| $ 2.58| § 0.31

2 | AD55|COLORS, WATER | 1 NO BID [ 1.55 NO BID NO BID NO BID S 0.59| $ 1.36| $ 0.59 NO BID

3 | A075|CRAYONS, \ 1 NO BID s 3.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID S 2.49 NO BID S 4,69 NO BID

4 | A100|FELT 3 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 4.49 NO BID NO BID S 1.92

5 | A250| MARKERS, WATER 370 NOBID |$S ~_0.83| NOBID NO BID NOBID |$ 0.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID |

6 | A255|MARKERS, WATER 750 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID S 1.19 NO BID S 0.74 NO BID

7 | A374|PAINT, FINGER 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID s 1.49|$ 3.84( & 1.32 NO BID

8 | A375|PAINT, FINGER 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID S 1.49| S 3.84| $ 1.32 NO BID

9 | A376|PAINT, FINGER | 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID S 1.49| $ 3.84| 8 1.32 NO BID
10 | A378|PAINT, FINGER . 1| NOBD NO BID NOBID NOBID | NOBID S - 149|3  3.84|5§ 1.32 NO BID

11 | A379|PAINT, FINGER W 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID | $ 149 % 3.84[ 8§ 132 NOBID

12 | A380|PAINT, FINGER 15 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 149 $ 3.84| % 1.32 NO BID

13 | A383|PAINT, FINGER 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 1.49 NO BID s 1.32 NO BID

14 | A384|PAINT, FINGER 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID S 1.49| $ 3.84| S 1.32 NO BID

15 | A385|PAINT, FINGER 15 NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID | NOBID $ 1.49| NOBID |[$ 1.32 NO BID
16 | A405|PAINT, TEMPERA 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID |§ 1.79| NOBID |$ 158 NOBID

17 | A410|PAINT, TEMPERA 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 1.79 NO BID S 1.58 NO BID

18 | A415|PAINT, TEMPERA 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 5 1.79 NO BID S 1.58 NO BID

19 | A420|PAINT, TEMPERA 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 5 1.79 NO BID S 1.58 NO BID

20 | A425|PAINT, TEMPERA 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 1.79 NO BID S 1.58 NO BID

21 | A430|PAINT, TEMPERA 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID [ 1.79 NO BID S 1.58 NO BID

22 | A435|PAINT, TEMPERA 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 5 1.79 NO BID S 1.58 NO BID

23 | A445|PAINT, TEMPERA | 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID [ 1.79 NO BID s 1.58 NO BID

24 | A450|PAINT, TEMPERA i 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 1.79 NO BID S 1.58 NO BID

25 | A455|PAINT, TEMPERA | 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID [ 1.79 NO BID S 1.58 NO BID

26 | A465|PAINT, TEMPERA ‘ 100 NO BID 5 1.32 NO BID NO BID NO BID (S 1.05 NO BID s 1.06| $ 1.34

27 | A470|PAINT, TEMPERA 80 NO BID 3 1.32 NO BID NO BID NO BID S 1.05 NO BID $ 1.06/ % 1.34

28 | A475|PAINT, TEMPERA 60 NO BID g 1.32 NO BID NO BID NO BID 5 1.05 NO BID $ 1.06| $ 1.34

29 | A480|PAINT, TEMPERA 100 NO BID S 1.32 NO BID NO BID NO BID S 1.05 NO BID S 106/ $ 1.34

30 | A490|PAINT, TEMPERA 150 NO BID S 1.32 NO BID NO BID NO BID 5 1.05 NO BID S 1.06| $ 1.34

31 | A495|PAINT, TEMPERA ; 120 NO BID s 1.32 NO BID NO BID NO BID S 1.05 NO BID S 106 S 1.34

32 | A505|PAINT, TEMPERA 120 NO BID s 1.32 NO BID NO BID NO BID S 1.05 NO BID 5 1.06| $ 1.34

33 | A510|PAINT, TEMPERA 100 NO BID S 1.32 NO BID NO BID NO BID S 1.05 NO BID 3 1.06| 5 1.34

34 | A515|PAINT, TEMPERA 120 NO BID s 1.32 NO BID NO BID NO BID S 1.05 NO BID $ 1.06| $ 1.34

35 | A520|PASTELS, OIL 150 NO BID s 4.82 NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 1.59 NO BID S 1.44| S 2.06

36 | AG40|YARN, RUG 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 2.09 NO BID NO BID [ 0.80

37 | A650|YARN, RUG 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 2.09 NO BID NO BID S 0.80

38 | A660|YARN, RUG 25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 2.09 NO BID NO BID S 0.80

39 | A670|YARN, RUG 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID S 2.09 NO BID NO BID S 0.80

40 | A675|YARN, RUG 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID S 0.80

Please note shaded areas denote recommended product and provider.
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EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 170306 - OFFICE AND TEACHING SUPPLIES
TABULATION SHEET

ACCO Brands Pyramid
ftem Description Estimated USA AFP Industries QlettoEtvices; M&M Office | Nolans Office School Quill Corp AR 2%
No. Quantity Inc. Pt Specialty Worldwide
41 | AGSO|YARN, RUG 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID |5$ 2.09 NO BID NOBID |$ 0.80
42 | A685|YARN, RUG 25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID |3 2.09 NO BID NOBID | 0.80
43 | A695|YARN, RUG 40 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID |3S 2.09 NO BID NOBID |$ 0.80
44 | A700|YARN, RUG 25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID | & 2.09 NO BID NOBID |$ 0.80
45 | T0OO BANDS, RUBBER 1| NOBD | NOBID NOBID | NOBD | NOBD |$ 0.72 NOBID |$ 0.72| NOBID
46 | TOOS|BATTERY, DURACELL 1,700 NOBID |$ 0.81 $ 1.94 NOBID |$ 221| 8 495)8$ 166/ NOBID NO BID
47 | TOO6|BATTERY, DURACELL 2,200 NOBID |$ 0.81] S 1.94 NOBID |$ 221] ¢ 4958 1.66/ $ 0.55 NO BID
48 | TOO7|BATTERY, DURACELL 175 NO BID ) 3.00| S 4,16 NO BID S 4.47| S 7.95| S 3.37 *$1.84 NO BID
49 | TOO8|BATTERY, DURACELL 35 NOBID |$ 3.25| ¢ 4.92 NOBID |$ 4.49 § 7.95] § 3.37 NO BID NO BID
50 | T0O9|BATTERY, DURACELL 200 NOBID |$ 487|$ 256 NOBID |$ 429 % 7.95| ¢ 3.37| *51.48 NO BID
| 51 | T010|BINDER, 3-RING 1 1/2" 55 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID | $ 1.60/ NOBID |
52 | TO11|BINDER, 3-RING 11/2" 90 NOBID |$ 1.48| NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID | $ 1.34] 8 1.44 NO BID
53 | T014/1" BLACK SPIRAL 5]¢ 10.15] $ 16.64 NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID |$ 4.04| $ 8.64 NO BID
54 | T017/5/16" BLACK SPIRAL 5/¢ 2.79 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID |§ 2.69| 8 173 NOBID
55 | T019/1/2" BLACK SPIRAL 18 4265 590/ NOBID | NOBID NO BID NOBID | $ 4048 279] NOBID
56 | T025/BOARD, MARKER 300 NOEBID NO BID NO BID NOBID |$ 471| $ 5.09] 3 463| s 5.66 NOBID
57 | T026|BOARD, SPRAY 200 NO BID $ 1.73 NO BID NO BID NOBID |$ 165 S 1.86| $ 2.28] 8 2.85
58 | T033|BOX, FILE (LEGAL) 200 NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID |$ 3.09] $ 4.29] 3 3.69] § 22.05 NO BID
59 | T035|BOX, FILE (LETTER) 1,200 NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID |$ 175 $ 295 ¢ 1.10] $ 10.58 NO EID
60 | TO40|CARDS, INDEX 500 NOBID |$& 0.27| NOBID NOBID |$ 033 $ 0.34] 8 0.28] $ 0.34| NOBID
61 | TO41|CARDS, INDEX 100 NOBID |$ 0.50/ NOBID NOBID |$ 056/ $ 0.55] $ 0.52] s 0.58 NO BID
62 | T042|CARDS, INDEX 200 NOBID | $ 0.86| NOBID NOBID |$ 095/ $ 0.92] 8 0.80| $ 0.96 NO BID
63 | T043|CARDS, INDEX 75 NOBID |$ 0.27| wNOBID NOBID |$ 033] % 0.34] 3 0.28] § 0.36 NO BID
64 | T044|CARDS, INDEX 5 NOBID |$% 0.50 NO BID NOBID |$ 0.56] $ 0.55] § 0.52] ¢ 0.57 NO BID
65 | T045|CARDS, INDEX 40 NOBID | $ 0.86| NOBID NOBID |$ 0.95| $ 0.92] 8 0.80| $ 0.96 NO BID
66 | T120|CLIPS, BINDER 150 NOBID | $ 2.16| NOBID NOBID |$ 2.40| § 2.40 NOBID |[$ 2.04| NOBID
67 | T121|cLIPS, BINDER 120 NOBID |$ 2.16| NOBID NOBID |$ 2.16| $ 2.28| NOBID |$§ 2.16| NOBID
68 | T122|CLIPS, BINDER 270 NO BID S 0.45 NO BID NO BID S 047| 8 0.39| S 0.77| § 0.38 NO BID
69 | T123|CLIPS, BINDER 250 NOBID | $ 1.11| NOBID NOBID |$ 1.15| 8§ 1.00] $ 218 ¢ 1.01 NO BID
70 | T124|CLIPS, ASSORTED 300 NOBID | $ 2.01| NOBID NO BID NOBID | $ 2.95| 8 0.75] $ 0.83 NO BID
71 | T125|CLIPS, PAPER 1 NOBID | 2.70 NO BID NOBID |$ 1.42] ¢ 1.80| ¢ 2.09] § 1.40] NOBID
72 | T126|CLIPS, PAPER 150 NO BID $ 10.78 NO BID NOBID |$ 430] S 4.00| $ 4.88] % 4.50 NO BID
73 | T127|cLIPS, PAPER 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID *$0.97 3 3.09| $ 6.00] NOBID NO BID NO BID
74 | T128|CRAYONS 130 NOBID | $§ 353 NOBID $ 12.24 NOBID |5 2.82| 8 0.49|§ 2.88| NOBID
75 | T129|CRAYONS 400 NO BID NO BID NO BID *$2.17 NOBID | & 462 NOBID | 468 NOBID
76 | T135|DISPENSER, TAPE 250 NOBID |$ 139 NOBD |S 5.82| $ 2.23| 8 2.04| NOBID $ 0.71 NO BID
77 | T145|ERASER, WHITEBOARD 420 NOBID | $ 086/ NOBD |$ 356 NOBID |38 1.25] ¢ 1.49( § 0.32] s 2.36
78 | T155|ENVELOPES, CLASP 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID g 12.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID
79 | T157|ENVELOPES, CLASP 75 NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID |$ 6.19] S 7.95| $ 7.34| 8 581 NOBID
80 | T158|ENVELOPES, CLASP 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID |$ 5.89| $ 6.29] $ 10.00 | § 6.75| NOBID

Please note shaded areas denote recommended product and provider.
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EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 170306 - OFFICE AND TEACHING SUPPLIES
TABULATION SHEET

ACCO Brands Pyramid
tem Description Eatiates USA AFP Industries g etksenvices, M&M Office | Nolans Office School Quill Corp Schiool S
No. Quantity Inc. preduats Specialty Worldwide
81 | T160|ENVELOPES, CLASP 5 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID S 6.59| $ 7.39| 11.93| § 8.17 NO BID
82 | T165|ENVELOPES, CLASP 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 9.19| § 12.95| § 13.48| % 8.00 NO BID
83 | T170|ENVELOPES, CLASP 25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID S 10.59 | $ 1295 § 14.78 | § 10.70 NO BID
84 | T175|ENVELOPES, WHITE 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID S 6.89| S 7.95| § 11.37| § 7.91 NO BID
85 | T190|ERASER, PENCIL 1 100| NOBID |$ 2.18| NOBID NO BID NOBID | § 429 NOBID |$ 0.80/ NOBID
86 | T195|FASTENER, ROUND 1 NO BID $ 0.58 NO BID NO BID NO BID 5 0.55 NO BID S 0.53 NO BID
87 | T197|FASTENER, PRONG 200 NO BID S 1.34 NO BID NO BID S 1.19( $ 1.69 NO BID NO BID NO BID
88 | T198|FASTENER, PRONG 60 NO BID s 6.47 NO BID NO BID S 1159 | § 8.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID
89 | T200|FILE POCKET, LEGAL 35 NO BID s 5.70 NO BID NO BID 5 6.45| S 5.89( $ 15.75| $ 17.64 NO BID
90 | T205 |FILE POCKET, LETTER - 60| NOBD |$§ 10.81 NO BID NOBID |$  11.25|5$ 10.95| $ 30.25| § 55.45|  NOBID
91 | T225|FILM, LAMINATING 650 | S 43.79| s 15.52 NO BID S 45.07| $ 19.29 | § 17.49| $ 56.76 | $ 23.73 NOBID |
92 | T233|FILM, TRANSPARENCY 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID S 33.96 NO BID S 11.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID
93 | T234|FLAG, POST IT 40 NO BID NO BID NO BID S 31.68| $ 6.19 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
94 | T235|FLAG, TEXAS G NO BID S 20.16 NO BID NO BID NO BID [ 20.95 NO BID $ 20.50 NO BID
| 95 | T237|FLAG, UNITED STATES 25 NOBID |$ 17.64 NO BID s 53.84| NOBID S 17.79 NO BID $ 4855 NOBID
96 | T240|FLAG, UNITED STATES 1 NOBID |3 1.58| NOBID NO BID NOBID |$ 1.00| NOBID $ 86.60| NOBID
97 | T242|FLAG, TEXAS 1 NO BID S 5.47 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
98 | T244|FLAG, TEXAS 1 NO BID S 2.76 NO BID NO BID NO BID S 1.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID
99 | T245|FLAG, UNITED STATES 1 NO BID S 2.33 NO BID NO BID NO BID S 2.79 NO BID 5 2.85 NO BID
100 | T250|FLUID, CORRECTION 30 NO BID NO BID NO BID s 23.76 NO BID S 5.76| S 955 § 11.16 NO BID
| 101 | T289|FOLDERS, FILE 30 NO BID $ 9,53 NO BID NO BID NO BID S 9.38| % 8.41 NO BID NO BID
102 | T290|FOLDERS, FILE 100 NO BID 3 9.38 NO BID NO BID NO BID S 9.23| § 8.41| 8 5.67 NO BID
103 | T291|FOLDERS, FILE 100 NO BID $ 9.38 NO BID NO BID NO BID S 9.23] % 8.41| 8 5.67 NO BID
104 | 7292 |FOLDERS, FILE 1 NO BID S 9.38 NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 9.23| § 8.41| S 5.67 NO BID
105 | T293|FOLDERS, FILE 10 NO BID S 9.38 NO BID NO BID NO BID S 9.23| &% 841( 5 5.67 NO BID
106 | T294|FOLDERS, FILE 20 NO BID S 9,53 NO BID NO BID NO BID S 9.38| % 841|898 5.67 NO BID
107 | T295|FOLDERS, FILE 120 NO BID § 6.73 NO BID NOBID NO BID S 6.89| S 6.37| $ 7.34 NO BID
108 | T300 FOLDERS, FILE 470 NO BID 3 4.66 NO BID NO BID NO BID S 4.89| 53 4.62| S 5.35 NO BID
109 | T301 FOLDERS, FILE (ASST. 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 2029 8 10.53 NO BID NO BID
110 | T302|FOLDERS, FILE 1 NO BID S 10.26 NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 1559 § 8.41| S 6.20 NO BID
111 | T305|FOLDERS, FILE 45 NO BID 3 5.81 NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 5995 473| % 5.94 NO BID
112 | T310|FOLDERS, FILE 75 NO BID s 4.61 NO BID NO BID s 5178 4655 3.87| $ 4.69 NO BID
113 | T311|FOLDERS, FILE 10 NO BID S 8.73 NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 13.95| § 14918 6.54 NO BID
114 | T312|FOLDERS, FILE 20 NO BID 5 7.06 NO BID NO BID NO BID s 6.99( S 5.28| $ 6.88 NO BID
115 | T315|FRAMES, HANGING FILE 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID s 5.39 NO BID S 8.51| S 5.49 NO BID
| 116 | T324|GLUE STICK 650 NO BID S 2.79 NO BID S 15.49| S 6.48| S 7.08| S 8.16| $ 3.00 NO BID
| 117 | T325|GLUE (Gallon) 30 NO BID s 8.04 NO BID S 23.93 NO BID S 7.95| $ 8.97| % 6.87| 8.02
118 | T330|GLUE 280 NO BID $ 5.22 NO BID S 21.36 NO BID S 6.12| $ 7.08| § 13.90 NO BID
119 | T335 HOLDERS, FLAG 1 NO BID s 0.49 NO BID NO BID NO BID s 0.59 NO BID $ 0.43 NO BID
120 | T375|LABELS 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 5 0.79 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Please note shaded areas denote recommended product and provider.
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EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 170306 - OFFICE AND TEACHING SUPPLIES
TABULATION SHEET

ACCO Brands % Pyramid
jtem Description Estimated USA AFP Industries Alerksenvices; M&M Office | Nolans Office School Quill Corp School 203
No. Quantity Inc. Dt Specialty Worldwide
| 121 | T380|LABELS 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID S 0.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID
122 | T385|LABELS 70 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID S 0.79 NO BID NO BID NO BID
123 | T401|LABELS, ADDRESS 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID S 4538 $ 547| S 21.25| § 21.46| § 6.07 NO BID
124 | T402|LABELS, ADDRESS | 30 NO BID NO BID NO BID S 58.77 | S 16.39| $ 28.19| S 28.39| S 31.80 NO BID
| 125 | T403|LABELS, FILING 75 NO BID NOBID NOBID | S 27.62| $ 217| $ 13.00( $ 13.12| & 19.24 NO BID
126 | T404|LABELS, FILING 40 NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID S 217 S 5.99| S 11.95 NO BID NOBID |
127 | T499|MARKERS, DRY ERASE 620 NO BID S 1.16 NO BID S 5.89| % 2.27| S 217| S 311 $ 1.12 NO BID
128 | T500|MARKER, EXTRA FINE | 55 NO BID S 1.71 NO BID NO BID ) 5.04| S 5.03 NO BID S 2.43 NO BID
129 | T505|MARKER, HIGHLIGHTING| 910 NO BID S 1.48 NO BID S 3.96| S 1.47| S 1.55 NO BID S 1.71 NO BID
130 | T506|MARKER, HIGHLIGHTING 1| NOBD |$ 310/ NOBID |$ 7.23 85 2.58| $ 312 NOBID |§ 3.56| NOBID
131 | T507|MARKER, HIGHLIGHTING 120 NO BID S 3.10 NO BID S 7.23| 8 2.58| S 3.12|$ 2.66| $ 3.56 NO BID
132 | TS08|MARKER, 65 NO BID S 3.10 NO BID S 7.23| S 2.58| $ 3.12| S 2.66| S 3.56 NO BID
133 | T509|MARKER, 500 NO BID $ 3.10 NO BID NO BID S 2.58| S 3.12| $ 2.66| S 3.56 NO BID
134 | T510|MARKER, PERMANENT 260 NO BID S 1.88 NO BID NO BID S 528 S 5.28 NO BID ) 2.79 NO BID
| 135 | T515|MARKER, PERMANENT | 1 NOBID |$ 1.88 NOBID | S 12078 528 $ 5.28) NOBID $ 279 NOBID
136 | T516|MARKER, PERMANENT 40 NO BID S 1.88 NO BID NO BID S 5.28| $ 5.28 NO BID ) 2.79 NO BID
137 | T520(MARKER, FINE POINT | 275 NO BID S 1.88 NO BID NO BID S 4928 4918 7.09| $ 7.35 NO BID
138 | T521|MARKER, FINE POINT 50 NO BID S 1.88 NO BID S 5.89| $ 4928 491 S 7.09| $ 7.35 NO BID
| 139 | T522|MARKER, FINE POINT 50 NO BID S 1.88 NO BID NO BID S 492| 5 4.91 NO BID S 7.35 NO BID
140 | T524|MARKER, FINE POINT 60 NO BID 5 1.46 NO BID NO BID S 2298 1.89 NO BID NO BID NO BID
141 | T525 MARKER, CHINA ‘ 10 NO BID 3 2.33 NO BID NO BID NO BID S 429§ 353| S 4.27 NO BID
142 | T531|MARKERS, DRY ERASE 625 NO BID S 2.32 NO BID S 10.94 | $ 4.65|8 4.49| S 13.48 | $ 2.23 NO BID
143 | T535|MARKER, 325 NO BID S 1.20 NO BID S 6.48| S 2.09|$ 239 S 3.04| S 3.58 NO BID
144 | T561|MOISTENER, ENVELOPE | 15 NO BID NO BID NO BID s 2.70 NOBID S 1.39| S 112| S 1.30 NO BID
145 | T565|MOISTENER, FINGERTIP 375 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID S 1.19| S 0.99| S 0.64| $ 0.90 NO BID
146 | T570/NOTEBOOK, SPIRAL 1,250 NO BID S 0.49 NO BID NO BID S 0.51|$ 0.65| S 0.65| § 0.51 NO BID
147 | T571|NOTES, POP-UP 70 NO BID NO BID NO BID S 12.07 | $ 9.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
148 | T572|NOTES, POP-UP 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID S 7.70 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
149 | T573|NOTES, POP-UP 250 NO BID NO BID NO BID s 11.75| § 468| S 5.90 NO BID 5 3.99 NO BID
150 | T574|NOTES, POP-UP 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID S 436| S 9.96| $ 10.11| § 2.85 NO BID
' 151 | T575|NOTES, POP-UP 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID S 6.07| S 4.21| S 4.27| 5 6.28 NO BID
152 | T576(NOTES, POP-UP ‘ 5 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID S 11.65 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
153 | T577|NOTES, POST-IT 250 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID S 099 S 1.13| $ 4.08| S 1.29 NO BID
154 | T578|NOTES, POST-IT | 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID S 229 S 247| S 950 § 2.81 NO BID
155 | T579|NOTES, POST-IT | 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID S 3.12( S 351 $ 12.67 | S 3.99 NO BID
156 | T580|NOTES, POST-IT 35 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID S 7.44| S 8.47| S 10.03 | § 2.51 NO BID
157 | T581|NOTES, POST-IT | 90 NO BID NO BID NO BID *$2.05 S 5778 4.75| S 4.82| S 5.39 NO BID
| 158 | T582|NOTES, POST-IT 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID S 419| S 459§ 4.66| S 5.20 NO BID
159 | 7583 NOTES, POST-IT 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 5 6.67| S 5.95 NO BID S 6.87 NO BID
| 160 | TS584|NOTES, POST-IT 60 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID S 6.51| S 5.93| § 6.02| S 6.72 NO BID
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EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 170306 - OFFICE AND TEACHING SUPPLIES
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ACCO Brands Pyramid
item Description Estimated USA AFP Industries Glegisetvicess M&M Office | Nolans Office School Quill Corp Schoal SR
No. Quantity Inc. Pradicts Specialty Worldwide
; 161 | T589|PAD, LEGAL RULED | 40 NO BID S 5.31 NO BID NO BID S 5.64| S 5.95| S 6.80| S 5.12 NO BID
| 162 | T590|PAD, LEGAL RULED | 1 NO BID S 6.87 NO BID NO BID S 9.00| $ 7.29| § 6.45| $ 7.81 NO BID
| 163 | T592|PAD, LEGAL RULED 1 NO BID S 3.14 NO BID NO BID S 3.24| § 3.89| S 333|S 2.53 NO BID
| 164 | T593|STENO PADS 40 NO BID S 6.78 NO BID NO BID NO BID S 7.19| § 5.56| $§ 8.40 NO BID
' 165 | T640|PENCILS ] 9,000 NOBID |$ 154/ NOBID |$ 3.24| NOBID |$ 1235 124 ~059|$ 153
- 166 | T641|PENCILS, COLORED 2,100 NO BID S 0.71 NO BID S 3.04 NO BID S 1.04| S 153|§ 1.04| S 1.21
167 | T645|PENCILS, PRIMARY 1 NO BID S 1.65 NO BID NO BID NO BID S 2.79 NO BID S 1.58 NO BID
168 | T646|PENCILS, MECHANICAL 50 NO BID S 10.09 NO BID S 2173 | S 10.20| § 10.29| S 9.81 NO BID NO BID
169 | T655|PEN, RETRACTABLE 30 NO BID S 3.58 NO BID NO BID s 3.24| 8§ 3695 4.40| S 4.09 NO BID
170 | T660|PEN, RETRACTABLE | 20 NO BID NO BID NOBID NOBID | NOBID NO BID NOBID NOBID | NOBID
171 | T665|PEN, RETRACTABLE 140 NO BID S 3.58 NO BID NO BID S 324| 8 3695 5.38| 5 4.09 NO BID
172 | T670|PEN, RETRACTABLE 80 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID S 499| S 538 S 6.71 NO BID
173 | T673|PEN, RETRACTABLE 200 NO BID S 3.58 NO BID NO BID S 3.24| § 3.69| 8§ 5.38| §$ 4.09 NO BID
| 174 | T675|PEN, RETRACTABLE 75 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID S 499| S 5.38| S 6.71 NO BID
| 175 | T677|PEN, GEL INK ) 450 | NOBID |$ 10.54| NOBID NOBID |$ 9.72| $ 9.66| $ 9.23| $ 11.81| NOBID
176 | T678|PEN, GEL INK 380 NO BID S 10.54 NO BID NO BID S 9.72| S 9.66| S 9.23| S 11.81 NO BID
177 | T679|PEN, GEL INK 160 NO BID S 10.54 NO BID NO BID S 9.72| § 9.66| S 9.23| $ 11.81 NO BID
178 | T680|PEN, GEL INK 20 NO BID S 10.54 NO BID NO BID S 9.72| S 9.66| S 9.23| S 11.81 NO BID
179 | T681|PEN, GEL INK 80 NO BID S 10.54 NO BID NO BID S 9.72| S 9.66| S 9.23| $ 11.81 NO BID
180 | T685|PEN, ROLLING 70 NO BID S 11.03 NO BID NO BID S 10.20| § 10.35| § 9.90| S 12.84 NO BID
181 | T686|PEN, ROLLING 1 NO BID S 11.03 NO BID NO BID S 10.20| $ 1035 § 990| S 12.84 NO BID
182 | Te87|PEN, ROLLING 5 NO BID S 11.03 NO BID NO BID NO BID S 3.39| $ 9.90| $ 12.84 NO BID
183 | T696|PEN, MICRO POINT 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID S 3.39| S 391| 8§ 5.24 NO BID
184 | T697|PEN, MICRO POINT 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID S 339| S 391|§ 5.24 NO BID
| 185 | T698|PEN, MICRO POINT 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID S 8.23 NO BID S 339 $ 391|5§ 5.24 NO BID
| 186 | T699|PEN, STICK BALL POINT 520 NO BID S 0.84 NO BID S 11.91| S 0.79| S 0.83| S 0.83| S 0.62 NO BID
187 | T700|PEN, STICK BALL POINT 220 NO BID S 0.84 NO BID S 1191 §$ 0.79| $ 0.83| S 0.83] S 0.62 NO BID
188 | T701(PEN, STICK BALL POINT 220 NO BID S 0.84 NO BID S 1191 S 0.79| S 0.83| S 0.83| 5 0.62 NO BID
189 | T706|PINS, PUSH 75 NO BID S 0.67 NO BID S 11.91 NO BID S 0.42| 5 0.48| S 0.46 NO BID
190 | T710|PUNCH, PAPER 130 NO BID S 0.59 NO BID S 1191 NO BID S 0.50| $ 1.20| S 0.50 NO BID
' 191 | T715|PUNCH, TWO HOLE 20 NO BID S 7.39 NO BID S 20.00| S 6.55| S 7.39| $ 7.45| 8 7.68 NO BID
192 | T717|PUNCH, THREE HOLE 175 NO BID S 13.02 NO BID S 20.00| S 1419 | § 1299 $ 12.18 NO BID NO BID
193 | T718|PUNCH, ELECTRIC HOLE | 50 NOBID S 62.84 NO BID *$3.47 S 69.79| S 69.95| S 143.25| § 17.60 NO BID
194 | T722|REINFORCEMENT LABEL 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID S 21.92 NO BID S 0.40/ $ 0.67| 0.50 NO BID
- 195 | T725|REMOVER, STAPLE 10 NO BID S 0.34 NO BID NO BID NO BID S 0.23| ¢ 0358 0.22 NO BID
| 196 | T781 RIBBON, TYPING LIFT- 10 NOBID NO BID NO BID *$8.55 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
197 | T782|RIBBON, TYPING 15 NO BID NO BID NO BID *$8.55 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
198 | T825|RULER, PLASTIC 1,400 NO BID S 0.22 NO BID *58.55 NO BID S 0.14| $ 0.16 *$0.12 NO BID
199 | T830|RULER, WOODEN 1 NO BID S 0.17 NO BID S 1.71 NO BID S 0.16| S 0.17| S 0.15 NO BID
200 | T840|SCISSORS 250 NO BID S 3.41 NO BID *$1.71 NO BID S 6.09 NO BID S 8.16 NO BID

Please note shaded areas denote recommended product and provider.
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EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
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i ACCO Brands Pyramid
l:f: Description E;::T‘:Ed USA  |AFPIndustries| €™ ;Tkes’ M&M Office | Nolans Office Pi::z:; Quill Corp 5:::;;?:,, WO:::nde
| 201 | T848|SHARPENER, ELECTRIC 300/ NOBID |$ 1039 NOBID *$171 | $ 1049 $ 1059 $ 13.69] $ 1631 NOBID
202 | T849|SHARPENER, ELECTRIC 55| NOBID |$ 2019 NOBID NOBID |$ 56.00| $ 91.95| $ 10064 $§ 11600 NOBID
203 | T855|SHARPENER, PENCIL 130| nNoBiD |$ 656 NOBID NO BID NOBID |& 6.19] $ 697 $ 691 NOBID
204 | T860|SHEARS, OFFICE 1,280 | NOBID |$ 181 NOBD |$ 2136 S 157 $ 1.65| $ 158] $ 0.87| NOBID
205 | T870|STAPLER 600| NOBD |$ 312] NOBID “NOBID | 2.99] $ 3.09] $ 4303 564 NOBID
206 | T872|STAPLER, ELECTRIC 35| NOBD |$ 37.22| NoBID | S 3897/ $ 36.65| 3671 $ 3828 $ 4571| NOBID
207 | T873|STAPLES, ELECTRIC 00| nNoBD |3 1.05| NOBID NOBID |$ 111] $ 1.09] $ 1.20] $ 169 NOBID
208 | T875|STAPLES 1,400| NOBD | $ 048] NOBID NOBID |3 0.47| $ 0.48( $ 0.59] $ 0.56| NOBID
209 | T876/STAPLES 1| nNoBD | 1.05| NOBID NO BID NOBID | S 439 1408 0.47| NOBID
| 210 | T880|POWER, STRIP 40| NOBDD | 1534 NOBID NO BID NOBID |$  895|$ 10488 6.35| NOBID
211 | T885|TABS, INDEX 30| NOBID |8 301 NOBID NOBID | NOBID NO BID NOBID | $ 12.90| NOBID
212 | T900|TACKS, THUMB 50| NOBID |S 030 NOBID NO BID NOBID | & 032 NOBID |$ 058 NOBID
213 | T905|TAPE, ADDING 480| NOBID |$ 0.35] NOBID NO BID NOBID |$ 039] NOBID |S 034] NOBID
" 214 | T930|TAPE, CORRECTION 2,400 NOBID |$ 1.46| NOBID *$031 |8 111 $ 139 NOBID | 181 NOBID
215 | T933|TAPE, CORRECTION 5|  NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
216 | T940|TAPE, TRANSPARENT 1,100 | NOBID NO BID NOBID | $ 3339| NOBID |$ 1.10] $ 0.48| ¢ 142] NOBID
217 | T943|TAPE, TRANSPARENT 2,030 | NOBID NO BID NOBID |$  21346| NOBD |$ 132] $ 063 ¢ 192] NOBID
218 | T944|TAPE, MASKING 330| NOBID NO BID NOBID |$ 1674| NOBID |$ 081 $ 11.20] $ 092] NOBID
219 | T945|TAPE, MASKING 630| NOBID NO BID NOBID |$ 293 NOBID |S 1.06] S 1472 8 120| NOBID
220 | T946|TAPE, MASKING 1,600 | NOBID NO BID NO BID *$12.50 NOBID |$ 160 NOBD |3 1.81| NOBID
221 | T950|TAPE, DOUBLE COATED | 70| NOBID NO BID NO BID *$112.41 NOBD |$ 572 NOBD |$ 7.87] NOBID
222 | T955|TAPE, SEALING " 2500| NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID |$ 234§ 269 NOBD |$ 428] NOBID
223 | T960|TAPE, MAGIC 1,610 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID |$ 139] NOBID |$ 215| NOBID
224 | T965|TAPE, MAGIC 300| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID |$ 123 NOBID | S 1.70| NOBID

Proposal Notes:

Prices are per unit cost
* Not bid as specified

Please note shaded areas denote recommended product and provider.
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