
GOVERNING BOARD AGENDA ITEM FORM 

AMPHITHEATER UNIFIED SCHOOL DISTRICT NO. 10 


DATE OF MEETING: April 27, 2010 

TITLE: 	 Award of Contracts for Paper Products for Graphics & Printing Based 
Upon Responses to Request for Bid 09-0073 

BACKGROUND: Request for Bid 09-0073 for paper products was mailed to 
seventeen vendors. Three vendors responded with priced bids. Please see the 
attached spreadsheet. The award recommendation is to Unisource for the 
carbonless forms & boxes and to Spicers Paper for the remaining paper products. 

RECOMMENDATION: The Administration Recommends the Governing Board 
make the determination a single award for paper products is not advantageous to 
the District and approve the Award of Contracts to both Spicers Paper and to 
Unisource based on their responses to Request for Bid 09-0073. 

Scott Little, Chief 
Cl j L ... J Financial Officer 4/19/2010 

INITIATOR:____dh:;t-...;.....-Of-/-------~-~~----__::::__--
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09-0073 Paper Products 

Product Spicers Unisource Xerox Product Spicers Unisource Xerox 
60# Parchment - 8.5xll PerM PerM PerM 65# Astrobright Bright - 8.5xll PerM PerM PerM 
Aqed Brown $19.00 $22.00 No Bid Blue $24.20 $35.00 No Bid 
Antique Gold $19.00 $22.00 No Bid Cobalt Blue $24.20 $35.00 No Bid 
Britannia Blue $19.00 $22.00 No Bid Electric Green $24.20 $35.00 No Bid 
Natural Cream $19.00 $22.00 No Bid Electric Orange $24.20 $35.00 No Bid 
Parche Pink $19.00 $22.00 No Bid Electric Pink $24.20 $35.00 No Bid 
Pewter Gray $19.00 $22.00 No Bid Electric Yellow $24.20 $35.00 No Bid 
Spring Green $19.00 $22.00 No Bid Fuchsia $24.20 $35.00 No Bid 
60# Astrobright Bright - 8.5xll PerM PerM PerM Kelly Green $24.20 $35.00 No Bid 
Blue $12.25 $18.00 No Bid Purple $24.20 $35.00 No Bid 
Cobalt Blue $12.25 $18.00 No Bid Red Vellum $24.20 $35.00 No Bid 
Electric Green $12.25 $18.00 No Bid Solar Yellow $24.20 $35.00 No Bid 
Electric Orange $12.25 $18.00 No Bid Teal $24.20 $35.00 No Bid 
Electric Pink $12.25 $18.00 No Bid 65# Astrobright Bright - llx17 PerM PerM PerM 
Electric Yellow $12.25 $18.00 No Bid Blue $50.50 $70.00 No Bid 
Fuchsia $12.25 $18.00 No Bid Cobalt Blue $50.50 $70.00 No Bid 
Kelly Green $12.25 $18.00 No Bid Electric Green $50.50 $70.00 No Bid 
Purple $12.25 $18.00 No Bid Electric Orange $50.50 $70.00 No Bid 
Red Vellum $12.25 $18.00 No Bid Electric Pink $50.50 $70.00 No Bid 
Solar Yellow $12.25 $18.00 No Bid Electric Yellow $50.50 $70.00 No Bid 
Teal $12.25 $18.00 No Bid Fuchsia $50.50 $70.00 No Bid 
60# Astrobright Bright - llx17 PerM PerM PerM Kelly Green $50.50 $70.00 No Bid 
Blue $25.50 $35.00 No Bid Purple $50.50 $70.00 No Bid 
Cobalt Blue $25.50 $35.00 No Bid Red Vellum $50.50 $70.00 No Bid . 
Electric Green $25.50 $35.00 No Bid Solar Yellow $50.50 $70.00 NoBid ' 
Electric Orange $25.50 $35.00 No Bid Teal $50.50 $70.00 No Bid 
Electric Pink $25.50 $35.00 No Bid Other - 8.5xll PerM PerM PerM 
Electric Yellow $25.50 $35.00 No Bid 24# Passport Writing RoseQuartz $95.00 No Bid No Bid 
Fuchsia $25.50 $35.00 No Bid 80# Passport Cover Rose Quartz $91.10 No Bid No Bid 
Kelly Green $25.50 $35.00 No Bid MacTac White - 3 Scored $214.00 No Bid No Bid 
Purple $25.50 $35.00 No Bid MacTac Passion Pink - 3 scored $446.00 No Bid No Bid 
Red Vellum $25.50 $35.00 No Bid MacTac Limelight - 3 scored $446.00 No Bid No Bid 
Solar Yellow $25.50 $35.00 No Bid MacTac Marquis Green - 3 scored $446.00 No Bid No Bid 
Teal $25.50 $35.00 No Bid MacTac Vaudeville Orange- 3 scored $446.00 No Bid No Bid 
ICarbonless Per Case Per Case Per Case MacTac Burlesque Red - 3 Scored $446.00 No Bid No Bid 
4 Part Forward Digital $115.85 $72.20 $109.30 Boxes Bundle Bundle Bundle 

3 Part Forward Digital $110.40 $66.20 $97.40 

200# Test RSC Corrugated carton 
Brown Kraft 
11-1/4" X 8-3/4" X 6/1 $9.30 $8.50 No Bid 

2 Part-'::Qrward Digital - ... $106.70 $57.80 $93.80 

200# fest RsC Corrugated carton 
Brown Kraft 
11-1/41f X 8-3/4/~X 12" $13.25 $4.50 No Bid 
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