Bids were received from 4 bidders for campus and building signage as
part of the construction project. Joe Prom and I recommend
accepting the bid from Sign Art of Mendota Heights in the amount
0of $102,105.



ICS CONSULTING, INC

August 1, 2014

Mr. Joe Prom

Becker Public Schools

Independent School District No. 726
12000 Hancock Street

Becker, MN 55308

Re: ICS Project No. 5046, BP-6
Becker Public Schools — Way Finding and Building Signage Project
Becker, Minnesota

Dear Mr. Prom:
ICS Consulting, Inc. has reviewed the bids that were received on Thursday, July 31%, 2014 for the

above referenced project. Our recommendations for award of these bids and alternates are as
follows:

Base Bid:

Signart Co., Inc. — Total Base Bid Amount: $ 100,556.00
Alternate No. 8:

Add Pictogram $ 409.00
Alternate No. 9:

Add Pictogram (Qty. 3) $ 1,140.00
Total accepted bid amount: $102,105.00

Attached is a copy of the official bid tabulation for the above-referenced bid division for your
use. Please contact us if you should have any questions regarding these recommendations.

Regards,

e

Ryan Hoffman
Program Manager

Cc: File

Becker Public Schools
Way Finding and Building Signage



Becker Public Schools BID TABULATIONS
Way Finding and Building Sighage July 31, 2014 @ 2:00 p.m.
OWNER: ISD #726 - Becker Public Schools

OWNER'S REPRESENTATIVE: ICS Consulting, Inc.

DESIGNER: Visual Communications Single Prime
BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER
Signart Co., Inc. Scenic S!gn Archetype Serigraphics Sign
2170 Dodd Road Corporation 9635 Gi Systems, Inc.
X irard Ave. S.
Mendota Heights, MN 828 S. 5th Street Mi ) 2401 Nevada Ave. N.
. inneapolis, MN 55431 " .
55120 Sauk Rapids, MN 56379 Jennifer Kruse Minneapolis, MN 55427
Kevin Snyder Daryl Kirt T: 952-641-9600 William Enright
T: 651-357-1123 T: 320-252-9400 ) T: 763-270-3323
BID SECURITY Check Check Bond Bond
ADDENDA REC'D. 1 & 2 noted only Yes Yes Yes
BASE BID $100,556.00 $117,727.00 $146,899.00 $137,600.00
Item Description Alternate Bid Add/Dedcut Add/Deduct Add/Deduct Add/Deduct

Individual Acrylic
Letters, 10"h, Accent
5 Bar $2,528.00 ($528.00) No bid $3,275.00 ($475.00) $2,414.00 $96.00

Individual Acrylic
Letters, 9"h, Accent
6 Bar $2,324.00 ($528.00) No bid $4,210.00 ($262.00) $2,196.00 $75.00

Individual Acrylic
Letters, 14"h, Accent

8-1 Bar $2,567.00 ($244.00) No bid $3,075.00 ($340.00) $2,714.00 $171.00
8-2 3'-0" Pictogram Disc $409.00 $409.00 No bid $615.00 $615.00 $538.00 $538.00
9 3'0" Pictogram Disc $1,140.00 $1,140.00 No bid $1,840.00 $1,840.00 $1,614.00 $1,614.00

Individual Acrylic
11 Letters, 8.5"h $1,604.00 ($528.00) No bid $2,380.00 ($270.00) $1,521.00 ($290.00)

Individual Acrylic
Letters, 10"h, Accent

12 Bar $1,556.00 ($396.00) No bid $3,120.00 ($300.00) $2,434.00 $460.00
Individual Acrylic

13 Letters, 10.5"h $2,206.00 ($396.00) No bid $3,320.00 $770.00 $10,212.00 ($32.00)
Individual Acrylic

14 Letters, 10"h $1,899.00 ($463.00) No bid $3,225.00 ($227.00) $1,974.00 $81.00
Individual Acrylic

15 Letters, 21"h $3,982.00 ($236.00) No bid $5,305.00 ($230.00) $4,107.00 $872.00
Non-llluminated Map

16 Kiosk (4-sided) $7,260.00 ($1,392.00) $7,485.00 ($1,500.00) $12,500.00 ($1,400.00) $14,281.00 ($3,796.00)
Non-llluminated Map

17 Kiosk (2-sided) $3,310.00 ($640.00) $4,425.00 ($670.00) $7,200.00 ($1,050.00) $5,076.00 ($1,277.00)

18 Vinyl Letters $362.00 ($212.00) $295.00 ($200.00) $225.00 ($265.00) $117.00 ($588.00)
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