DETAILED BID RESPONSES ALL VENDORS

ITEM DESCRIPTION

#1 28" WALK BEHIND AUTOMATIC SCRUBBERS TOMCAT 28" Orbital | PACIFIC 28" Orbital
(13) 85,415.72
COST $57,600.00 (8) 54,315.60
#2 32" WALK BEHIND AUTOMATIC SCRUBBERS TASKI32" DISC TOMCAT 32" Orbital
COST $46,200.00 $38,600.00 NO BID
#3 20" STAND ON RIDERS MINUTEMAN 21" TORNADO 28" WINDSOR 20"* [~ " TASKI 30"
COST $76,800.00 $23,865.00 $14,724.42 S $380000
#4 18" SELF CONTAINED CARPET EXTRACTOR POWERFLITE 18" ADVANCE 18" TASKI 18" TASKI 18"
COST $11,560.00 $20,640.48 $21,120.00 $21,120.00

ltems where 24v battery not met

Iterr'l’# 3 does nbt
meet specification due

to 36 volt battery
ltems.where orbital scrubber specifications item #2 has disc
not met scrubber
Items where equipment was tested or reviewed ltem #4 not
and did not meet commercial grade construction recommended
Equal Opportunity Statement X X X X X X
Affidavit of Compliance- Iran Economic Sanctig X X X X X X
Familial Disclosure statement X X X X X X
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DETAILED BID RESPONSES

ALL VENDORS

ITEM DESCRIPTION
#1 28" WALK BEHIND AUTOMATIC SCRUBBERS CLARK 28" Orbital ADVANCE REV -Orbital
COST $58,712.00 $72,240.08
#2 32" WALK BEHIND AUTOMATIC SCRUBBERS CLARKE 32" Orbital
COST $39,245,00
#3 20" STAND ON RIDERS MINUTEMAN 21" WINDSOR 20" * ADVANCE 20" ADVANCE 20"
: SITDOWN
COST $17,685.00 $15,083.40 $16,563.00 - $16,476.96
#4 18" SELF CONTAINED CARPET EXTRACTOR WINDSOR 1 8" | ADVANCE 18"
COST $16,910.48 $21,781.92

*item # 3 does not

Iterns where 24v battery not met meet specification
due to 36 volt battery

ltems where orbital scrubber specifications
not met
items where equipment was tested or reviewed
and did not meet commercial grade construction
Equal Opportunity Statement X X X X X
Affidavit of Compliance- Iran Economic Sanctig X X X X X
Familial Disclosure statement X X X X X
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DETAILED BID RESPONSES ALL VENDORS

ITEM DESCRIPTION

#1 28" WALK BEHIND AUTOMATIC SCRUBBERS VIPER 28" Disc CLARK 28" Orbital | CLARK 28" Orbital
COST $36,839.12 $63,020.00 $65,944.00
#2 ~ |32" WALK BEHIND AUTOMATIC SCRUBBERS *VIPER DISC “| CLARK 30" Orbital VIPER 32" Disc . KARCHER 32" DISC
COST $30,206.78 $42,990.00 $29,110.00 $45,125.00
#3 20" STAND ON RIDERS ADVANCE 20" ADVANCE 20" KARCHER
) 18" WALK BEHIND
COST $16,476.96 $20,700.00 NO BID $10,854.00
#4 18" SELF CONTAINED CARPET EXTRACTOR VIPER 18" CLARKE 18" CLARK 18"
$8,629.60 $17,311.20 $16,816.00
. *ltem # 2 does not
ltems where 24v battery not met meet specification due
: to 36 volt battery
ltems where orbital scrubber specifications ltem #1 has disc _ltem #2 has disc Vtem #2 has disc scrubber
not met scrubber ‘ ‘scrubber
Items where equipment was tested or reviewed ltem #4 not
and did not meet commercial grade construction recommended not
Equal Opportunity Statement X X X X X
Affidavit of Compliance- Iran Economic Sancti X X X X X
Familial Disclosure statement X X X X X
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SUMMARY OF VENDOR RESPONSES THAT MEET BID SPECIFICATIONS

ITEM

#1

28" WALK BEHIND
AUTOMATIC
SCRUBBERS

TOMCAT 28" Orbital

PACIFIC 28" Orbital

(13) 85,415.72

COST

$57,600.00

(8) 54,315.60

CLARK 28" Orbital

$58,712.00

#2

32" WALK BEHIND
AUTOMATIC
SCRUBBERS

TOMCAT 32" Orbital

COST

$38,600.00

NO BID

CLARKE 32" Orbital

$39,245.00

#3

20" STAND ON
RIDERS

MINUTEMAN 21"

ADVANCE 20"

TORNADO 28"

COST

$16,800.00

$23,865.00

NO BID

$16,563.00

#4

18" SELF
CONTAINED
CARPET
EXTRACTOR

ADVANCE 18"

TASKI 18"

TASKI 18"

WINDSOR 18"

JCOST

$20,640.48

$21,120.00

$21,120.00

$16,910.48
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SUMMARY OF VENDOR RESPONSES THAT MEET BID SPECIFICATIONS

ITEM

28" WALK BEHIND

AUTOMATIC
#1 SCRUBBERS ADVANCE REV -Orbital CLARK 28" Orbital | CLARK 28" Orbital
CosT §72.040.08 $63,020.00 $65,944 .00
32" WALK BEHIND
AUTOMATIC
#2 SCRUBBERS CLARK 32" Orbital | CLARK 30" Orbital
COST $25.174.86 $47.690.00
20" STAND ON
#3 RIDERS ADVANCE 20" ADVANCE 20"|  ADVANCE 20" KARCHER
' 18" WALK BEHIND
COSsT $16,476.96 $16,476.96 $20,700.00 NO BID $10.654.00
18" SELF
CONTAINED
CARPET
#4 EXTRACTOR ADVANCE 18" CLARKE 18" CLARK 18"
COST $27.781.92 $17.317.20 $16,876.00
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