FOREST LAKE AREA SCHOOLS
FOREST LAKE, MN 55025

May 31, 2012

AGENDA ITEM: 9.8

TOPIC: RECOMMENDATION FOR AWARD OF PAPER SUPPLY BID

BACKGROUND: To comply with the bid law and to obtain the best
possible pricing, the District annually solicits sealed bids for paper supplies.
Permission to go out for bid was received from the School Board on March
29, 2012.

PROCESS: A bid announcement was published in the Forest Lake Times
on April 12 and 19, 2012. The bid opening occurred on May 17, 2012 at
10:00 a.m. in the Board Room at the District Office. Eighteen companies
were sent bid specifications, eight companies returned bids. Bids were
analyzed and Board approval is being requested. The budget for the bids
was $90,000. A copy of the bid tabulation is attached.

RECOMMENDATION: The administration recommends that the School
Board approve the following award of the paper bid for 2012-2013.

C. J. Duffey $ 73,998.95
Pyramid School Products $ 9,244.59
Wilcox Paper $ 102.30

TOTAL $ 83,345.84




FOREST LAKE AREA SCHOOLS
Forest Lake, MN 55025

May 17, 2012
PAPER SUPPLIES
2012 - 2013
Iitem/s Supplier Amount

1 Pyramid School Products $ 332.50
2-4 Pyramid School Products $ 1,208.20
5 Pyramid School Products $ 438.75
6-34 Pyramid School Products $ 4,985.00
35-38 Pyramid School Products $ 129.00
39-47 C. J. Duffey $ 20,480.40
48-49 C. J. Duffey $ 50,820.00
50 Not Bid $ .
51 Not Bid $ -
52-62 Pyramid School Products $ 481.54
63-66 Pyramid School Products $ 1,241.60
67 Pyramid School Products $ 428.00
68-76 C. J. Duffey $ 2,698.55
77-79 Wilcox Paper $ 102.30

TOTAL $ 83,345.84

C. J. Duffey $ 73,998.95

Pyramid School Products $ 9,244.59

Wiicox Paper $ 102.30

TOTAL $ 83,345.84

2012/BIDSHT



INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT #831
Forest Lake, MN 55025

May 17, 2012
NOTE: Recommended award in Gray
PAPER SUPPLIES
2012 - 2013
* CPG - Contract Paper C. J. Duffey ** Pyramid School *** School Speciaity *+** Standard Stationery
Group Paper Company Products Suppiy Co.
NUMBER UNIT EXTENDED (| UNIT | EXTENDED | UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT | EXTENDED
ITEM DESCRIPTION COLOR | SPEC| REQUESTED || PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1.|Envelopes #10, Plain, 500 Per Box, 5 Box Per Cs. White 50 I Boxes No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 665|% 33250 $ 7321% 366.00[|$ 662]% 331.00
GQualtty
LUMP SUM BID ITEM 1 No Bid No Bid Ampad | $ 332.50 $ 366.00 [park $ 331.00
#63, 6-1/2 x 9-1/2, 28 Ib. Stock,
2.]Envelopes, Clasp 100 Per Box, 10 Boxes Per Case Manila 30 Boxes }| No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 483|% 144.90 || § 5191]% 155.70||$ 4.81|$ 144.30
#90, 9 x 12, 28 Ib. Stack,
3.|Envelopes, Clasp 100 Per Box, 5 Boxes Per Case Manila 100 Boxes No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 517(9% 517.00 | $ 594|8% 594.00[{$ 5.14]$ 514.00
#97, 10 x 13, 28 [b. Stock,
4.|Envelopes, Ciasp 100 Per Box, 5 Boxes Per Case Manila 90 Boxes || No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 607]% 546.30 || $ 744 1% 669.60|$ 604|$ 543.60
Quality
LUMP SUM BID ITEMS 2 - 4 No Bid No Bid Ampad | $ 1,208.20 $ 1,419.30 |park $ 1,201.90
5.|Paper, Blanks, Piain 6 Ply, 22 x 28, 100 Sht Per Package White | 25 | Pkg No Bid No Bid $ 17.55| % 438.75 || $ 20.90 522.50 No Bid
LUMP SUM BID ITEM 5 No Bid No Bid *APC $ 438.75 $ 5§22.50 No Bid
9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre,
6.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case Black 5 Cases No Bid No Bid $ 2514 | % 125.70[|$ 2450 | $ 12250l $ 2950 $ 147.50||$ 24.89|$ 124.45
9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre,
7.JPaper, Construction 50 Shests Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case Blue 0 Cases | No Bid No Bid $2351]9 - Ui% - 13 - s - 18 o No Bid
9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre,
8.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case Dark Blue 5 Cases || No Bid No Bid $ 2514 | $ 125.70 1 $ 2450 | $ 12250 | $ 3050 $ 152.50(|$ 24.89 | % 124.45
9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre,
9.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheels Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case | Light Blue 0 Cases | No Bid No Bid $ 23519 -IIs - |s - I8 - 18 - 18 - I$ o
9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre,
10.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case Brown 10 Cases |l No Bid No Bid $ 25.14 | % 2514016 2450 | $ 245.00 1| $ 3050 % 305.00)|$ 24.89]% 248.90
9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre,
11.]Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case Gray 0 Cases || No Bid No Bid $2351|$ - s - |s$ - |s - 18 - $ - |8 o
9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre, Brilliant
12.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case Green 15 Cases No Bid No Bid $ 2351 |8 35265l $ 22.50 | 337501 $ 28.00 | $ 420.00(1$ 23.04]% 345.60
9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre,
13.]|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case | Dark Green 5 Cases || No Bid No Bid $ 27181 % 135.90|$ 2650 | $ 132501 $ 3250 % 162.50 |$ 26.98 | $ 134.90
9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre,
14.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case Orange 10 Cases || No Bid No Bid $ 27181 % 27180 $ 26.50 | $ 265.00 | $ 3250 ($ 325.00||$ 26981 $ 269.80
9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre,
15.]|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case Pink 0 Cases No Bid No Bid $ 2351|% - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ -
9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre,
16.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case Scarlet 10 Cases No Bid No Bid $ 2718 $ 271.80{|$ 26.50 | $ 265.00 | $ 3250 | $ 325.00[|$ 26981 $ 269.80
9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre,
17.]Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case Violet 10 Cases No Bid No Bid $ 2351 (% 235.10|$ 2250 | $ 225001 $ 28.00{ $ 280.00($ 23.041]% 230.40
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NOTE: Recommended award in Gray

Unisource Wilcox Paper XEROX
UNIT EXTENDED || UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1.|Envelopes #10, Plain, 500 Per Box, 5 Box Per Cs. No Bid $ 3595|$% 1,797.50 No Bid
HLUMP SUM BID ITEM 1 No Bid $ 1,797.50 No Bid
#63, 6-1/2 x 9-1/2, 28 lb. Stock,
2.|Envelopes, Clasp 100 Per Box, 10 Boxes Per Case No Bid No Bid No Bid
#90, 9 x 12, 28 tb. Stock,
3.|Envelopes, Clasp 100 Per Box, 5 Boxes Per Case No Bid No Bid No Bid
#97, 10 x 13, 28 Ib. Stock,
4 |Envelopes, Clasp 100 Per Box, 5 Boxes Per Case No Bid No Bid No Bid
LUMP SUM BID ITEMS 2 -4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
5.|Paper, Blanks, Plain 6 Ply, 22 x 28, 100 Sht Per Package No Bid No Bid No Bid
LUMP SUM BID ITEM 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid
9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre,
6.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case No Bid No Bid No Bid
9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre,
7.{Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case No Bid No Bid No Bld
9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre,
8.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case No Bid No Bid No Bid
9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre,
9.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case No Bid No Bid No Bid
9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre,
10.]Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case No Bid No Bid No Bid
9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre,
11.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case No Bid No Bid No Bid
9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre,
12.{Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case No Bid No Bid No Bid
9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre,
13.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case No Bid No Bid No Bid
9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre,
14.}Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case No Bid No Bid No Bid
9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre,
15.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case No Bid No Bid No Bid
9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre,
16.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case No Bid No Bid No Bid
9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre,
17.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case No Bid No Bid No Bid
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* CPG - Contract Paper C. J. Duffey ** Pyramid Schootl “** School Speciaity +++* Standard Stationery
Group Paper Company Products Supply Co.
NUMBER UNIT EXTENDED || UNIT | EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT | EXTENDED
ITEM DESCRIPTION COLOR | SPEC| REQUESTED PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre, Bright
18.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case White 0 Cases || No Bid No Bid $ 27.69 s 1 - 19 - 1Is e K - 18 - |s 2
9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre,
19.{Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case Yellow 10 Cases No Bid No Bid $ 23.51 235.10 || $ 2250 | $ 225.00 | $ 2750 | $ 275.00)|$ 23.04 | $ 230.40
12 x 18, Groundwood Fibre,
20.]Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case Black 15 Cases No Bid No Bid $ 24.60 369.00 | $ 24.00 | $ 360.00 || $ 29.00 | $ 435.004|$ 2459 % 368.85
12 x 18 Groundwood Fibre,
21.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case Blue 0 Cases No Bid No Bid $ 22.72 - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ -
12 x 18 Groundwood Fibre,
22.{Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case Dark Blue 10 Cases || No Bid No Bid $ 24.60 246.001$ 24.00] $ 24000 $ 29.00 | $ 290.00[1$ 2459|% 245.90
12 x 18 Groundwoad Fibre,
23.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case Light Blue 10 Cases || No Bid No Bid $ 22.72 227.20[i$ 22.00| $ 220.00{ $ 26.50 | $ 265.00||$ 22.49|$% 224.90
12 x 18 Groundwood Fibre,
24.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case Brown 10 Cases J{ No Bid No Bid $ 24.60 246.00|$ 24001 $ 240.00 /| $ 29.00 | 290.00[|$ 2458 |8 245.90
12 x 18 Groundwood Fibre,
25.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case | Dark Brown 0 Cases || No Bid No Bid $ 26.90 - 115 - s - Is - |3 - - 18 S
12 x 18 Groundwoad Fibre,
26.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case Gray 0 Cases No Bid No Bid $ 22.72 - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ -
12 x 18 Groundwood Fibre, Brilliant
27.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg,25 Pkgs Per Case Green 15 Cases No Bid No Bid $ 22.72 34080l $ 22.25| $ 333.75(| $ 2650 $ 397.50||$ 22.49|$ 337.35
12 x 18 Groundwoad Fibre,
28.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case Orange 0 Cases || No Bid No Bid $ 26.90 - $ - |$ - s - |8 - s - 18 -
12 x 18 Groundwood Fibre,
29.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case Pink 0 Cases__|| No Bid No Bid $ 22.72 - Is - 1s - I8 - |8 -5 - 13 -
12 x 18 Groundwood Fibre,
30.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case Red 0 Cases No Bid No Bid $ 30.21 - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ -
12 x 18 Groundwood Fibre,
31.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case Scarlet 5 Cases || No Bid No Bid $ 26.90 13450||$ 26251 $ 131.25|| $ 33.001 % 165.00(1|$ 27.18| $ 135.90
12 x 18 Groundwood Fibre,
32.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case Violet 0 Cases No Bid No Bid $ 22.72 - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ -
12 x 18 Groundwood Fibre, Bright
33.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case White 50 Cases No Bid No Bid $ 26.59 1,329.50 1% 26.00 | $ 1,300.00 || $ 30.00 | % 1,500.00(($ 26.93] % 1,346.50
12 x 18 Groundwood Fibre,
34.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case Yellow 10 Cases _|{ No Bid No Bid $ 22.72 227.20 | $ 22.00] $ 220.00 | $ 26.50 | $ 265.00]|$ 22.491% 224.90
LUMP SUM BID ITEMS 6 - 34 NO BID 512535| AFC |s 4,985.00 $ 6,000.00 APC|$S  5108.90

BIDSHT
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Unisource Wilcox Paper XEROX
UNIT EXTENDED || UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre,
18.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case No Bid No Bid No Bid
9 x 12, Groundwood Fibre,
19.]Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 50 Pkgs Per Case No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 x 18, Groundwood Fibre,
20.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 x 18 Groundwood Fibre,
21.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 x 18 Groundwood Fibre,
22.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 x 18 Groundwood Fibre,
23.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 x 18 Groundwood Fibre,
24.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 x 18 Groundwood Fibre,
25.}Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 x 18 Groundwood Fibre,
26.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 x 18 Groundwood Fibre,
27.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg,25 Pkgs Per Case No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 x 18 Groundwood Fibre,
28.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 x 18 Groundwood Fibre,
28.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 x 18 Groundwood Fibre,
30.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 x 18 Groundwood Fibre,
31.|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 x 18 Groundwood Fibre,
32.]Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 x 18 Groundwood Fibre,
33.]|Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 x 18 Groundwood Fibre,
34.{Paper, Construction 50 Sheets Per Pkg, 25 Pkgs Per Case No Bid No Bid No Bid
LUMP SUM BID ITEMS 6 - 34 No bid No bid No Bid
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* CPG - Contract Paper C. J. Duffey ** Pyramid School *** School Speclaity *++ Standard Stationery
Group Paper Company Products Supply Co.
NUMBER UNIT EXTENDED || UNIT | EXTENDED || UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT | EXTENDED
ITEM DESCRIPTION COLOR | SPEC| REQUESTED || PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
35.|Paper, Drawing 9 x 12, 8 Rms Per Case, 50 Ib. Manila 0 Cases__|| No Bid No Bid $ 2643 |% - I - 19 - 18 - 18 = $ =
36.|Paper, Drawing 12 x 18, 4 Rms Per Case, 50 Ib. Manila 5 Cases || No Bid No Bid $ 26421 8% 132.10||$ 2580 | $ 129.00{ $ 30.20 | $ 151.00[|$ 2629 |$ 131.45
37.|Paper, Drawing 9 x 12, 8 Rms Per Case, 50 Ib. White 0 Cases || No Bid No Bid $3299|8% - - 19 - IS - 18 - I - 18 S
38.|Paper, Drawing 12 x 18, 4 Rms Per Case, 50 (b. White 0 Cases || No Bid No Bid $3299|$% - s - $ - s - 18 - s _ - 18 -
LUMP SUM BID ITEMS 35-38 NO BID $ 132.10}} “APC | 8 129.00 $ 151.00 || APC $ 131.45
39 - 46 PAPER, PREMIUM NUMBER 4, MiLL BRAND, XEROGRAPHIC
See Instructions to Bidders for Specifications.
39.|Paper, As Per Spec 8-1/2 x 11, 20 Ib., 10 Rms Per Case Blue 120 Cases [|$ 3223|$% 3,867.60 1 $ 31.66 | $ 3,799.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid
40.1Paper, As Per Spec 8-1/2 x 11, 20 |b., 10 Rms Per Case Canary 120 Cases ||$ 3223|$% 3,867.60||$ 3166 |$ 3,799.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid
41.|Paper, As Per Spec 8-1/2 x 11, 20 |b., 10 Rms Per Case Gold 80 Cases $ 3223|$% 2,578.40(|$ 3166 | % 2,532.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid
42.]Paper, As Per Spec 8-1/2 x 11, 20 Ib., 10 Rms Per Case Green 80 Cases $ 3223|% 2,578.40 | $ 31.66 | $ 2,532.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid
43.|Paper, As Per Spec 8-1/2 x 11, 20 Ib., 10 Rms Per Case Pink 40 Cases |$§ 32238 1,280.20|$ 31.66 | $ 1,266.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid
44.|Paper, As Per Spec 8-1/2 x 11, 20 Ib., 10 Rms Per Case Salmon 80 Cases [|[$ 3223}% 2,578.40||$ 3275 | $ 2,620.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
45.|Paper, As Per Spec 8-1/2 x 11, 20 1b., 10 Rms Per Case Buft 0 Cases [l$ 3223|$ - s - 18 - No Bid No Bid No Bid
46.|Paper, As Per Spec 8-1/2 x 11, 20 lb., 10 Rms Per Case Orchid 120 Cases [[$ 32238 3,86760[|$ 3275 | $ 3,930.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
47.{Paper, As Per Spec 8-1/2 x 14, 20 b., 10 Rms Per Case Green 0 Cases ||$ 3223|% - Is - 18 = No Bid No Bid No Bid
orchgl
LUMP SUM BID ITEMS 39 - 47 FASCOPY | § 20,627.20 oo e $ 20,480.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Paper, As Per Spec - See
Instructions to Bidders for
48.|Specs. #4, 8-1/2 x 11, 20 lb. White 2100 Cases $ 25171% 52,857.00]|$ 2420 $ 50,820.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Paper, As Per Spec - See
Instructions to Bidders for
49.|Specs. #4, 8-1/2 x 14, 20 |b. White 0 Cases $ © $ = $ - $ = No Bid No Bid No Bid
LUMP SUM BID ITEMS 48 - 49 (See Instructions to Bidders for Specifications) FASCOPY | $ 52,857.00 || FrPs2B | § 50,820.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
8-1/2 x 11 - 1/2" Writing Line With a 1/4*
Broken Line and a 1/4" space Between
Writing Lines. The Following Is acceptable:
Pacon Corp. #2639 ~ SEE SAMPLE
50.|Paper, Manuscript ATTACHED. 0 Cases || § - |8 - |I$ 199118 - s - 18 - |8 - | NoBid $ - IS -
LUMP SUM BID ITEM 50 No Bid $ - $ - No Bid $ -
BIDSHT Page 5
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Unisource Wiicox Paper XEROX
UNIT EXTENDED || UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
35.|Paper, Drawing 9 x 12, 8 Rms Per Case, 50 Ib. No Bid No Bid No Bid
36.|Paper, Drawing 12 x 18, 4 Rms Per Case, 50 Ib. No Bid No Bid No Bid
37.|Paper, Drawing 9 x 12, 8 Rms Per Case, 50 Ib. No Bid No Bid No Bid
38.|Paper, Drawing 12 x 18, 4 Rms Per Case, 50 Ib. No Bid No Bid No Bid
LUMP SUM BID ITEMS 35-38 No Bid No Bid No Bid
39 - 46 PAPER, PREMIUM NUMBER 4, MILL BRAND, XEROGRAPHIC
See Instructions to Bidders far Specifications.
39.|Paper, As Per Spec 8-1/2 x 11, 20 Ib., 10 Rms Per Case $ 35711 % 4,28520$ 32.95|% 3,954.00 || $ 37221 % 4,466.40
40.|Paper, As Per Spec 8-1/2 x 11, 20 tb., 10 Bms Per Case $ 3571 | $ 4,285.201$ 32.95|% 3,954.00 || $ 3722 | $ 4,466.40
41.|Paper, As Per Spec 8-1/2 x 11, 20 tb., 10 Rms Per Case $ 357118 2,856.80||$ 32.95|% 2,636.00 || $ 3722 | % 2,977.60
42.1Paper, As Per Spec 8-1/2 x 11, 20 Ib., 10 Rms Per Case $ 3571 $ 2,856.80||$ 32.951% 2,636.00 || $ 3722 | $ 2,977.60
43.|Paper, As Per Spec 8-1/2 x 11, 20 Ib., 10 Rms Per Case $ 357119 1,428.40[1$ 32.95| % 1,318.00 | $ 3722 | $ 1,488.80
44.|Paper, As Per Spec 8-1/2 x 11, 20 Ib., 10 Rms Per Case $ 357119 2,856.801$ 32.95|$% 2,636.00 || $ 3722 | $ 2,977.60
45.{Paper, As Per Spec 8-1/2 x 11, 20 Ib., 10 Rms Per Case $ 35711 $ - |I$ 32.95|% - 18 - 18 -
46.|Paper, As Per Spec 8-1/2 x 11, 20 tb., 10 Bms Per Case $ 35.71 4,285.20(|$ 32.95|$% 3,954.00 || $ 3722 $ 4,466.40
47.|Paper, As Per Spec 8-1/2 x 14, 20 [b., 10 Rms Per Case $ 35711 % - 15 - 18 - s e -
Bolse Bolse
LUMP SUM BID ITEMS 39 - 47 Fireworx $ 22,854.40|Fireworx | § 21,088.00 || Xerox $ 23,820.80
Paper, As Per Spec - See
Instructions to Bidders for
48.|Specs. #4,8-1/2 x 11, 20 Ib. $ 25.44 | $ 53,424.00||$ 244519 51,345.00 No Bid
Paper, As Per Spec - See
Instructions to Bidders for
49.|Specs. #4, 8-1/2 x 14, 20 lb. $ - 18 - s - |8 - No Bid
LUMP SUM BID ITEMS 48 - 49 (See instructions to Bidders for Specificat{ Comet92 $ 53,424.00| Boise MH $ 51,345.00 No Bid
8-1/2 x 11 - 1/2* Writing Line With a 1/4*
Broken Line and a 1/4” space Between
Writing Lines. The Following is acceptabie:
Pacon Corp. #2639 -~ SEE SAMPLE
50.}Paper, Manuscript ATTACHED. No Bid No Bid No Bid
LUMP SUM BID ITEM 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
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* CPG - Contract Paper C. J. Duffey * pyramid Schooi + School Speciaity *++ Standard Stationery
Group Paper Company Products Supply Co.
NUMBER UNIT EXTENDED || UNIT | EXTENDED || UNIT | EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED || UNIT | EXTENDED
ITEM DESCRIPTION COLOR | SPEC | REQUESTED | PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
51.|Paper, Mounting Board 22 x 28, 14-Ply, 50 Sheets Per Pkg White 0 Pkgs $ - 1% - No Bid $ - 15 - $ - | No Bid No Bid
LUMP SUM BID ITEM 51 No Bid No Bid $ o No Bid No Bid
52.|Paper, Roll Poster 36" W, 1,000' L, 40 Ib., Bases Weight Black 6 Rolis $ - No Bid $2722|$ 163.32{|$ 25.58 | $ 153.48 || $ 2723 % 163.38}|$ 25651 % 153.90
53.|Paper, Roll Poster 36" W, 1,000'L, 40 Ib., Bases Weight Blue 3 Rolis $ - No Bid $ 25.12] % 75.36 || $ 24.09 | $ 72.27 | $ 2514 | $ 75.42(|$ 24.15] % 72.45
54.|Paper, Roll Poster 36" W, 1,000' L, 40 Ib., Bases Weight | Dark Brown 0 Rolls $ - | NoBid $ 2449 | ¢ - 11s_ - 1Is - s - I$ - s - |$ -
55.|Paper, Roll Poster 36" W, 1,000" L, 40 Ib., Bases Weight Green 0 Rolls $ - | No Bid $ 2332 |% - $ - 1|8 - s - 18 - s - 1 -
56.|Paper, Roll Poster 36" W, 1,000' L, 40 Ib., Bases Weight Orange 0 Rolls $ - | No Bid $ 2046 | $ = $ - 1% - s - 18 - ls - |s .
57.1Paper, Roll Poster 36" W, 1,000' L, 40 Ib., Bases Weight Pink 0 Rolls $ - No Bid $ 2858 |$ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ -
58.|Paper, Roll Poster 36" W, 1,000'L, 40 Ib., Bases Weight Red 1 Rolls $ = No Bid $ 26581% 2658 (| $ 24.89 | $ 24891 $ 4545 (% 45451 249418 24.94
59.|Paper, Roll Poster 36" W, 1,000' L, 40 Ib., Bases Weight Scariet 0 Rolls $ - | No Bid $ 265818 - s - $ - s - |8 - IIs - | -
60.|Paper, Roll Poster 36" W, 1,000 L, 40 Ib., Bases Weight Sky Blue 0 Rolls $ - | NoBid $ 29.02|% - s - 18 - |8 - 18 - 15 - 13 -
61.|Paper, Roll Poster 36" W, 1,000'L, 40 Ib., Bases Weight White 10 Rolls $ = No Bid $2400]|% 240.00(|$ 23.09 1 $ 230.90 || $ 2402 8§ 240.20[1$ 23.15($% 231.50
62.|Paper, Roll Poster 36" W, 1,000'L, 40 lb., Bases Weight Yellow 0 Rolls $ - No Bid $ 2046 |8 - $ = $ - $ - $ 5 Shk- $ 5
LUMP SUM BID ITEMS 52 - 62 No Bid Pacon | § 50526\ "APC |§ 481.54 $ 524.45|| APC |s§ 482.79

BIDSHT
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Unisource Wilcox Paper XEROX
UNIT EXTENDED | UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
51.|Paper, Mounting Board 22 x 28, 14-Ply, 50 Sheets Per Pkg No Bid No Bid No Bid
LUMP SUM BID ITEM 51 No Bid No Bld No Bld
52.|Paper, Roll Poster 36" W, 1,000' L, 40 Ib., Bases Weight No Bid No Bid No Bid
53.]Paper, Roll Poster 36" W, 1,000'L, 40 Ib., Bases Weight No Bid No Bid No Bid
54.|Paper, Rolt Poster 36" W, 1,000' L, 40 |b., Bases Weight No Bid No Bid No Bid
55.|Paper, Roll Poster 36" W, 1,000'L, 40 Ib., Bases Weight No Bid No Bid No Bid
56.|Paper, Roll Poster 36" W, 1,000' L, 40 Ib., Bases Weight No Bid No Bid No Bid
57.{Paper, Roll Poster 36" W, 1,000'L, 40 [b., Bases Weight No Bid No Bid No Bid
58.|Paper, Roll Poster 36" W, 1,000' L, 40 ib., Bases Weight No Bid No Bid No Bid
59.|Paper, Rol! Poster 36" W, 1,000' L, 40 Ib., Bases Weight No Bid No Bid No Bid
60.|Paper, Roll Poster 36" W, 1,000'L, 40 Ib., Bases Weight No Bid No Bid No Bid
61.]Paper, Roll Poster 36" W, 1,000°L, 40 Ib., Bases Weight No Bid No Bid No Bid
62.|Paper, Roll Poster 36" W, 1,000'L, 40 Ib., Bases Weight No Bid No Bid No Bid
LUMP SUM BID ITEMS 52 - 62 No Bid No Bid No Bid
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* CPG - Contract Paper C. J. Duffey + pyramid School ** School Specialty *+++ Standard Stationery
Group Paper Company Products Supply Co.
NUMBER UNIT EXTENDED || UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT | EXTENDED
ITEM DESCRIPTION COLOR | SPEC| REQUESTED PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
9 x 12, 150 Ib., 100 Sheets Per Pkg
63.|Paper, Tagboard 12 Pkgs/Case Manila 20 Cases || No Bid No Bid $ 24.00 480.00 | $ 23.28 | $ 465.60 || $ 24.00 | $ 480.001$ 23.70 | $ 474.00
12 x 18, 1560 Ib., 100 Sheets Per Pkg
64.|Paper, Tagboard 10 Pkgs/Case Manila 0 Cases No Bid No Bid $ 23.57 - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ -
65.|Paper, Tagboard 24 x 36, 150 Ib., 100 Sheets Per Pkg Manila 0 Pkgs No Bid No Bid $ 15.89 - $ - $ - $ - 3 - $ - $ -
66.|Paper, Tagboard 24 x 36, 150 Ib., 100 Sheets Per Pkg White 50 Pkgs || No Bid No Bid $ 15.89 79450 || $ 1552 ] 8 776.00 || 1590 ] $ 795.00[$ 15.81]$% 790.50
LUMP SUM BID ITEMS 63 - 66 No Bid Pacon 1,274.50|| *APC | § 1,241.60 $ 1,275.00 $ 1,264.50
Red Lined, Left Margin,
67.|Paper, Theme (holeless) 3/8* Ruled, 8-1/2 x 11 (NOT 3 Hole) White 20 Cases || $ - $ 2 $ 22.77 455.40 (| $ 21.401 % 428.00 | $ 258|% 51.60]$ 21451% 429.00
EerTor on
LUMP SUM BID ITEM 67 No Bid Pacon 455.40 s 428.00 bid $ 51.60 s 429.00
8-1/2 x 11, 67 Ib., 250 Sheets Per
68.|Paper, Vellum, Bristol Cover |Pkg, 8 Reams Per Case Blue 9 Cases ||$ 3685}$% 331.65(|$ 31.00 279.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
8-1/2 x 11, 67 Ib., 250 Sheets Per
69.|Paper, Vellum, Bristol Cover_|Pkg, 8 Reams Per Case Canary 11 Cases $ 368519 405.35 (| $ 31.00 341.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
8-1/2 x 11, 67 Ib., 250 Sheets Per
70.|Paper, Vellum, Bristol Cover |Pkg, 8 Reams Per Case Goldenrod 10 Cases $ 3685|% 368.50 || $ 31.00 310.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
8-1/2 x 11, 67 Ib., 250 Sheets Per
71.|Paper, Vellum, Bristol Cover |Pkg, 8 Reams Per Case Gray 1 Cases $ 36.85]% 36.85|| $ 31.00 31.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
8-1/2 x 11, 67 Ib., 250 Sheets Per
72.|Paper, Vellum, Bristol Cover |Pkg, 8 Reams Per Case Green 7 Cases $ 36.85(8% 257.951$ 31.00 217.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
8-1/2 x 11, 67 Ib., 250 Sheets Per
73.|Paper, Vellum, Bristol Cover_|Pkg, 8 Reams Per Case lvory 3 Cases $ 36.85(% 110.55 1 $ 31.00 93.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
8-1/2 x 11, 67 Ib., 250 Sheets Per
74.|Paper, Vellum, Bristol Cover |Pkg, 8 Reams Per Case Pink 8 Cases |[|[$ 36.85|8% 294.80 | $ 31.00 248.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
8-1/2 x 11, 67 Ib., 250 Sheets Per
75.|Paper, Vellum, Bristol Cover |Pkg, 8 Reams Per Case Tan 1 Cases $ 3685(% 36.85|| $ 31.00 31.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
8-1/2 x 11, 67 Ib., 250 Sheets Per
76.|Paper, Vellum, Bristol Cover |Pkg, 8 Reams Per Case White 39 Cases $ 3528|% 1,375.92 1 $ 29.45 1,148.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid
LUMP SUM BID ITEMS 68 - 76 WAUSAU | ¢ 3,218.42 || Domtar 2,698.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid

BIDSHT
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BIDSHT

Unisource Wilcox Paper XEROX
UNIT EXTENDED || UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
9x 12, 150 Ib., 100 Sheets Per Pkg
63.|Paper, Tagboard 12 Pkgs/Case No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 x 18, 150 1b., 100 Sheets Per Pkg
64.|Paper, Tagboard 10 Pkgs/Case No Bid No Bid No Bid
65.|Paper, Tagboard 24 x 36, 150 Ib., 100 Sheets Per Pkg No Bid No Bid No Bid
66.|Paper, Tagboard 24 x 36, 150 Ib., 100 Sheets Per Pkg No Bid No Bid No Bid
LUMP SUM BID ITEMS 63 - 66 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Red Lined, Left Margin,
67.|Paper, Theme (holeless) 3/8" Ruled, 8-1/2 x 11 (NOT 3 Hole) No Bid No Bid No Bid
LUMP SUM BID ITEM 67 No Bid No Bid No Bid
8-1/2 x 11, 67 Ib., 250 Sheets Per
68.|Paper, Vellum, Bristol Cover |Pkg, 8 Reams Per Case No Bid $ 1840|$ 165.60 No Bid
8-1/2 x 11, 67 Ib., 250 Sheets Per
69.|Paper, Vellum, Bristol Cover [Pkg, 8 Reams Per Case No Bid $ 18401% 202.40 No Bid
8-1/2 x 11, 67 Ib., 250 Sheets Per
70.{Paper, Vellum, Bristol Cover |Pkg, 8 Reams Per Case No Bid No Bid No Bid
8-1/2 x 11, 67 [b., 250 Sheets Per
71.|Paper, Vellum, Bristol Cover |Pkg, 8 Reams Per Case No Bid $ 18408 18.40 No Bid
8-1/2 x 11, 67 Ib., 250 Sheets Per
72.|Paper, Vellum, Bristol Cover |Pkg, 8 Reams Per Case No Bid $ 1840|835 128.80 No Bid
8-1/2 x 11, 67 Ib., 250 Sheets Per
73.|Paper, Vellum, Bristol Cover |Pkg, 8 Reams Per Case No Bid $ 1840159 55.20 No Bid
8-1/2 x 11, 67 Ib., 250 Sheets Per
74.|Paper, Vellum, Bristol Cover |Pkg, 8 Reams Per Case No Bid $ 18.40|$ 147.20 No Bid
8-1/2 x 11, 67 Ib., 250 Sheets Per
75.|Paper, Vellum, Bristol Cover |Pkg, 8 Reams Per Case No Bid NA No Bid No Bid
8-1/2 x 11, 67 Ib., 250 Sheets Per
76.|Paper, Vellum, Bristol Cover |Pkg, 8 Reams Per Case No Bid $ 1740} % 678.60 No Bid
Bolse
5 rms/cs
Not All
LUMP SUM BID ITEMS 68 - 76 No Bid Bid $ 1,396.20 No Bid
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+++ School Specialty - No Bid Securlty

All other bidders submitted a bid security.

* CPG - Contract Paper Group - 20 case per order minimum for free shipping.

**Pyramid School Products - APC - American Paper Company
Minimum order $4,000 full cases.

****Standard Stationery Supply Co. - American Paper Company
Minimum order $5,400 full cases.

**++Standard Stationery Supply Co. - Quality Paper minimum order 50 cases

****Standard Stationery Supply Co. - Unsligned bid document.

BIDSHT
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* CPG - Contract Paper C. J. Duffey ** Pyramid School *** School Specialty +++* Standard Stationery
Group Paper Company Products Supply Co.
NUMBER UNIT EXTENDED || UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT | EXTENDED
ITEM DESCRIPTION COLOR | SPEC| REQUESTED PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
77.|Paper, Xerographic 11 x 17,20 bb. White 1 Cases $ 46.00|$% 46.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
78.|Paper, Xerographic 11x17, 20 lb. Blue 1 Cases $ 5200|$% 52.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
79.|Paper, Xerographic 11x17, 20 Ib. Gold 1 Cases $ 5200|% 52.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
LUMP SUM BID ITEMS 77 - 79 FASCOPY | ¢ 150.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
20 cs min.




BIDSHT

Unisource Wiicox Paper XEROX
UNIT EXTENDED | UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
77.|Paper, Xerographic 11 x 17, 20 Ib. No Bid $ 3050($ 30.50 || $ 40751 % 40.75
78.|Paper, Xerographic 11 x 17, 20 Ib. No Bid $ 3590]% 3590 $ 4564 | $ 45.64
79.{Paper, Xerographic 11 x 17, 20 [b. No Bid $ 359 |$% 3590 % 4564 | $ 40.75
LUMP SUM BID ITEMS 77 - 79 No Bid Bolse $ 102.30 $ 127.14

** School Specialty - No Bid Security

Ali other bidders submitted a bid security.

* CPG - Contract Paper Group - 20 case per order minimum for free shipping.

“*Pyramid School Products - APC - American Paper Company

Minimum order $4,000 full cases.

*+++Standard Stationery Supply Co. - American Paper Company

Minimum order $5,400 full cases.

«*+Standard Stationery Supply Co. - Quality Paper minimum order 50 cases

«++Standard Stationery Supply Co. - Unsigned bid document.
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