Lisle Community Unit School District 202
Snow Removal Bid Tabulation
2024-2025 School Year

Bid Opening: October 3, 2024 - 10:00 am

Bidder

Lisle Sr. High School

Flat rate per removal up to 3”

Flat rate per removal greater than 3" up to 6”

Flat rate per removal greater than 6" up to 9”
Hourly rate for removal greater than 9" (hourly rate)
Flat rate salt furnished and applied

"Straight Push" up to 3"

Lisle Jr. High School

Flat rate per removal up to 3”

Flat rate per removal greater than 3" up to 6”

Flat rate per removal greater than 6" up to 9”
Hourly rate for removal greater than 9" (hourly rate)
Flat rate salt furnished and applied

"Straight Push" up to 3"

Lisle Elementary School

Flat rate per removal up to 3”

Flat rate per removal greater than 3" up to 6”

Flat rate per removal greater than 6" up to 9”
Hourly rate for removal greater than 9" (hourly rate)
Flat rate salt furnished and applied

"Straight Push" up to 3"

All Schools

Flat rate per removal up to 3”

Flat rate per removal greater than 3" up to 6”

Flat rate per removal greater than 6" up to 9”
Hourly rate for removal greater than 9" (hourly rate)
Flat rate salt furnished and applied

"Straight Push" up to 3"

30% up to 3" + salt, 10% 3"-6" + salt,
10% Straight Push, 50% salt only
Place based on "All Schools" bid

Hourly Rates

Skid Steer

4-wheel drive pick-up truck with blade
Front end loader

Dump truck (for snow transportation)

Schiesher Elementary School

Flat rate per removal up to 3”

Flat rate per removal greater than 3" up to 6”

Flat rate per removal greater than 6" up to 9”
Hourly rate for removal greater than 9" (hourly rate)
Flat rate salt furnished and applied

"Straight Push" up to 3"

Everest Snow Mark 1

Management Langton Group Landscape, Inc.
$ 456.00 $ 380.00 $ 750.00
$ 456.00 $ 570.00 $ 1,050.00
$ 684.00 $ 855.00 $ 1,350.00
No Bid $ 150.00 $ 260.00

$ 468.00 $ 374.00 $ 562.50
$ 456.00 $ 190.00 $ 250.00
$ 300.00 $ 232.00 $ 500.00
$ 300.00 $ 348.00 $ 750.00
$ 450.00 $ 522.00 $ 1,000.00
No Bid $ 150.00 $ 260.00

$ 300.00 $ 228.00 $ 450.00
$ 300.00 $ 116.00 $ 250.00
$ 226.00 $ 242.00 $ 500.00
$ 226.00 $ 362.00 $ 750.00
$ 339.00 $ 544.00 $ 1,000.00
No Bid $ 150.00 $ 260.00

$ 226.00 $ 238.00 $ 450.00
$ 226.00 $ 121.00 $ 250.00
$ 982.00 $ 854.00 $ 1,750.00
$ 982.00 $ 1,280.00 $ 2,550.00
$ 1,473.00 $ 1,921.00 $ 3,350.00
No Bid $ 450.00 $ 780.00

$ 994.00 $ 840.00 $ 1,462.50
$ 982.00 $ 427.00 $ 750.00
$ 1,385.60 $ 1,182.90 $ 2,171.25

2 1 3

$ 250.00 /hr $ 150.00 /hr § 155.00
$ 165.00 /hr $ 150.00 /hr $ 125.00
$ 425.00 /hr $ 300.00 /hr $ 255.00
$ 280.00 /hr $ 250.00 /hr $ 255.00
$ 305.00 $ 203.00 $ 500.00
$ 305.00 $ 305.00 $ 750.00
$ 457.00 $ 457.00 $ 1,000.00
No Bid $ 150.00 $ 260.00

$ 305.00 $ 201.00 $ 450.00
$ 305.00 $ 102.00 $ 250.00

/hr
/hr
/hr
/hr



