Project: 2019 LIFE SAFETY WORK
Owner: PROSPECT HEIGHTS SCHOOL DISTRICT 23
Project No.: 18104

Bid Date/Time: on January 31, 2019 at 11:00 AM

PROSPECT HEIGHTS
SCHOOL DISTRICT 23
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ALTERNATE A-1

ALTERNATE A-2

ALTERNATE A-3

CONTRACTOR BID BOND ADDENDUM BASE BID (Window/Door replacement at corr., (MPR flooring and VCT) (Mac Kitchen Ventilation) TOTAL
teacher wkrm and vest.)
Y 1,2,3 $230,000.00 $77,000.00 $81,000.00 $51,500.00 $439,500.00
1 [Happ Builders, Inc.
Y 1,2,3 $273,000.00 $66,000.00 $95,000.00 $42,000.00 $476,000.00
2 |Bergen Construction Corporation
Y 1,2,3 $251,260.00 $91,185.00 $93,200.00 $57,658.00 $493,303.00
3 |D. Kersey Construction Company
Y 1,2,3 $275,600.00 $68,900.00 $113,500.00 $51,400.00 $509,400.00
4 [L.J. Morse Construction Company
Y 1,2,3 $330,000.00 $85,000.00 $90,000.00 $58,000.00 $563,000.00
5 [RB Construction, Inc.
Y 1,2,3 $361,703.00 $95,725.00 $107,295.00 $56,560.00 $621,283.00
6 |Manusos General Contracting, Inc.
Y 1,2,3 $449,000.00 $85,000.00 $85,000.00 $50,000.00 $669,000.00
7 |R.L. Sohol General Contractor
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
8 |Edwin Anderson Construction Company
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
9 |Frontier Construction Inc.
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
10 [Monarch Construction Company
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
11 |Simpson Construction Company
12
13
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