Office of the Superintendent of Schools October 26, 2020
Board Meeting of November 16, 2020

Office of Finance
Janet C. Robles, Chief Financial Officer

SUBIJECT: REJECT AND RE-ADVERTISE / TIRES FOR MAINTENANCE AND TRANSPORTATION
VEHICLES DISTRICT-WIDE BID # 19-20-035

The purpose of this agenda item is to Reject and Approve to Re-Advertise the Tires for Maintenance and
Transportation Vehicles District Wide Bid # 19-20-035 for the 2020-2021 school year due to bid
information submitted for this bid is outdated / forty-five (45) plus days have lapsed since bid opening.

The attachment reflects the tabulation on the advertised bid.
THIS ITEM DOES NOT ESTABLISH, MODIFY OR DELETE BOARD POLICY OR ADMINISTRATIVE PROCEDURE.

RECOMMENDED LOW BIDDER:

That the Board of Education Reject and Approve to Re-Advertise the Tires for Maintenance and
Transportation Vehicles District Wide for the 2020-2021 school year as indicated below:

LOW BIDDER /
ITEM: LOW JUSTIFIED BIDDER: TOTALS:
All Items Gonzalez Auto Parts REJECT
(Laredo, TX)
All Items Hesselbein Tire Southwest REJECT
(Mission, TX)
All Items Southern Tire Mart, LLC REJECT
(Columbia, MS)
All items T & W Tire REJECT
(Pharr, TX)
All Iltems The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company REJECT
(Akron, OH)

RECOMMEND: That the Board of Education Reject and Approve to Re-Advertise the Tires for
Maintenance and Transportation Vehicles District Wide Bid # 19-20-0356 for the 2020-
2021 school year, effective November 17, 2020.



PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO 1.8.D.
TIRES FOR MAINTENANCE AND TRANSPORTATION VEHICLES DISTRICT WIDE BID # 19-20-035
BID OPENING: FEBRUARY 12, 2020 @ 2:30 P.M.

Event Number #19-20-035 Organization P514 15D Ebids

Event Title Tires for Maintenance and Transportatlon Vehicles District-wide Workgroup Purchasing

Event Description Event Owner Emily Garza

Event Type Bid Email emily.garza@psjaisd.us
Issue Date 1/24/2020 10:50:27 AM (CT) Phone

Close Date 2/12/2020 02:30:00 PM (CT) Fax

Recommendation: That the Board of Education Reject and Approve to Re-Advertise the Tires for Maintenance and Transpartation Vehicle

District-Wide Bid # 19-20-035 due to bid information submitted for this bid is outdated / forty-five (45} plus days have lapsed.

[Name Jcity [state [Classiticati Lines Awarded  Award Tatal Award R

GONZALEZ AUTO PARTS LAREDO X 2 $2,355.20 REJECTY
Hesselbein Tire Southwest Mission TX i3 $20,756,92 REJECT
Southern Tire Mart, LLC Columbia  MS 6 52,640,38 REJECT
T&W Tire Phatr ™ 4 $49,574,00 REJECT
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company Akron OH ] $13.855.10 REJECT

od it

Emll‘y'Garza. Director of*Purchasing Efren L. Aralza, per#ions Logistics Coordinator

Sixty Eight (68) invitations were emailed to vendors
Six (6) Vendors viewed Bid Specifications

Five (5) Submitted Bid

One (1) Unsubmitted Bld

One (1} No Bid
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3
OLLEGE PHARR-SAN JUAN-ALAMO ISD

EADY.CONNECTED.COMPLETE - bR Of Operations
Hestroverto Nicholas Martinez "Nick”, Chief of Operations

=

To: Emily Garza, Director of Purchasing
From: Efren L. Araiza, Operations Logistics Coordinator

Subject: Proposal to reject bids:

Requesting rejection of bids listed:

o Tires for Maintenance & Transportation Vehicles District-Wide Bid # 19-20-035
-Reason for rejection is that information is outdated 45 plus days have lapsed.

o Floor Wax & Stripper for Central Supply Warehouse Supply Bid # 19-20-036
-Reason for rejection is that information is outdated 45 plus days have lapsed.

o Paper Towels & Dispenser for Use District-Wide # 19-20-047
-Reason for rejection is that information is outdated 45 plus days have lapsed.

= Janitorial Dilution System for Use District-Wide # 19-20-048
-Due to COVID environment want to seek more effective option to ensure student and staff
safety. Implement a cost analysis on dispenser efficiency.

cc: Hestroverto Nick Martinez, Chief of Operations Ofﬂcer“‘f\l
cc: Janet C. Robles, Chief Financial Officer

START COLLEGE NOW! COMPLETE EARLY! GO FAR!
601 E. KellySt., Pharr, TX 78577 P: (956) 354-2000 F:{956) 354-3006  www.psjaisd.us

it is the policy of Pharr-San Juan-Atoma ISD not te discriminate on the basis of sex, disability, race, color, religion, notional origin or age.



TIRES FOR MAINTENANCE AND TRANSPORTATION VEHICLES DISTRICT WIDE BID # 19-20-035
BID OPENING: FEBRUARY 12, 2020 @ 2:30 P.M.

PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO L.S.D,

[ 1 [Bus. 11R22.5 (As Specified / No Deviations)

Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended  Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
REIECT TRW Tire 150 EA $255.00 $38,250.00 Hankook AH37
REIECT Southern Tire Mart, LLC 150 EA $260.00 $39,000.00 Hankook AH37 Hankook AH37
REIECT Hesselbein Tire Southwest 150 EA $295.00 $44,250.00 Hankook AH37
REJECT GONZALEZ AUTO PARTS 150 EA $379.22 $56,883.00 #3002162 Hankook AH37
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company 150 EA No Bid Hankook AH37
|2 |Bus. 255/70 R22.5 (As Specified / No Deviations)
Supplier QTY uom Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
REJECT T&W Tire 50 EA $220.00 $11,000.00 Hankook AH37
REIECT Southern Tire Mart, LLC 50 EA $223.00 $11,150.00 Hankoook AH37 Hankook AH37
REIECT Hesselbein Tire Southwest 50 EA $250.00 $12,500.00 Hankook AH37
REJECT GONZALEZ AUTO PARTS 50 EA $297.28 $14,864.00 #3002450 Hankook AH37
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company 50 EA No Bid Hankook AH37
| 3 [Truck. LT265/70 R17 (10 Ply) or equal.
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
REIECT The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company 50 EA $130.00 $6,500.00 Firestone
REJECT [ALT1] Hesselbein Tire Southwest 50 EA $135.00 $6,750.00 General Grabber HD General 04507220000
REIECT Southern Tire Mart, LLC 50 EA $141.00 $7,050.00 Firestone HT2 #002768 Firestone
REJECT Hasselbein Tire Southwest 50 EA $142.00 $7,100.00 Firestone
REIECT [ALT1] T&W Tire 50 EA $144.28 $7,214.00 HANKQOK DYNAPRO HT HANKOOK DYNAPR 2001848
REIECT GONZALEZ AUTO PARTS 50 EA $188.10 $9,405.00 Firestone
T&W Tire 50 EA No Bid Firestone
[ALT]_] The Goodyear Tire & Rubber company 50 EA WRANGLER FORTITUDE HT LT265/70R17 121R E WRL GOODYEAR WRANGLER FORTITUDE HT
FORTITUDE HT TL 179535620
| 4 |Aero Lift. 8-14.5 (12 Ply) or equal.
Supplier QTY uom Price Extended  Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
REJECT Hesselbein Tire Southwest 2 EA $62.89 $125.78 Deestone
REJECT TR W Tire 2 EA $64.00 $128.00 8X14.5 - DEESTONE D902 HWY T/L 6310 Deestone
REJECT Southern Tire Mart, LLC 2 EA $65.00 $130.00 Deestone DST8145001 Deestone
REECT GONZALEZ AUTO PARTS 2 EA $68.72 $137.44 #6310 Deestone
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company 2 EA No Bid Deestone
| 5 |Backhoe. 19.5L-24 or equal.
Supplier QTY uom Price Extended  Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
REJECT [ALT1] Hesselbein Tire Southwest 2 EA $377.89 $755.78 D314 R-4TL DEESTONE DS8120
RUECT Southern Tire Mart, LLC 2 EA $396.00 $792.00 Galaxy R4 EZ Rider #GAL200439 Goodyear
REJECT Hesselbein Tire Southwest 2 EA $474.50 $949.00 Goodyear
REECT The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company 2 EA $564.38 $1,128.76 Goodyear
REIECT T&W Tire %) EA $585.00 $1,170.00 19:5L24 - GOODYEAR IT525 R-4 TL45T161 Goodyear
REIECT GONZALEZ AUTO PARTS 2 EA $620.72 $1,241.44 45T161 Goodyear
| 6 [Backhoe. 111-16 or equal.
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
REIECT Southern Tire Mart, LLC 4 EA $107.00 $428.00 Galaxy #GAL231231 Lande
REJECT T&W Tire 4 EA $11000 544000 DEESTONE 1116 - DEESTONE D412 F-3 TL DS8831 Lande
REIECT [ALT1] Hesselbein Tire Southwest 4 EA $111.32 $445.28 F-3TL D-412 DEESTONE DS8831
REJECT GONZALEZ AUTO PARTS 4 EA $114.72 $458.88 MAX DURA #058118-625 Lande
The Goadyear Tire & Rubber Company 4 EA No Bid Lande
| 7 |Badboy. 13 x 6.50-6/4.50 or equal.
Supplier QTY UomM Price Extended  Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
REJECT [ALT1] Hesselbein Tire Southwest 4 EA $11.00 $44.00 D265 TURF DEESTONE 7029
REJECT TR&W Tire 4 EA $26.00 $104.00 TURF SAVER 5111861 Carlisle
REJECT Southern Tire Mart, LLC 4 EA $26.90 $107.60 Carlisle Turf Saver #CA5111861 Carlisle
REJECT GONZALEZ AUTO PARTS 4 EA $27.60 $110.40 #5111861 Carlisle
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company 4 EA No Bid Carlisle
[ 8 IBadboy. 26 x 12.00-12 NHS or equal.
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
REECT TRW Tire 4 EA $50.00 $200.00 DEESTONE 26/1200-12 - DEESTONE D265 Maxxis
TURF T/L 7085
REIECT [ALT1] Hessetbein Tire Southwest 4 EA $50.53 $202.12 D265 TURF 6 PLY DEESTONE 7085
REECT GONZALEZ AUTO PARTS 4 EA $76.48 $305.92 #ATR1-119L Maxxis
REIECT Southern Tire Mart, LLC 4 EA $104.25 $417.00 Carlisle Multitrac #CA5743611 Maxxis
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company 4 EA No Bid Maxxis
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TIRES FOR MAINTENANCE AND TRANSPORTATION VEHICLES DISTRICT WIDE BID # 19-20-035
BID OPENING: FEBRUARY 12, 2020 @ 2:30 P.M.

PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.

| 9 [Bobcat. 12-16.5 (TL) or equal

Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
REJECT [ALT1] Hesselbein Tire Southwest 4 EA $109.25 $437.00 D304 SKID DEESTONE DS6110
REIECT Southern Tire Mart, LLC 4 EA $124.00 $496.00 Regency Skid Steer #378712 Carlisle
REJECT T&W Tire 4 EA $220'00 $880.00 12-16.5 - CARLISLE ULTRA GUARD MX 6A0326 Carlisle
REIECT GONZALEZ AUTO PARTS 4 EA $229.72 $918.88 #6A0326 Carlisle
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company 4 EA No Bid Carlisie
[ 10 [cutter. 21 x 7-12 (16 Ply) Severe duty tire or equal
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended  Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
REECT [ALT1] Hesselbein Tire Southwest 4 EA $157.63 $630.52 TRAKS TT AIRPLANE RECAP TRAKS GR11-39
REIECT TRW Tire 4 EA $275.00 $1,100.00
REIECT GONZALEZ AUTO PARTS 4 EA $287.50 $1,150.00 MISCELLANEOUS #21712BM
REECT The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company 4 EA No Bid
Southern Tire Mart, LLC 4 EA No Bid
| 11 |Gator. 22 x 9.50-10 NHS or equal
Supplier QTy UOM Price Extended  Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
REECT Hasselbein Tire Southwest 4 EA $77.00 $308.00 Carlisle
REIECT Southern Tire Mart, LLC 4 EA $88.50 $354.00 Carlisle All Trail #CA5S5A3N1 Carlisle
REJECT GONZALEZ AUTO PARTS 4 EA $88.55 $354.20 #55A3N1 Carlisle
REJECT T&W Tire 4 EA 510000 $40000 22/9.50-10 NHS - CARLISLE ALL TRAIL I 55A3N1 Car|is|e
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company 4 EA No Bid Carlisle
[ 12 |Gator.24x 10.50 x 10 or equal
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended  Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
REJECT Hesselbein Tire Southwest 4 EA $89.00 $356.00 Carlisle
REJECT Southern Tire Mart, LLC 4 EA $102.00 $408.00 Carlisle All Trail #CA55A3N9 Carlisle
REIECT GONZALEZ AUTO PARTS 4 EA $103.35 $413.40 #55A3N9 Carlisle
REJECT T&W Tire 4 EA $11000 544000 24/10.50-10 NHS - CARLISLE ALL TRAIL Il 55A3N9 Carlisle
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company 4 EA No Bid Carlisle
| 13 [Gator, AT22.5 x 10.00-8 or equal
Supplier Qry UOM Price Extended  Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
REIECT Hesselbein Tire Southwest 4 EA $72.00 $288.00 Carlisle
REIECT Southern Tire Mart, LLC 4 EA $76.08 $304.32 OTR Wheel Engineering #T225108001 Carlisle
REJECT T&W Tire 4 EA 57800 salz‘oo 22.5/10.00-8 NHS - CARLISLE TURF TAMER KNOBBY TL Carlisle
55U3C7
REJECT GONZALEZ AUTO PARTS 4 EA $85.68 $342.72 #5753B71 Carlisle
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company 4 EA No Bid Carlisle
| 14 [Gator. AT25 x 13-9 or equal
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended  Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
REJECT Hesselbein Tire Southwest 4 EA $92.00 $368.00 Carlisle
RBJECT T&W Tire 4 EA $9400 $376_00 AT25/13-9 - CARLISLE HD FIELD TRAX 558394 Car|i5|e
REIECT Southern Tire Mart, LLC 4 EA $105.65 $422.60 Carlisle Field Max #CA588394 Carlisle
REECT GONZALEZ AUTO PARTS 4 EA $105.80 $423.20 #588394 Carlisle
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company 4 EA No Bid Carlisle
[ 15 |Gator, 26 x 12-12 or equal
Supplier QTY Uom Price Extended  Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
REECT [ALT1] Hesselbein Tire Southwest 4 EA $50.53 $202.12 D265 TURF 6 PLY DEESTONE 7085
REJECT T&W Tire 4 EA $95.00 $380.00 26/1200-12 - CARLISLE MULT! TRAC C/S 5743611 Carlisle
REIECT Southern Tire Mart, LLC 4 EA $121.36 $485.44 Carlisle Field Trax #CA560467 Carlisle
REIECT GONZALEZ AUTO PARTS 4 EA $142.03 $568.12 #50D363 Carlisle
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company 4 EA No Bid Carlisle
| 16 |Gator. AT26 x 9-12 or equal
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended  Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
REECT Hesselbein Tire Southwest 4 EA $81.50 $326.00 Carlisle
REJECT TRW Tire 4 EA $91.00 $364.00 AT26/9-12 - CARLISLE AT489 XL 560460 Carlisle
REIECT Southern Tire Mart, LLC 4 EA $98.94 $395.76 Carlisle Versatrail #CA6P0272 Carlisle
REIECT GONZALEZ AUTO PARTS 4 EA $100.34 $401.36 #560460 Carlisle
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company 4 EA No Bid Carlisle
| 17 |Gator. AT26 x 11-12 or equal
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
REIECT Hesselbein Tire Southwest 4 EA $91.00 $364.00 Carlisle
REIECT T&W Tire 4 EA $99.00 $396.00 AT26/11-12 - CARLISLE AT489 XL 560461 Carlisle
REIECT GONZALEZ AUTO PARTS 4 EA $109.54 $438.16 #560461 Carlisle
REECT Southern Tire Mart, LLC 4 EA $110.63 $442.52 Carlisle Versatrail #HCA6P0273 Carlisie
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company 4 EA No Bid Carlisle
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PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.5.D.

TIRES FOR MAINTENANCE AND TRANSPORTATION VEHICLES DISTRICT WIDE BID # 19-20-035

BID OPENING: FEBRUARY 12, 2020 @ 2:30 P.M.

| 18 [Gator. 25 x 12-9 Turf or equal

Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
REJECT [ALT1] Hesselbein Tire Southwest 4 EA $36.58 $146.32 D929 KNOBBY DEESTONE 7325
REJECT T&W Tire 4 EA S7800 531200 25/12-9 - CARLISLE TURF TRAC R/S 50D3T7 car|i5|e
REJECT Southern Tire Mart, LLC 4 EA $94.34 $377.36 Carlisle Turf Tamer #CA550373 Carlisle
REIECT GONZALEZ AUTO PARTS 4 EA $96.89 $387.56 #55U373 Carlisle
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company 4 EA No Bid Carlisle
[ 19 [Golf cart. 23 x10.50-12 Turf or equal
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
REJECT [ALT1] Hesselbein Tire Southwest 2 EA $39.47 $78.94 D265 TURF DEESTONE 7083
REJECT T&W Tire 2 EA 57000 $14000 23/1050-12 - CARLISLE TURF SAVER 511121 Carlisle
REIECT GONZALEZ AUTO PARTS 2 EA $82.80 $165.60 #5114081 Carlisle
REIECT Southern Tire Mart, LLC 2 EA $104.64 $209.28 Carlisle Multitrac #CA574353 Carlisle
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company 2 EA No Bid Carlisle
| 20 [Golf Cart. 18 x 8.50-8 Turf or equal
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended  Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
REJECT [ALT1] Hesselbein Tire Southwest 20 EA $21.25 $425.00 D265 TURF DEESTONE 7037
REJECT Southern Tire Mart, LLC 20 EA $38.76 $775.20 Carlisle Fairway Pro #CA5189761 Carlisle
REJECT GONZALEZ AUTOQ PARTS 20 EA $49,17 $983.40 #5110711 Carlisle
REIECT TRW Tire 20 EA 567.00 $1’340100 18/850-8 - CARLISLE MULTI TRAC C/S 574365 Carlisle
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company 20 EA No Bid Carlisle
| 21 [Golf Cart. 15 x 6.50-8 Turf or equal
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
REJECT Hesselbein Tire Southwest 4 EA $29.75 $119.00 Carlisle
REJECT T&W Tire 4 EA 53100 $12400 15/650-8 - CARL. TURF MASTER TL 5112531 Car|15|e
REJECT Southern Tire Mart, LLC 4 EA $32.00 $128.00 Carlisle Turfmaster #CA5112531 Carlisle
REJECT GONZALEZ AUTO PARTS 4 EA $34.22 $136.88 #5112531 Carlisle
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company 4 EA No Bid Carlisle
[ 22 [Golf Mower. 18 x 8.50-8 smooth or equal
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
REECT Southern Tire Mart, LLC 2 EA $24.35 $48.70 OTR Wheel Engineering #T189508008 Carlisle
REIECT Hesselbein Tire Southwest 2 EA $45.50 $91.00 Carlisle
REIECT T&W Tire 2 EA $47.00 $94,00 18/950-8 - CARLISLE SMOOTH 5908811 Carlisle
REECT GONZALEZ AUTO PARTS 2 EA $52.33 $104.66 #5109811 Carlisle
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company 2 EA No Bid Carlisle
| 23 [Passenger Vehicle. P225/60 R16 Speed Rating H or equal.
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
REJECT [ALT1] GONZALEZ AUTO PARTS 8 EA $56.35 $450.80 Passenger Vehicle. P225/60 R16 Speed LANDSAIL 134027
Rating H or equal.
REJECT [ALTl] The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company 8 EA $67 27 $53816 ASSURANCE ALL SEASON 225/60R16 98T SL ASSURANCE ALL- GOODYEAR ASSURANCE ALL SEASON
SEASON 407715374
REECT [ALT1) T&W Tire 8 EA $69.92 $559.36 HANKQOK KINERGY ST H735 HANKOOK KINERGY1021495
REIECT [ALT1] Hesselbein Tire Southwest 8 EA $78.00 $624.00 ALTIMAX RT43 GENERAL 15494650000
REJECT Hesselbein Tire Southwest 8 EA $79.00 $632.00 Firestone
REECT Southern Tire Mart, LLC 8 EA $80.60 $644.,80 Firestone Champion Fuel Fighter 4015607 Firestone
T&W Tire 8 EA No Bid Firestone
[ 24 [passenger Vehicle. P235/55 R17 Speed Rating H or equal
Supplier QTY UoM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
REECT [ALT1] GONZALEZ AUTO PARTS 24 EA §79.35 $1,904.40 Passenger Vehicle. P235/55 R17 Speed NEXEN 15151NXK
Rating H or equal
REJECT [ALT]_] The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company 24 EA $8497 $2’03928 ASSURANCE ALL SEASON 235/55R17 99T SL ASSURANCE ALL- GOODYEAR ASSURANCE ALL SEASON
SEASON 407599374
REIECT [AIT1] T&W Tire 24 EA $89.39 $2,145.36 HANKOOK VENTUS S1 HANKOOK VENTUS 1014867
REIECT [ALT1] Hesselbein Tire Southwest 24 EA $99.00 $2,376.00 ALTIMAX RT43 GENERAL 15497930000
REECT Hesselbein Tire Southwest 24 EA $101.00 $2,424.00 Firestone
REECT Southern Tire Mart, LLC 24 EA $101.93 $2,446.32 Firestone Champion Fuel Fighter #015641 Firestone
T&W Tire 24 EA No Bid Firestone
[ 25 IRiding Mower, 24 x 12.00-12 NHS or equal
Supplier QTry uom Price Extended  Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
REECT [ALT1] Hesselbein Tire Southwest 20 EA $44.21 $884.20 D265 TURF DEESTONE DS7051
REJECT T&W Tire 20 EA $82.00 $1,640.00 24/1200-12 - CARLISLE TURF MASTER 5114091 Carlisle
REJECT Southern Tire Mart, LLC 20 EA $85.73 $1,714.60 Carlisle Turf Master #CA5714091 Carlisle
REIECT GONZALEZ AUTO PARTS 20 EA $88.27 $1,765.40 #5114091 Carlisle
REJECT [ALT1] The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company 20 EA $451.21 $9,024.20 ?fSU'W"CE ALL SEASON 24X12-12NHS 24 AMER MINER SLHD GOQDYEAR :;i';’fﬂ; MINER
Page 4

TAKEN TO BOARD OF EDUCATION / NOVEMBER 16, 2020



TIRES FOR MAINTENANCE AND TRANSPORTATION VEHICLES DISTRICT WIDE BID # 19-20-035
BID OPENING: FEBRUARY 12, 2020 @ 2:30 P.M.

PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO 1.S.D.

[ 26 [Riding Mower- 16 x 6.50-8 or equal

Supplier QTY uoM Price Extended  Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
REIECT Hesselbein Tire Southwest 50 EA $18.16 $908.00 Deestone
REIECT GONZALEZ AUTO PARTS 50 EA $19.84 $992.00 #7031 Deestone
REJECT Southern Tire Mart, LLC 50 EA $21.70 $1,085.00 OTR Wheel Enigneering #T16658007 Deestone
REECT TALT1] T&W Tire 50 EA $26.50 $1,325.00 16/650-8 - CARLISLE TURF SAVER 5110961 CARLISLE TURF SAV5110961
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company 50 EA No Bid Deestone
T&W Tire 50 EA No Bid Deestone
[ 27 [Riding Mower. 18 x 8.50-8 or equal
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended  Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
REECT Hesselbein Tire Southwest 10 EA $22.37 $223.70 Deestone
REIECT GONZALEZ AUTO PARTS 10 EA $24.44 $244.40 #7037 Deestone
REECT Southern Tire Mart, LLC 10 EA $26.24 $262.40 OTR Wheel Enigneering #T18858004 Deestone
REJECT T&W Tire 10 EA $2800 $28000 18/850%8 - DEESTONE D265 TURF T/L 7037 Deestone
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company 10 EA No Bid Deestone
I 28 lRiding Mower. 23 x 10.50-12 NHS or equal
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
REECT [ALT1] Hesselbein Tire Southwest 4 EA $39.47 $157.88 D265 TURF DEESTONE 7083
REJECT [ALT1] GONZALEZ AUTO PARTS 4 EA $43.13 $172.52 Riding Mower. 23 x 10.50-12 NHS or equal DEESTONE 7083
REJECT Southern Tire Mart, LLC 4 EA $47.91 $191.64 Grass Master #723105012004 Titan
REJECT [ALT1] T&W Tire 4 EA $88.00 $352.00 23/1050-12 - CARLISLE TURF SAVER 511121 CARLISLE TURF SAV511121
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company 4 EA No Bid Titan
T&W Tire 4 EA No Bid Titan
[ 29 [sweeper. P205/75 R14 or equal
Supplier QTY uoM Price Extended  Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
REJECT [ALT1) Hesselbein Tire Southwest 2 EA $47.37 $94.74 787 VERCELLI VvC003
REECT TRW Tire 2 EA $53.36 $106.72 Hankook
REECT Southern Tire Mart, LLC 2 EA $62.73 $125.46 Hankook Optimo H724 #HNK1010991 Hankook
REIECT GONZALEZ AUTO PARTS 2 EA $63.58 $127.16 #1010991 Hankook
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company 2 EA No Bid Hankook
[ 30 [Tractor. 25-8.50-14 NHS or equal
Supplier Q1Y UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
REECT [ALT1] Hesselbein Tire Southwest 2 EA $81.32 $162.64 SKID POWER BKT 94042050
REIECT Southern Tire Mart, LLC 2 EA $91.11 $182.22 Galaxy Marathon R4 #GAL102103 Carlisle
REJECT TRAW Tire 2 EA 510000 SZO0.00 25/850-14 - CARLISLE TRAC CHIEF T 515379 Carlisle
REECT GONZALEZ AUTO PARTS 2 EA $104.94 $209.88 #574339 Carlisle
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company 2 EA No Bid Carlisle
| 31 [Tractor. 14.9-24 Farm or equal
Supplier QTy uom Price Extended  Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
REIECT Southern Tire Mart, LLC 2 EA $183.93 $367.86 Gladiator R1 #GL1584774941 Carlisie
REJECT [ALT1] T&W Tire 2 EA $275.00 $550.00 14.9-24 - CROP-MAX REAR R-1TL CM5621 CROP-MAX REAR R-CM5621
REIECT [ALT1] Hesselbein Tire Southwest 2 EA $349.75 $699.50 SAT H R-1TL FIRESTONE 008-560
REJECT [ALT1] GONZALEZ AUTO PARTS 2 EA $378.93 $757.86 Tractor. 14.9-24 Farm or equal ALLIANCE 32407218
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company 2 EA No Bid Carlisle
T&W Tire T EA No Bid Carlisle
| 32 [Tractor. 15 x 6.00-6 Turf or equal
Supplier QTrY uom Price Extended  Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
REECT Southern Tire Mart, LLC 4 EA $12.98 $51.92 Greenball HANK #6562S Carlisle
REIECT [ALT1] Hesselbein Tire Southwest 4 EA $13.68 $54.72 D265 TURF DEESTONE 7026
REJECT TRW Tire 4 EA 530_00 $120.00 15/600-6 - CARLISLE TURF MASTER 5112521 Carlisle
REECT GONZALEZ AUTOQ PARTS 4 EA $33.07 $132.28 #5112521 Carlisle
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company 4 EA No Bid Carlisle
| 33 [rractor. 27 x 8.50-15 NHS or equal
Supplier QTyY Uom Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
REJECT [ALT1] TRW Tire 2 EA $62.00 $124.00 27/850-15 - DEESTONE D304 SKID R/G T/L  DEESTONE D304 SKID 6102
6102 R/GT/L 6102
REJECT [ALT1] Hesselbein Tire Southwest 2 EA $62.89 $125.78 D304 SKID DEESTONE 6102
REJECT [ALT1]) GONZALEZ AUTO PARTS 2 EA $68.72 $137.44 Tractor. 27 x 8.50-15 NHS or equal DEESTONE 6102
REIECT Southern Tire Mart, LLC 2 EA $109.28 $218.56 Galaxy R4 #GAL102141 Carlisle
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company 2 EA No Bid Carlisle
T&W Tire 2 EA No Bid Carlisle
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PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO 1.S.D.
TIRES FOR MAINTENANCE AND TRANSPORTATION VEHICLES DISTRICT WIDE BID # 19-20-035
BID OPENING: FEBRUARY 12, 2020 @ 2:30 P.M.

| 34 [rractor. 14.9-28 or equal |

Supplier QTY UoOM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
REIECT [ALT1] Hesselbein Tire Southwest 2 EA $303.95 $607.90 R-1 CROP MAX CM5635
REIECT Hesselbein Tire Southwest 2 EA $385.75 $771.50 Firestone
REJECT Southern Tire Mart, LLC 2 EA $397.06 $794.12 Firestone SAT I} 23 #008561 Firestone
REIECT TRW Tire 2 EA $418.00 $836.00 14.9-28 - FIRESTONE SAT 1 23 R-1 T/L 008561 Firestone
REJECT GONZALEZ AUTO PARTS 2 EA $443.62 $887.24 #008-561 Firestone
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company 2 EA No Bid Firestone
[ 35 [rractor. 18.4-30 or equal
Supplier QTy uomMm Price Extended  Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
REIECT Sguthern Tire Mart, LLC 2 EA $466.99 $933.98 Galaxy Earth Pro #GALS40567 Goodyear
REJECT [ALT1] GONZALEZ AUTO PARTS 2 EA $504.85 $1,009.70 Tractor. 18.4-30 or equal BKT 94003761
REIECT [ALT1] Hesselbein Tire Southwest 2 EA $549.00 $1,098.00 SAT Il R-1 FIRESTONE 372-626
REJECT [ALT1] T&W Tire 2 EA $593.00 $1,186.00 184-30- FIRESTONE SAT 11 23 -1 T/L 372-626 FIRESTONE SAT Il 2:372-626
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company 2 EA No Bid Goodyear
T&W Tire 2 EA No Bid Goodyear
| 36 [Tractor. 41 x 14.00-20 NHS or equal ]
Supplier QrYy Uom Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
REECT Hesselbein Tire Southwest 2 EA $413.85 $827.70 Titan
REJECT Southern Tire Mart, LLC 2 EA $483.06 $966.12 Galaxy Mighty Mow #GAL135343 Titan
REJECT [ALT1] T&W Tire 2 EA $525.00 $1,050.00 41/1400-20 - FOAM FILL 41/1400-20 - FOAN FF41140020
GONZALEZ AUTO PARTS 2 EA No Bid Titan
T&W Tire 2 EA No Bid Titan
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company 2 EA No Bid Titan
| 37 [rractor. 13.6-16 R3 or equal |
Supplier Qry uoMm Price Extended  Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
REECT [ALT1] Hesselbein Tire Southwest 2 EA $219.50 $439.00 TURF PRO CARLISLE 570080
REECT [ALT1] T&W Tire 2 EA $230.00 $460.00 13.6-16 - CARLISLE TURF PRO R-3 TL CARLISLE TURF PRC570080
REJECT [ALT1] GONZALEZ AUTO PARTS 2 EA $252.43 $504.86 Tractor. 13.6-16 R3 or equal CARLISLE 570080
REIECT Southern Tire Mart, LLC 2 EA $312.54 $625.08 Firestone Turf and Field #345210 Titan
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company 2 EA No Bid Titan
T&W Tire 2 EA No Bid Titan
[ 38 [rrailer.7.50-16 or equal
Supplier QTY UoOM Price Extended  Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
REJECT [ALT1] Hesselbein Tire Southwest 40 EA $71.58 $2,863.20 TRAIL EXPRESS ZEEMAX 1506H1031
REIECT Southern Tire Mart, LLC 40 EA $78.20 $3,128.00 Taskmaster #SF225D16F (225/90D16) Carlisle
REIECT Hesselbein Tire Southwest 40 EA $99.50 $3,980.00 Carlisle
REECT T&W Tire 40 EA $106.15 $4,246.00 ST750-16 (ST225/90D16} - CARLISLE SPORT TRAILLH 6H1431  Carlisle
REECT GONZALEZ AUTO PARTS 40 EA $114.43 $4,577.20 #6H01431 Carlisle
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company 40 EA No Bid Carlisle
| 39 [Trailer. ST225/75 R15 6 ply or equal
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
REIECT [ALT1] Hesselbein Tire Southwest 40 EA $52.37 $2,094.80 TRAILER TRANS EAGLE TSL10
REJECT Sputhern Tire Mart, LLC 40 EA $59.59 $2,383.60 Zenna #GL11720552253 Carlisle
REECT Hesselbein Tire Southwest 40 EA $61.50 $2,460.00 Carlisle
REIECT T&W Tire 40 EA $74.00 $2,960.00 ST225/75D15 - CARLISLE SPORT TRAIL LH 06H1411 Carlisle
REJECT GONZALEZ AUTO PARTS 40 EA $94.02 $3,760.80 #6H04621 Carlisle
REJECT [ALT1] The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company 40 EA $109.96 $4,398.40 ENDURANCE TRAILER ST225/75R15 117N LR-E ENDURANCE  GOODYEAR ENDURANCE TRAILER
BSWTL 724857519
| 40 |Trencher. 26 x 12.00-12 Lug or equal |
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended  Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
REIECT [ALT1] Hesselbein Tire Southwest 2 EA $75.26 $150.52 D408 R-1 DEESTONE 5336
REECT Hesselbein Tire Southwest 2 EA $107.75 $215.50 Carlisle
REJECT T&W Tire o EA $110.00 $220.00 26/12-12 - CARLISLE TRU POWER R-1 523361 Carlisle
REIECT GONZALEZ AUTO PARTS 2 EA $123.92 $247.84 #523361 Carlisle
REIECT Southern Tire Mart, LLC 2 EA $172.51 $345.02 Carlisle Tru Power #CA523360 Carlisle
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company 4 EA No Bid Carlisle
| 41 [Truck. 245/75R22.5 14 ply or equal.
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
REJECT [ALT1] Hesselbein Tire Southwest 4 EA $264.31 $1,057.24 TOYO M154 TOYO 548770
REIECT [ALT1] The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company 4 EA $272.00 $1,088.00 ENDURANCE RSA 245/75R22.5 G ENDURANCE RSA TL GOODYEAR s;“:ll;:‘;';jf -
REECT [ALT1] TRW Tire 4 EA $290.00 $1,160.00 245/75R225 - TOYO M154 PREM REGIONAL AP TOYO M154 PREM 1548770
REJECT [ALT1] GONZALEZ AUTOQ PARTS 4 EA $290.86 $1,163.44 Truck. 245/75R22.5 14 ply or equal. TOYO 548770
REJECT Southern Tire Mart, LLC 4 EA $325.00 $1,300.00 Bridgestone R268 Ecopia #000280 Bridgestone
T&W Tire 4 EA No Bid Bridgestone
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PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO 1.5.D.
TIRES FOR MAINTENANCE AND TRANSPORTATION VEHICLES DISTRICT WIDE BID # 19-20-035
BID OPENING: FEBRUARY 12, 2020 @ 2:30 P.M.

|42 [Truck. LT235/75 R15 6 ply or equal

Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
REJECT Southern Tire Mart, LLC 8 EA $101.24 $809.92 Firestone Destination AT2 #014043 Firestone
REIECT [ALT1] Hesselbein Tire Southwest 8 EA $102.00 $816.00 GRABBER A/T GENERAL 04508390000
REECT [ALT1] GONZALEZ AUTO PARTS 8 EA $102.35 $818.80 Truck. LT235/75 R15 6 ply or equal NEXEN 12744NXK
REIECT [A|T1] T&W Tire 8 EA $108.25 $866.00 HANKOOK DYNAPRO HT HANKOOK DYNAPR 2002008
REIECT Hesselbein Tire Southwest 8 EA $114.00 $912.00 Firestone
REJECT [ALT1] The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company 8 EA $128.49 $1,027.92 WRANGLER HT LT235/75R15C WRL HT BSL TL GOODYEAR WRANGLER HT 744826802
T&W Tire 8 EA No Bid Firestone
| 43 Jrruck. LT265/75 R16 10 ply or equal.
Supplier QTY UoOM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
REIECT [ALT1] Hesselbein Tire Southwest 8 EA $125.00 $1,000.00 GRABBER HD GENERAL 04507190000
REIECT [ALT1] TRW Tire 8 EA $135.38 $1,083.04 HANKOOK DYNAPRO HT HANKOOK DYNAPR 2001812
REIECT Hesselbein Tire Southwest 8 EA $141.00 $1,128.00 Firestone
RESECT Southern Tire Mart, LLC 8 EA $142.00 $1,136.00 Firestone Transforce HT2 #002762 Firestone
REIECT [ALT1] The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company 8 EA $150.93 $1,207.44 WRANGLER FORTITUDE HT LT265/7SR16 123R E WAL GOODYEAR WRANGLER FORTITUDE HT
FORTITUDE HT TL 179746620
REIECT GONZALEZ AUTO PARTS 8 EA $183.72 $1,469.76 #000-182 Firestone
T&W Tire 8 EA No Bid Firestone
| 44 [Truck. LT215/85 R16 10 ply or equal
Supplier Qry uomM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
REJECT [ALT2] Hesselbein Tire Southwest 4 EA $104.00 $416.00 GRABBER HD GENERAL 04507140000
REJECT Southern Tire Mart, LLC 4 EA $104.44 $417.76 Firestone Transforce HT2 #002758 Firestone
REJECT Hesselbein Tire Southwest 4 EA $105.00 $420.00 Firestone
REIECT [ALT1] The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company 4 EA $115.00 $460.00 WRANGLER HT LT215/85R16E WAL HT OL BSLTL GOODYEAR x':‘;;‘f;—gg b
REJECT [ALT1] T&W Tire 4 EA $117.80 $471.20 HANKOOK DYNAPRO HT HANKOOK DYNAPR 2001832
RUECT GONZALEZ AUTO PARTS 4 EA $169.92 $679.68 #000-178 Firestone
T&W Tire 4 EA No Bid Firestone
[ 45 [Truck. LT245/75 R16 10 ply or equal
Supplier QTY UoOM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
REIECT [ALT1] Hesselbein Tire Southwest 24 EA $110.00 $2,640.00 GRABBER HD GENERAL 04507180000
REIECT Southern Tire Mart, LLC 24 EA $111.00 $2,664.00 Firestone Transforce HT2 #002761 Firestone
REIECT Hesselbein Tire Southwest 24 EA $112.00 $2,688.00 Firestone
REIECT [ALT1] The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company 24 EA $120.00 $2,880.00 WRANGLER HT LT245/75R16 120R E WRL FORTITUDEHTTL  GOODYEAR WRANGLER HT 179747622
REIECT [ALT1] T&W Tire 24 EA $131.65 $3,159.60 HANKOOK DYNAPRO HT HANKOOK DYNAPR 2001614
REECT GONZALEZ AUTO PARTS 24  EA $174.80 $4,195.20 #000-181 Firestone
T&W Tire 24 EA No Bid Firestone
| 46 [rruck. LT245/70 R17 10 ply or equal
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended  Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
REJECT [ALT1] The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company (G012 EA $120.00 $1,440.00 WRANGLER FORTITUDE HT LT245/70R17 119R E WRL GOODYEAR WRANGLER FORTITUDE HT
FORTITUDE HT TL 179469622
REJECT [ALT1] Hesselbein Tire Southwest 12 EA $121.00 $1,452.00 GRABBER HD GENERAL 04507210000
REECT Hesselbein Tire Southwest 12 EA $125.00 $1,500.00 Firestone
REECT Southern Tire Mart, LLC 12 EA $125.00 $1,500.00 Firestone Transforce HT2 #002767 Firestone
REIECT [ALT1] TRW Tire 12 EA $137.33 $1,647.96 HANKOOK DYNAPRO HT HANKOOK DYNAPRO HT 2001833
REECT GONZALEZ AUTO PARTS 12 EA $198.67 $2,384.04 #000-186 Firestone
T&W Tire 12 EA No Bid Firestone
| 47 [Truck. LT275/65 R18 10 ply or equal
Supplier QTYy UoM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
REECT [ALT1] Hesselbein Tire Southwest 8 EA $147.00 $1,176.00 GRABER HD GENERAL 04509170000
RBJECT [ALT]_] The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company 8 EA 515000 51,20000 FORTITUDE HT LT275/65R18 123R E WRL FORTITUDE HT TL GOODYEAR FORTITUDE HT 179092622
REECT Hesselbein Tire Southwest 8 EA $153.00 $1,224.00 Firestone
REIECT Southern Tire Mart, LLC 8 EA $154.00 $1,232.00 Firestone Transforce HT2 #002773 Firestone
REIECT [ALT1] TRW Tire 8 EA $188.87 $1,510.96 HANKOOK DYNAPRO AT2 HANKOOK DYNAPRO AT2 2020861
REIECT GONZALEZ AUTO PARTS 8 EA $232.30 $1,858.40 #002-773 Firestone
{Laredo Gonzalez Auto Parts, Ltd.}
T&W Tire 8 EA No Bid Firestone
[ 48 [Passenger Vehicle. P205/60 R16 or equal
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended  Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
REIECT [ALT1] The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company (Goo 6 EA $65.85 $395.10 ASSURANCE ALL SEASON 205/60R16 92T SL A’ GOODYEAR :2:‘2’;‘:3”;5 ALL SEASON
REIECT [ALT1) TRW Tire 6 EA $66.30 $397.80 HANKOOK KINERGY ST HANKOOK KINERGY ST 1021500
REECT [ALT1] Hesselbein Tire Southwest 6 EA $74.00 $444.00 ALTIMAX RT43 GENERAL 15434930000
REECT Hesselbein Tire Southwest 6 EA $75.00 $450.00 Firestone
REJECT Southern Tire Mart, LLC 6 EA $76.64 $459.84 Firestone Champlon Fuel Fighter #015182 Firestone
REIECT GONZALEZ AUTO PARTS 6 EA $101.49 $608.94 #015-182 Firestone
T&W Tire 6 EA No Bid Firestone
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PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO 1.S.D.
TIRES FOR MAINTENANCE AND TRANSPORTATION VEHICLES DISTRICT WIDE BID # 19-20-035
BID OPENING: FEBRUARY 12, 2020 @ 2:30 P.M.

| 49 [Light Truck, Police SUV All S P265/60 R17 speed rating H or equal

Supplier QTYy uom Price Extended  Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
REJECT [ALT1] The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company 48 EA $115.00 §5,520,00 EAGLE RS-A P265/50R17 108V 5L EAG RS-A VSBRPTL (Tahoe)  GOODYEAR EAGLERS-A 732523500
REIECT [ALT1] Hesselbein Tire Southwest 48 EA $118.00 $5,664.00 G-MAX JUSTICE PURSUIT GENERAL 15553560000
REIECT [ALT1] T&W Tire 48 EA $121.66 $5,839.68 BF GOODRICH ADVANTAGE TA SPORT BF GOODRICH ADV. 88590
REIECT Southern Tire Mart, LLC 48 EA $122.00 $5,856.00 Firestone Firehawk GTV Pursuit #023189 Firestone
REECT Hegselbein Tire Southwest 48 EA $123.00 $5,904,00 Firestone
REIECT [ALT1] GONZALEZ AUTO PARTS 48 EA 5216.78 $10,405.44 Lisht Truck,palice UV Al esson. P265/60 R17 speed rating - GENERAL 15553960000

H or equal
T&W Tire 48 EA No Bid Firestone
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PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO 1.5.D.
TIRES FOR MAINTENANCE AND TRANSPORTATION VEHICLES DISTRICT WIDE BID # 19-20-035
BID OPENING: FEBRUARY 12, 2020 @ 2:30 P.M.

Att# Attribute Name GONZALEZ AUTO PARTS Hesselbein Tire Southern Tire T&W Tire The Goodyear Tire &
|(Laredo Gonzalez Auto Parts, Ltd.) Southwest Mart, LLC Rubber Company (Goodyear
Commercial Tire & Service Center)

66 Business/Company Owner Name Joe Gage Jr,, Bob Dunlop Thomas and T&W Tire, LLC The Goodyear Tire &
Please provide the complete name of the 956-726-9766 James Duff Rubber Company
business/company owner responding to the bid/proposal

67 Date of Establishment 1934 1987 in Texas June 2003 1985 1898

68 Wil the bid/proposal deviate from No No No Yes Yes
specifications?

69 "No Deviation" " No Deviations " No Deviation ~ T&W is not a Firestone or Pt 43, Pt 25, Pt 33, pt 35, Pt

If no please state "No devlation", if yes,
please specify deviations:

(Please also complete and attach Form B - Devlations from:
SpecificatlonsCompliance Signature Form to this bid
response,)
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Goodyear dealer, so we
will propose alternative
brands such as Hankook
which are comparable in
quality and competltive

In pricing.

49, Pt 321




PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO 1.5.D.
TIRES FOR MAINTENANCE AND TRANSPORTATION VEHICLES DISTRICT WIDE BID # 19-20-035
BID OPENING: FEBRUARY 12, 2020 @ 2:30 P.M.

|Responding Supplier Signature Full Name Signature Email Supplier Notes

GONZALEZ AUTO PARTS (Lared(JOE GAGE JR. blds@gapautoparts.com

Hesselbein Tire Southwest Rick Lopez rickL@dktire.com

Southern Tire Mart, LLC Richard Conwill richard.conwill@stmtires.com Bid to be serviced by
Southern Tire Mart, LLC
345 W Exp. 83
Pharr, TX 78577

Robert Salinas, Manager
gov-sales@stmtires.com

T&W Tire losh Thompson jthompson@tandwtire.com It's been a pleasure doing business with PSIA-ISD the past year and
we look forward to doing business in 2020!

The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Cc Michelle May ct_govtsales@goodyear.com
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