



March 3, 2014

Ms. Lisa Abbey
Director of Business Services
Livonia Public Schools
15125 Farmington Road
Livonia, MI 48154

RE: Contract Award Recommendation for Construction Bids
Coolidge, Cleveland and Rosedale Lower Elementary Schools

Dear Ms. Abbey:

This letter transmits an update from Plante Moran Cresa (PMC) as it relates to the assignment to assist and advise Livonia Public Schools (LPS) in its selection of Prime Contractors for the Projects listed above. This update represents the mutual efforts of PMC, McCarthy & Smith, French Associates and LPS administration and staff (the Bond Team) to present a framework in order to identify, evaluate and recommend Prime Contractors firms for this Project.

On January 23, 2014 Construction Documents were formally issued and made available. An advertisement for bids was published in a local newspaper and also posted to the required State of Michigan websites.

On February 13, 2014 over 240 bid proposals were received from 124 separate firms, and over the next several days were reviewed to determine the budget implications. Interviews were held over the next two weeks and were attended by various members of the Bond Team.

Upon completion of the interviews, and after subsequent clarifications and discussions, the Bond Team is recommending the firms listed in McCarthy & Smith's Award Recommendation Letter dated February 28, 2014 for contract award. Including hard construction, CM fees and costs, and construction contingency dollars, the total Project award recommendation equals \$7,240,908.00. This also includes several Alternates as detailed in the letter.

For the Prime Contractors, the costs for this work will be detailed in AIA Contract A132 – 2009 Standard Form of Agreement between Owner and Contractor. The CM costs and fees will be detailed in Amendment #01 to AIA – C132 – 2009 Standard Form of Agreement between Owner and Construction Manager, both pending final review and approval by district legal counsel.

The Project Team is available at the Board's convenience to answer any questions regarding bidding, the interview process, or the recommendations of the Bond Team. Please direct all questions through me via email.

Sincerely,

PLANTE MORAN CRESA

A handwritten signature in black ink, appearing to read 'P - T' followed by a stylized flourish.

Paul Theriault, PE, LEED AP
Vice President

Enclosures: Budget Summary
 Award Recommendation Letter
 Summary of Costs
 Bid Tabulations



CLEVELAND, COOLIDGE AND ROSEDALE - BUDGET SUMMARY

Building	Hard Construction		
	Budget	Actual	Variance
Cleveland Elementary	\$ 2,518,768	\$ 2,225,133	\$ 293,635
Coolidge Elementary	\$ 3,092,684	\$ 2,332,266	\$ 760,418
Rosedale Elementary	\$ 2,294,407	\$ 1,555,288	\$ 739,119
Totals	\$ 7,905,859	\$ 6,112,688	\$ 1,793,171

Building	CM Fees/Costs		
	Budget	Actual	Variance
Cleveland Elementary	\$ 201,501	\$ 172,317	\$ 29,184
Coolidge Elementary	\$ 247,415	\$ 172,317	\$ 75,098
Rosedale Elementary	\$ 183,553	\$ 172,317	\$ 11,236
Totals	\$ 632,469	\$ 516,951	\$ 115,518

Building	Construction Contingency		
	Budget	Actual	Variance
Cleveland Elementary	\$ 239,732	\$ 222,513	\$ 17,219
Coolidge Elementary	\$ 294,356	\$ 233,227	\$ 61,129
Rosedale Elementary	\$ 218,378	\$ 155,529	\$ 62,849
Totals	\$ 752,466	\$ 611,269	\$ 141,197

Building	Total Project Costs		
	Budget	Actual	Variance
Cleveland Elementary	\$ 2,960,002	\$ 2,619,964	\$ 340,038
Coolidge Elementary	\$ 3,634,454	\$ 2,737,810	\$ 896,645
Rosedale Elementary	\$ 2,696,337	\$ 1,883,134	\$ 813,204
Totals	\$ 9,290,793	\$ 7,240,908	\$ 2,049,886



McCarthy & Smith, Inc.
Construction Services

February 28, 2014

Lisa Abbey, Director of Business Services
 Livonia Public Schools
 15125 Farmington Road
 Livonia, MI 48154

RE: Livonia Public Schools – 2013 Bond Program
 Bid Package #1 – Cleveland, Coolidge and Rosedale Elementary School Remodeling Projects

SUBJ: Contract Award Recommendation

Dear Ms. Abbey,

On Thursday, February 13, 2014 at 12:00 p.m., sealed bids were received and publicly opened for the above referenced project. In attendance for the bid opening were representatives from Livonia Public Schools, Plante Moran Cresa, French Associates, McCarthy & Smith, Inc. and interested bidders. Bids were opened, recorded and tabulated. We received 241 bids from 124 vendors covering 37 separate scopes of work.

The project team conducted post bid interviews with each of the qualified bidders for each bid division of work. During the post bid interview, the project team reviewed the scope of work, project schedule, manpower requirements, and specified materials with each of the contractors. Based upon the project team's review of the proposals and bidders, we propose the following recommendations to Livonia Public Schools for contract award:

Bid Division 103: Selective Demolition (Cleveland)

Phil Monsour

DKI, Inc.

6346 Orchard Lake Road, Suite 16

West Bloomfield, MI 48322

Base Bid	\$ 77,800.00
PLM Bond (Western Surety Company)	\$ 2,500.00
Alternate: A-3CL (Provide and Install new student corridor lockers)	<u>\$ 600.00</u>
TOTAL	\$ 80,900.00

Bid Division 103: Selective Demolition (Coolidge)*

Phil Monsour

DKI, Inc.

6346 Orchard Lake Road, Suite 16

West Bloomfield, MI 48322

Base Bid	\$ 48,800.00
PLM Bond (Not Required)	<u>\$ 0.00</u>
TOTAL	\$ 48,800.00

***2nd low bidder. Apparent low bidder had multiple items missed in the scope and is not recommended for the project.**

Bid Division 103: Selective Demolition (Rosedale)

Phil Monsour
DKI, Inc.
6346 Orchard Lake Road, Suite 16
West Bloomfield, MI 48322

Base Bid	\$	38,800.00
PLM Bond (Not Required)	\$	<u>0.00</u>
TOTAL	\$	38,800.00

Bid Division 104: Concrete Foundations*

Robert Sheridan
R.L. Sheridan
32125 Block
Garden City, MI 48135

Base Bid	\$	49,900.00
PLM Bond (The Guarantee Company of North America USA)	\$	<u>1,300.00</u>
TOTAL	\$	51,200.00

***2nd low bidder. Apparent low bidder had a gross error in their bid, and respectfully requested their bid be withdrawn from consideration.**

Bid Division 106: Masonry

Daniel Thomas
Heritage Contracting LLC
3821 Camden Place
Clarkston, MI 48348

Base Bid	\$	153,600.00
PLM Bond (North American Specialty Insurance Company)	\$	<u>2,300.00</u>
TOTAL	\$	155,900.00

Bid Division 107: Steel

Jim Sowards
Morkin & Sowards, Inc.
38058 Van Born Rd.
Wayne, MI 48184

Base Bid	\$	37,400.00
PLM Bond (Not Required)	\$	<u>0.00</u>
TOTAL	\$	37,400.00

Bid Division 108: Carpentry / General Trades

Jeff Sordyl
Arjac, Inc.
11267 Kennebec
Allen Park, MI 48101

Base Bid	\$	103,195.00
PLM Bond (Granite Re, Inc.)	\$	2,580.00
Alternate: A-1CL (Replace existing closers for the classroom toilet rooms with new closers)	\$	3,765.00
Alternate: A-3CL (Provide and install new student corridor lockers)	\$	13,552.00
Alternate: A-1CO (Replace existing closers for the classroom toilet rooms with new closers)	\$	4,689.00
Alternate: A-1RO (Replace existing closers for the classroom toilet rooms with new closers)	\$	<u>2,199.00</u>
TOTAL	\$	129,980.00

Bid Division 109: Roofing

Don Ciampichini
Newton Crane Roofing, Inc.
353 North Cass Avenue
Pontiac, MI 48342

Base Bid	\$	58,500.00
PLM Bond (Merchants Bonding Company)	\$	<u>900.00</u>
TOTAL	\$	59,400.00

Bid Division 113: Hollow Metal / Wood Doors / Finish Hardware*

Jack Patton
LaForce, Inc.
289 Robbins Drive
Troy, MI 48083

Base Bid	\$	148,571.00
PLM Bond (Liberty Mutual)	\$	1,486.00
Alternate: A-1CL (Replace existing closers for the classroom toilet rooms with new closers)	\$	5,676.00
Alternate: A-1CO (Replace existing closers for the classroom toilet rooms with new closers)	\$	6,471.00
Alternate: A-1RO (Replace existing closers for the classroom toilet rooms with new closers)	\$	<u>2,952.00</u>
TOTAL	\$	165,156.00

***2nd low bidder. Apparent low bidder had a gross error in their bid, and respectfully requested their bid be withdrawn from consideration.**

Bid Division 114: Alum Entrances; Windows; Glass & Glazing (Cleveland)

Howard Beindit
Preferred Glass Inc.
6215 King Road
Marine City, MI 48039

Base Bid	\$	307,750.00
PLM Bond (Travelers Casualty & Surety Company of America)	\$	<u>6,000.00</u>
TOTAL	\$	313,750.00

Bid Division 114: Alum Entrances; Windows; Glass & Glazing (Coolidge)*

Martin W. Dziejewit
DZI Construction Services, Inc.
8405 Anderson Road, Suite F
Clarkston, MI 48346

Base Bid	\$	305,000.00
PLM Bond (International Fidelity Insurance Company)	\$	6,100.00
Alternate: A-3CO - Replace Media Center Single Pane Windows with Double Pane Windows	\$	<u>14,000.00</u>
TOTAL	\$	325,100.00

***2nd low bidder with Alternate. DZI is being recommended due to scheduling and manpower requirements needed to complete the project on schedule. .**

Bid Division 114: Alum Entrances; Windows; Glass & Glazing (Rosedale)

John Trenkamp

B&B Glass.

3885 Industrial Drive

Rochester Hills, MI 48309

Base Bid	\$	146,000.00
PLM Bond (North American Specialty Insurance Company)	\$	3,200.00
Alternate: A-3RO Replace Media Center Single Pane Windows with Double Pane Windows		
	\$	<u>13,600.00</u>
TOTAL	\$	162,800.00

Bid Division 115: Metal Studs / GPDW / EIFS

Jeff Sordyl

Arjac, Inc.

11267 Kennebec

Allen Park, MI 48101

Base Bid	\$	55,729.00
PLM Bond (Granite Re, Inc.)	\$	<u>1,394.00</u>
TOTAL	\$	57,123.00

Bid Division 116: Hard Tile

William Elzay

D.F. Floor Covering

5242 Exchange Drive, Suite 2

Flint, MI 48507

Base Bid	\$	40,860.00
PLM Bond (Not Required)	\$	<u>0.00</u>
TOTAL	\$	40,860.00

Bid Division 117: Acoustical Treatments (Cleveland)

Doug Hull

Impressive Tile Company, Inc.

12992 West 8 Mile Road

Oak Park, MI 48237

Base Bid	\$	84,000.00
PLM Bond (West Bend Mutual Insurance Company)	\$	<u>900.00</u>
TOTAL	\$	84,900.00

Bid Division 117: Acoustical Treatments (Coolidge)

Doug Hull

Impressive Tile Company, Inc.

12992 West 8 Mile Road

Oak Park, MI 48237

Base Bid	\$	94,500.00
PLM Bond (West Bend Mutual Insurance Company)	\$	<u>1,000.00</u>
TOTAL	\$	95,500.00

Bid Division 117: Acoustical Treatments (Rosedale)

Doug Hull

Impressive Tile Company, Inc.

12992 West 8 Mile Road

Oak Park, MI 48237

Base Bid	\$	66,500.00
PLM Bond (West Bend Mutual Insurance Company)	\$	<u>800.00</u>
TOTAL	\$	67,300.00

Bid Division 118: Carpet & Resilient Flooring (Cleveland)

Mark Cohn

Cohn's Commercial Floor Covering

47561 Avante Drive

Wixom, MI 48393

Base Bid	\$	92,000.00
PLM Bond (North American Specialty Insurance Company)	\$	750.00
Alternate: A-2CL Provide 12' x 12' area rug for each classroom	\$	<u>11,600.00</u>
TOTAL	\$	104,350.00

Bid Division 118: Carpet & Resilient Flooring (Coolidge)

Mark Cohn

Cohn's Commercial Floor Covering

47561 Avante Drive

Wixom, MI 48393

Base Bid	\$	97,100.00
PLM Bond (North American Specialty Insurance Company)	\$	850.00
Alternate: A-2CO Provide 12' x 12' area rug for each classroom	\$	<u>11,600.00</u>
TOTAL	\$	109,550.00

Bid Division 118: Carpet & Resilient Flooring (Rosedale)

Mark Cohn

Cohn's Commercial Floor Covering

47561 Avante Drive

Wixom, MI 48393

Base Bid	\$	80,100.00
PLM Bond (North American Specialty Insurance Company)	\$	690.00
Alternate: A-2RO Provide 12' x 12' area rug for each classroom	\$	<u>11,600.00</u>
TOTAL	\$	92,390.00

Bid Division 120: Painting (Cleveland)

Steve Normand

Classic Painting Company, Inc.

9903 Viewcrest Ct.

Howell, MI 48843

Base Bid	\$	42,827.00
PLM Bond (Merchants Bonding Company)	\$	<u>1,098.00</u>
TOTAL	\$	43,925.00

Bid Division 120: Painting (Coolidge)

Steve Normand

Classic Painting Company, Inc.

9903 Viewcrest Ct.

Howell, MI 48843

Base Bid	\$	41,745.00
PLM Bond (Merchants Bonding Company)	\$	<u>1,070.00</u>
TOTAL	\$	42,815.00

Bid Division 120: Painting (Rosedale)

Steve Normand
Classic Painting Company, Inc.
9903 Viewcrest Ct.
Howell, MI 48843

Base Bid	\$ 28,755.00
PLM Bond (Merchants Bonding Company)	<u>\$ 737.00</u>
TOTAL	\$ 29,492.00

Bid Division 121: Visual Display Boards

Tom Schiller
Cig Jan Products LTD
39 Twin Oaks Drive
Lapeer, MI 48446

Base Bid	\$ 59,154.00
PLM Bond (Western Surety Company)	<u>\$ 900.00</u>
TOTAL	\$ 60,054.00

Bid Division 125: Toilet Partitions*

Phil Marien
Rayhaven Group Inc.
22122 Telegraph.
Southfield, MI 48033

Base Bid	\$ 24,149.00
PLM Bond (Not Required)	<u>\$ 0.00</u>
TOTAL	\$ 24,149.00

*Apparent low bidder included a voluntary alternate for a base bid requirement that when added to the base bid made them 2nd.

Bid Division 128: Casework

Michael Lee
Stonecreek Interior Systems, LLC
7603 Green Meadows Drive
Lewis Center, MI 43035

Base Bid	\$ 285,850.00
PLM Bond (Western Surety Company)	<u>\$ 2,851.00</u>
TOTAL	\$ 288,701.00

Bid Division 140: Plumbing (Cleveland)

Dustan Cunningham
J. M. & Sons Plumbing Company
8080 Boardwalk
Brighton, MI 48116

Base Bid	\$ 88,986.00
PLM Bond (Old Republic Insurance)	<u>\$ 1,300.00</u>
TOTAL	\$ 90,286.00

Bid Division 140: Plumbing (Coolidge)

Dustan Cunningham
J. M. & Sons Plumbing Company
8080 Boardwalk
Brighton, MI 48116

Base Bid	\$ 63,049.00
PLM Bond (Old Republic Insurance)	<u>\$ 925.00</u>
TOTAL	\$ 63,974.00

Bid Division 140: Plumbing (Rosedale)

Dustan Cunningham

J. M. & Sons Plumbing Company

8080 Boardwalk

Brighton, MI 48116

Base Bid

\$ 68,593.00

PLM Bond (Old Republic Insurance)

\$ 1,000.00

TOTAL

\$ **69,593.00**

Bid Division 142: HVAC (Cleveland)

Jon Clark

Johnson & Wood, LLC

2130 E. Hemphill Road

Burton, MI 48529

Base Bid

\$ 617,000.00

PLM Bond (Westfield Insurance Company)

\$ 6,170.00

Alternate: M-1CL Replace Existing Condensing Unit

\$ 44,800.00

TOTAL

\$ **667,970.00**

***2nd low bidder. Apparent low bidder had a gross error in their bid, and respectfully requested their bid be withdrawn from consideration.**

Bid Division 142: HVAC (Coolidge)

Michael Mills

Mills Mechanical, LLC

406 Bearberry Lane

Ortonville, MI 48462

Base Bid

\$ 700,060.00

PLM Bond (Westfield Insurance Company)

\$ 11,400.00

Alternate: M-1CO Replace Existing Condensing Unit

\$ 31,000.00

TOTAL

\$ **742,460.00**

***3rd low bidder. Apparent low bidders had a gross error in their bid, and respectfully requested their bid be withdrawn from consideration.**

Bid Division 142: HVAC (Rosedale)

Matthew Miller

Miller-Boldt, Inc.

42826 Mound Road

Sterling Heights, MI 48314

Base Bid

\$ 478,000.00

PLM Bond (Westfield Insurance Company)

\$ 7,000.00

Alternate: M-1RO Replace Existing Condensing Unit

\$ 22,700.00

TOTAL

\$ **507,700.00**

***2nd low bidder. Apparent low bidder had a gross error in their bid, and respectfully requested their bid be withdrawn from consideration.**

Bid Division 143: Electrical (Cleveland)*

Robert Abb

Lineside LLC

7723 Kensington Ct.

Brighton, MI 48116

Base Bid	\$	424,000.00
PLM Bond (AMCO Insurance Company)	\$	8,000.00
Alternate: M-1CL Electrical required to Replace Existing Condensing Unit	\$	500.00
TOTAL	\$	432,500.00

***2nd low bidder. Apparent low bidder had a gross error in their bid, and respectfully requested their bid be withdrawn from consideration.**

Bid Division 143: Electrical (Coolidge)*

Joseph Brewer

Metro Electric Engineering Technology

110 East Pond Drive

Romeo, MI 48065

Base Bid	\$	448,000.00
PLM Bond (Cincinnati Insurance Company)	\$	4,000.00
Alternate: M-1CO Electrical required to Replace Existing Condensing Unit	\$	2,500.00
TOTAL	\$	454,500.00

***2nd low bidder. Apparent low bidder had a gross error in their bid, and respectfully requested their bid be withdrawn from consideration.**

Bid Division 143: Electrical (Rosedale)*

Alvin E. Giroux

Omega Electric, Inc.

24784 Hathaway Street

Farmington Hills, MI 48335

Base Bid	\$	329,000.00
PLM Bond (Westfield Insurance Company)	\$	6,600.00
Alternate: M-1RO Electrical required to Replace Existing Condensing Unit	\$	460.00
TOTAL	\$	336,060.00

***3rd low bidder. Apparent low bidder had a gross error in their bid, and respectfully requested their bid be withdrawn from consideration. The 2nd bidder is Lineside LLC. They do not have the capacity to perform Cleveland and Rosedale and has asked only to be awarded Cleveland.**

Bid Division 185: Test and Balance

Viliam Barci

Barmatic Inspecting Company

1771 Dix Avenue, Suite 200

Lincoln Park, MI 48146

Base Bid	\$	37,350.00
PLM Bond (Not Required)	\$	0.00
TOTAL	\$	37,350.00

TOTAL AWARD RECOMMENDATION AMOUNT: \$ 6,112,688.00

I trust the above recommendation meets the approval of the administration and the Board of Education. I will be in attendance at the March 3, 2014 board meeting to address any questions or concerns that may arise.

Please feel free to contact me with any questions.

Sincerely,



Steve Banchemo
Sr. Project Manager

cc: Mr. Paul Theriault, Plante Moran Cresa
Ms. Keti Mitevska, French Associates
Mr. Bill McCarthy, McCarthy & Smith, Inc.
Ms. Lisa Bondy, McCarthy & Smith, Inc.
Mr. Rob Sturdy, McCarthy & Smith, Inc.
Mr. Dave Hampton, McCarthy & Smith, Inc.
File

**Livonia Public Schools Bid Pack 1
Cleveland, Coolidge and Rosedale
Construction Budget Summary**

Contractors Awarded Bid



Bid Division of Work	Contract amounts including alternates			Totals
	Cleveland	Coolidge	Rosedale	
103 Selective Demolition - DKI, Inc.	\$ 80,900.00	\$ 48,800.00	\$ 38,800.00	\$ 168,500.00
104 Concrete Foundations - RL Sheridan	\$ 16,650.00	\$ 34,550.00		\$ 51,200.00
106 Masonry - Heritage Contracting	\$ 49,500.00	\$ 71,800.00	\$ 34,600.00	\$ 155,900.00
107 Steel - Morkin and Sowards	\$ 10,166.00	\$ 22,937.00	\$ 4,297.00	\$ 37,400.00
108 Carpentry / General Trades - Arjac, Inc.	\$ 56,839.00	\$ 42,801.00	\$ 30,340.00	\$ 129,980.00
109 Roofing - Newton Crane Roofing, Inc.	\$ 8,380.00	\$ 47,820.00	\$ 3,200.00	\$ 59,400.00
113 Hollow Metal / Wood Doors / Finish Hardware - LaForce, Inc.	\$ 63,986.33	\$ 67,320.33	\$ 33,849.33	\$ 165,155.99
114 Alum Entrances; Windows; Glass & Glazing - Preferred Glass	\$ 313,750.00			\$ 313,750.00
114 Alum Entrances; Windows; Glass & Glazing - DZI Construction		\$ 325,100.00		\$ 325,100.00
114 Alum Entrances; Windows; Glass & Glazing - B&B Glass			\$ 162,800.00	\$ 162,800.00
115 Metal Studs / GPDW / EIFS - Arjac, Inc.	\$ 26,652.67	\$ 25,005.67	\$ 5,464.67	\$ 57,123.01
116 Hard Tile - DF Floor Covering	\$ 19,920.00	\$ 9,800.00	\$ 11,140.00	\$ 40,860.00
117 Acoustical Treatments - Impressive Tile Company	\$ 84,900.00	\$ 95,500.00	\$ 67,300.00	\$ 247,700.00
118 Carpet & Resilient Flooring - Cohn's Commercial Floor Covering	\$ 104,350.00	\$ 109,550.00	\$ 92,390.00	\$ 306,290.00
120 Painting - Classic Painting	\$ 43,925.00	\$ 42,815.00	\$ 29,492.00	\$ 116,232.00
121 Visual Display Boards - Cig Jan Products LTD	\$ 20,162.00	\$ 20,521.00	\$ 19,371.00	\$ 60,054.00
125 Toilet Partition - Rayhaven Group	\$ 4,196.00	\$ 17,662.00	\$ 2,291.00	\$ 24,149.00
128 Casework - Sotne Creek Interior Systems, LLC	\$ 117,450.33	\$ 75,100.33	\$ 96,150.33	\$ 288,700.99
130 Window Treatments - NOT OPENED				\$ -
140 Plumbing - JM & Sons Plumbing Company	\$ 90,286.00	\$ 63,974.00	\$ 69,593.00	\$ 223,853.00
142 HVAC (Cleveland) - Johnson & Wood, LLC	\$ 667,970.00			\$ 667,970.00
142 HVAC (Coolidge) - Mills Mechanical, LLC		\$ 742,460.00		\$ 742,460.00
142 HVAC (Rosedale) - Miller-Bolt, Inc.			\$ 507,700.00	\$ 507,700.00
143 Electrical (Cleveland) - Lineside, LLC	\$ 432,500.00			\$ 432,500.00
143 Electrical (Coolidge) - Metro Electric Engineering		\$ 454,500.00		\$ 454,500.00
143 Electrical (Rosedale) - Omega Electric			\$ 336,060.00	\$ 336,060.00
185 Test and Balance - Baromatic Inspecting Company	\$ 12,650.00	\$ 14,250.00	\$ 10,450.00	\$ 37,350.00
Subtotal	\$ 2,225,133.33	\$ 2,332,266.33	\$ 1,555,288.33	\$ 6,112,688.00
CM Fee	\$ 39,074.49	\$ 39,074.49	\$ 39,074.49	\$ 117,223.47
CM Staffing Labor	\$ 104,838.67	\$ 104,838.67	\$ 104,838.67	\$ 314,516.01
CM General Conditions	\$ 7,366.67	\$ 7,366.67	\$ 7,366.67	\$ 22,100.01
General Conditions	\$ 21,037.05	\$ 21,037.05	\$ 21,037.05	\$ 63,111.15
Sub Total	\$ 172,316.88	\$ 172,316.88	\$ 172,316.88	\$ 516,950.64
Project Contingency	\$ 222,513.00	\$ 233,227.00	\$ 155,529.00	\$ 611,269.00
Total	\$ 2,619,963.21	\$ 2,737,810.21	\$ 1,883,134.21	\$ 7,240,907.63

Project: Bid Package #1
Owner: Livonia Public Schools
Architect: French Associates
Construction Mgr: McCarthy & Smith, Inc.
Bid Due Date: Thursday, February 13, 2014 @ 12:00 pm
BD #: 109 Roofing



	Bidder	Base Bid	PLM Bond	Total	Bid Security	Fam. Disc.	Iran Sanct.	Add #1	Add #2	Add #3	Remarks
1	Newton & Crane 353 N. Cass Ave Pontiac, MI 48342 (248) 332-3021	\$58,500.00	\$900.00	\$59,400.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	Vol. Alt.: Panel (\$3,800.00)
2	J.D. candler Roofing 31111 Industrial Road Livonia, MI 48150 (734) 762-0100	\$60,400.00	\$525.00	\$60,925.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	
3	Esko Roofing 14000 Simone Drive Shelby Twp., MI (586) 532-1950	\$392,000.00	\$6,000.00	\$398,000.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	Vol. Alt.: Install Omega Panel (\$147,000.00)

Project: Bid Package #1

Owner: Livonia Public Schools

Architect: French Associates

Construction Mgr: McCarthy & Smith, Inc.

Bid Due Date: Thursday, February 13, 2014 @ 12:00 pm

BD #: 115 Metal Studs / Drywall / Plaster / EIFS



	Bidder	Base Bid	PLM Bond	Total	Bid Security	Fam. Disc.	Iran Sanct.	Add #1	Add #2	Add #3	Remarks
1	A/jac 11267 Kennebuc Allen Park, MI (313) 383-8234	\$55,729.00	\$1,394.00	\$57,123.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	
2	Eikhorn Construction 6072 N. Birch Hill Kimball, MI 48074 (810) 367-7460	\$65,900.00	\$1,100.00	\$67,000.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	CBD of (\$5,000.00) w/BD108 CBD of (\$6,000.00) w/BD108 and BD117
3	Arrow Acoustical, Inc. 1255 W. Michigan Ave. Ypsilanti, MI 48197 (734) 483-0733	\$69,060.00	\$2,072.00	\$71,132.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	
4	ANM Construction 55331 Lyon Industrial New Hudson, MI (248) 486-7090	\$71,240.00	\$1,000.00	\$72,240.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	
5	Grunwell Cashero 1041 Major Ave. Detroit MI 48217 (313) 843-8440	\$107,250.00	\$1,340.00	\$108,590.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	
6	Commercial Contract 4260 N. Atlantic Blvd. Auburn Hills, MI (248) 209-0500	\$114,000.00	\$1,150.00	\$115,150.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	
7	Central Ceiling 3742 E. Ten Mile Road Warren, MI (248) 960-9800	\$158,800.00	\$3,200.00	\$162,000.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	



Project: Bid Package #1
Owner: Livonia Public Schools
Architect: French Associates
Construction Mgr: McCarthy & Smith, Inc.
Bid Due Date: Thursday, February 13, 2014 @ 12:00 p.m.
BD #: 117 Acoustical Ceilings - Cleveland Elementary School

Bidder	Cleveland Base Bid	Cleveland PLM Bond	Cleveland Total	Bid Security	Fam. Disc.	Iran Sanct.	Add #1	Add #2	Add #3	Remarks
1 Impressive Tile Co. 12992 W. Eight Mile Oak Park, MI 48237 (248) 545-9000	\$84,000.00	\$900.00	\$84,900.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	
2 Commercial Contract 4260 N. Atlantic Blvd. Auburn Hills, MI (248) 209-0500	\$90,500.00	\$910.00	\$91,410.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	
3 R.E. Leggette Co. 9335 St. Stephens St. Dearborn, MI 48126 (313) 584-2000	\$90,570.00	\$1,190.00	\$91,760.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	
4 Elkhorn Construction 6072 N. Birch Hill Kimball, MI 48074 (810) 367-7460	\$97,000.00	\$1,500.00	\$98,500.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	CBD of (\$6,000.00) w/BD108 and BD115
5 Northwest Acoustical 12675 Arnold Ave. Redford, MI 48239 (313) 531-3100	\$103,420.00	\$1,865.00	\$105,285.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	VA: Alternate Tile (\$2,100.00)
6 William E. Harnish 24400 Capitol Road Redford, MI 48239 (313) 538-8823	\$104,433.00	\$3,310.00	\$107,743.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	
7 Turner Brooks 28811 John R. Road Madison Hgts MI 48071 (248) 548-3400	\$107,620.00	\$1,100.00	\$108,720.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	
8 ANIM Construction 55331 Lyon Industrial New Hudson, MI (248) 486-7090	\$117,182.00	\$1,100.00	\$118,282.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	
9 Central Ceiling 3742 E. Ten Mile Warren, MI (248) 960-9800	\$109,700.00	\$22,000.00	\$131,700.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	
10 Grunwell-Cashero 1041 Major Ave. Detroit MI 48217 (313) 843-8440	\$175,000.00	\$2,187.50	\$177,187.50	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	



Project: Bid Package #1
Owner: Livonia Public Schools
Architect: French Associates
Construction Mgr: McCarthy & Smith, Inc.

Bid Due Date: Thursday, February 13, 2014 @ 12:00 p.m.

BD #: 117 Acoustical Ceilings - Coolidge Elementary School

Bidder	Coolidge Base Bid	Coolidge PLM Bond	Coolidge Total	Bid Security	Fam. Disc.	Iran Sanct.	Add #1	Add #2	Add #3	Remarks
1. Impressive Tile Co. 12992 W. Eight Mile Oak Park, MI 48237 (248) 545-9000	\$94,500.00	\$1,000.00	\$95,500.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	
2 R.E. Leggette Co. 9335 St. Stephens St. Dearborn, MI 48126 (313) 584-2000	\$107,990.00	\$1,400.00	\$109,390.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	
3 Elkhorn Construction 6072 N. Birch Hill Kimball, MI 48074 (810) 367-7460	\$115,500.00	\$1,800.00	\$117,300.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	CBD of (\$6,000.00) w/BD108 and BD115
4 Commercial Contract 4260 N. Atlantic Blvd. Auburn Hills, MI (248) 209-0500	\$120,000.00	\$1,200.00	\$121,200.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	
5 Northwest Acoustical 12675 Arnold Ave. Redford, MI 48239 (313) 531-3100	\$124,795.00	\$2,250.00	\$127,045.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	VA: Alternate Tile (\$3,200.00)
6 William E. Harnish 24400 Capitol Road Redford, MI 48239 (313) 538-8823	\$123,185.00	\$3,880.00	\$127,065.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	
7 Turner Brooks 28811 John R. Road Madison Hgts MI 48071 (248) 548-3400	\$127,310.00	\$1,300.00	\$128,610.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	
8 Central Ceiling 3742 E. Ten Mile Warren, MI (248) 960-9800	\$134,900.00	\$2,700.00	\$137,600.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	
9 ANM Construction 55331 Lyon Industrial New Hudson, MI (248) 486-7090	\$137,113.00	\$1,200.00	\$138,313.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	
10 Grunwell-Cashero 1041 Major Ave. Detroit MI 48217 (313) 843-8440	\$181,000.00	\$2,262.50	\$183,262.50	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	



Project: Bid Package #1
Owner: Livonia Public Schools
Architect: French Associates
Construction Mgr: McCarthy & Smith, Inc.
Bid Due Date: Thursday, February 13, 2014 @ 12:00 p.m.
BD #: 117 Acoustical Ceilings - Rosedale Elementary School

Bidder	Rosedale Base Bid	Rosedale PLM Bond	Rosedale Total	Bid Security	Firm. Disc.	Iran Sanct.	Add #1	Add #2	Add #3	Remarks
1. Impressive Tile Co. 12992 W. Eight Mile Oak Park, MI 48237 (248) 545-9000	\$66,500.00	\$800.00	\$67,300.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	
2 Commercial Contract 4260 N. Atlantic Blvd. Auburn Hills, MI (248) 209-0500	\$70,300.00	\$710.00	\$71,010.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	
3 R.E. Leggette Co. 9335 St. Stephens St. Dearborn, MI 48126 (313) 584-2000	\$71,220.00	\$940.00	\$72,160.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	
4 Elkhorn Construction 6072 N. Birch Hill Kimball, MI 48074 (810) 367-7460	\$71,400.00	\$1,100.00	\$72,500.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	CBD of (\$6,000.00) w/BD108 and BD115
5 Northwest Acoustical 12675 Arnold Ave. Redford, MI 48239 (313) 531-3100	\$74,910.00	\$1,350.00	\$76,260.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	VA: Alternate Tile (\$2,800.00)
6 Turner Brooks 28811 John R. Road Madison Hgts MI 48071 (248) 548-3400	\$84,440.00	\$850.00	\$85,290.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	
7 William E. Harnish 24400 Capitol Road Redford, MI 48239 (313) 538-8823	\$86,202.00	\$2,710.00	\$88,912.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	
8 Central Ceiling 3742 E. Ten Mile Warren, MI (248) 960-9800	\$88,800.00	\$1,800.00	\$90,600.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	
9 ANM Construction 55331 Lyon Industrial New Hudson, MI (248) 486-7090	\$90,169.00	\$900.00	\$91,069.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	
10 Grunwell-Cashero 1041 Major Ave. Detroit MI 48217 (313) 843-8440	\$112,800.00	\$1,410.00	\$114,210.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	



Project: Bid Package #1
Owner: Livonia Public Schools
Architect: French Associates
Construction Mgr: McCarthy & Smith, Inc.
Bid Due Date: Thursday, February 13, 2014 @ 12:00 p.m.
BD #: 118 Carpet & Resilient Flooring - Coolidge Elementary School

		Alternate										
	Bidder	Coolidge Base Bid	Coolidge PLM Bond	Coolidge Total	#A-2CO	Bid Security	Fam. Disc.	Iran Sanct.	Add #1	Add #2	Add #3	Remarks
1	Cohn's Commercial 47561 Avante Drive Wixom, MI 48393 (248) 374-9702	\$97,100.00	\$850.00	\$97,950.00	\$11,600.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	
2	City Carpet 3633 Michigan Ave. Detroit, MI 48216 (313) 899-2994	\$110,500.00	\$585.00	\$111,085.00	\$14,790.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	
3	Master Craft 12870 Inkster Road Redford, MI 48239 (313) 387-7000	\$119,000.00	\$854.00	\$119,854.00	\$10,500.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	
4	Shock Brothers 20320 Cornille Drive Roseville, MI 48066 (586) 585-7470	\$124,000.00	\$700.00	\$124,700.00	\$11,600.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	Vol. Alt.: Carpet Deduct (\$3,300.00)
5	DF Floor Covering 5242 Exchange Drive Flint, MI (810) 743-1201	\$140,690.00	\$3,886.00	\$144,576.00	\$11,415.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	
6	Turner Brooks 28811 John R. Road Madison Hgts MI 48071 (248) 548-3400	\$152,220.00	\$1,520.00	\$153,740.00	\$20,375.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	

Project: Bid Package #1
Owner: Livonia Public Schools
Architect: French Associates
Construction Mgr: McCarthy & Smith, Inc.

Bid Due Date: Thursday, February 13, 2014 @ 12:00 p.m.

BD #: 140 Plumbing - Cleveland Elementary School



Bidder	Cleveland Base Bid	Cleveland PLM Bond	Cleveland Total	Bid Security	Fam. Disc.	Iran Sanct.	Add #1	Add #2	Add #3	Remarks
1 J.M. & Sons 8080 Boardwalk Brighton, MI 48116 (248) 667-3140	\$88,986.00	\$1,300.00	\$90,286.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	
2 Johnson and Wood 2130 Hemphill Road Burton, MI (810) 715-0700	\$108,000.00	\$1,188.00	\$109,188.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	
3 Mills Mechanical 406 Bearberry Lane Orville, MI 48462 (248) 627-8449	\$113,400.00	\$1,600.00	\$115,000.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	
4 Dickerson Mech. 415 W. Rising Davison, MI (810) 653-7290	\$118,500.00	\$1,200.00	\$119,700.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	
5 Danboise Mechanical 31625 Grand River Farmington, MI (248) 471-2230	\$128,496.00	\$2,928.00	\$131,424.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	
6 Ecker Mechanical 3149 E. Maple Street Burton, MI 48529 (810) 742-8652	\$892,000.00	\$13,000.00	\$905,000.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	Combined Bid w/BD#142

Project: Bid Package #1
Owner: Livonia Public Schools
Architect: French Associates
Construction Mgr: McCarthy & Smith, Inc.

Bid Due Date: Thursday, February 13, 2014 @ 12:00 p.m.
BD #: 140 Plumbing - Coolidge Elementary School



Bidder	Coolidge Base Bid	Coolidge PLM Bond	Coolidge Total	Bid Security	Fam. Disc.	Iran Sanct.	Add #1	Add #2	Add #3	Remarks
1 J.M. & Sons 8080 Boardwalk Brighton, MI 48116 (248) 567-3140	\$63,049.00	\$925.00	\$63,974.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	
2 Johnson and Wood 2130 Hemphill Road Burton, MI (810) 715-0700	\$72,000.00	\$800.00	\$72,800.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	
3 Mills Mechanical 406 Bearberry Lane Orville, MI 48462 (248) 627-8449	\$78,810.00	\$1,190.00	\$80,000.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	
4 Dickerson Mech. 415 W. Rising Davison, MI (810) 653-7290	\$91,700.00	\$920.00	\$92,620.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	
5 Danboise Mechanical 31625 Grand River Farmington, MI (248) 471-2230	\$141,291.00	\$3,119.00	\$144,410.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	
6 Ecker Mechanical 3149 E. Maple Street Burton, MI 48529 (810) 742-8652	\$868,000.00	\$13,000.00	\$881,000.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	Combined Bid w/BD#142



Project: Bid Package #1
Owner: Livonia Public Schools
Architect: French Associates
Construction Mgr: McCarthy & Smith, Inc.
Bid Due Date: Thursday, February 13, 2014 @ 12:00 p.m.
BD #: 140 Plumbing - Rosedale Elementary School

	Bidder	Rosedale Base Bid	Rosedale PLM Bond	Rosedale Total	Bid Security	Fam. Disc.	Iran Sanct.	Add #1	Add #2	Add #3	Remarks
1	J.M. & Sons 8080 Boardwalk Brighton MI 48116 (248) 667-3140	\$68,593.00	\$1,000.00	\$69,593.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	
2	Mills Mechanical 406 Bearberry Lane Ortville, MI 48462 (248) 627-8449	\$83,800.00	\$1,200.00	\$85,000.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	
3	Dickerson Mech. 415 W. Rising Davison, MI (810) 653-7290	\$94,000.00	\$940.00	\$94,940.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	
4	Johnson and Wood 2130 Hemphill Road Burton, MI (810) 715-0700	\$97,200.00	\$1,081.00	\$98,281.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	
5	Danboise Mechanical 31625 Grand River Farmington, MI (248)471-2230	\$130,437.00	\$2,957.00	\$133,394.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	
6	Ecker Mechanical 3149 E. Maple Street Burton, MI 48529 (810) 742-8652	\$622,000.00	\$9,000.00	\$631,000.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	Combined Bid w/BD#142



Project: Bid Package #1
Owner: Livonia Public Schools
Architect: French Associates
Construction Mgr: McCarthy & Smith, Inc.
Bid Due Date: Thursday, February 13, 2014 @ 12:00 p.m.
BD #: 142 HVAC - Coolidge

		Alternates						Coolidge Total	Coolidge PLM Bond	Coolidge Base Bid	Coolidge	Remarks
	Bidder	Alt. #M-1CO	Fam. Disc.	Iran Sanct.	Add #1	Add #2	Add #3					
1	Great Lakes Mech 3800 Maple Street Dearborn, MI 48126 (313) 581-1400	\$34,000.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	\$602,970.00	\$5,970.00	\$597,000.00		
2	Miller-Boldt, Inc. 42826 Mound Road Sterling Hgts., MI (586) 997-3300	\$22,700.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	\$668,000.00	\$11,000.00	\$657,000.00		
3	Mills Mechanical 406 Bearberry Lane Ortville, MI 48462 (248) 627-8449	\$31,000.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	\$711,460.00	\$11,400.00	\$700,060.00		
4	Johnson Wood 2130 Hemphill Road Burton, MI 48529 810-715-0700	\$44,800.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	\$728,210.00	\$7,210.00	\$721,000.00		CBD w/BD#140 (\$20,000)
5	Pleune Service 750 Himes S.E. Grand Rapids, MI 49548 (616) 243-6374	\$43,500.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	\$773,000.00	\$65,000.00	\$708,000.00		
6	Dickerson Mech 415 W. Rising Davison, MI 48423 (810) 653-7290	\$32,000.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	\$743,400.00	\$7,400.00	\$736,000.00		
7	Ecker Mechanical 3149 E. Maple Street Burton, MI 48529 (810) 742-8652	\$34,100.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	\$881,000.00	\$13,000.00	\$868,000.00		Combined Bid w/BD#142
8	Danboise 31625 Grand River Farmington, MI 48336 (248) 471-2230	\$35,566.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	\$924,355.00	\$12,618.00	\$911,737.00		
9	Kelley Brothers LLC 37100 Amrhein Livonia, MI 48150 (734) 462-6266		<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>			No Bid		



Project: Bid Package #1
Owner: Livonia Public Schools
Architect: French Associates
Construction Mgr: McCarthy & Smith, Inc.
Bid Due Date: Thursday, February 13, 2014 @ 12:00 p.m.
BD #: 142 HVAC - Rosedale

		Alternates										
	Bidder	Rosedale Base Bid	Rosedale PLM Bond	Rosedale Total	Alt. #M-1RO	Bid Security	Fam. Disc.	Iran Sanct.	Add #1	Add #2	Add #3	Remarks
1	Great Lakes Mech 3800 Maple Street Dearborn, MI 48126 (313) 581-1400	\$380,000.00	\$3,800.00	\$383,800.00	\$34,000.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	
2	Dickerson Mech 415 W. Rising Davison, MI 48423 (810) 653-7290	\$473,000.00	\$4,700.00	\$477,700.00	\$32,000.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	
3	Johnson Wood 2130 Hemphill Road Burton, MI 48529 810-715-0700	\$491,000.00	\$4,910.00	\$495,910.00	\$44,800.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	CBD w/BD#140 (\$20,000)
4	Miller-Boyd, Inc. 42825 Mound Road Sterling Hgts., MI (586) 997-3300	\$478,000.00	\$7,000.00	\$485,000.00	\$22,700.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	
5	Pleune Service 750 Himes S.E. Grand Rapids, MI 49548 (616) 243-6374	\$480,000.00	\$4,800.00	\$484,800.00	\$43,500.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	
6	Mills Mechanical 406 Bearberry Lane Orville, MI 48462 (248) 627-8449	\$506,000.00	\$7,500.00	\$513,500.00	\$31,000.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	
7	Danboise 31625 Grand River Farmington, MI 48336 (248) 471-2230	\$544,386.00	\$8,944.00	\$553,330.00	\$33,261.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	
8	Kelley Brothers LLC 37100 Amrhein Livonia, MI 48150 (734) 462-6266	\$567,800.00	\$8,500.00	\$576,300.00	\$39,500.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	
9	Ecker Mechanical 3149 E. Maple Street Burton, MI 48529 (810) 742-8652	\$622,000.00	\$9,000.00	\$631,000.00	\$34,100.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	Combined Bid w/BD#142



Project: Bid Package #1
Owner: Livonia Public Schools
Architect: French Associates
Construction Mgr: McCarthy & Smith, Inc.
Bid Due Date: Thursday, February 13, 2014 @ 12:00 p.m.
BD #: 143 Electrical - Cleveland

		Alternates							Remarks		
Bidder	Cleveland Base Bid	Cleveland PLM Bond	Cleveland Total	Alt. #M-1CL	Alt. #E-1CL	Bid Security	Fam. Disc.	Iran Sanct.	Add #1	Add #2	Add #3
1 Ecker Mechanical 3149 E. Maple Street Burton, MI 48529 (810) 742-8652	\$302,800.00	\$4,500.00	\$307,300.00	no bid	\$3,300.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
2 Lineside LLC 7735 Kensington Ct. Brighton, MI 48116 (248) 345-2035	\$424,000.00	\$8,000.00	\$432,000.00	\$500.00	\$1,000.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
3 Metro Electric 110 E. Pond Drive Romeo, MI 48065 (586) 752-2622	\$443,000.00	\$4,000.00	\$447,000.00	\$2,500.00	\$13,000.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
4 McNulty Electric 7070 S. Lakeshore Lexington, MI 48450 (810) 359-5451	\$443,000.00	\$6,700.00	\$449,700.00	\$500.00	\$8,400.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
5 Omega Electric 24784 Hathaway St. Farmington Hills, MI (248) 471-4358	\$458,000.00	\$9,000.00	\$467,000.00	\$460.00	\$3,000.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
6 Green Line Electric P.O. Box 703390 Plymouth, MI 48170 (248) 231-5716	\$460,000.00	\$12,000.00	\$472,000.00	\$500.00	\$1,800.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
7 J&J Electric, Inc. 25162 Mound Road Warren, MI 48091 (586) 757-7080	\$470,000.00	\$5,000.00	\$475,000.00	\$850.00	\$2,000.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
8 Great Lakes Power 9546 Marine City Casco, MI 48064 (586) 716-4000	\$496,000.00	\$6,000.00	\$502,000.00	\$2,000.00	\$7,000.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
9 Shoreview Electric 37839 Groesbeck Hwy Clinton Twp., MI (586) 463-8900	\$526,000.00	\$6,300.00	\$532,300.00	\$450.00	\$7,500.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
								Combined Bid for all three schools \$1,346,694 plus bond of \$13,463			
								Combined Bid Deduct All Three Schools (\$12,000) VA:(\$13,000)			



Project: Bid Package #1
Owner: Livonia Public Schools
Architect: French Associates
Construction Mgr: McCarthy & Smith, Inc.
Bid Due Date: Thursday, February 13, 2014 @ 12:00 p.m.
BD #: 143 Electrical - Coolidge

		Alternates										Remarks	
	Bidder	Coolidge Base Bid	Coolidge PLM Bond	Coolidge Total	Alt. #M-1CO	Alt. #E-1CO	Bid Security	Fam. Disc.	Iran Sanct.	Add #1	Add #2	Add #3	
1	Ecker Mechanical 3149 E. Maple St Burton, MI 48529 (810) 742-8652	\$337,400.00	\$5,000.00	\$342,400.00	no bid	\$3,300.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	
2	Metro Electric 110 E. Pond Drive Romeo, MI 48065 (586) 752-2622	\$448,000.00	\$4,000.00	\$452,000.00	\$2,500.00	\$14,000.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	
3	Omega Electric 24784 Hathaway Farmington Hills, MI (248) 471-4358	\$489,000.00	\$9,600.00	\$498,600.00	\$460.00	\$5,500.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	
4	J&J Electric, Inc. 25162 Mound Road Warren, MI 48091 (586) 757-7080	\$511,000.00	\$6,000.00	\$517,000.00	\$850.00	\$3,000.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	Combined Bid for all three schools \$1,346,634 plus bond of \$13,463
5	Great Lakes Power 9646 Marine City Casco, MI 48064 (586) 716-4000	\$569,000.00	\$7,000.00	\$576,000.00	\$2,000.00	\$8,000.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	Combined Bid Deduct All Three Schools (\$12,000) VA: (\$23,000)
6	Shoreview Electric 37839 Groesbeck Clinton Twp., MI (586) 463-8900	\$576,000.00	\$6,900.00	\$582,900.00	\$450.00	\$8,000.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	
7	Green Line Electric P.O. Box 703390 Plymouth, MI 48170 (248) 231-5716	\$850,000.00	\$25,000.00	\$875,000.00	\$1,000.00	\$2,000.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	
8	Lineside LLC 7735 Kensington Brighton, MI 48116 (248) 345-2035	No Bid					<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	
9	McNulty Electric 7070 S. Lakeshore Lexington, MI 48450 (810) 359-5451	No Bid					<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	

