Tabulation for

RFP #16-25

Furniture for 6th grd

School Office School

VENDOR Lone Star Troxell Outfitters Depot |Spec Staples
Hokkie/Stool
12" $ 74.63 109.3.5 $ 63.00
15" $ 77.63
18" $ 86.25
Table
Low $ 365.22 $ 205.53
Medium $ 365.22
High $ 870.00
Teacher Chair
Low $ 66.46 $ 100.31 | $ 79.33
Medium $ 143.33
High $ 143.33
Total /Set $ 82114 $ 62116 | $ 48842 $ 53771 |$ 536.86 $489.59
Total Pkg.
Low $ 183,090.48 $ 152,805.36 | $ 120,152.00 | $ 132,276.66 | $ 132,067.56 | $120,440.48
Medium $ 202,000.50
High $ 326,176.38
Cafeteria
Stools $ 957.77 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 1,114.09 $871.56
Bench $ 1,233.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid $  1,548.51 $1,007.90
Total
Stools $ 34,477.20 $ 40,107.24 | $ 31,376.16
Bench $ 44,422 .20 $ 55,746.36 | $ 36,284.40




	Total Breakdown

