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From: Chad Doucet, Interim Chief of Staff

Item Title: Operational Update: Kazen MS Auxiliary Gymnasium fire related damage.

Description: District staff will provide information relating to the claim status and steps forward in
relation to the Kazen MS Auxiliary Gymnasium.

Historical Data: This is the first report from current administration.
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EXAS ASSOCIATION OF PUBLIC SCHOOLS
PROPERTY AND LIABILITY FUND

QOctober 12, 2017

South San Antonio ISD

Attention: Peggy Gonzalez

5622 Ray Ellison Blvd.

San Antonio, TX 78242

Email Address: pgonzalez2@southsanisd.net

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT OF ASSIGNMENT

RE: CONTRACT NO. : TX-10153-P
MEMBER : South San Antonio ISD
CLAIMANT :
D/LOSS : 05/15/2017
OUR FILE NO. : 3123295
TYPE OF LOSS : PR - Fire

Dear Ms. Gonzalez:

Please be advised that we are the Third Party Administrators assigned by Texas
Association of Public Schools to investigate the above captioned claim.

We acknowledge receipt of your assignment dated October 12, 2017. We have
assigned this claim to Roy Sims.

Should you have any questions please contact your claims adjuster at 361-876-2024 or
at email address roy sims@us.crawco.com .

Sincerely,

TAPS
CRAWFORD & COMPANY

CC: Kristi Small
Barnard Donegan Insurance Agency, Inc.
314 N. Camp Street
Seguin, TX 78155

Email Address: ksmall@bdi-insurance.com

Crawford & Company
342 West Woodlawn Avenue, Ste 200 M San Antonio, TX 78212 M Fax (210) 736-4200



10/23/2018 Mail - FW: Status on claims // 3123295

Paine, Irma E <ipaine@southsanisd.net>

FW: Status on claims // 3123295

1 message

Roy L. Sims <Roy_Sims@us.crawco.com> Mon, Oct 22, 2018 at 9:42 PM
To: "ipaine@southsanisd.net" <ipaine@southsanisd.net>
Cc: CMS2Email <CMS2Email@us.crawco.com>

Hilrma,

Regarding claim number 3123295, reserves were set at $124,196 which is based on the school’s contractor’s estimate for repairs to the gym. This includes the
$10,000 deductible under the policy. No payment was made to the school due to TAPS’ bankruptcy filing.

Let me know if you need anything else.

Regards,

Roy L. Sims

Senior Property Adjuster

Texas - Oklahoma District
Crawford & Company

1503 LBJ Frwy Suite 600

Dallas Texas 75234

phone: 361.876.2024

fax: 770.723.8855

cell: 361.876.2024

email: Roy_Sims@us.crawco.com

httne-limail annale.com/mail/u/0?ik=46c9adcf7e&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-{%3A161 5082364885523029%7Cmsg-f%3A1615082364885523029&simpl=msg-%3A1615082364885523029&... 1/5
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web: www.crawfordandcompany.com

Crawford

Restoring and enhancing lives,

businesses and communities.
[

From: Marilyn S. Bowles

Sent: Monday, October 22, 2018 12:09 PM

To: Roy L. Sims <Roy_Sims(@us.crawco.com>

Cc: Austin C. Laney <Austin_Laney@us.crawco.com>
Subject: FW: Status on claims

Roy,

Please provide a status to Irma on claim 3123295.

Thank you

From: Paine, Irma E [mailto:ipaine@southsanisd.net]
Sent: Monday, October 22, 2018 11:48 AM

To: Marilyn S. Bowles <Marilyn_Bowles@us.crawco.com>
Subject: Re: Status on claims

Hello Marilyn

Hope all is well. Can you give me a status on all district claims?

Please let me know if you have any questions. Thank you.
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