Denton ISD

RFP #1804-09 Kitchen Smallwares and Equipment Bid Tabulation

April 19, 2018

Pyramid
Pollock Paper School Supreme
Distributors Products Ace Mart Fixture Co. INC
Description Mfgr MfgNo UuoMm QTY Extended Extended Extended Extended
Apron, Bib (NO POCKET) White San Jamar 600 BAW-NP PK/12 1 No Bid No Bid $2.35 $3.55
Apron, Bib Black Neoprene for washing
dishes IMP7361 EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $17.50
Gloves, 19' Heat Resistant, Heavy Duty
Pot/Sink gloves, Asst BVT 19NU EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.32
Gloves, Cut Resistant, Hvy Wght large BVT SG-10 L EA 1 No Bid No Bid $13.39 $18.11
Gloves, Cut Resistant, Hvy Wght medium BVT SG-10 M EA 1 No Bid No Bid $13.39 $18.11
10 Gauge Cut Resistant Glove, Gray,
Medium 12K-008-Medium EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $102.03
Gloves, Cut Resistant, Hvy Wght small BVT SG-10 S EA 1 No Bid No Bid $13.39 $18.11
Cut resistant glove rack 6 clip Ecolab 50603-01-11 EA 1 $42.99 No Bid No Bid $50.49
Oven Mitt, Glove Style TUCKES5 15 EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $35.65
Oven Mitts, 17"L, Fire Retardant Cotton-
Lined, Machine Washable 06K-003 EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.97
Pot Holder 8in Cotton ARDCLTPHB8BE EA 1 No Bid No Bid $3.68 $8.42
Safety Glasses low profile Ecolab 50913-01-00 EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.99
Disposable dust mask Ecolab 50912-00-00 EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.14
T1243 or CL 601413
Bowl 13.5 QT Stainless Steel Polar Ware or Equiv. EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $31.99
Bowl 8 QT Heavy Mixing Polar Ware | T1238 or CL 601408 EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.14
Colander Stainless- 8 Quart Vollrath 47969 EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $16.63
Bun Pans - Aluminum 16 guage - 1 Deep",
Full Size Vollrath 68372 EA 1 No Bid No Bid $10.80 $12.67
Vollrath,
Polar Ware
Bun Pans - Aluminum 18 guage - Half size [or Ware
1" Deep Ever 68371, 3614 or 5303 EA 1 No Bid No Bid $4.34 $7.13
Pan - 1/2 Size - 2.5 Deep, 22 guage SS  |Polar Ware E12102/30222 EA 1 No Bid No Bid $7.79 $10.99
Pan - 1/2 Size - 4 Deep, 22 guage SS Polar Ware E12104/30242 EA 1 No Bid No Bid $10.04 $15.74
Pan -- 1/2 Size - 4 Deep Perforated VOL90243 EA 1 No Bid No Bid $25.97 $23.81
Pan - Full Size - 2.50 Deep, 22 guage SS VOL90243 EA 1 No Bid No Bid $12.70 $17.67
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Pan - Full Size - 4 Deep, 22 gauge SS Polar Ware E20124/30042 EA 1 No Bid No Bid $26.78 $23.71
Pan - Full Size - 6 Deep VOL20069 EA 1 No Bid No Bid $40.12 $35.44
Pan (Perf)- Full - 2.5", 22 guage SS Polar Ware P20122 EA 1 No Bid No Bid $31.54 $29.25
Pan (Perf)- Half - 2.5", 22 gauge SS Polar Ware P12102/68375 EA 1 No Bid No Bid $20.95 $19.40
Pan Covers - Full Size - Flat, 22 gauge SS [Polar Ware 2000-2 EA 1 No Bid No Bid $8.26 $22.47
Pan Covers - Half Size - Flat, 22 gauge SS|Polar Ware 1311-2 EA 1 No Bid No Bid $5.42 $10.84
Pan Cover Food , Full size, flat,
polycarbonate, clear NSF 10 CWC135Cambro EA 1 No Bid No Bid $8.38 $8.91
Pan, Plastic Food, Full size 4"Deep 14CW135
polycarbonate, clear, NSF Cambro EA 1 No Bid No Bid $0.00 $13.44
22LPCW135 Camb
Pan Food %2 long, 2-1/2” deep, clear ro EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.02
20LPCWC135
Pan Food zlong, 4” deep, clear Cambro EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.83
E52009492, MFG
PAN,FULL SZ,6"D,WHITE,NON-MICRO, Stock:
CAMBRO #16CW148, WSM #105010,EA CAM16CW148 EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $16.31
PAN,LID,1/2
SZ,CLEAR,SLD,NON/MICRO, 52001454, MFG
W/HANDLE, CAMBRO #20CWCH-135, Stock:
WSM #104953,EA CAM20CWCH135 EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.65
Sauce Pan - 3.75 Quart Lincoln WE 4343 1/2 EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $21.04
Sauce Pan - 4.5 Quart Lincoln WE 4344 1/2 EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $23.31
"Rack, Bun Pan
20 rack medium duty" WIHAL-1820B EA 1 No Bid No Bid $157.20 $246.40
Baguette/French Bread Pan, 5" Long, 18"
x 26" x 1" Overall 835-044 EA 1 No Bid No Bid $0.00 $37.39
Half-Size Sheet Pan, Medium Duty, 17
3/4"x127/8" x 1" 115-102-CRP EA 1 No Bid No Bid $4.34 $7.13
Full Size Pan, 6" Deep 913-246 EA 1 No Bid No Bid $4.14 $35.44
Vollrath
Stock Pot - 3 Gallon Lincoln 78600 EA 1 No Bid No Bid $102.49 $33.46
Stock Pot Cover/lid - 3 Gallon Lincoln 78672 EA 1 No Bid No Bid $29.32 $10.44
Stock Pot 24QT (6 gallon) AAAACST-24L EA 1 No Bid No Bid $28.96 $44.75
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Lid, Stock Poit 24 QT AAAACST-24LC EA 1 No Bid No Bid $5.75 $14.21
Carlisle or
Cafe' Tray,6 Comp,10x14,Top Utensil CW Cambro
Black or Equiv. 615-14 or 915 EA 1 $4.06 No Bid No Bid $4.75
Cutlery - Peeler - Stainless Steel w/ 3"
Blade Carlisle 6020 EA 1 No Bid No Bid $5.40 $1.93
Knife - 4" Vegetable Paring Mundial WO0547-4 EA 1 No Bid No Bid $70.20 $3.57
Knife - Cook's 8" Mundial w561-8 EA 1 No Bid No Bid $22.44 $15.26
Knife - Utility 8" (Serrated Blade)(5627-8E) |Mundial W 5627-8e EA 1 No Bid No Bid $9.00 $10.31
Mundial KR-
Knife Rack 1 KR-1 EA 1 No Bid No Bid $14.64 $17.74
Knife Sharpener Accu Sharp FMP 280-1620 EA 1 No Bid No Bid $7.26 $6.55
Knife Steel - 12" Hard Steel w/Poly Handle [Mundial W3303-12 EA 1 No Bid No Bid $14.04 $16.09
Paring Knife, 3-1/8" White, Handle 973-052 EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.76
Spoons (Slotted) - 13", Poly Handle Polar Ware T1533 EA 1 No Bid No Bid $0.83 $7.33
Spoons (Solid) - 18" ALEGACY 4780 EA 1 No Bid No Bid $1.32 $1.09
Ladle - 1 oz., Stainless w Kool Touch
Handle Polar Ware T22-01C EA 1 No Bid No Bid $10.42 $9.55
Ladle 1-1/2 oz VOL46915 EA 1 No Bid No Bid $2.11 $1.93
Ladle - 2 oz., Stainless w Kool Touch
Handle Polar Ware T22-02C EA 1 No Bid No Bid $11.39 $10.44
Ladle, 3 oz VOL46813 EA 1 No Bid No Bid $2.05 $1.88
Ladle - 8 oz., Stainless w Kool Touch
Handle Polar Ware T22-08C EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.11
Spoodle (Slotted) - 4 oz. Polar Ware T1304 EA 1 No Bid No Bid $8.59 $17.96
Spoodle (Slotted) - 6 oz. Polar Ware T1306 EA 1 No Bid No Bid $8.59 $19.09
Spoodle (Slotted) - 8 oz. Polar Ware T1308 EA 1 No Bid No Bid $8.59 $20.46
Spoodle (Solid) - 2 oz. Polar Ware T1202 EA 1 No Bid No Bid $8.59 $7.87
Spoodle (Solid) - 4 oz. Polar Ware T1204 EA 1 No Bid No Bid $8.59 $7.87
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Pizzacraft

Calzone

Filling and

Froming
Calzone Press Press PM 0405 EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.69
Spoodle (Solid) - 6 oz. Polar Ware T1206 EA 1 No Bid No Bid $9.07 $8.32
Spoodle (Solid) - 8 oz. Polar Ware T1208 EA 1 No Bid No Bid $9.07 $8.32
Disher - Size 12 Polar Ware T7312 EA 1 No Bid No Bid $8.42 $7.72
Disher - Size 16 Polar Ware T7316 EA 1 No Bid No Bid $8.42 $7.72
Disher - Size 30 Polar Ware T7330 EA 1 No Bid No Bid $8.42 $7.72
Disher - Size 6 Polar Ware T7306 EA 1 No Bid No Bid $8.42 $7.72
Disher - Size 8 Polar Ware T7308 EA 1 No Bid No Bid $8.80 $7.72
Measure, Polycarbonate -1 Cup Carlisle 431507 EA 1 No Bid No Bid $3.54 $4.11
Measure, Polycarbonate -2 Cup Carlisle 4314207 EA 1 $5.15 $7.40 $7.13

Carlisle or 431430 7 orfg3216-
Measuring Cup-1 QT(Clear) Rubber Maid 00 cIr EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.30
Measure, Polycarbonate -2 Quart Carlisle 4314307 EA 1 No Bid No Bid $10.21 $8.30
Measure, Plastic Clear 4 QT CAM400MCCW EA 1 No Bid No Bid $11.07 $10.15

Vollrath or

PW or 47119 or t1245 or
Measuring Cup Set - 1/4, 1/3, 1/2 & 1 Cup |Carlisle 604310 EA 1 No Bid No Bid $12.85 $11.78
Measuring Spoon Set Vollrath 47118 EA 1 No Bid No Bid $4.21 $3.86
French Whip - 18" Polar Ware T9518 EA 1 No Bid No Bid $4.24 $9.90
French Whip - 12" Polar Ware T9512 EA 1 No Bid No Bid $2.53 $7.57

Cooper-
Coolit-Rite 15" Cooling Validator Atkins Model TTM41 EA 1 No Bid No Bid $39.63 $36.33
Thermometer - 5 Stem (SS)" Cooper 1246-03c-1 EA 1 No Bid No Bid $6.04 $5.53
Thermometer - Oven 2 Dial" TAYLOR 5932 EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.12
Thermometer (R/F) - Stainless w/2 Dial TAYLOR 5981N EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.12
Thermometer for store room Cooper 212-158 EA 1 No Bid No Bid $30.90 $28.33
Can opener, Bench Type Nemco 56050 EA 1 No Bid No Bid $328.06 $311.50

Nemco
Replacement Gripper for Nemco Can Replacemen
Opener t Gripper 56028 EA 1 No Bid No Bid $27.54 $26.09
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Ice Tea Dispnsr - Plastic -3 Gallon -
Amber Color Rubber Maid RM 3358 EA 1 No Bid No Bid $140.46 $154.00

Tomlinson
Dispenser faucet Industries SPBH Faucet EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.66
Cutlery Box, Gray Plastic, 4-compartment |Vollrath 52651 EA 1 No Bid No Bid $11.26 $10.35
Cutlery Dispenser - 6 hole - Plastic | Vollrath 52644 EA 1 No Bid No Bid $35.26 $32.32
Cutlery Dispenser, Flatware Inserts,
plastic Ad Craft CYL-M EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.89
Cutting Board Rack Carlisle 11879-03 EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $49.81
Cutting Boards 12x18, White Carlisle 10881 EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.02
Dish Towels - Bar towels, 100 % cotton [San jamar 700 BRT - BL SBL EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.72

Carlisle ROP
Dishmachine Rack, Bakry Tray 14 ROP 14 EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $33.66
Dishmachine Rack, Flatware Carlisle RF14 EA 1 $12.52 No Bid $17.59 $20.21
Dishmachine Rack, Plate Carlisle RTP 14 EA 1 $13.16 No Bid $19.55 $21.24
Dust Pan - Lobby Type w/Handle Rubber Maid FG2531-20BLA EA 1 No Bid No Bid $17.21 $34.22

Dexter
Pizza Cutter SaniSafe 18043 Russell 18043 EA 1 No Bid No Bid $13.99 $14.25
Safety bag opener Ecolab 50403-01-00 EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.79
Safety E52001180,MFG
CUTTER,PAPER,3/BAG,TANGIBLES Stock:
CUSTOM, WSM#277601 TNGBLSCUSTOM EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.09
Scale (Ib.) - 25# Capacity YG425R Taylor TS25KL EA 1 No Bid No Bid $65.52 $49.10
Scale (Digital/Electr) - Stainless Taylor TE32R EA 1 No Bid No Bid $50.98 $46.73
Scoop, Ice Aluminum 58 oz AAAASC58 EA 1 No Bid No Bid $4.81 $6.63
Scoop Holder for 58 oz IFRISH558 EA 1 No Bid No Bid $39.42 $70.04
Scrapers - High Heat All Purpose, Molded
handle/blade. 10 Vollrath 52010 EA 1 No Bid No Bid $6.70 $6.14
Scrapers - High Heat All Purpose, Molded
handle/blade. 16 Vollrath 52026 EA 1 No Bid No Bid $11.45 $10.49
SPATULA,16 1/2" WHITE PLASTIC, E52000084, MFG
RUBBERMAID #1906 WSM#124201 Stock: RUC1906 EA 1 $3.97 No Bid No Bid $5.50
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Spray Bottle Plastic with Sprayer Rubbermaid 9C03 EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tomato Slicer, Stainless blades w Prince
Replacement Blades Castle 943A/943-038A EA 1 No Bid No Bid $320.91 $309.65

Prince
Tomato Slicer, Replacement Blades Castle 943A/943-038A EA 1 No Bid No Bid $63.84 $61.60
Tongs- Cool Touch - 9.5 Vollrath 4780920 EA 1 No Bid No Bid $7.40 $6.78
Turner-Cake 8 x 3 Blade, Poly Handle Mundial W5683 turner EA 1 No Bid No Bid $7.09 $8.12
Turner-Hamburger - 6 x 3 Blade, Poly
Handle Mundial W5685 turner EA 1 No Bid No Bid $6.84 $7.84
Super Removable peel EZ Edge prep 2x4 |Ecolab 10234-01-21 EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $20.86
Basket Stand 12" Round with 3
baskets12x18x22 Hubert 31160 EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $100.29
Basket Stand Rectangle 18x19x22 Hubert 60796 EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $137.46
TIMER/CLOCK/STOPWATCH,DIGITAL,M
EMORY RECALL,CLIP ON OR
MAGNET,AAA BATTERY
INCLUDED,COOPER #TC6-08YUM,WSM
#317232 E52008661 EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.14
Condiment Holder, large Hubert 54561 EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $442.20

LD024 (PROKD024)

Drink Dispenser or W21H-LD024 EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Floor Signs - WET FLOOR Rubber Maid FG611277YEL EA 1 $5.03 $5.99 $9.67 $13.20

Rubber Maid
Floor Squeegee FG9C2700 FG9C2700 EA 1 $6.67 $8.99 $11.03 $11.00
Floor Squeegee Handle Rubber Maid FG636200 EA 1 $3.29 $2.89 No Bid $5.85

Protech

Mats black
Protech Mats w/holes PTMA-366034 EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $317.90
Matting, fatigue Warewell 420 12x2x3 EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Mop Buckets w/Wringer 26 Quart Carlisle 36904-04 EA 1 $33.16 No Bid $64.92 $58.50
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Mop Handle for 7" Head Carlisle 369595 EA 1 $7.64 No Bid $6.16 $9.89
Mop Heads - 20 oz. Rayon - Medium Mop
Head Carlisle 369074 EA 1 No Bid No Bid $9.72 $5.33
Pail (Green) - Labeled For Cleaning
Solution San Jammer KP 97 GN EA 1 No Bid No Bid $2.30 $3.02
Pail (Red) - Labeled For Sanitation San Jammer KP 97 RD EA 1 No Bid No Bid $2.20 $3.02
Adapter Bar 12" VOL75012 EA 1 No Bid No Bid $4.21 $3.86
Adapter Bar 20" VOL75020 EA 1 No Bid No Bid $6.43 $5.89

Wasserstro 30900-01-00 Day
Stainless Steel Loading Stand m Dots EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $24.75
Stor Cntnr - 12 Qt Square Cambro 12 SFSP EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.36
Stor Cntnr - 18 Qt Square Cambro 18 SFSP EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.65
Stor Cntnr Lids - SQR 12/18/22 Cambro SFC 12 EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.22
CONTAINER,STORAGE,FOOD,CLEAR,2
QT, "CAMSQUARE",7 V
POLYCARBONATE,NSF, CAMBRO E52009617, MFG
#2SFSCW,WSM #106199 Stock: CAM2SFSCW EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.23
COVER,CONTAINER,STORAGE,FOOD,K
ELLY GREEN,POLY,F/2 & 4 QT
"CAMSQUARE"
CONTAINERS,NSF,CAMBRO#SFC2-452 E52008061, MFG
WSM# 106422 Stock: CAMSFC2452 EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.78
Tilt Truck - Utility Duty Rubber Maid TT005 EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $544.50
Mop and Broom Tool Organizer Rubbermaid FG199300 Gray EA 1 No Bid $39.98 No Bid $53.90
Trash Can 'Dolly' for 55 Gallon Rubber Maid 2640 EA 1 $27.84 $18.98 No Bid $51.69

Rubber Maid
Trash Can - 55 Gallon trash can Brute 2655 EA 1 No Bid $49.98 No Bid $82.50
Trash Can Lid - 55 Gallon Rubber Maid 26554 Lid EA 1 No Bid $9.95 No Bid $27.50
Trash Can, 12 gal. White Rubber Maid 6144 EA 1 $81.13 $89.98 No Bid $107.80
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Trasch Can Wastebasket Medium Black RUB2956BLA EA 1 $3.89 $6.71 $6.56
Cold Temp Kit labels only 1" Ecolab 10104-93-21 EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $59.47
Communication Station GHS Ecolab 50630-01-31 EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $111.10
Sanitizer Test Kit QT 40 Ecolab 20304-05-11 EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $16.50
Sanitizer Test Station Ecolab 20312-01-00 EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $26.40

Xtend &
4-5/8 Aluminum Step Ladder Climb Type IA Model WT4 EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $130.90
Quickie - Clean Results Ply Fiber Toilet Iltem # 85490 Model #
Brush Lowes 315 EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.00

Iltem # 135360 Model

Plunger Lowes 00308 EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
160z FIFO Bottle W/Medium Dispensing
Cap & Label Lid 885-105 EA 1 No Bid No Bid $1.44 $3.27
Sparta Bottle Brush 12: Long 4"x 2.75"
Round Head Brush W269-4000025 EA 1 No Bid No Bid $10.04 $7.33
Tablecraft BKT3 Blask 3 Tiered Basket
w/Legs 682-18U EA 1 No Bid No Bid $43.63 $40.00
Mat, Marble Tuff, 2' x 3', 1/2" Thick,
Beveled Edges Blue 664-099-BLU EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Lobbymaster Plastic Lobby Dust Pan 576-022 EA 1 No Bid No Bid $17.21 $6.37
Mat, Rubber, 39" x 19.5" x 7/8" Thick,
Grease Resistant, Black 158-093 EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $26.18

Winco WSS-
12" Window Squeegee W/Sponge 12 481-515 EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.16
18" Plastic Broom Holder Sys 269-DK8 EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.46
Deck Brush size 10" w 56" handle Rubber Maid x134 EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $34.10
Brush Scrub Braising Pan 20" Carlisle 40500 EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.49

Carlisle Flo-

Pac Steel

Wire Brush

with Scraper

and Wood
Brush Steel Handle 4577300 EA 1 No Bid No Bid $2.95 $2.79
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6482 Iron Handle

Scrub Brush for Produce Rubbemaid scrub bursh EA 1 $0.87 $1.59 No Bid $3.84
Bus Box 20x15x7 Polypropylene Vollrath 52657 EA 1 No Bid No Bid $7.70 $9.06
Cart - Heavy Duty, Flat Shelf Utility Cart  |Rubbermaid 4525 EA 1 $279.98 $235.98 $214.50
Cart - Stainless Heavy Dut LAKESIDE 544 EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $717.75
Cart Stainless Steel Utility Cart for
Beverage Station Lakeside L322 EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $187.11
Platform Truck 24"W x 36"Lx36" High
Chrome AARSB-1C EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $539.85
Cart #10 Cans & 14 x 19 Milk Crates Cambro CD 2028 EA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $153.45
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