Denton Independent School District
Phase 2a of 5 Technology Refresh Purchase Quotes

November 12, 2019

Item Description Company Extended Price | Company Extended Price | Company | Qty | Unit Price Extended Price Company Company Extended Price| Company Extended Price|] Company Extended Price
Dell Global SCwW Pathway Apple CDW-G BestBuy
Asset

$ 455,175.00 $ $  814,590.00 630 | § No bid
Dell Desktop PC Model Optiplex 3070 w/soundbar
& monitor - Includes SetUp Services
Chromebook Devices - Dell Model Chromebook 11 3100 $ 47,272.00 $ $ 60,192.00 152 | $ $ 62,766.88
Lock N Charge Carrier 15 Charging Station $ 4,796.00 11193 No bid
Installation - LocknCharge Carrier 15 Charging Station $ 2,626.14 11 193 No bid
Apple 10.2" iPad $ 9,119.00 $ 10,199.00 $ 10,199.00
Apple iPad Mini 7.9" $ 3,411.00 $ 3,591.00 $ 3,599.91
iPad Otterbox case $ $ 1,384.00 31 |'$ $ 1,435.61 $ 1,437.78
Dell Laptop Model Latitude 3300 XCTO $ 9,180.00 $ $ 14,616.00 12 8 No bid
Dell 24" Monitor Model P2419H $ 652.00 $ $ 828.00 4 $ No bid

Total Dell Purchase $ 517,075.00 | Total Global Asset Purchase $ 1,384.00 Total Pathway Purchase Total Apple Purchase $ 12,530.00

Dell Desktop Purchase - Dell $  455,175.00
Dell Chromebook Purchase - Dell §  47.272.00
Lock N Charge Purchase - Dell $  4796.00
Lock N Charge Installation - Pathway §  1,100.00
Apple iPad Purchase - Apple §  9.119.00
Apple iPad Mini Purchase - Apple $ 341100
iPad Case Purchase - Global Asset $ 138400
Dell Laptop Purchase - Dell $  9,180.00
Dell Monitor Purchase - Dell $ 652.00
Total Purchase $  532,089.00
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