Event Number

4097

Organization

Collin College Purchasing

Event Title Lamps, Ballasts, and Fuses Workgroup CCccD

Event Description All vendors must submit their respon: Event Owner Jennifer Wright

Event Type ITB Email jewright@collin.edu

Issue Date 9/8/2017 08:00:00 AM (CT) Phone 001 (972) 758-3879

Close Date 9/22/2017 01:00:00 PM (CT) Fax 001 (972) 758-3881

|Responding Supplier City State Response Submitted Lines Responded Response Total
Elliott Electric Supply Nacogdoches X 9/22/2017 11:08:57 AM (CT) 33 $37,798.70
Dealers Electrical Supply,

Inc. Dallas - 9/22/2017 11:59:31 AM (CT) 107 $67,447.93
GROOM & SONS

HARDWARE (GROOM & 9/22/2017 12:03:15 PM (CT) 101

SONS HARDWARE &

LUMBER, INC.) MCKINNEY TX $70,867.90
VOSS LIGHTING (VOSS 9/22/2017 12:58:02 PM (CT) 149

ELECTRIC CO.) DALLAS TX o $89,976.82
Facility Solutions Group Austin X 9/22/2017 09:34:45 AM (CT) 148 $96,177.72
Texas Industrial Electrical

Supply (JCW INDUSTRIES 9/22/2017 10:46:39 AM (CT) 138

LLC) Mckinney TX $114,865.04
Batteries Plus Bulbs 9/19/2017 05:07:49 PM (CT) 153

(SYDMOR, Inc.) Allen TX o $126,532.86

Please note: Lines Responded and Response Total only includes responses to specification. No alternate response data is included.
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I 1 |Provide a percentage discount off manufacturer's list price for items "NOT" listed.

Supplier QTY UOM Percent Off Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
VOSS LIGHTING (VOSS ELECTRIC 1 EA 86.5

Facility Solutions Group 1 EA 80

Batteries Plus Bulbs (SYDMOR, I 1 EA 30 Depending on Item Category, LED or Metal

Elliott Electric Supply 1 EA 10 Off most current Elliott Electric Supply Cata

Texas Industrial Electrical Supply 1 EA No Bid

Dealers Electrical Supply, Inc. 1 EA 0 Use Buy Board Contracts

GROOM & SONS HARDWARE (G 1 EA 0

[ 2 [32w Triple Tube cF

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
Elliott Electric Supply 12 EA No Bid

Dealers Electrical Supply, Inc. 12 EA No Bid

Facility Solutions Group 12 EA $3.24 $38.88 Sylvania 20885 CF32DT/E/IN/835/ECO

GROOM & SONS HARDWARE (G 12 EA $3.40 $40.80 SYLVANIA 20885

Texas Industrial Electrical Supply 12 EA $3.51 $42.12 Each as in one*

VOSS LIGHTING (VOSS ELECTRIC 12 EA $3.88 $46.56

Batteries Plus Bulbs (SYDMOR, |1 12 EA $4.10 $49.20 Duracell Ultra or Werker Brand

[ 3 [1/175W/M57 Metal Halide 4 Tap Ballasts

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
VOSS LIGHTING (VOSS ELECTRIC 40 EA $31.40 $1,256.00

Facility Solutions Group 40 EA $31.58 $1,263.20 Advance 71A5570001D

Dealers Electrical Supply, Inc. 40 EA $34.24 $1,369.60 UNIVERSAL M175MLTAC3M500K

Texas Industrial Electrical Supply 40 EA $38.95 $1,558.00 Each

Elliott Electric Supply 40 EA $41.08 $1,643.20 Advance 71A5570001D

GROOM & SONS HARDWARE (G 40 EA $41.30 $1,652.00 SYLVANIA 47735

Batteries Plus Bulbs (SYDMOR, |1 40 EA $45.81 $1,832.40 Keystone Brand

[ 4 [100 watt MH M90

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
Facility Solutions Group 75 EA $9.89 $741.75 Sylvania M100/U/MED M90

GROOM & SONS HARDWARE (G 75 EA $10.90 $817.50 SYLVANIA 64418

Batteries Plus Bulbs (SYDMOR, |1 75 EA $11.99 $899.25 Werker Brand

VOSS LIGHTING (VOSS ELECTRIC 75 EA $18.07 $1,355.25

Dealers Electrical Supply, Inc. 75 EA $19.75 $1,481.25 PHILIPS 429886

Elliott Electric Supply 75 EA $20.23 $1,517.25 GE MVR100UMED

Texas Industrial Electrical Supply 75 EA $41.54 $3,115.50 Each

[ 5 [1000W MH 130-25 series

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
Texas Industrial Electrical Supply 4 EA No Bid

GROOM & SONS HARDWARE (G 4 EA No Bid

VOSS LIGHTING (VOSS ELECTRIC 4 EA $18.10 $72.40

Facility Solutions Group 4 EA $18.68 $74.72 GE MVR1000/U

Batteries Plus Bulbs (SYDMOR, |1 4 EA $27.14 $108.56

Dealers Electrical Supply, Inc. 4 EA $39.00 $156.00 PHILIPS 415224

I 6 |100W Medium Base Metal Halide

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
Batteries Plus Bulbs (SYDMOR, |1 12 EA $9.66 $115.92

Facility Solutions Group 12 EA $9.89 $118.68 Sylvania M100/U/MED M90

GROOM & SONS HARDWARE (G 12 EA $10.90 $130.80 SYLVANIA 64418

Texas Industrial Electrical Supply 12 EA $11.38 $136.56 Each

VOSS LIGHTING (VOSS ELECTRIC 12 EA $18.07 $216.84

Dealers Electrical Supply, Inc. 12 EA $19.75 $237.00 PHILIPS 429886. KELVIN NOT MENTIONED. (

Elliott Electric Supply 12 EA $20.23 $242.76

[ 7 [10709c/a1 TP

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manuf Num
GROOM & SONS HARDWARE (G 100 EA No Bid

Elliott Electric Supply 100 EA No Bid

Facility Solutions Group 100 EA $2.80 $280.00

VOSS LIGHTING (VOSS ELECTRIC 100 EA $2.87 $287.00 10709C41 DELISTED

Dealers Electrical Supply, Inc. 100 EA $2.99 $299.00

é[ALTl] Batteries Plus Bulbs (SYD 100 EA $4.66 $466.00 LED 2 Pack 2700K 40W Equivalent $9.33 pel Duracell Ultra  LED12392
Texas Industrial Electrical Supply 100  EA $4.95 $495.00 Each

Batteries Plus Bulbs (SYDMOR, 11 100 EA $7.10 $710.00

[ 8 [10709ca1ka100k

Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
Elliott Electric Supply 24 EA No Bid

GROOM & SONS HARDWARE (G 24 EA No Bid

Facility Solutions Group 24 EA $2.80 $67.20

VOSS LIGHTING (VOSS ELECTRIC 24 EA $2.87 $68.88 10709C41 DELISTED
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