
BID TABULATIONBID TABULATION
REFUSE REMOVAL AND RECYCLING SERVICESREFUSE REMOVAL AND RECYCLING SERVICES

July 1, 2011 through June 30, 2012
BID #1206

July 1, 2011 through June 30, 2012
BID #1206

Thursday April 29 2010 2:00 p mThursday, April 29, 2010, 2:00 p.m.

Hartel's/DBJ Nordic Waste WasteHartel's/DBJ Nordic Waste Waste
building size pickups Disposal Co Serives Managementbuilding size pickups Disposal Co. Serives Management

Bid Bond yes yesBid Bond  yes yes

CentralCentral

  Summer Program 6 2 $23.70 $25.73  Summer Program 6 2 $23.70 $25.73

$ $Congdon Park 6 2 $23.70 $25.73Congdon Park 6 2 $23.70 $25.73
D f ld 6 5 $23 70 $25 73Denfeld 6 5 $23.70 $25.73Denfeld 6 5 $23.70 $25.73
E t 6 (2) 3 $23 70 $25 73East 6 (2) 3 $23.70 $25.73( ) $ $
Grant 6 3 $23 70 $25 73Grant 6 3 $23.70 $25.73
HOCHS 6 2 $23 70 $25 73HOCHS 6 2 $23.70 $25.73
Homecroft 6 (2) 1 $23 70 $25 73Homecroft 6 (2) 1 $23.70 $25.73
Lakewood 6 (2) 1 $23 70 $25 73Lakewood 6 (2) 1 $23.70 $25.73
Laura MacArthur 6 3 $23.70 $25.73Laura MacArthur 6 3 $23.70 $25.73

$ $  Summer Program 6 2 $23.70 $25.73  Summer Program 6 2 $23.70 $25.73
L t  P k 6 1 $23 70 $25 73Lester Park 6 1 $23.70 $25.73Lester Park 6 1 $23.70 $25.73
Li l  P k $23 70 $25 73Lincoln Park $23.70 $25.73$ $
  Summer Program 6 2 $23 70 $25 73

no  Summer Program 6 2 $23.70 $25.73

nog

Lowell 6 3 $23 70 $25 73

no bLowell 6 3 $23.70 $25.73

no bidMorgan Park 6 (2) 2 $23 70 $25 73

no bidMorgan Park 6 (2) 2 $23.70 $25.73

no bid

  Summer Program 6 2 $23 70 $25 73

no bid

  Summer Program 6 2 $23.70 $25.73

no bid

Nettleton 6 3 $23.70 $25.73

no bid

Nettleton 6 3 $23.70 $25.73

$ $

no bid

  Summer Program 6 2 $23.70 $25.73

no bid

  Summer Program 6 2 $23.70 $25.73
O d $23 70 $25 73

no bid

Ordean 6 5 $23.70 $25.73

no bid

Ordean 6 5 $23.70 $25.73
Pi d t 6 3 $23 70 $25 73

no bid

Piedmont 6 3 $23.70 $25.73

no bid

$ 3 0 $ 5 3
PS Stadium 6 on call $23 70 $25 73

no bid

PS Stadium 6 on call $23.70 $25.73

no bid

$
STC Upper 4 on call $15 80 $17 15

no bid

STC Upper 4 on call $15.80 $17.15

no bid

Stowe 6 1 $23 70 $25 73

no bid

Stowe 6 1 $23.70 $25.73

no bid

  Summer Program 6 2 $23 70 $25 73

no bid

  Summer Program 6 2 $23.70 $25.73

no bid

Transportation 4 1 $15.80 $17 15

no bid

Transportation 4 1 $15.80 $17.15

$ $

no bid

Woodland 6 3 $23.70 $25.73

no bid

Woodland 6 3 $23.70 $25.73
E i d T l A l A  

no bid

Estimated Total Annual Amount 

no bid

Estimated Total Annual Amount 

$52 361 20 $56 845 70

no bid

$52,361.20 $56,845.70

no bid

$52,361.20 $56,845.70
(49 516 40 incorrect)

no bid

(49,516.40 incorrect)

no bid

Cardboard Pickup per Container $0.00 $10.20

no bid

Cardboard Pickup per Container $0.00 $10.20

$0 00 $2 550 00

no bid

Estimated Annual Amount for Cardboard $0.00 $2,550.00

no bid

Estimated Annual Amount for Cardboard $0.00 $2,550.00
P  Pi k   C t i $0 00 $1 02

no bid

Paper Pickup per Container $0.00 $1.02

no bid

Paper Pickup per Container $0.00 $1.02
E ti t d A l A t f  P $0 00 $1 530 00

no bid

Estimated Annual Amount for Paper $0.00 $1,530.00

no bid

p $ $ ,
Confindential Pickup per Container $1 00 $21 00

no bid

Confindential Pickup per Container $1.00 $21.00

no bid

Estimated Annual Amount for Confidentail $300 00 $6 300 00

no bid

Estimated Annual Amount for Confidentail $300.00 $6,300.00

no bid

$52 661 20 $67 225 70

no bid

$52,661.20 $67,225.70

no bid

$52,661.20 $67,225.70
E ti t d T t l A t I l di R li

no bid

Estimated Total Amount Including Recycling

no bid

Estimated Total Amount Including Recycling

no bid


