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GOVERNING BOARD AGENDA ITEM  

AMPHITHEATER UNIFIED SCHOOL DISTRICT NO. 10 

_________________________________________________________________________ 
 
DATE OF MEETING:   June 3, 2014 

 

TITLE: Award of Contract for Lubrication Services Based Upon Responses to Request for 

Bid (RFB) 13-0050 
________________________________________________________________________________ 

BACKGROUND: 

Request for Bid (RFB) 13-0050 was e-mailed to ten vendors and published on the District’s website.  This 

request for bid requested pricing for lubricant products and services.  The results were as follows: 

 

Item/Service Description AZ 

Petroleum 

AZ Waste Oil 

Service 

Canyon State 

Oil 

MSC 

Distributing 

RWC  Western 

Refining 

Engine Oil and Filter 

Disposal/Recycling Program 

(revenue per gallon) 

0.35 0.75 0.00 0.75 No Bid No Bid 

CJ-4/SM Engine Oil 8000 

Quarts (per gallon bulk) 

10.10 No Bid 8.76 10.79 No Bid 9.22 

Dexron VI ATF 2000 Quarts 

(per gallon bulk) 

10.78 No Bid 10.81 9.79 No Bid 14.01 

Lithium NLG1 #2 Grade 

Chassis Grease 400 Pounds 

(per pound) 

1.59 No Bid 2.36 2.25 No Bid 2.54 

Gear Oil 75w90 GL-5 400 

Pounds (per 55-gallon drum) 

956.00 No Bid 1,075.94 1,287.80 2,202.76 1,410.00 

Allison ATF TES-295 220 

Gallons (per 55-gallon drum) 

1,522.95 No Bid 1,676.40 1,679.95 1,940.18 1,768.25 

Diesel Exhaust Fluid 1000 

Gallons (per 330-gallon vat) 

580.80 No Bid 610.00 544.50 963.07 773.19 

_________________________________________________________________________ 
RECOMMENDATION: 
It is the recommendation of the Administration that the Governing Board determine that a single award is not 

advantageous to the District and award multiple contracts to Arizona Waste Oil Service for the engine oil and 

filter disposal/recycling program and Arizona Petroleum for the lubricant products based on each vendor’s 

response to RFB 13-0050. 

_________________________________________________________________________ 
INITIATED BY:                                                     

          
_________________________________________________________________________ 
Scott Little, Chief Financial Officer                                                                                 Date:  May 27, 2014 

                            
 ______________________________    

                                                                                              Patrick Nelson, Superintendent 


