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We have developed a new custodial supply
order form. The new form will allow us to track
the total cost, type and amount of supplies
being used at each school per month and year.

With this information we will be able to  supply 
the District and Board with a true break- down 
on what the total custodial supply costs are to 
run a school. It will also help us better manage 
our month to month supply costs per building 
based on it’s square footage and the 
staff/student population.  

CUSTODIAL



SPRING BREAK PROJECTS

THANK YOU

To our custodial staff for their hard work and
dedication over this spring break. A lot of great
work was completed in a short period of time.
Here are just a few of the projects completed:

•Fruitdale – Power scrubbed, refinished café 
floor. High dusted gym and main hallway. 
Hosted custodial training

•Jerome Prairie – Extracted carpets in  
classrooms 2-7, 11 and 12. Burnished hard 
floor areas in rooms 1-4, and the café. 

•Madrona – Scrubbed and refinished the gym. 
Floor. 



The focus of our training over spring break
was on FloorCare QL. This is the next process
being covered in the ARAMARK Quantum leap
innovations program. It’s the next generation
in advanced resilient floor maintenance, this
system employs high speed equipment and
specific finishes, designed to reduce labor and
increase productivity.

Benefits of the program include:

• Excellent floor appearances through the use 
of higher quality floor finishes 

• Greater productivity

• Controlled product usage

• Enhanced risk management, due to 
decreased incidents of slips and falls

• Asset preservation

CUSTODIAL TRAINING


