
AGENDA ITEM 

boardBOARD OF TRUSTEES 
AGENDA 

     

(A)  Report Only Recognition 

Presenter(s): 

Briefly describe the subject of the report or recognition presentation. 

(B)   Action Item 

Presenter(s): ISMAEL MIJARES, DEPUTY SUPERINTENDENT FOR BUSINESS & FINANCE 
LUIS VELEZ, PURCHASING DIRECTOR 

 Briefly describe the action required. 

CONSIDER AND TAKE APPROPRIATE ACTION ON THE REQUEST TO AWARD SEALED 
PROPOSAL NO. 250104 FOR CHARTER BUS TRANSPORTATION SERVICES AND THE 
BOARD DELEGATES THE SUPERINTENDENT OR DESIGNEE THE AUTHORITY TO 
MAKE  RELATED BUDGETED PURCHASES OF GOODS OR SERVICES AS  PER BOARD 
POLICY CH. 

(C)   Funding source: Identify the source of funds if any are required. 

   

(D)   Clarification: Explain any question or issues that might be raised regarding 
  this item. 

  Workshop Regular Special 
X 

BUDGETED FUNDS 

X

SEE ATTACHED MEMORANDUM 



MEMORANDUM 

To: 

From:  

Date: 

Mr. Ismael Mijares, Deputy Superintendent for Business and Finance 

Mr. Luis A. Vélez, Purchasing Director

Thursday, May 9, 2024

Subject: Recommendation on Sealed Proposal Number 250104 for Charter 
Bus Transportation Services

Based on the submitted proposals, the Department of Purchasing recommends 
that Sealed Proposal 250104 for Charter Bus Transportation Services be 
awarded in accordance with the specifications and requirements of the proposal 
and as per the attached Tabulation Sheet. 

If you have any questions or need more information regarding this matter, please 
contact me at the Purchasing Department. 



EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 250104 - CHARTER BUS TRANSPORTATION SERVICES

TABULATION SHEET

DATE OF TRIP RETURN DATE

# OF 

CHARTER 

BUSES

GROUP DESTINATION
CLASSIC 

ELEGANCE
IMPERIAL BUS KERRVILLE BUS OK TOURS R CHARTERS

REGENT COACH 

LINE

UNITED 

CHARTERS

EL PASO, TX SAN ANTONIO, TX SAN ANTONIO, TX SAN ANTONIO, TX LAREDO, TX SAN ANTONIO, TX EL PASO, TX

1 Friday, August 2, 2024 8/2/2024 1 EPHS XC LAREDO ,TX. $1,790.00 $2,200.00 $3,550.00 $1,900.00 $1,600.00 $3,170.00 $2,000.00 
2 Friday, August 2, 2024 8/2/2024 1 CC WINN XC LAREDO ,TX. $1,790.00 $2,200.00 $3,550.00 $1,900.00 $1,600.00 $3,170.00 $2,000.00 
3 Friday, August 2, 2024 8/3/2024 1 CCW TENNIS LAREDO ,TX. $3,580.00 $3,900.00 $3,550.00 $3,250.00 $2,600.00 $4,492.00 $2,800.00 
4 Thursday, August 8, 2024 8/9/2024 1 EPHS XC EDCOUCH, TX $3,580.00 $4,400.00 $5,250.00 $3,450.00 $4,500.00 $5,130.00 $4,280.00 
5 Thursday, August 8, 2024 8/9/2024 1 CC WINN XC EDCOUCH, TX $3,580.00 $4,400.00 $5,250.00 $3,450.00 $4,500.00 $5,130.00 $4,280.00 
6 Saturday, August 10, 2024 8/10/2024 1 EPHS LADY EAGLE VOLLEYBALL UVALDE, TX. $1,790.00 $1,975.00 $2,500.00 $1,900.00 $1,500.00 $2,510.00 $1,500.00 
7 Monday, August 12, 2024 8/12/2024 2 EPHS JV FOOTBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $3,580.00 $4,400.00 $6,900.00 $2,800.00 $3,400.00 $6,600.00 $4,560.00 
8 Monday, August 12, 2024 8/12/2024 2 EPHS 9TH FOOTBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $3,580.00 $4,400.00 $6,900.00 $2,800.00 $3,400.00 $6,600.00 $4,560.00 
9 Tuesday, August 13, 2024 8/13/2024 1 EPHS LADY EAGLE VOLLEYBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $1,790.00 $2,200.00 $3,450.00 $2,000.00 $1,600.00 $3,300.00 $2,280.00 

10 Thursday, August 15, 2024 8/17/2024 1 EPHS LADY EAGLE VOLLEYBALL GEORGETOWN, TX $5,370.00 $5,400.00 $5,350.00 $3,468.50 $3,700.00 $6,738.00 $4,000.00 
11 Thursday, August 15, 2024 8/15/2024 2 EPHS JV FOOTBALL LAREDO ,TX. $3,580.00 $4,400.00 $7,100.00 $4,000.00 $3,200.00 $6,340.00 $4,000.00 
12 Thursday, August 15, 2024 8/15/2024 2 EPHS 9TH FOOTBALL LAREDO ,TX. $3,580.00 $4,400.00 $7,100.00 $4,000.00 $3,200.00 $6,340.00 $4,000.00 
13 Friday, August 16, 2024 8/17/2024 1 EPHS LADY EAGLE VOLLEYBALL D'HANIS, TX $3,580.00 $3,800.00 $3,550.00 $3,450.00 $2,600.00 $4,492.00 $2,600.00 
14 Friday, August 16, 2024 8/16/2024 2 EPHS VARSITY FOOTBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. NO BID $4,400.00 $6,900.00 $4,400.00 $3,400.00 $6,600.00 $4,560.00 

15 Friday, August 16, 2024 8/16/2024 2 CCW VARSITY FOOTBALL CARRIZO SPRINGS, TX. $3,580.00 $4,200.00 $5,280.00 $4,200.00 $3,000.00 $4,290.00 $2,800.00 
16 Friday, August 16, 2024 8/16/2024 2 CCW JV FOOTBALL CARRIZO SPRINGS, TX. $3,850.00 $4,200.00 $5,280.00 $4,200.00 $3,000.00 $4,290.00 $2,800.00 
17 Friday, August 16, 2024 8/16/2024 2 CCW 9TH FOOTBALL CARRIZO SPRINGS, TX. NO BID $4,200.00 $5,280.00 $4,200.00 $3,000.00 $4,290.00 $2,800.00 
18 Friday, August 16, 2024 8/17/2024 1 EPHS XC MCALLEN, TX $3,580.00 $4,400.00 $5,120.00 $3,886.00 $4,200.00 $5,385.00 $4,285.00 
19 Friday, August 16, 2024 8/17/2024 1 CC WINN XC MCALLEN, TX $3,580.00 $4,400.00 $5,120.00 $3,886.00 $4,200.00 $5,385.00 $4,285.00 
20 Thursday, August 22, 2024 8/22/2024 2 CCW VARSITY FOOTBALL LAREDO ,TX. $3,580.00 $4,400.00 $7,100.00 $4,200.00 $3,200.00 $6,340.00 $4,000.00 
21 Thursday, August 22, 2024 8/22/2024 2 CCW JV FOOTBALL LAREDO ,TX. $3,580.00 $4,400.00 $7,100.00 $4,200.00 $3,200.00 $6,340.00 $4,000.00 
22 Thursday, August 22, 2024 8/22/2024 2 CCW 9TH FOOTBALL LAREDO ,TX. $3,580.00 $4,400.00 $7,100.00 $4,200.00 $3,200.00 $6,340.00 $4,000.00 
23 Thursday, August 22, 2024 8/22/2024 1 EP JUNIOR HIGH VOLLEYBALL DEL RIO, TX. $1,790.00 $1,975.00 $2,255.00 $1,900.00 $2,000.00 $2,255.00 $1,500.00 
24 Friday, August 23, 2024 8/23/2024 2 EPHS VARSITY FOOTBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $3,580.00 $4,400.00 $6,900.00 $4,982.00 $3,400.00 $6,600.00 $4,560.00 
25 Friday, August 23, 2024 8/24/2024 1 EPHS LADY EAGLE VOLLEYBALL FLORESVILLE, TX $3,580.00 $3,900.00 $3,660.00 $3,450.00 $3,000.00 $4,492.00 $3,200.00 
26 Saturday, August 24, 2024 8/24/2024 1 CCW TENNIS UVALDE, TX. $1,790.00 $1,975.00 $2,500.00 $2,400.00 $1,500.00 $2,510.00 $1,500.00 
27 Monday, August 26, 2024 8/26/2024 1 EP JUNIOR HIGH VOLLEYBALL LAREDO ,TX. $1,790.00 $2,200.00 $3,550.00 $1,900.00 $1,600.00 $3,170.00 $2,000.00 
28 Tuesday, August 27, 2024 8/27/2024 1 EPHS LADY EAGLE VOLLEYBALL UNIVERSAL CITY, TX $1,790.00 $2,200.00 $3,450.00 $1,900.00 $2,350.00 $3,300.00 $2,390.00 
29 Friday, August 30, 2024 8/31/2024 1 EPHS LADY EAGLE VOLLEYBALL LAREDO ,TX. $3,580.00 $3,900.00 $3,550.00 $3,700.00 $2,500.00 $4,490.00 $2,800.00 
30 Friday, August 30, 2024 8/31/2024 1 EPHS XC LAREDO ,TX. $1,790.00 $2,200.00 $3,550.00 $3,700.00 $1,800.00 $3,170.00 $2,000.00 
31 Friday, August 30, 2024 8/31/2024 1 CC WINN XC LAREDO ,TX. $3,580.00 $3,900.00 $3,550.00 $3,700.00 $2,800.00 $4,492.00 $2,800.00 
32 Saturday, August 31, 2024 8/31/2024 1 MJH XC CASTROVILLE, TX $1,790.00 $2,200.00 $3,165.00 $3,200.00 $2,500.00 $3,115.00 $2,000.00 
33 Saturday, August 31, 2024 8/31/2024 1 CC WINN XC CASTROVILLE, TX $1,790.00 $2,200.00 $3,165.00 $3,200.00 $2,500.00 $3,115.00 $2,000.00 
34 Saturday, August 31, 2024 8/31/2024 1 EPHS XC CASTROVILLE, TX $1,790.00 $2,200.00 $3,165.00 $3,200.00 $2,500.00 $3,115.00 $2,000.00 

35 Saturday, August 31, 2024 8/31/2024 1 EPJH XC CASTROVILLE, TX $1,790.00 $2,200.00 $3,165.00 $3,200.00 $2,500.00 $3,115.00 $2,000.00 
36 Friday, September 6, 2024 9/6/2024 1 EPHS LADY EAGLE VOLLEYBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $1,790.00 $2,700.00 $3,450.00 $3,200.00 $2,500.00 $3,300.00 $2,280.00 
37 Friday, September 6, 2024 9/6/2024 2 EPHS VARSITY FOOTBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $3,580.00 $5,400.00 $6,900.00 $6,400.00 $5,000.00 $6,600.00 $4,560.00 
38 Friday, September 6, 2024 9/6/2024 5 EPHS BAND SAN ANTONIO, TX. NO BID NO BID $17,250.00 $17,000.00 $15,000.00 $16,500.00 $11,400.00 
39 Friday, September 6, 2024 9/6/2024 1 EPHS CHEER & DANCE SAN ANTONIO, TX. $1,790.00 $2,700.00 $3,450.00 $3,400.00 $2,500.00 $3,300.00 $2,280.00 
40 Friday, September 6, 2024 9/6/2024 2 CCW VARSITY FOOTBALL UVALDE, TX. NO BID $4,600.00 $5,000.00 $6,800.00 $4,000.00 $5,020.00 $3,000.00 
41 Friday, September 6, 2024 9/6/2024 5 CCW BAND UVALDE, TX. NO BID NO BID $12,500.00 $14,000.00 $12,000.00 $12,550.00 $7,500.00 
42 Friday, September 6, 2024 9/6/2024 1 CCW CHEER & DANCE UVALDE, TX. NO BID $2,300.00 $2,500.00 $2,800.00 $2,600.00 $2,510.00 $1,500.00 
43 Friday, September 6, 2024 9/7/2024 1 EPHS XC SAN MARCOS, TX NO BID $4,600.00 $4,050.00 $3,900.00 $3,800.00 $4,492.00 $3,450.00 
44 Friday, September 6, 2024 9/7/2024 1 CC WINN XC SAN MARCOS, TX $3,580.00 $4,600.00 $4,050.00 $3,900.00 $3,800.00 $4,492.00 $3,450.00 
45 Saturday, September 7, 2024 9/7/2024 2 MJH XC CRYSTAL CITY, TX $3,580.00 $4,600.00 $4,600.00 $6,400.00 $5,400.00 $4,290.00 $2,800.00 
46 Saturday, September 7, 2024 9/7/2024 2 EPJH XC CRYSTAL CITY, TX $3,580.00 $4,600.00 $5,280.00 $6,400.00 $5,400.00 $4,290.00 $2,800.00 
47 Saturday, September 7, 2024 9/7/2024 1 EPHS XC CRYSTAL CITY, TX $1,790.00 $4,600.00 $2,640.00 $3,200.00 $2,700.00 $2,145.00 $1,400.00 
48 Saturday, September 7, 2024 9/7/2024 1 CC WINN XC CRYSTAL CITY, TX $1,790.00 $4,600.00 $2,640.00 $3,200.00 $2,700.00 $2,145.00 $1,400.00 
49 Saturday, September 7, 2024 9/7/2024 1 EPHS LADY EAGLE VOLLEYBALL LAREDO ,TX. $1,790.00 $2,700.00 $3,550.00 $2,800.00 $2,800.00 $3,170.00 $2,000.00 
50 Saturday, September 7, 2024 9/7/2024 1 CCW TENNIS UVALDE, TX. NO BID $2,300.00 $2,500.00 $3,200.00 $2,800.00 $2,510.00 $1,500.00 

Please note shaded price denotes recommended vendor. Page 1 of 6



EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 250104 - CHARTER BUS TRANSPORTATION SERVICES

TABULATION SHEET

DATE OF TRIP RETURN DATE

# OF 

CHARTER 

BUSES

GROUP DESTINATION
CLASSIC 

ELEGANCE
IMPERIAL BUS KERRVILLE BUS OK TOURS R CHARTERS

REGENT COACH 

LINE

UNITED 

CHARTERS

EL PASO, TX SAN ANTONIO, TX SAN ANTONIO, TX SAN ANTONIO, TX LAREDO, TX SAN ANTONIO, TX EL PASO, TX

51 Monday, September 9, 2024 9/9/2024 1 EP JUNIOR HIGH VOLLEYBALL LAREDO ,TX. $1,790.00 $2,500.00 $3,550.00 $1,900.00 $1,600.00 $3,170.00 $2,000.00 
52 Tuesday, September 10, 2024 9/10/2024 2 MJH 8TH FOOTBALL LAREDO ,TX. $3,580.00 $5,000.00 $7,100.00 $3,800.00 $3,200.00 $6,340.00 $4,000.00 
53 Tuesday, September 10, 2024 9/10/2024 2 MJH 7TH FOOTBALL LAREDO ,TX. $3,580.00 $5,000.00 $7,100.00 $3,800.00 $3,200.00 $6,340.00 $4,000.00 
54 Tuesday, September 10, 2024 9/10/2024 2 EPJH 7TH FOOTBALL LAREDO ,TX. $3,580.00 $5,000.00 $7,100.00 $3,800.00 $3,200.00 $6,340.00 $4,000.00 
55 Wednesday, September 11, 2024 9/11/2024 2 CCW 9TH FOOTBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $3,580.00 $5,000.00 $6,900.00 $3,800.00 $3,200.00 $6,600.00 $4,560.00 
56 Wednesday, September 11, 2024 9/11/2024 2 EPJH 8TH FOOTBALL LAREDO ,TX. $3,580.00 $5,000.00 $7,100.00 $3,800.00 $3,200.00 $6,340.00 $4,000.00 
57 Friday, September 13, 2024 9/13/2024 2 EPHS VARSITY FOOTBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $3,580.00 $5,400.00 $6,900.00 $5,600.00 $5,600.00 $6,600.00 $4,560.00 
58 Friday, September 13, 2024 9/13/2024 5 EPHS BAND SAN ANTONIO, TX. NO BID NO BID $17,250.00 $14,000.00 $15,000.00 $16,500.00 $11,400.00 
59 Friday, September 13, 2024 9/13/2024 1 EPHS CHEER & DANCE SAN ANTONIO, TX. $3,580.00 $2,700.00 $3,450.00 $2,800.00 $3,000.00 $3,300.00 $2,280.00 
60 Friday, September 13, 2024 9/13/2024 2 CCW VARSITY FOOTBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $3,580.00 $5,400.00 $6,900.00 $5,600.00 $6,000.00 $6,600.00 $4,560.00 
61 Friday, September 13, 2024 9/13/2024 5 CCW BAND SAN ANTONIO, TX. NO BID NO BID $17,250.00 $14,000.00 $15,000.00 $16,500.00 $11,400.00 
62 Friday, September 13, 2024 9/13/2024 1 CCW CHEER & DANCE SAN ANTONIO, TX. $3,580.00 $2,700.00 $3,450.00 $2,800.00 $3,000.00 $3,300.00 $2,280.00 
63 Friday, September 13, 2024 9/14/2024 1 EPHS XC CORPUS CHRISTI, TX $3,580.00 $4,600.00 $4,410.00 $4,100.00 $4,500.00 $4,492.00 $3,650.00 
64 Friday, September 13, 2024 9/14/2024 1 CC WINN XC CORPUS CHRISTI, TX $1,780.00 $4,600.00 $4,410.00 $4,100.00 $4,500.00 $4,492.00 $3,650.00 

65 Monday, September 16, 2024 9/16/2024 1 EP JUNIOR HIGH VOLLEYBALL LAREDO ,TX. $1,790.00 $2,500.00 $3,550.00 $1,900.00 $1,600.00 $3,170.00 $2,000.00 
66 Tuesday, September 17, 2024 9/17/2024 2 MJH 8TH FOOTBALL LAREDO ,TX. $3,580.00 $5,000.00 $7,100.00 $3,800.00 $3,300.00 $6,340.00 $4,000.00 
67 Tuesday, September 17, 2024 9/17/2024 2 MJH 7TH FOOTBALL LAREDO ,TX. $3,580.00 $5,000.00 $7,100.00 $3,800.00 $3,300.00 $6,340.00 $4,000.00 
68 Tuesday, September 17, 2024 9/17/2024 2 EPJH 7TH FOOTBALL DEL RIO, TX. $3,580.00 $4,000.00 $4,510.00 $3,800.00 $3,300.00 $4,510.00 $3,000.00 
69 Thursday, September 19, 2024 9/19/2024 2 EPHS JV FOOTBALL NEW BRAUNFELS, TX. $3,580.00 $5,700.00 $7,000.00 $4,800.00 $5,000.00 $7,550.00 $5,000.00 
70 Thursday, September 19, 2024 9/19/2024 2 EPHS 9TH FOOTBALL NEW BRAUNFELS, TX. $3,580.00 $5,700.00 $7,000.00 $4,800.00 $5,000.00 $7,550.00 $5,000.00 
71 Saturday, September 21, 2024 9/21/2024 2 EPJH XC PEARSALL, TX $3,580.00 $4,400.00 $2,900.00 $6,400.00 $5,000.00 $5,335.00 $3,670.00 
72 Friday, September 20, 2024 9/21/2024 1 EPHS XC COLLEGE STATION, TX $3,580.00 $4,690.00 $5,560.00 $4,900.00 $5,000.00 $4,850.00 $4,500.00 
73 Friday, September 20, 2024 9/21/2024 1 CC WINN XC COLLEGE STATION, TX $3,580.00 $4,690.00 $5,560.00 $4,900.00 $5,000.00 $4,850.00 $4,500.00 
74 Saturday, September 21, 2024 9/21/2024 1 EPHS XC PEARSALL, TX $1,790.00 $2,200.00 $2,900.00 $2,800.00 $2,600.00 $2,667.50 $1,835.00 
75 Saturday, September 21, 2024 9/21/2024 1 CC WINN XC PEARSALL, TX $1,790.00 $2,200.00 $2,900.00 $2,800.00 $2,600.00 $2,667.50 $1,835.00 
76 Tuesday, September 24, 2024 9/24/2024 1 EPHS LADY EAGLE VOLLEYBALL LAREDO ,TX. $1,790.00 $2,500.00 $3,550.00 $1,900.00 $1,600.00 $3,170.00 $2,000.00 
77 Tuesday, September 24, 2024 9/24/2024 1 CC WINN BAND CASTROVILLE, TX $1,790.00 $2,500.00 $3,165.00 $1,900.00 $1,600.00 $3,115.00 $2,000.00 
78 Wednesday, September 25, 2024 9/25/2024 1 EP JUNIOR HIGH VOLLEYBALL LAREDO ,TX. $1,790.00 $2,500.00 $3,550.00 $1,900.00 $1,600.00 $3,170.00 $2,000.00 
79 Wednesday, September 25, 2024 9/25/2024 2 EPJH 8TH FOOTBALL UVALDE, TX. $3,580.00 $4,000.00 $5,000.00 $3,800.00 $3,100.00 $5,020.00 $3,000.00 
80 Thursday, September 26, 2024 9/26/2024 2 CCW JV FOOTBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $3,580.00 $5,600.00 $6,900.00 $4,200.00 $3,500.00 $6,600.00 $4,560.00 
81 Friday, September 27, 2024 9/27/2024 2 EPHS VARSITY FOOTBALL CASTROVILLE, TX. $3,580.00 $5,990.00 $6,330.00 $5,600.00 $6,000.00 $6,230.00 $4,000.00 
82 Friday, September 27, 2024 9/27/2024 5 EPHS BAND CASTROVILLE, TX. NO BID NO BID $15,825.00 $14,000.00 $16,000.00 $15,575.00 $10,000.00 
83 Friday, September 27, 2024 9/27/2024 1 EPHS CHEER & DANCE CASTROVILLE, TX. $1,790.00 $2,995.00 $3,165.00 $2,800.00 $3,000.00 $3,115.00 $2,000.00 
84 Friday, September 27, 2024 9/28/2024 1 CC WINN XC THE WOODLANDS, TX $3,580.00 $5,000.00 $6,200.00 $5,900.00 $5,500.00 NO BID $4,850.00 

85 Friday, September 27, 2024 9/28/2024 1 EPHS XC THE WOODLANDS, TX $3,580.00 $5,000.00 $6,200.00 $5,900.00 $5,500.00 NO BID $4,850.00 
86 Saturday, September 28, 2024 9/28/2024 1 CC WINN BAND SAN ANTONIO, TX. $1,790.00 $2,995.00 $3,450.00 $3,200.00 $3,000.00 $3,300.00 $2,280.00 
87 Saturday, September 28, 2024 9/28/2024 5 CC WINN BAND SAN ANTONIO, TX. NO BID NO BID $17,250.00 $16,000.00 $15,000.00 $16,500.00 $11,400.00 
88 Saturday, September 28, 2024 9/28/2024 1 EPHS XC CASTROVILLE, TX $1,790.00 $2,995.00 $3,165.00 $3,200.00 $3,000.00 $3,115.00 $2,000.00 
89 Saturday, September 28, 2024 9/28/2024 1 CC WINN XC CASTROVILLE, TX $1,790.00 $2,995.00 $3,165.00 $3,200.00 $3,000.00 $3,115.00 $2,000.00 
90 Saturday, September 28, 2024 9/28/2024 1 CCW TENNIS UVALDE, TX. $1,790.00 $2,400.00 $2,500.00 $3,200.00 $2,300.00 $2,510.00 $1,500.00 
91 Monday, September 30, 2024 9/30/2024 1 EP JUNIOR HIGH VOLLEYBALL LAREDO ,TX. $1,790.00 $2,500.00 $3,550.00 $1,900.00 $1,600.00 $3,170.00 $2,000.00 
92 Tuesday, October 1, 2024 10/1/2024 1 EPHS LADY EAGLE VOLLEYBALL LAREDO ,TX. $1,790.00 $2,500.00 $3,550.00 $1,900.00 $1,600.00 $3,170.00 $2,000.00 
93 Wednesday, October 2, 2024 10/2/2024 2 MJH 7TH FOOTBALL DEL RIO, TX. $3,580.00 $4,000.00 $4,510.00 $3,800.00 $3,000.00 $4,510.00 $3,000.00 
94 Wednesday, October 2, 2024 10/2/2024 2 EPJH 7TH FOOTBALL CARRIZO SPRINGS, TX. $3,580.00 $4,000.00 $5,280.00 $3,800.00 $3,000.00 $4,290.00 $2,800.00 
95 Thursday, October 3, 2024 10/3/2024 2 CCW JV FOOTBALL LAREDO ,TX. $3,580.00 $5,400.00 $7,100.00 $3,800.00 $3,200.00 $6,340.00 $4,000.00 
96 Thursday, October 3, 2024 10/3/2024 2 EPJH 8TH FOOTBALL CARRIZO SPRINGS, TX. $3,580.00 $4,600.00 $5,280.00 $3,800.00 $3,000.00 $4,290.00 $2,800.00 
97 Saturday, October 5, 2024 10/5/2024 5 CC WINN BAND LAREDO ,TX. NO BID NO BID $17,750.00 $16,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,850.00 $10,000.00 
98 Saturday, October 5, 2024 10/5/2024 5 EPHS BAND SAN ANTONIO, TX. NO BID NO BID $17,250.00 $16,000.00 $16,000.00 $16,500.00 $11,400.00 
99 Saturday, October 5, 2024 10/5/2024 2 EPJH XC LAREDO ,TX. $3,580.00 $2,995.00 $7,100.00 $6,400.00 $6,000.00 $6,340.00 $4,000.00 

100 Saturday, October 5, 2024 10/5/2024 2 MJH XC LAREDO ,TX. $3,580.00 $2,995.00 $7,100.00 $6,400.00 $6,000.00 $6,340.00 $4,000.00 
Please note shaded price denotes recommended vendor. Page 2 of 6
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101 Saturday, October 5, 2024 10/5/2024 1 EPHS LADY EAGLE VOLLEYBALL DEL RIO, TX. $1,790.00 $2,300.00 $2,255.00 $3,200.00 $2,800.00 $2,255.00 $1,500.00 
102 Tuesday, October 8, 2024 10/8/2024 1 EPHS LADY EAGLE VOLLEYBALL CASTROVILLE, TX $1,790.00 $2,500.00 $3,165.00 $1,900.00 $1,700.00 $3,115.00 $2,000.00 
103 Tuesday, October 8, 2024 10/8/2024 2 EPJH 7TH FOOTBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $3,580.00 $5,000.00 $6,900.00 $3,800.00 $3,300.00 $6,600.00 $4,560.00 
104 Wednesday, October 9, 2024 10/9/2024 2 EPJH 8TH FOOTBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $3,580.00 $5,000.00 $6,900.00 $3,800.00 $3,300.00 $6,600.00 $4,560.00 
105 Thursday, October 10, 2024 10/10/2024 2 CCW 9TH FOOTBALL LAREDO ,TX. $3,580.00 $5,400.00 $7,100.00 $3,800.00 $3,200.00 $6,340.00 $4,000.00 
106 Thursday, October 10, 2024 10/10/2024 2 EPHS JV FOOTBALL LAREDO ,TX. $3,580.00 $5,400.00 $7,100.00 $3,800.00 $3,200.00 $6,340.00 $4,000.00 
107 Thursday, October 10, 2024 10/10/2024 2 EPHS 9TH FOOTBALL LAREDO ,TX. $3,580.00 $5,400.00 $7,100.00 $3,800.00 $3,200.00 $6,340.00 $4,000.00 
108 Friday, October 11, 2024 10/11/2024 2 CCW VARSITY FOOTBALL LAREDO ,TX. $3,580.00 $5,990.00 $7,100.00 $3,800.00 $3,200.00 $6,340.00 $4,000.00 
109 Friday, October 11, 2024 10/11/2024 5 CCW BAND LAREDO ,TX. NO BID NO BID $17,750.00 NO BID $14,000.00 $15,850.00 $10,000.00 
110 Friday, October 11, 2024 10/11/2024 1 CCW CHEER & DANCE LAREDO ,TX. $3,580.00 $2,995.00 $3,550.00 $3,200.00 $3,000.00 $3,170.00 $2,000.00 
111 Saturday, October 12, 2024 10/12/2024 5 CC WINN BAND CONVERSE, TX NO BID NO BID $17,250.00 $16,000.00 $15,500.00 $17,275.00 $11,400.00 
112 Saturday, October 12, 2024 10/12/2024 5 EPHS BAND SAN ANTONIO, TX. NO BID NO BID $17,250.00 $16,000.00 $14,000.00 $16,500.00 $11,400.00 
113 Saturday, October 12, 2024 10/12/2024 2 EPJH XC LAREDO ,TX. $3,580.00 $5,990.00 $7,100.00 $5,600.00 $3,200.00 $6,340.00 $4,000.00 
114 Saturday, October 12, 2024 10/12/2024 2 MJH XC LAREDO ,TX. $3,580.00 $5,990.00 $7,100.00 $6,400.00 $3,200.00 $6,340.00 $4,000.00 

115 Tuesday, October 15, 2024 10/15/2024 1 EPHS LADY EAGLE VOLLEYBALL LAREDO ,TX. $1,790.00 $2,500.00 $3,550.00 $2,100.00 $1,600.00 $3,170.00 $2,000.00 
116 Thursday, October 17, 2024 10/17/2024 2 CCW VARSITY FOOTBALL LAREDO ,TX. $3,580.00 $5,600.00 $7,100.00 $5,200.00 $3,200.00 $6,340.00 $4,000.00 
117 Thursday, October 17, 2024 10/17/2024 5 CCW BAND LAREDO ,TX. NO BID NO BID $17,750.00 $13,000.00 $8,500.00 $15,850.00 $10,000.00 
118 Thursday, October 17, 2024 10/17/2024 1 CCW CHEER & DANCE LAREDO ,TX. $1,790.00 $2,800.00 $3,550.00 $2,600.00 $2,800.00 $3,170.00 $2,000.00 
119 Thursday, October 17, 2024 10/17/2024 2 MJH 8TH FOOTBALL CARRIZO SPRINGS, TX. $3,580.00 $4,600.00 $5,280.00 $5,200.00 $4,000.00 $4,290.00 $2,800.00 
120 Thursday, October 17, 2024 10/17/2024 2 MJH 7TH FOOTBALL CARRIZO SPRINGS, TX. $3,580.00 $4,600.00 $5,280.00 $5,200.00 $4,000.00 $4,290.00 $2,800.00 
121 Saturday, October 19, 2024 10/19/2024 2 EPHS VARSITY FOOTBALL LAREDO ,TX. $3,580.00 $5,990.00 $7,100.00 $5,200.00 $6,000.00 $6,340.00 $4,000.00 
122 Saturday, October 19, 2024 10/19/2024 5 EPHS BAND LAREDO ,TX. NO BID NO BID $17,750.00 $13,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,850.00 $10,000.00 
123 Saturday, October 19, 2024 10/19/2024 1 EPHS CHEER & DANCE LAREDO ,TX. $1,790.00 $2,995.00 $3,550.00 $2,600.00 $3,000.00 $3,170.00 $2,000.00 
124 Saturday, October 19, 2024 10/19/2024 5 EPHS BAND SAN ANTONIO, TX. NO BID NO BID $17,250.00 $13,000.00 $15,000.00 $16,500.00 $11,400.00 
125 Tuesday, October 22, 2024 10/22/2024 1 EPHS LADY EAGLE VOLLEYBALL LAREDO ,TX. $1,790.00 $2,995.00 $3,550.00 $2,100.00 $1,600.00 $3,170.00 $2,000.00 
126 Tuesday, October 22, 2024 10/22/2024 2 MJH 8TH FOOTBALL UVALDE, TX. $3,580.00 $4,000.00 $5,000.00 $4,200.00 $3,200.00 $5,020.00 $3,000.00 
127 Tuesday, October 22, 2024 10/22/2024 2 MJH 7TH FOOTBALL UVALDE, TX. $3,580.00 $4,000.00 $5,000.00 $4,200.00 $3,200.00 $5,020.00 $3,000.00 
128 Tuesday, October 22, 2024 10/22/2024 2 EPJH 8TH FOOTBALL DEL RIO, TX. $3,580.00 $4,000.00 $4,510.00 $4,200.00 $3,200.00 $4,510.00 $3,000.00 
129 Wednesday, October 23, 2024 10/23/2024 2 CCW JV FOOTBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $3,580.00 $5,000.00 $6,900.00 $4,200.00 $3,200.00 $6,600.00 $4,560.00 
130 Wednesday, October 23, 2024 10/24/2024 1 EPHS XC CORPUS CHRISTI, TX NO BID $4,500.00 $4,410.00 $3,900.00 $3,800.00 $4,492.00 $3,650.00 
131 Wednesday, October 23, 2024 10/24/2024 1 CC WINN XC CORPUS CHRISTI, TX NO BID $4,500.00 $4,410.00 $3,900.00 $3,800.00 $4,492.00 $3,650.00 
132 Thursday, October 24, 2024 10/24/2024 2 EPHS JV FOOTBALL LAREDO ,TX. $3,580.00 $5,600.00 $7,100.00 $4,800.00 $3,400.00 $6,340.00 $4,000.00 
133 Thursday, October 24, 2024 10/24/2024 2 EPHS 9TH FOOTBALL LAREDO ,TX. $3,580.00 $5,600.00 $7,100.00 $4,800.00 $3,400.00 $6,340.00 $4,000.00 
134 Saturday, October 26, 2024 10/26/2024 1 EPHS LADY EAGLE VOLLEYBALL LAREDO ,TX. $1,790.00 $2,995.00 $3,550.00 $2,800.00 $3,000.00 $3,170.00 $4,000.00 

135 Tuesday, October 29, 2024 10/29/2024 2 EPJH 7TH FOOTBALL UVALDE, TX. $3,580.00 $4,000.00 $5,000.00 $4,200.00 $3,000.00 $5,020.00 $3,000.00 
136 Wednesday, October 30, 2024 10/30/2024 2 MJH 8TH FOOTBALL DEL RIO, TX. $3,580.00 $4,000.00 $4,510.00 $4,200.00 $3,000.00 $4,510.00 $3,000.00 
137 Thursday, October 31, 2024 10/31/2024 2 EPHS VARSITY FOOTBALL LAREDO ,TX. $3,580.00 $5,600.00 $7,100.00 $4,200.00 $3,150.00 $6,340.00 $4,000.00 
138 Thursday, October 31, 2024 10/31/2024 5 EPHS BAND LAREDO ,TX. NO BID NO BID $17,750.00 $13,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,850.00 $10,000.00 
139 Thursday, October 31, 2024 10/31/2024 1 EPHS CHEER & DANCE LAREDO ,TX. $1,790.00 $2,800.00 $3,550.00 $2,600.00 $3,000.00 $3,170.00 $2,000.00 
140 Thursday, October 31, 2024 10/31/2024 2 CCW 9TH FOOTBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $3,580.00 $5,600.00 $6,900.00 $5,200.00 $3,200.00 $6,600.00 $4,560.00 
141 Friday, November 1, 2024 11/1/2024 2 CCW VARSITY FOOTBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $3,580.00 $5,990.00 $6,900.00 NO BID $6,000.00 $6,600.00 $4,560.00 
142 Friday, November 1, 2024 11/1/2024 5 CCW BAND SAN ANTONIO, TX. NO BID NO BID $17,250.00 NO BID $15,000.00 $16,500.00 $11,400.00 
143 Friday, November 1, 2024 11/1/2024 1 CCW CHEER & DANCE SAN ANTONIO, TX. $1,790.00 $2,995.00 $3,450.00 NO BID $3,000.00 $3,300.00 $2,280.00 
144 Friday, November 1, 2024 11/2/2024 1 EPHS XC ROUND ROCK, TX $3,580.00 $4,500.00 $4,935.00 $4,400.00 $4,800.00 NO BID $3,850.00 
145 Friday, November 1, 2024 11/2/2024 1 CC WINN XC ROUND ROCK, TX $3,580.00 $4,500.00 $4,935.00 $4,400.00 $4,800.00 NO BID $3,850.00 
146 Saturday, November 2, 2024 11/2/2024 1 EPHS BOYS BASKETBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $1,790.00 $2,995.00 $3,450.00 $2,491.00 $3,000.00 $3,300.00 $2,280.00 
147 Saturday, November 2, 2024 11/2/2024 1 LADY EAGLES BASKETBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $1,790.00 $2,995.00 $3,450.00 $2,491.00 $3,000.00 $3,300.00 $2,280.00 
148 Saturday, November 2, 2024 11/2/2024 1 CCW BOYS BASKETBALL LAREDO ,TX. $1,790.00 $2,995.00 $3,550.00 $2,400.00 $3,000.00 $3,170.00 $2,000.00 
149 Monday, November 4, 2024 11/4/2024 5 CC WINN BAND SAN ANTONIO, TX. NO BID NO BID $17,250.00 $14,000.00 $8,000.00 $16,500.00 $11,400.00 
150 Tuesday, November 5, 2024 11/5/2024 1 CCW BOYS BASKETBALL LAREDO ,TX. $1,790.00 $2,500.00 $3,550.00 $2,800.00 $1,600.00 $3,170.00 $2,000.00 
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151 Tuesday, November 5, 2024 11/5/2024 1 EPHS BOYS BASKETBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $1,790.00 $2,500.00 $3,450.00 $2,800.00 $1,600.00 $3,300.00 $2,280.00 
152 Wednesday, November 6, 2024 11/6/2024 2 EPHS JV FOOTBALL DEL RIO, TX. $3,580.00 $4,000.00 $4,510.00 $5,600.00 $3,000.00 $4,510.00 $3,000.00 
153 Wednesday, November 6, 2024 11/6/2024 2 EPHS 9TH FOOTBALL DEL RIO, TX. $3,580.00 $4,000.00 $4,510.00 $5,600.00 $3,000.00 $4,510.00 $3,000.00 
154 Thursday, November 7, 2024 11/7/2024 2 CCW JV FOOTBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $3,580.00 $5,600.00 $6,900.00 $4,982.00 $3,200.00 $6,600.00 $4,560.00 
155 Friday, November 8, 2024 11/8/2024 2 EPHS VARSITY FOOTBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $3,580.00 $5,990.00 $6,900.00 $5,600.00 $6,000.00 NO BID $4,560.00 
156 Friday, November 8, 2024 11/8/2024 5 EPHS BAND SAN ANTONIO, TX. NO BID NO BID $17,250.00 $14,000.00 $15,000.00 NO BID $11,400.00 
157 Friday, November 8, 2024 11/8/2024 1 EPHS CHEER & DANCE SAN ANTONIO, TX. $1,790.00 $2,995.00 $3,450.00 $2,800.00 $3,000.00 NO BID $2,280.00 
158 Friday, November 8, 2024 11/8/2024 2 CCW VARSITY FOOTBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $3,580.00 $5,990.00 $6,900.00 $5,600.00 $6,000.00 NO BID $4,560.00 
159 Friday, November 8, 2024 11/8/2024 5 CCW BAND SAN ANTONIO, TX. NO BID NO BID $17,250.00 $14,000.00 $16,000.00 NO BID $11,400.00 
160 Friday, November 8, 2024 11/8/2024 1 CCW CHEER & DANCE SAN ANTONIO, TX. $1,790.00 $2,995.00 $3,450.00 $2,800.00 $3,000.00 NO BID $2,280.00 
161 Saturday, November 9, 2024 11/9/2024 2 EPHS VARSITY FOOTBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $3,580.00 $5,990.00 $6,900.00 $5,600.00 $6,000.00 $6,600.00 $4,560.00 
162 Saturday, November 9, 2024 11/9/2024 5 EPHS BAND SAN ANTONIO, TX. NO BID NO BID $17,250.00 $14,000.00 $16,000.00 $16,500.00 $11,400.00 
163 Saturday, November 9, 2024 11/9/2024 1 EPHS CHEER & DANCE SAN ANTONIO, TX. $1,790.00 $2,995.00 $3,450.00 $2,800.00 $3,000.00 $3,300.00 $2,280.00 
164 Saturday, November 9, 2024 11/9/2024 2 CCW VARSITY FOOTBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $3,580.00 $5,995.00 $6,900.00 $5,600.00 $6,000.00 $6,600.00 $4,560.00 

165 Saturday, November 9, 2024 11/9/2024 5 CCW BAND SAN ANTONIO, TX. NO BID NO BID $17,250.00 $14,000.00 $16,000.00 $16,500.00 $11,400.00 
166 Saturday, November 9, 2024 11/9/2024 1 CCW CHEER & DANCE SAN ANTONIO, TX. $1,790.00 $2,995.00 $3,450.00 $2,800.00 $3,000.00 $3,300.00 $2,280.00 
167 Friday, November 8, 2024 11/8/2024 1 EPHS BOYS BASKETBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. NO BID $2,995.00 $3,450.00 $2,200.00 $3,000.00 NO BID $2,280.00 
168 Saturday, November 9, 2024 11/9/2024 1 CCW BOYS BASKETBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $1,790.00 $2,995.00 $3,450.00 $2,200.00 $3,000.00 $3,300.00 $2,280.00 
169 Saturday, November 9, 2024 11/9/2024 1 LADY EAGLES BASKETBALL LAREDO ,TX. NO BID $2,995.00 $3,550.00 $2,400.00 $2,800.00 $3,170.00 $2,000.00 
170 Monday, November 11, 2024 11/11/2024 1 EPHS BOYS BASKETBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $1,790.00 $2,500.00 $3,450.00 $2,491.00 $1,600.00 $3,300.00 $2,280.00 
171 Tuesday, November 12, 2024 11/12/2024 1 CCW BOYS BASKETBALL CARRIZO SPRINGS, TX $1,790.00 $2,000.00 $2,640.00 $2,400.00 $1,500.00 $2,145.00 $1,400.00 
172 Thursday, November 14, 2024 11/16/2024 1 EPHS BOYS BASKETBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $3,580.00 $5,700.00 $5,350.00 $4,700.00 $3,800.00 $6,138.00 $3,080.00 
173 Friday, November 15, 2024 11/15/2024 1 LADY EAGLES BASKETBALL BANDERA, TX $1,790.00 $2,995.00 $3,275.00 $3,000.00 $4,000.00 $3,052.50 $2,100.00 
174 Friday, November 15, 2024 11/15/2024 2 EPHS VARSITY FOOTBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $3,580.00 $5,990.00 $6,900.00 $6,400.00 $6,000.00 $6,600.00 $4,560.00 
175 Friday, November 15, 2024 11/15/2024 5 EPHS BAND SAN ANTONIO, TX. NO BID NO BID $17,250.00 $14,000.00 $16,000.00 $16,500.00 $11,400.00 
176 Friday, November 15, 2024 11/15/2024 1 EPHS CHEER & DANCE SAN ANTONIO, TX. $1,790.00 $2,995.00 $3,450.00 $2,800.00 $3,000.00 $3,300.00 $2,280.00 
177 Friday, November 15, 2024 11/15/2024 2 CCW VARSITY FOOTBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $3,580.00 $5,990.00 $6,900.00 $5,600.00 $6,000.00 $6,600.00 $4,560.00 
178 Friday, November 15, 2024 11/15/2024 5 CCW BAND SAN ANTONIO, TX. NO BID NO BID $17,250.00 $14,000.00 $16,000.00 $16,500.00 $11,400.00 
179 Friday, November 15, 2024 11/15/2024 1 CCW CHEER & DANCE SAN ANTONIO, TX. $1,790.00 $2,995.00 $3,450.00 $5,600.00 $3,000.00 $3,300.00 $2,280.00 
180 Saturday, November 16, 2024 11/16/2024 2 EPHS VARSITY FOOTBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $3,580.00 $5,990.00 $6,900.00 $5,600.00 $6,000.00 $6,600.00 $4,560.00 
181 Saturday, November 16, 2024 11/16/2024 5 EPHS BAND SAN ANTONIO, TX. NO BID NO BID $17,250.00 $16,000.00 $16,000.00 $16,500.00 $11,400.00 
182 Saturday, November 16, 2024 11/16/2024 1 EPHS CHEER & DANCE SAN ANTONIO, TX. $1,790.00 $2,995.00 $3,450.00 $2,800.00 $3,000.00 $3,300.00 $2,280.00 
183 Saturday, November 16, 2024 11/16/2024 2 CCW VARSITY FOOTBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $3,580.00 $5,990.00 $6,900.00 $4,800.00 $6,000.00 $6,600.00 $4,560.00 
184 Saturday, November 16, 2024 11/16/2024 5 CCW BAND SAN ANTONIO, TX. NO BID NO BID $17,250.00 $14,000.00 $16,000.00 $16,500.00 $11,400.00 

185 Saturday, November 16, 2024 11/16/2024 1 CCW CHEER & DANCE SAN ANTONIO, TX. $1,790.00 $2,995.00 $3,450.00 $2,800.00 $3,000.00 $3,300.00 $2,280.00 
186 Tuesday, November 19, 2024 11/19/2024 1 LADY EAGLES BASKETBALL CARRIZO SPRINGS, TX $1,790.00 $2,000.00 $2,640.00 $2,100.00 $1,500.00 $2,145.00 $1,400.00 
187 Tuesday, November 19, 2024 11/19/2024 1 EPHS BOYS BASKETBALL SOMERSET, TX $1,790.00 $2,995.00 $3,275.00 $2,100.00 $1,650.00 $3,080.00 $2,100.00 
188 Saturday, November 16, 2024 11/16/2024 1 CCW BOYS BASKETBALL NEW BRAUNFELS, TX. NO BID $3,100.00 $3,750.00 $2,800.00 $4,000.00 $3,775.00 $2,500.00 
189 Thursday, November 21, 2024 11/21/2024 1 EPHS BOYS BASKETBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $1,790.00 $2,800.00 $3,450.00 $2,200.00 $3,000.00 $3,300.00 $2,280.00 
190 Thursday, November 21, 2024 11/23/2024 1 CCW BOYS BASKETBALL LA JOLLA, TX $3,580.00 $6,750.00 $5,045.00 $4,900.00 $6,000.00 NO BID $4,000.00 
191 Thursday, November 21, 2024 11/23/2024 1 LADY EAGLES BASKETBALL MCALLEN, TX $3,580.00 $6,750.00 $5,350.00 $4,900.00 $6,200.00 NO BID $4,285.00 
192 Tuesday, November 26, 2024 11/26/2024 1 CCW BOYS BASKETBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $1,790.00 $2,500.00 $3,450.00 $2,100.00 $1,600.00 $3,300.00 $2,280.00 
193 Saturday, November 30, 2024 11/30/2024 1 EPHS BOYS BASKETBALL LAREDO ,TX. $1,790.00 $2,995.00 $3,550.00 $2,100.00 $2,000.00 $3,170.00 $2,000.00 
194 Saturday, November 30, 2024 11/30/2024 1 EPHS BOYS BASKETBALL PEARSALL, TX $1,790.00 $2,400.00 $2,900.00 $2,100.00 $2,000.00 NO BID $1,835.00 
195 Tuesday, December 3, 2024 12/3/2024 1 LADY EAGLES BASKETBALL HONDO, TX $1,790.00 $2,100.00 $2,895.00 $2,100.00 $1,600.00 $2,750.00 $1,900.00 
196 Thursday, December 5, 2024 12/7/2024 1 CCW BOYS BASKETBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $3,580.00 $4,800.00 $5,350.00 $4,900.00 $4,000.00 NO BID $3,080.00 
197 Thursday, December 5, 2024 12/7/2024 1 EPHS BOYS BASKETBALL KERRVILLE, TX. $1,790.00 $5,900.00 $5,350.00 $4,900.00 $3,000.00 NO BID $2,350.00 
198 Saturday, December 7, 2024 12/7/2024 1 CCW BOYS SOCCER SAN ANTONIO, TX. $1,790.00 $2,600.00 $3,450.00 $2,100.00 $3,000.00 $3,300.00 $2,280.00 
199 Saturday, December 7, 2024 12/7/2024 1 EPHS BOYS BASKETBALL DEL RIO, TX. $1,790.00 $2,175.00 $2,255.00 $2,100.00 $3,000.00 $2,255.00 $1,500.00 
200 Saturday, December 7, 2024 12/7/2024 4 CC WINN BAND SAN ANTONIO, TX. NO BID NO BID $13,800.00 $10,400.00 $12,000.00 $13,200.00 $9,120.00 
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201 Saturday, December 7, 2024 12/7/2024 1 EPHS BAND SAN ANTONIO, TX. NO BID $2,600.00 $3,450.00 $2,491.00 $2,500.00 $3,300.00 $2,280.00 
202 Tuesday, December 10, 2024 12/10/2024 1 CCW BOYS BASKETBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $1,790.00 $2,500.00 $3,450.00 $2,491.00 $1,600.00 $3,300.00 $2,280.00 
203 Friday, December 13, 2024 12/13/2024 1 CCW BOYS SOCCER SAN ANTONIO, TX. $1,790.00 $2,600.00 $3,450.00 $2,491.00 $1,800.00 $3,300.00 $2,280.00 
204 Saturday, December 14, 2024 12/14/2024 1 EPHS BAND SAN ANTONIO, TX. $1,790.00 $2,600.00 $3,450.00 $2,491.00 $1,800.00 $3,300.00 $2,280.00 
205 Tuesday, December 17, 2024 12/17/2024 1 EPHS BOYS BASKETBALL LAREDO ,TX. $1,790.00 $2,400.00 $3,550.00 $2,400.00 $1,600.00 $3,170.00 $2,000.00 
206 Thursday, December 19, 2024 12/19/2024 1 LADY EAGLES SOCCER LAREDO ,TX. $1,790.00 $2,400.00 $3,550.00 $2,400.00 $1,700.00 $3,170.00 $2,000.00 
207 Friday, December 20, 2024 12/20/2024 1 LADY EAGLES BASKETBALL LAREDO ,TX. $1,790.00 $2,600.00 $3,550.00 $2,400.00 $1,700.00 $3,170.00 $2,000.00 
208 Friday, December 20, 2024 12/20/2024 1 CCW BOYS BASKETBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $1,790.00 $2,600.00 $3,450.00 $2,491.00 $3,000.00 $3,300.00 $2,280.00 
209 Friday, December 20, 2024 12/20/2024 1 LADY EAGLES BASKETBALL LAREDO ,TX. $1,790.00 $2,600.00 $3,550.00 $2,400.00 $2,500.00 $3,170.00 $2,000.00 
210 Friday, December 27, 2024 12/28/2024 1 EPHS BOYS BASKETBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $3,580.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $3,400.00 $3,100.00 $4,092.00 $3,080.00 
211 Saturday, December 28, 2024 12/28/2024 1 CCW BOYS SOCCER SAN ANTONIO, TX. $1,790.00 $2,600.00 $3,450.00 $2,491.00 $3,000.00 $3,300.00 $2,280.00 
212 Thursday, January 2, 2025 1/4/2025 1 LADY EAGLES SOCCER BROWNSVILLE, TX $3,580.00 $5,400.00 $6,125.00 $4,995.00 $6,600.00 NO BID $3,750.00 
213 Friday, January 3, 2025 1/3/2025 1 EPHS BOYS BASKETBALL LAREDO ,TX. $1,790.00 $2,600.00 $3,550.00 $2,400.00 $1,500.00 $3,170.00 $2,000.00 
214 Friday, January 3, 2025 1/3/2025 1 CCW BOYS BASKETBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $1,790.00 $2,600.00 $3,450.00 $2,491.00 $1,600.00 $3,300.00 $2,280.00 

215 Tuesday, January 7, 2025 1/7/2025 1 LADY EAGLES BASKETBALL LAREDO ,TX. $1,790.00 $2,400.00 $3,550.00 $2,400.00 $1,600.00 $3,170.00 $2,000.00 
216 Tuesday, January 7, 2025 1/7/2025 1 CCW BOYS SOCCER LAREDO ,TX. $1,790.00 $2,400.00 $3,550.00 $2,400.00 $1,600.00 $3,170.00 $2,000.00 
217 Thursday, January 9, 2025 1/11/2025 1 LADY EAGLES SOCCER SAN ANTONIO, TX. $3,580.00 $5,400.00 $5,350.00 $4,900.00 $4,000.00 $3,300.00 $3,080.00 
218 Thursday, January 9, 2025 1/10/2025 1 CC WINN BAND CASTROVILLE, TX $3,580.00 $3,600.00 $3,550.00 $3,800.00 $3,200.00 $4,492.00 $2,800.00 
219 Friday, January 10, 2025 1/10/2025 1 LADY EAGLES BASKETBALL LAREDO ,TX. $1,790.00 $2,600.00 $3,550.00 $2,400.00 $1,600.00 $3,170.00 $2,000.00 
220 Friday, January 10, 2025 1/10/2025 1 CCW BOYS SOCCER SAN ANTONIO, TX. $1,790.00 $2,600.00 $3,450.00 $2,491.00 $1,600.00 $3,300.00 $2,280.00 
221 Tuesday, January 14, 2025 1/14/2025 1 LADY EAGLES BASKETBALL CASTROVILLE, TX $1,790.00 $2,400.00 $3,165.00 $2,100.00 $1,700.00 $3,115.00 $2,000.00 
222 Tuesday, January 14, 2025 1/14/2025 1 CCW BOYS BASKETBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $1,790.00 $2,400.00 $3,450.00 $2,100.00 $1,650.00 $3,300.00 $2,280.00 
223 Thursday, January 16, 2025 1/17/2025 1 EPHS BAND SAN ANTONIO, TX. $3,580.00 $3,600.00 $3,550.00 $3,000.00 $3,300.00 $4,092.00 $3,080.00 
224 Friday, January 17, 2025 1/17/2025 1 EPHS BOYS BASKETBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $1,790.00 $2,600.00 $3,450.00 $2,491.00 $1,600.00 $3,300.00 $2,280.00 
225 Friday, January 17, 2025 1/17/2025 1 CCW BOYS SOCCER SAN ANTONIO, TX. $1,790.00 $2,600.00 $3,450.00 $2,491.00 $1,600.00 $3,300.00 $2,280.00 
226 Tuesday, January 21, 2025 1/21/2025 1 LADY EAGLES BASKETBALL LAREDO ,TX. $1,790.00 $2,400.00 $3,550.00 $2,100.00 $1,600.00 $3,170.00 $2,000.00 
227 Friday, January 24, 2025 1/24/2025 1 EPHS BOYS BASKETBALL LAREDO ,TX. $1,790.00 $2,600.00 $3,550.00 $2,100.00 $2,000.00 $3,170.00 $2,000.00 
228 Friday, January 24, 2025 1/24/2025 1 CCW BOYS BASKETBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. NO BID $2,600.00 $3,450.00 $2,491.00 $2,000.00 $3,300.00 $2,280.00 
229 Friday, January 24, 2025 1/24/2025 1 CCW BOYS SOCCER SAN ANTONIO, TX. $1,790.00 $2,600.00 $3,500.00 $2,491.00 $2,000.00 $3,300.00 $2,280.00 
230 Tuesday, January 28, 2025 1/28/2025 1 LADY EAGLES BASKETBALL LAREDO ,TX. $1,790.00 $2,500.00 $3,550.00 $2,100.00 $1,750.00 $3,170.00 $2,000.00 
231 Friday, January 31, 2025 1/31/2025 1 CCW BOYS BASKETBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $1,790.00 $2,600.00 $3,450.00 $2,491.00 $3,000.00 $3,300.00 $2,280.00 
232 Friday, January 31, 2025 1/31/2025 1 CCW BOYS SOCCER SAN ANTONIO, TX. $1,790.00 $2,600.00 $3,450.00 $2,491.00 $3,000.00 $3,300.00 $2,280.00 
233 Saturday, February 1, 2025 2/1/2025 1 CC WINN BAND SAN ANTONIO, TX. $1,790.00 $2,700.00 $3,450.00 $2,491.00 $3,000.00 $3,300.00 $2,280.00 
234 Saturday, February 1, 2025 2/1/2025 1 EPHS BAND SAN ANTONIO, TX. $1,790.00 $2,700.00 $3,450.00 $2,491.00 $3,000.00 $3,300.00 $2,280.00 

235 Saturday, February 1, 2025 2/1/2025 1 EPHS BAND SAN ANTONIO, TX. $1,790.00 $2,700.00 $3,450.00 $2,491.00 $3,000.00 $3,300.00 $2,280.00 
236 Saturday, February 1, 2025 2/1/2025 1 EPHS BAND SAN ANTONIO, TX. $1,790.00 $2,700.00 $3,450.00 $2,491.00 $3,000.00 $3,300.00 $2,280.00 
237 Tuesday, February 4, 2025 2/4/2025 1 LADY EAGLES SOCCER LAREDO ,TX. $1,790.00 $2,500.00 $3,550.00 $2,100.00 $1,750.00 $3,170.00 $2,000.00 
238 Tuesday, February 4, 2025 2/4/2025 1 EPHS BOYS BASKETBALL DEL RIO, TX. $1,790.00 $2,000.00 $2,255.00 $2,100.00 $1,750.00 $2,255.00 $1,500.00 
239 Friday, February 7, 2025 2/7/2025 1 CCW BOYS BASKETBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $1,790.00 $2,700.00 $3,450.00 $2,491.00 $3,000.00 $3,300.00 $2,280.00 
240 Friday, February 7, 2025 2/7/2025 1 CCW BOYS SOCCER SAN ANTONIO, TX. $1,790.00 $2,700.00 $3,450.00 $2,491.00 $3,000.00 $3,300.00 $2,280.00 
241 Friday, February 7, 2025 2/7/2025 1 EPHS BOYS BASKETBALL CASTROVILLE, TX $1,790.00 $2,700.00 $3,165.00 $2,400.00 $3,000.00 $3,115.00 $2,000.00 
242 Tuesday, February 11, 2025 2/11/2025 1 LADY EAGLES SOCCER LAREDO ,TX. $1,790.00 $2,500.00 $3,550.00 $2,100.00 $1,800.00 $3,170.00 $2,000.00 
243 Friday, February 14, 2025 2/14/2025 1 LADY EAGLES SOCCER DEL RIO, TX. $1,790.00 $2,300.00 $2,255.00 $2,400.00 $2,500.00 $2,255.00 $1,500.00 
244 Friday, February 14, 2025 2/14/2025 1 CCW BOYS SOCCER SAN ANTONIO, TX. $1,790.00 $2,700.00 $3,450.00 $2,491.00 $1,700.00 $3,300.00 $2,280.00 
245 Saturday, February 15, 2025 2/15/2025 1 CC WINN BAND SAN ANTONIO, TX. $1,790.00 $2,700.00 $3,450.00 $2,491.00 $1,700.00 $3,300.00 $2,280.00 
246 Tuesday, February 18, 2025 2/18/2025 1 LADY EAGLES SOCCER CASTROVILLE, TX. $1,790.00 $2,500.00 $3,165.00 $2,100.00 $1,700.00 $3,115.00 $2,000.00 
247 Saturday, February 22, 2025 2/22/2025 1 EPHS BAND SAN ANTONIO, TX. $1,790.00 $2,800.00 $3,450.00 $2,491.00 $3,000.00 $3,300.00 $2,280.00 
248 Saturday, February 22, 2025 2/22/2025 1 EPHS BAND SAN ANTONIO, TX. $1,790.00 $2,800.00 $3,450.00 $2,491.00 $3,000.00 $3,300.00 $2,280.00 
249 Tuesday, February 25, 2025 2/25/2025 1 LADY EAGLES SOCCER LAREDO ,TX. $1,790.00 $2,500.00 $3,550.00 $2,400.00 $1,700.00 $3,170.00 $2,000.00 
250 Friday, February 28, 2025 2/28/2025 1 CCW BOYS SOCCER SAN ANTONIO, TX. $1,790.00 $2,800.00 $3,450.00 $3,200.00 $3,000.00 $3,300.00 $2,280.00 
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EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 250104 - CHARTER BUS TRANSPORTATION SERVICES

TABULATION SHEET

DATE OF TRIP RETURN DATE

# OF 

CHARTER 

BUSES

GROUP DESTINATION
CLASSIC 

ELEGANCE
IMPERIAL BUS KERRVILLE BUS OK TOURS R CHARTERS

REGENT COACH 

LINE

UNITED 

CHARTERS

EL PASO, TX SAN ANTONIO, TX SAN ANTONIO, TX SAN ANTONIO, TX LAREDO, TX SAN ANTONIO, TX EL PASO, TX

251 Saturday, March 1, 2025 3/1/2025 1 CC WINN BAND SEGUIN, TX $1,790.00 $3,100.00 $3,785.00 $3,200.00 $3,300.00 $3,775.00 $2,500.00 
252 Tuesday, March 4, 2025 3/4/2025 1 LADY EAGLES SOCCER LAREDO ,TX. $1,790.00 $2,500.00 $3,550.00 $2,400.00 $1,650.00 $3,170.00 $2,000.00 
253 Friday, March 7, 2025 3/7/2025 1 CCW BOYS SOCCER SAN ANTONIO, TX. $1,790.00 $2,995.00 $3,450.00 $2,800.00 $1,700.00 $3,300.00 $2,280.00 
254 Tuesday, March 11, 2025 3/11/2025 1 EPHS BAND SAN ANTONIO, TX. $1,790.00 $2,500.00 $3,450.00 $2,491.00 $1,800.00 $3,300.00 $2,280.00 
255 Tuesday, March 11, 2025 3/11/2025 1 EPHS BAND SAN ANTONIO, TX. $1,790.00 $2,500.00 $3,450.00 $2,491.00 $1,800.00 $3,300.00 $2,280.00 
256 Saturday, March 15, 2025 3/15/2025 1 EPHS BAND ROBSTOWN, TX. $1,790.00 $3,100.00 $4,295.00 $3,095.00 $4,000.00 NO BID $2,750.00 
257 Saturday, March 29, 2025 3/29/2025 1 EPHS BAND KINGSVILLE, TX. $1,790.00 $3,100.00 $4,295.00 $3,095.00 $4,000.00 $4,305.00 $2,780.00 
258 Saturday, March 29, 2025 3/29/2025 1 EPHS BAND SAN ANTONIO, TX. $1,790.00 $2,995.00 $3,450.00 $2,800.00 $2,800.00 $3,300.00 $2,280.00 
259 Saturday, April 5, 2025 4/5/2025 1 CC WINN BAND SAN ANTONIO, TX. $1,790.00 $2,995.00 $3,450.00 $2,800.00 $2,500.00 $3,300.00 $2,280.00 
260 Saturday, April 12, 2025 4/12/2025 1 CC WINN BAND SAN ANTONIO, TX. $1,790.00 $2,995.00 $3,450.00 $3,200.00 $2,500.00 $3,300.00 $2,280.00 
261 Saturday, April 12, 2025 4/12/2025 1 EPHS BAND SAN ANTONIO, TX. $1,790.00 $2,995.00 $3,450.00 $3,200.00 $2,500.00 $3,300.00 $2,280.00 
262 Saturday, April 12, 2025 4/12/2025 1 EPHS BAND SAN ANTONIO, TX. $1,790.00 $2,995.00 $3,450.00 $3,200.00 $2,000.00 $3,300.00 $2,280.00 
263 Saturday, April 19, 2025 4/19/2025 1 CC WINN BAND CORPUS CHRISTI, TX $1,790.00 $3,150.00 $4,410.00 $3,900.00 $4,000.00 $4,415.00 $2,850.00 
264 Thursday, April 24, 2025 4/26/2024 1 EPHS BAND LAREDO ,TX. $3,580.00 $6,600.00 $5,000.00 $4,900.00 $4,000.00 $6,738.00 $2,800.00 

265 Saturday, April 26, 2025 4/26/2025 1 CC WINN BAND SAN ANTONIO, TX. $1,790.00 $2,995.00 $3,450.00 $3,200.00 $2,500.00 $3,300.00 $2,280.00 
266 Saturday, May 3, 2025 5/3/2025 1 CC WINN BAND LAREDO ,TX. $1,790.00 $2,995.00 $3,550.00 $2,400.00 $2,500.00 $3,170.00 $2,000.00 
267 Monday, May 26, 2025 5/26/2025 1 EPHS BAND AUSTIN, TX. $1,790.00 $3,300.00 $4,515.00 $4,900.00 $3,200.00 NO BID $2,900.00 
268 Sunday, June 15, 2025 6/20/2025 1 EPHS BAND KINGSVILLE, TX. $1,790.00 $3,100.00 $9,000.00 $7,100.00 $3,500.00 $4,305.00 $2,780.00 
269
270
271
272
273
274
275
276
277
278
279
280
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