
                               No.___________________ 

    

 

 

Topic: Consideration for approval of Bids, Proposals, and Qualifications  
 

Submitted by: Ms. Cordelia Flores-Jackson     of: Purchasing Department  
 

Approved for transmittal to school board: September 16, 2009                              
                                                                           

Recommendations: 
 
Staff recommends the UISD board of trustees approve the following Bids, Proposals, & Qualifications as 
presented: 
 
Bids/Proposals/Qualifications 
 
Facilities & Maintenance: 
RFP 066-2009 Landscaping Materials 
 
Transportation: 
RFP 067-2009 Bus / Vehicle Repairs & Services 
RFP 068-2009 Automotive Parts & Supplies 
 
Renewals: 
RFP 2008-054 Drinking Water 
  
Rationale: 
Staff has complied with all applicable federal, state and local purchasing policies and procedures in 
obtaining pricing information for the items listed above.   Staff is recommending the awards based on 
being the best value to the district. 
 
Budgetary Information: 
The budget includes the funds for these purchases 
 
Board Policy Reference and Compliance 
CH local – purchasing and acquisition 
Texas education code 44.031 

UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT 
AGENDA ACTION ITEM



Bids/ Proposals/ Qualifications
Facilities & Maintenance:
RFP 066-2009 Recommended Vendor(s)
Landscaping Materials Primary Vendor

Hillside Nursery
Secondary Vendor

Olympia Landscaping
See Attached Tabulation

Transportation:
RFP 067-2009 Recommended Vendor(s)
Bus - Vehicle Repair & Service A&B Wheel Alignment

Andy's Auto Air & Supply
Cruz Auto Glass

D Rodriguez Auto Inspection
Family Chevrolet

CGR Tires
Rotex Truck Center
Rush Truck Center

See Attached Tabulation

RFP 068-2009 Recommended Vendor(s)
Automotive Parts & Supplies American Sales & Service

Andy's Auto Air & Supply
Batteries Plus

Belco
CC Battery
Chalk Truck

Cummins
Diesel Injection

Family Chevrolet
Fleet Pride

Gonzalez Auto Parts
Laredo Wholesale Auto Parts

Longhorn Bus 
One Stop Bus Stop

Napa Auto Parts
O'Reilly Auto Parts
Rotex Truck Center
Rush Truck Center

Texas Altenator
Texas Fleet Supply

Zep
See Attached Tabulation

Renewals:
RFP 2008-054 Recommended Vendor(s)
Drinking Water Laredo Spring Water Inc.

See Attached Tabulation

Summary of Recommendation(s)



Board Approval 
Awarding Of Bids/Proposals 

September 16, 2009 
 
 
RFP 066-2009 Landscaping Materials    
                                  
Recommendation: 
Requesting approval to purchase from the best bidder(s)/ offer(s) meeting specifications as follows:  
   
             
  Primary Vendor               Est. Annual Amount                           

  Hillside Nursery                  
            See Tabulation 

Secondary Vendor                 
           Olympia Landscaping 
                     

 
     

Administration distributed nine-teen (19) proposals and advertised on July 18, 2009 and July 19, 2009.   Three (3) 
proposals were received on July 29, 2009 @ 3:00 p.m. at the UISD Service Center Purchasing Department.  
 
 
Budget Information: 
2009-2010 Maintenance & Operations 
 
Resource Personnel:  
Juan A. Davila, Director of Facilities Maintenance & Operations 
Juan Leza, Facilities Manager 
Cordelia Flores Jackson, Director of Purchasing 
Venesa Navarro, Procurement Officer 





HILLSIDE NURSERY
JOHN DEERE 
LANDSCAPES

OLYMPIA LANDSCAPING

EST QTY DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

SECTION I ANNUAL LANDSCAPING MATERIALS

1‐119 LIVE OAKS (QUERCUS VIRGINANA) $299.00 $250.00 $300.00
120‐200 LIVE OAKS (QUERCUS VIRGINANA) $299.00 $250.00 $300.00
201‐300 LIVE OAKS (QUERCUS VIRGINANA) $299.00 $250.00 $300.00
301‐400 LIVE OAKS (QUERCUS VIRGINANA) $299.00 $250.00 $300.00
401‐500 LIVE OAKS (QUERCUS VIRGINANA) $299.00 $250.00 $300.00

1‐119 LIVE OAKS (QUERCUS VIRGINANA) $510.00 $480.00 $550.00
120‐200 LIVE OAKS (QUERCUS VIRGINANA) $510.00 $480.00 $550.00
201‐300 LIVE OAKS (QUERCUS VIRGINANA) $510.00 $480.00 $550.00
301‐400 LIVE OAKS (QUERCUS VIRGINANA) $510.00 $480.00 $550.00
401‐500 LIVE OAKS (QUERCUS VIRGINANA) $510.00 $480.00 $550.00

1000‐2000 PLANTING PELLETS $0.25 $0.25
2001‐3000 PLANTING PELLETS $0.25 $0.25
3001‐4000 PLANTING PELLETS $0.25 $0.25
4001‐5000 PLANTING PELLETS $0.25 $0.25

1‐399 #419 COMMON BERMUDA GRASS (PALLETS) $109.00 $110.00
400‐600 #419 COMMON BERMUDA GRASS (PALLETS) $109.00 $110.00
601‐1000 #419 COMMON BERMUDA GRASS (PALLETS) $109.00 $110.00
1001‐2000 #419 COMMON BERMUDA GRASS (PALLETS) $109.00 $110.00
2001‐3000 #419 COMMON BERMUDA GRASS (PALLETS) $109.00 $110.00

1‐149 CELLULOSE FIBER MULCH (50 LB BAG) $14.99 $8.56 $15.00
150‐250 CELLULOSE FIBER MULCH (50 LB BAG) $14.99 $8.56 $15.00
251‐400 CELLULOSE FIBER MULCH (50 LB BAG) $14.99 $8.56 $15.00
401‐550 CELLULOSE FIBER MULCH (50 LB BAG) $14.99 $8.56 $15.00
551‐700 CELLULOSE FIBER MULCH (50 LB BAG) $14.99 $8.56 $15.00

1‐24 NUMEX SAHARA BERMUDA SEED (25 LB BUCKET) $99.00 $70.64 $120.00
25‐49 NUMEX SAHARA BERMUDA SEED (25 LB BUCKET) $99.00 $70.64 $120.00
50‐100 NUMEX SAHARA BERMUDA SEED (25 LB BUCKET) $99.00 $70.64 $120.00
101‐200 NUMEX SAHARA BERMUDA SEED (25 LB BUCKET) $99.00 $70.64 $120.00
201‐300 NUMEX SAHARA BERMUDA SEED (25 LB BUCKET) $99.00 $70.64 $120.00

150‐250 PINE BARK IN 3 CUBIC FT BAGS $5.75 $4.75
251‐400 PINE BARK IN 3 CUBIC FT BAGS $5.75 $4.75
401‐550 PINE BARK IN 3 CUBIC FT BAGS $5.75 $4.75
551‐700 PINE BARK IN 3 CUBIC FT BAGS $5.75 $4.75

1‐40 MAJESTIC BEAUTY INDIAN HAWTHORN (3 GAL. CONT) $8.50 $12.00 $25.00
41‐100 MAJESTIC BEAUTY INDIAN HAWTHORN (3 GAL. CONT) $8.50 $12.00 $25.00
101‐200 MAJESTIC BEAUTY INDIAN HAWTHORN (3 GAL. CONT) $8.50 $12.00 $25.00
201‐300 MAJESTIC BEAUTY INDIAN HAWTHORN (3 GAL. CONT) $8.50 $12.00 $25.00
301‐400 MAJESTIC BEAUTY INDIAN HAWTHORN (3 GAL. CONT) $8.50 $12.00 $25.00

1‐40 GREEN PITTOSPORUM (5 GAL. CONTAINER) $10.00 $16.00 $16.50
41‐100 GREEN PITTOSPORUM (5 GAL. CONTAINER) $10.00 $16.00 $16.50
101‐200 GREEN PITTOSPORUM (5 GAL. CONTAINER) $10.00 $16.00 $16.50
201‐300 GREEN PITTOSPORUM (5 GAL. CONTAINER) $10.00 $16.00 $16.50
301‐400 GREEN PITTOSPORUM (5 GAL. CONTAINER) $10.00 $16.00 $16.50

1‐24 WATER SOLUBLE FERTILIZER (25 LB. BAG) $37.00 $47.14 $29.00
25‐50 WATER SOLUBLE FERTILIZER (25 LB. BAG) $37.00 $47.14 $29.00
51‐100 WATER SOLUBLE FERTILIZER (25 LB. BAG) $36.00 $47.14 $29.00
101‐200 WATER SOLUBLE FERTILIZER (25 LB. BAG) $36.00 $47.14 $29.00
201‐300 WATER SOLUBLE FERTILIZER (25 LB. BAG) $36.00 $47.14 $29.00

PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT OFF LIST PRICE FOR OTHER ITEMS 0% 0% 10%

no bid

VENDORS

UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
LANDSCAPING MATERIALS 

RFP 066‐2009

no bid

no bid

A 3" MINIMUM CALIPER MEASURED ONE FOOT ABOVE THE BEGINNING OF THE ROOT SYSTEM IS REQUIRED FOR THIS ITEM

A 4" MINIMUM CALIPER MEASURED ONE FOOT ABOVE THE BEGINNING OF THE ROOT SYSTEM IS REQUIRED FOR THIS ITEM



A. VASQUEZ CONSTRUCTION CO INC LEYENDECKER CONSTRUCTION CO.
6227 W. COMMERCE ST P.O. BOX   1827
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78237 LAREDO, TEXAS   78044-1827
PHONE: 210.436.2299 PHONE:  956. 722.0531
FAX: 210.436.2290 FAX:  956. 722.8215
KIM CREWS GARY A. LEYENDECKER
arturovasquezconstruction@yahoo.com leycon@netscorp.net

cortes@leycon.net

COLORSCAPES LANDSCAPING LOWE'S HOME CENTER INC
14445 MINES ROAD 6623 SAN DARIO
LAREDO, TEXAS   78045 LAREDO, TEXAS 78041
PHONE:  956.729.9000 PHONE: 956-753-7033
FAX: 729.9162 FAX: 956-753-6646
colorsp@sbcglobal.net ARMANDO DUARTE

armando.j.duarte@store.lowes.com
EL PATIO NURSERY 
LANDSCAPE & SPRINKLERS OLYMPIA LANDSCAPING
1704 E. HILLSIDE RD. P.O. BOX   450347
LAREDO, TEXAS   78041 LAREDO, TEXAS   78045
PHONE:  956.724.4558 PHONE:  956.237.6457
elpationursery@sbcglobal.net FAX: 956.728.9708

olympiainc2004@yahoo.com
EVERGREEN LANDSCAPING
8210 SAN GABRIEL DR. RAINBOW LANDSCAPE & SPRINKLER
LAREDO, TEXAS  78045 519 CENTURY DR WEST
PHONE: 956.729.7784 LAREDO, TEXAS 78046
FAX: 956.729.7785 PHONE: 956.723.7700
rckahncorp@sbcglobal.net GUSTAVO DOMINGUEZ
richardkahn@att.net

FOX LAWN CARE LLC ROY'S PALMS & LANDSCAPING
264 EL PICO RD 309 E SAUNDERS
LAREDO, TX 78041 LAREDO, TX 78041
PHONE: 956-727-0844 PHONE: 956-723-2823

GROUND CONTROL LANDSCAPING
11901TOEPPER  WIEN RD. STE 402 SISCO SPRINKLER IRRIGATION CO. 
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78233 5203 CASA BELLA
PHONE: 210.599.3832 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78249 
FAX:  210.599.8242 PHONE: 210.697.9086 
rhastings@groundscontrol.com RICK NELTZEL

siscota@aol.com
HILLSIDE NURSERY
4651 CASA BLANCA ROAD BOX 4 TEJAS EQUIPMENT SALES

UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
LANDSCAPING MATERIALS

RFP 066-2009

4651 CASA BLANCA ROAD BOX 4 TEJAS EQUIPMENT SALES
LAREDO, TEXAS   78041 1212 N. 23RD ST
PHONE:  956.724.9988 MCALLEN, TX  78501
FAX: 956.724.9988 PHONE: 956.682.1312
johnfasulo@att.net FAX: 956.686.8579

PETER M. CASAS
J.R. LANDSCAPING pcasas@tejasequipment.com
113 DELAWARE ST
LAREDO, TEXAS 78041 TRIPLE O LANDSCAPING INC
PHONE: 956.727.0351 7807 MCPHERSON RD 
FAX: 956.727-0351 LAREDO, TX 78045
jrlandscapingenterprises@yahoo.com PHONE: 956-712-4210

JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
1301 E 9TH ST, STE 1300 YARDART GARDEN CENTER
CLEVELAND, OH 44114 2517 E. DEL MAR BLVD.
PHONE: 800.321.5325 EXT 6550 LAREDO, TEXAS   78045
FAX: 248.581.1400 PHONE:  956.726.3796
MARGARET DVORZNAK yardartgc1@hotmail.com
bids@johndeerelandscapes.com

JONES EQUIPMENT & TURF, INC
228 TRADE CENTER DRIVE
NEW BRAUNFELS, TX  78130
PHONE: 800.578.7278
FAX: 830.627.0360
CHRIS RANDAZZO
crandazzo_jet@yahoo.com



Board Approval 
Awarding of Bids/Proposals 

September 16, 2009 
 
 
RFP#  067-2009 Bus / Vehicle Repairs And Services     
 
Recommendation: 
Requesting approval to purchase from the best bidder(S)/ offer(S) meeting specifications as follows:  
       
       Recommended Vendor (S)                     Est. Annual Amount 
   
                         A/C Service & Installation                                      See Tabulation 
        Andy’s Auto Air 
 
                         Body Repair & Collision              
        Rush Truck Center – Buses 
                         Family Chevrolet – Cars & Trucks 
                         Rotex Truck Service – Buses 
 
                         Transmission Repair 
                         Rotex Truck Center 
                         Rush Truck Center 
 
        Gasoline, Diesel, Services 
                         Rush Truck Center 
                         Rotex Truck Service    
                         GGR Tires 
                                    
                         Muffler Repair 
                         Rush Truck Center 
        GGR Tires 
 
         Radiator Repair 

        Andy’s Auto Air  
        GGR Tires 
 

                          Windshield Repairs 
        Cruz Auto Glass 
                   

                          Electrical & Diagnostic 
                          Rotex Truck Center 
                          Rush Truck Center 
 

        Inspection Stickers 
        D. Rodriguez Auto Inspection 
                  
        Wheel Alignment/ Balancing 

                 A&B Wheel  ----  Cars/ Trucks 
         CGR Tires  ------ Bus/ Heavy Trucks 
 
Administration Distributed One Hundred Twenty-Eight (128) Proposals & Advertised On August 2, 2009 & August 
9, 2009.  Eight (11) Proposals Were Received On August 19, 2009 @ 3:00 P.M. At The UISD Service Center 
Purchasing Department.  
 
Budget Information: 
2009-2010 Transportation Department  
 
Resource Personnel:  
Joe Aranda, Executive Director Of Transportation 
Danny Trevino, Transportation Operations Supervisor 
Cordelia Flores Jackson, Director Of Purchasing 
Hector Cavazos, Purchasing Manager 
 





% DISC. INSTALLATION WARRANTY % DISC. INSTALLATION WARRANTY % DISC. INSTALLATION WARRANTY % DISC. INSTALLATION WARRANTY % DISC. INSTALLATION WARRANTY
OFF LIST RATE / HOUR (MOS./MILES) OFF LIST RATE / HOUR (MOS./MILES) OFF LIST RATE / HOUR (MOS./MILES) OFF LIST RATE / HOUR (MOS./MILES) OFF LIST RATE / HOUR (MOS./MILES)

1 A/C SERVICE AND INSTALLATION - 20% $60.00 12 MONTHS
BODY REPAIRS/COLLISION 

BUSES

CARS & TRUCKS

3 TRANSMISSION REPAIRS AND SERVICE

4 MUFFLER REPAIRS AND SERVICE 

5 GASOLINE ENGINE REPAIR AND SERVICE 

6 DIESEL ENGINE REPAIRS 

CUMMINS 
MR & HD 

PRICE LIST *

SERVICE 
CENTER 
PRICING

$93 PER HIOUR

90 DAYS 
CRAFTSMANSHIP 1 
YEAR HD PARTS / 6 
MO. MR PARTS

7 ELECTRIC SERVICE AND REPAIRS 

8 RADIATOR REPAIR AND INSTALLATION - 20% $60.00 12 MONTHS

9 DIAGNOSTIC REPAIRS AND SERVICE 
PRICE PER 

AXLE
%DISC  

OFF LIST
LABOR RATE FOR 

ADD WORK WARRANTY
PRICE PER 

AXLE
%DISC  

OFF LIST
LABOR RATE FOR  

ADD WORK WARRANTY
PRICE PER 

AXLE
%DISC  

OFF LIST
LABOR RATE FOR 

ADD WORK WARRANTY
PRICE PER 

AXLE
%DISC  OFF 

LIST
LABOR RATE FOR  

ADD WORK WARRANTY
PRICE PER 

AXLE
%DISC  OFF 

LIST
LABOR RATE 

FOR  ADD WORK WARRANTY

1
WHEEL ALIGNMENT FOR PICKUP TRUCKS & 
CARGO VANS

38.95 1/2 
TON 0% $40.00/ HOUR 30 DAYS

2 WHEEL ALIGNMENT FOR DISTRICT CARS $29.95 0% $40.00/ HOUR 30 DAYS

3 WHEEL ALIGNMENT FOR SCHOOL BUSES N/A

4 WHEEL ALIGNMENT FOR HEAVY DUTY VEHICLES

$85.00 NOT 
INCLUDING 
EXENTRICS 0% $40.00/ HOUR 30 DAYS

LIST PRICE
% DISC. 

OFF LIST

LABOR RATE PER 
WHEEL TO 
BALANCE WARRANTY LIST PRICE

% DISC. 
OFF LIST

LABOR RATE PER 
WHEEL TO 
BALANCE WARRANTY LIST PRICE

% DISC. 
OFF LIST

LABOR RATE PER 
WHEEL TO 
BALANCE WARRANTY

PRICE PER 
AXLE

%DISC  OFF 
LIST

LABOR RATE FOR  
ADD WORK WARRANTY

1 BALANCING FOR PICKUP TRUCKS & CARGO VAN $6.00/ TIRE 0% $40.00/ HOUR 30 DAYS

2 BALANCING FOR DISTRICT CARS $5.00/TIRE 0% $40.00/ HOUR 30 DAYS
3 BALANCING FOR SCHOOL BUSES - - - -
4 BALANCING FOR HEAVY DUTY VEHICLES $16.00/ TIRE 0% $40.00/ HOUR 30 DAYS

5
ANY OTHER ADDITIONAL WORK REQUIRED TO 
PERFORM THE ALIGNMENT OR BALANCING - - - -

SEC. III: WINDSHIELD REPAIR AND INSTALLATION

INSTALLATION 
COST WARRANTY

INSTALLATION 
COST WARRANTY

INSTALLATION 
COST WARRANTY

INSTALLATION 
COST WARRANTY

INSTALLATION 
COST WARRANTY

1 WINDSHIELD FULL SIZE P/U TRUCK & CARGO VAN $55.00-$110.00 *
2 WINDSHIELD MINI PICK UP $55.00-$110.00
3 WINDSHIELD FULL SIZE CAR $55.00-$110.00
4 WINDSHIELD MID SIZE CAR $55.00-$110.00
5 WINDSHIELD THOMAS BUS $300.00 N/A $110.00-$165.00
6 WINDSHIELD INTL. BUS $250.00 N/A $110.00-$165.00

WINDSHIELD & WINDOWS FOR SCHOOL 
BUSES AND OTHER HEAVY DUTY VEHICLES:

10"X24" $25.00
 10"X36" $25.00
12"X24" $25.00
 13"X24" $25.00
 26"X48" $25.00
12"X40" $25.00
14"X24" $25.00
20"X31" $25.00
13"X32" $25.00
21"X31" $25.00
16"X30" $25.00
 24"X 12" $25.00
25"X10" $25.00
MIRRORS FOR THE FOLLOWING SIZES:

10" X24" 1/8" CLEAR TEMP $10.00
8 1/2" X 23 1/8" CLEAR TEMP $10.00
6" X8 X 3/4" CLEAR TEMP. $10.00
28 1/4" X 21 1/4" INSULATED 

SEC. IV: PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT ON LABOR & PARTS

1 DISCOUNT FROM LIST PRICE ON REPLACEMENT 
PARTS 

2 LABOR RATE PER HOUR
SEC. V: QUESTIONS & STATEMENTS

2A SERVICE VEHICLES OUTSIDE NORMAL HOURS 
2B SERVICE VEHICLES AT ANY UISD PROPERTY

3 VENDOR AGREES TO KEEP ALL PARTS IN STOCK

NOTES: Received 2 No bids 

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

YES

YES

MONDAY - SATURDAY 9:00 AM - 6:00 PM

UNIT COST

NO BID

D RODRIGUEZ AUTO INSPECTION

LIST PRICE

YES

-
-

9:30am to 7:30pm 

-

-
-
-

-

SEC. II: HOURLY LABOR AND REPLACEMENT PARTS FOR 
WHEEL ALIGNMENTS AND BALANCING

-
-

-
-

-
-

-

-
-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-
-
-
-
-
-

-

-

-

-

N/A

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

N/A
N/A

-
-

LIST PRICE

A & B Wheel Alignment

-

-
-

YES

$60.00

$10.00
N/A

-

YES

YES

$25.00

N/A
N/A
N/A

NO BID

20%

N/A

N/A
N/A
N/A

N/A

N/A
NO BID

$35.00
$45.00
$65.00
$35.00

N/A
N/A

2

VENDORS UNIT COST

N/A

-

-
-
-

NO BID

YES

MONDAY - FRIDAY 8:00AM - 6:00PM                              
& SATURDAY 8:00AM - 1:00PM

$0.20

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

YES 

$45.00

YES
YES

LIST PRICE

CRUZ AUTO GLASS CENTER

LIST PRICE

VENDORS 
SEC. I: HOURLY LABOR AND REPLACEMENT PARTS FOR 
MECHANICAL TRADES LIST PRICE

UNIT COST UNIT COST

CUMMINS SOUTHERN PLAINSANDY'S AUTO AIR & SUPPLY

-

NO BID

UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
BUS VEHICLE REPAIRS AND SERVICES 

RFP 067-2009

UNIT COST

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

MONDAY - FRIDAY 8:00AM - 5:30PM                            

YES
NO YES

NO

VENDOR AGREES TO ADDRESS WARRENTY WORK 
W/IN 48 HRS FROM TIME OF WORK4

YES YES YES

YES YES

YES

-

1

8

7

-

$1,090.68
$562.73

REGULAR WORKING HOURS MONDAY - FRIDAY 7AM - 6PM & SATURDAYS 8AM - 2PM

N/A

N/A
N/A
N/A

N/A

-

-

-

-

-

-

-
-

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID

NO  BID

-

NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

-
-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-
-
-

-

$20.00
$20.00

$25.00
$25.00
$45.00
$45.00
$45.00
$45.00

$35.00
$25.00

$70.00-$130.00

$70.00-$110.00
$70.00-$130.00
$70.00-$110.00
$450.00-$490.00
$220.00-$250.00



% DISC. INSTALLATION WARRANTY % DISC. INSTALLATION WARRANTY % DISC. INSTALLATION WARRANTY % DISC. INSTALLATION WARRANTY
OFF LIST RATE / HOUR (MOS./MILES) OFF LIST RATE / HOUR (MOS./MILES) OFF LIST RATE / HOUR (MOS./MILES) OFF LIST RATE / HOUR (MOS./MILES)

COST + 25% ** $90.00/HR **
12 MONTHS/ 
12,000 MILES

$65.00 HR + 
PARTS 15% $65.00 HR

Parts Labor = 1 
month $75.00

Labor 90 days  Parts 
1 year

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 20% $70.00 12 MONTHS $75.00

COST + 25% COST + 25%  $90.00/ HR 12 MONTHS/ 
12,000 MILES 20% 12 MONTHS

$65.00 HR + 
PARTS 15% $65.00 HR

Factory Warranty on 
Parts Labor = 1 
month 10% $70.00 12 MONTHS $75.00

Labor 90 days  Parts 
1 year

$65.00 HR + 
PARTS 15% $65.00 HR

Factory Warranty on 
Parts Labor = 1 
month $75.00

Labor 90 days  Parts 
1 year

$65.00 HR + 
PARTS 15% $65.00 HR

Factory Warranty on 
Parts Labor = 1 
month $75.00

Labor 90 days  Parts 
1 year

$65.00 HR + 
PARTS 15% $65.00 HR

Factory Warranty on 
Parts Labor = 1 
month 20% $70.00 12 MONTHS $75.00

Labor 90 days  Parts 
1 year

$65.00 HR + 
PARTS 15% $65.00 HR

Factory Warranty on 
Parts Labor = 1 
month 20% $70.00 3 MONTHS $75.00

Labor 90 days  Parts 
1 year

$65.00 HR + 
PARTS 15% $65.00 HR

Factory Warranty on 
Parts Labor = 1 
month $75.00

Labor 90 days  Parts 
1 year

$65.00 HR + 
PARTS 15% $65.00 HR

Factory Warranty on 
Parts Labor = 1 
month 20% $70.00 $75.00

Labor 90 days  Parts 
1 year

PRICE PER 
AXLE

%DISC  OFF 
LIST

LABOR RATE 
FOR  ADD WORK WARRANTY

PRICE PER 
AXLE

%DISC  OFF 
LIST

FOR  ADD 
WORK WARRANTY

PRICE PER 
AXLE

%DISC  OFF 
LIST

FOR  ADD 
WORK WARRANTY

PRICE PER 
AXLE

%DISC  OFF 
LIST

FOR  ADD 
WORK WARRANTY

$49.99 
$99.99 FOR 
ONE TON 
DUELLYS - $90.00/  HR

90 DAYS OR 
4,000 MILES $39.99 20% $65.00 hr 1 Month

$49.99 - $90.00 / HR SAME $29.99 20% $65.00 hr 1 Month

NO BID - - - $89.99 20% $65.00 hr 1 Month $75.00
Labor 90 days  Parts 
1 year

NO BID - - - $49.99 20% $65.00 hr 1 Month $75.00
Labor 90 days  Parts 
1 year

PRICE PER 
AXLE

%DISC  OFF 
LIST

LABOR RATE 
FOR  ADD WORK WARRANTY

PRICE PER 
AXLE

%DISC  OFF 
LIST

LABOR RATE 
FOR  ADD 

WORK WARRANTY
PRICE PER 

AXLE
%DISC  OFF 

LIST

LABOR RATE 
FOR  ADD 

WORK WARRANTY
PRICE PER 

AXLE
%DISC  OFF 

LIST

LABOR RATE 
FOR  ADD 

WORK WARRANTY

$49.99 - $9.99
90 DAYS OR 
4,000 MILES $8.00 20% $16.00 hr 1 Month

$49.99 - $9.99
90 DAYS OR 
4,000 MILES $8.00 20% $16.00 hr 1 Month

$20.00 20% $16.00 hr 1 Month $75.00
$49.00 20% $16.00 hr 1 month $75.00 90 days labor

$75.00

INSTALLATION 
COST WARRANTY

INSTALLATION 
COST WARRANTY

INSTALLATION 
COST WARRANTY

INSTALLATION 
COST WARRANTY

YES
YES
YES

NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID

YES

Labor 90 days  Parts 
1 year

NO BID
NO BID

20%
$75.00

MONDAY - FRIDAY 7:00AM - 6:00PM                            

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

RUSH TRUCK CENTER

LIST PRICE

NO BID
NO BID

YES

NO BID

10%
$70.00 hr

UNIT COST

YES
YES

YES

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID

MONDAY - FRIDAY 7:00AM - 6:00PM                            
SATURDAY 8:00AM - 2:00PM                              

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

ROTEX TRUCK CENTER

LIST PRICE

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

$65.00 hr

MONDAY - FRIDAY 7:30AM - 5:00PM                            

YES
YES
YES

YES

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

15%

NO BID
NO BID

GCR TIRES

LIST PRICE

UNIT COST

NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BIDNO BID

NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

UNIT COST

NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID

FAMILY CHEVORLET

LIST PRICE

UNIT COST

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID

NO
NO

MONDAY - FRIDAY 7:30AM - 6:00PM                          
SATURDAY 8:00 AM - 12:00 NOON

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

COST + 25 %
$90.00/ HR

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

YES

YES

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID



A-1 AUTO SHOP ADRIANS AUTO MACHINE
3410 E SAUNDERS 1503 PARK ST.
LAREDO, TEXAS 78041 LAREDO, TEXAS 78040
PHONE: 956-725-9119 PHONE: 956.723.2856
n_garibay@a-1autostop.com FAX: 956.723.2856

MIGUEL HERNANDEZ 
A & B WHEEL ALIGNMENT SPECIALIST
3419 SPRINGFIELD AVE AIRGAS SOUTHWEST
LAREDO, TEXAS 78041 2519 GUADALUPE
PHONE: 956-729-0371 LAREDO, TEXAS 78043
GILBERTO BRIONES PHONE: 956-722-8411

FAX: 956-723-8970
A TO Z TIRE & BATTERY J ANGEL LINCON
2310 E. SAUNDERS STE 105 joseangellincon@airgas.com
LAREDO, TX  78041 juan.gutierrez@airgas.com
PHONE: 956.722.5213
PAGER: 956.344.3717 ALLEN SAMUELS CHEVROLET
FAX: 956.722.6399 2118 S. PADRE ISLAND DRIVE
ddees@atoztire.com CORPUS CHRISTI, TX  78416-1100

PHONE: 361.884.5234/800.242.3249
ACE AUTO SERVICE FAX: 361.854.0855
2804 CLARK BLVD jgarza@asag.net
LAREDO, TEXAS 78043
PHONE: 956-723-7433 AMERICA'S OIL 

ROYAL MFG CO LP
ACCESS CHEVROLET LTD PO BOX 200152
620 E. MAIN ST / P.O.BOX 311 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78220
ROBSTOWN, TX  78380 PHONE: 210-337-2720
PHONE: 361.387.7577 FAX: 210-337-2451
FAX:  361.387.7583 BOB KELIEHOR
GLENN RACHUI bobkeliehor@yahoo.com
grachui@accesschevrolet.com

ANDY'S AUTO AIR
ADVANCE AUTO PARTS 11901 SARA LN
3219 SAN BERNARDO RD LAREDO, TX  78045
LAREDO, TEXAS 78041 PHONE: 956.722.7321
PHONE: 956-712-9932 FAX: 956.727.7835
FAX: 956-712-9581 ROBERT ROSAS

robert@andys-air.com

UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
BUS/ VEHICLE REPAIRS & SERVICES

RFP 067-2009



AUTO BODY TOOLMART BORDER TRANSMISSION PARTS
2545 MILLENNIUM DR 1419 SPRINGFIELD
ELGIN, IL 60124 LAREDO, TEXAS 78040
PHONE: 800-382-1200 PHONE: 956.726.0171
FAX: 866-656-1245 FAX: 956.726.3018
MARISOL LAZARO JAIME RODRIGUEZ 
marisol@abtm.com btp@stx.rr.com

AUTO ZONE BUCKS WHEEL & EQUIPMENT
5419 MCPHERSON 220 S. COMMERCIAL ST
LAREDO, TX  78041 FORT WORTH, TX  76107
PHONE: 956.728.0371 PHONE: 800.433.5613
DIRECT:  956.728.7291 FAX: 817.338.0505
robert.maldonado@autozone.com SANDRA LAXSON

bucks_1@charterinternet.com
AVCO ENTERPRISES, LTD
BATTERIES PLUS BULLSEYE AUTOGLASS
7609 MCPHERSON STE 1 5827 NORTH GATE LANE
LAREDO, TX  78041 LAREDO, TEXAS 78401
PHONE: 956.722.2887 PHONE:
FAX: 956.722.3436 FAX 956-791-5200
ALFREDO VILLARREAL, JR PHIL SANCHEZ
bp9157@batteriesplus.net phil_sanchez@hotmail.com

AVERY OIL COMPANY BIGSTARBRANDING
219 DUVAL ST 4009 NACO PERRIN
SAN ANTONIO, TX  78208-1956 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78217
PHONE:  210.222.1308 PHONE:210-590-2662
FAX: 210.222.1353 FAX: 210-590-2663
MARIA WHITE CONTACT: DWAYNE
averyoil@averyoil.com dwayne@bigstarbranding.com

BELCO SUPPLY BUS PARTS WAREHOUSE
5886 DEZAVALA ROAD STE 102-502 PO BOX 441
SAN ANTONIO, TX  78249 MANLIUS, NY 13104
PHONE: 210.690.3280 PHONE: 800-635-5567
FAX:  210.690.3875 FAX: 877-682-4443
LUIS BELTRAN sales@buspartswarehouse.com
sales@belcosupply.com

CUMMINS SOUTHERN PLAINS
BETOS WINDSHIELD MOBILE SERVICE 6226 PAN AM EXPRESSWAY N
1606 SAN BERNARDO AVE SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78218
LAREDO, TEXAS 78040 PHONE: 800-364-4884
PHONE: 956-723-6013 FAX: 210-655-3865
betoswindshield@att.net DANIEL C HOLBROOK

daniel.c.holbrook@cummins.com



CASANOVA SPEED STOP D & D AUTOMOTIVE PARTS
318 HOUSTON ST 2401 MARKETS ST
LAREDO, TX  78040 LAREDO, TEXAS 78040
PHONE: 956.727.8573 PHONE: 956-722-6688
FAX: 956.727.8731 FAX: 956-725-8804
CARLOS CASANOVA DAVID MENDIOLA
marcel@casanova-trans.com DAVID VELA

jrchino28@hotmail.com
C.C. BATTERY CO, INC mendr78@hotmail.com
3513 AGNES ST hopieve@hotmail.com
CORPUS CHRISTI, TX  78405
PHONE: 361.882.5561 D.RODRIGUEZ AUTO INSPECTION
FAX:  361.882.9163 1301 LAFAYETTE
KENNY TURNER LAREDO, TX  78040
ccbattery@aol.com PHONE: 956.712.4335
wecrankem@aol.com DANIEL RODRIGUEZ

CITY RADIATOR DIESEL INJECTION SALES & SERVICE
1715 SAN BERNARDO 1050 SE LOOP 410 
LAREDO, TEXAS 78041 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78220
PHONE: 956.723.3312 PHONE: 210-648-4500

FAX: 210-648-0015
CHALK'S TRUCK PARTS CONTACT: JAVIER HERNANDEZ
838 MCCARTY DR CONTACT: MICHAEL EICHMAN
HOUSTON, TX  77029 jhernandez@dieselinjection.com
PHONE: 800.231.5061 meichman@dieselinjection.com
FAX:  713.672.2665
RICHARD DAVIS DISCOUNT AUTO GLASS
rdavis@chalks.com 1900 JUSTO PENN
aheiser@chalks.com LAREDO, TX  78041

PHONE: 956.727.7807
COMMERCIAL REBUILD, INC FAX: 956.727.7907
P.O. BOX 4806 ANTONIO VIDAL
VICTORIA, TX  77903 daglaredo@sbcglobal.net
PHONE: 361.578.0219
FAX: 361.578.2326 DISCOUNT TIRE
GARY BURNS 7301 MCPHERSON RD
ldn333@yahoo.com LAREDO, TX 78041

PHONE: 956-796-0117
CRUZ AUTO GLASS sales@discounttire.com
2701 FLORES AVE
LAREDO, TEXAS 78040 DR LOUIES WINDSHIELD REPAIR
PHONE: 956-722-2530 PHONE: 956-724-1327
cruzautoglass@yahoo.com drlouies@stx,com



DUTCH GLO-CHEMICALS FLEETPRIDE INTERNATIONAL LTD
P.O. BOX 574 123 FLECHA LANE 
DEVINE, TX  78016 LAREDO, TEXAS 78045
PHONE: 830.665.2823 PHONE: 956-722-0761
FAX: 830.663.3934 FAX: 956-722-0750
dutchglo@aol.com RAYMUNDO MALDONADO

raymundo.maldonado@fleetpride.com
DURHAM SCHOOL SERVICES, L.P.
9011 MOUNTAIN RIDGE DR STE 200 FREIGHTLINER WESTERN 
AUSTIN, TX  78759 STAR OF LAREDO, LTD
PHONE: 512.343.6292 12002 FM 1472
FAX: 512.342.2806 LAREDO, TX 78045
PATRICIA DURHAM PHONE: 956-723-7473
info@durhamschoolservices.com FAX: 956-723-6530

ANGEL ORTEGA
EXCLUSIVE WINDSHIELD REPAIR /LUCIANO MALDONADO
PHONE: 956-286-2271 lmaldonado@opuskane.com

aortega@opuskane.com
rmendiola@opuskane.com

FEDERAL TIRE INC
1310 BARTLETT FRENCH ELLISON
LAREDO, TX  78043 8402 MILO RD
PHONE: 956.791.8473 LAREDO, TEXAS 78045
FAX: 956.722.8807 PHONE: 956-727-7886
VALENTINE LOPEZ FAX: 956-727-7114
federalt@stx.rr.com jescobar@frenchellison.com

FIRESTONE TIRE & FULL SERVICE AUTO PARTS
 SERVICE CENTERS 1605 E. HILLSIDE STE 1
1020 SAN BERNARDO LAREDO, TX  78041
LAREDO, TEXAS 78040 PHONE: 956.726.6977
PHONE: (956) 723-5516 FAX: 956.726.6925
FAX: 723-6737 RICK LEDEZMA
JOSE GONZALEZ loc11@fullserviceap.com
jodowney@bfrc.com

GCR TIRE CENTERS
FIRESTONE 8115 LAS CRUCES DRIVE 
502 E CALTON RD LAREDO, TEXAS 78045
LAREDO, TEXAS 78041 PHONE: 956-729-7077
PHONE: 956-726-1613 FAX: 956-729-7017
CARY HOWARD JOHNNY GARCIA 
lizziegirl46@aol.com ESTHER MEDRANO

johnnygarcia@gcrtires.com
esthermedrano@gcrtires.com
mariopaez@gcrtires.com



GATEWAY AUTO GLASS HOLLON OIL COMPANY
502 GUADALUPE 1300 DAVENPORT
LAREDO, TX  78041 WESLACO, TX 78596
PHONE: 956.723.2016 PHONE: 956-968-9581
FAX: 956.723.2564 FAX: 956-969-2976
GREGORIO REYES JR DAVID MORENO

dmoreno@hollomail.com
GONZALEZ AUTO PARTS
4220 SAN BERNARDO HYDROTEX
LAREDO, TX  78041 1825 MONETARY LANE
PHONE: 956.726.9766 CARROLLTON, TX  75006
FAX: 956.726.9760 PHONE: 800.527.9439
JOSEPH A. GAGE FAX: 800.333.8461
gap@gapauto.net DWIGHT GLEAVES

msmith@hydrotexlube.com
GRAINGER dgleaves@hydrotexlube.com
LAREDO, TX 78041
PHONE: 956.717.0050; 956.566.0388 INTERNATIONAL SALES, INC
FAX: 956.682.9121 1119 SAN EDUARDO
PAT SANTORE LAREDO, TX  78040
pat.santore@grainger.com PHONE: 956.725.7373

FAX:  956.725.7374
GRAY'S WHOLESALE TIRE EVA SHOULTS
201 N. RUPERT shoultse@bizlaredo.rr.com
FORTH WORTH, TEXAS   76113
PHONE: 800-392-8604 J&B INDUSTRIES
FAX: 713-937-7399 2100 J & B DRIVE
jnewton@graystire.com SAN BENITO, TX  78586
sherry@graystire.com PHONE: 956.399.4003
govtsales@graystire.com FAX: 956.399.9470

CALVIN R. BURGESS
GUERRA AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES jbchems@aol.com
107 FLECHA LN
LAREDO, TX 78045 JAMES AUTOMOTIVE
PHONE: 956-723-6461 3212 N. ARKANSAS
FAX: 956-717-8535 LAREDO, TX  78043
ALFONSO GUERRA PHONE: 956.722.3653
guerraauto@aol.com FAX: 956.723.1066

ANDRES MARTINEZ
HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS
17850 I-45 JASPER ENGINES
WILLIS, TX  77318 6618 PETRO PARK 
PHONE: 936.344.9957 HOUSTON, TEXAS 77041
FAX: 936.344.9963 PHONE: 800-827-7455
DON BILLINGSLEY FAX: 812-634-1820
don@directbus.com BRIAN FLANAGAN

bflanagan@jasperengines.com



JESSE MARTINEZ AUTO CENTER LAREDO QUICK TRASH LUBE 
GOODYEAR & CAR WASH
1301 SAN BERNARDO 2522 HWY 83 SOUTH
LAREDO, TEXAS 78040 LAREDO, TEXAS 78046
PHONE: (956) 723-4722 PHONE: 956-728-0386
FAX: 956-723-9588 FAX: 956-729-7004
jessem@lmtonline.com OSCAR SALINAS

augie_71@hotmail.com
JESSIE MARTINEZ
555 W. HILLSIDE LAREDO WHOLESALE AUTO PARTS
LAREDO, TX  78041 4115 FREE TRADE
PHONE: 956.722.7574 LAREDO, TX  78045
FAX: 956.723.5957 PHONE: 956.722.6481
ROBERT MARTINEZ FAX:  956.791.3163
parts@hillsideauto.net JUAN ANGEL VALLEJO, JR

lwsjvallejo@stx.rr.com
JESSIE MARTINEZ AUTO SOUTH
520 S ZAPATA HWY 83 LEO'S ENGINE SERVICE
LAREDO, TX  78043 318 W. MAPLE LP
PHONE: 956.722.5106 LAREDO, TX  78041
FAX:  956.722.7982 PHONE: 956.727.2243
JORGE MARTINEZ LEONEL GUTIERREZ
parts@jrmartinezauto.com

LIFETIME FILTER MANUFACTURING INC
K&N MOBILE DISTRIBUTION SYSTEMS 1005 KATYLAND DR
4909 RONDO DR KATY, TX 77493
FT. WORTH TX PHONE: 281-391-8060
PHONE: 817-626-2885 FAX: 281-391-1243
FAX: 817-624-3721 TONI AUCOIN
JOHNNY MAURICE www.lifetimefilter.com
skelly@kandnelectric.com

LONGHORN BUS SALES
L & R TRANSMISSION 6921 HOMESTEAD RD
1001 SAUNDERS HOUSTON, TX  77028
LAREDO, TEXAS 78041 PHONE: 800.392.5356
PHONE: 956.722.3042 FAX:  713.631.6965
jazy87@hotmail.com theider@lhb-tx.com

LAREDO MUFFLER SHOP
1520 SAN BERNARDO LAREDO AUTO PAINT
LAREDO, TEXAS 78040 1718 SAN BERNARDO
PHONE: 956.722.1522 LAREDO, TEXAS 78040

PHONE: 956-722-2449



LUBRICATION ENGINEERS INC NARVAEZ WHEEL ALIGNMENT
3851 AIRPORT FREEWAY 301 SAUNDERS ST
FORT WORTH, TX  76111 LAREDO, TEXAS 78041
PHONE: 800.537.7683 PHONE: 956-722-4819
FAX: 800.228.1143
MIKE CALK NATIONAL BUS 
m.calk@le-inc.com SALES & LEASING INC

27749 FM 149
MID AMERICA RESEARCH CHEM RICHARDS, TX  77873
2470 14TH AVE PHONE: 936.851.2691
P.O. BOX 927 FAX:  936.851.2691
COLUMBUS, DE  68601 KELLEY KETOSKI
PHONE: 800.228.8508 kketkoski@nationalbussales.com
FAX: 402.563.1290
STEVEN F. FREMAREK NATIONAL CHEMICAL LABORATORIES
marci@marci.com 401 N 10TH STREET

PHILADELPHIA, PA 19123
MIKE'S PAINT PLACE PHONE: 800-628-2436
6410 POLARIS DR. FAX: 215-922-5517
LAREDO, TEXAS 78041 JUAN HENRY
PHONE: 956-729-8080 jhenry@nclonline.com
collision@mikespaintplace.com jsocha@nclonline.com

MORALES MACHINE SHOP ONE STOP BUS STOP, INC
801 N. ARKANSAS 1440 S. LOOP 12
LAREDO, TEXAS 78040 IRVING, TX  75060
PHONE: 956.722.4485 PHONE: 800.460.2877
jessem@lmtonline.com FAX: 972.554.0883

CHERYL GAINES
NANIS AUTO GLASS cgaines@onestopbusstop.com
1216 S URBAHN AVE
LAREDO, TX 78046 O'REILLY AUTO PARTS
PHONE: 956.753.8181 233 S. PATTERSON
JESUS CHAPA SPRINGFIELD, MO  65802
NO EMAIL PHONE: 417.874.7131

FAX: 800.925.0899
NAPA AUTO & TRUCK PARTS DOUG BENNETT
501 W CALTON RD dbennett@oreillyauto.com
LAREDO, TEXAS 78045
PHONE: 956-712-4840 OSCAR' S GARAGE & INSPECTION
FAX: 956-712-4844 205 W. SAUNDERS
EDITH LAREDO, TEXAS 78041
eddyr7@hotmail.com PHONE: 956.722.4132



PAUL YOUNG AUTO MALL RUSH BUS CENTER NUMBER 2
3701 E. SAUNDERS PO BOX 1030 
LAREDO, TX  78041 CONVERSE, TEXAS 78109
PHONE: 956.727.1192 PHONE: 210-310-1423
PARTS MANAGER FAX: 210-662-2656
joe@paulyoungautogroup.com JACQUES VAN HEERDEN

vanheerdenj@rushenterprises.com
PEP BOYS
4401 SAN DARIO RUSH-TRUCK CENTERS OF TEXAS
LAREDO, TX  78041 10216 UNION PACIFIC BLVD
PHONE: 956.725.0033 LAREDO, TX  78045
FAX:  956.726.9142 PHONE: 956.724.7383
PEDRO A. VASQUEZ FAX: 956.717.1709
mngr0775@pepboys.com CINDY MARTINEZ

martinezclar@rush-enterprises.com
POWELL WATSON MOTORS INC LEWIS WOODUL, GENERAL MGR
IH 35 N @ MANN ROAD woodull@rush-enterprises.com
LAREDO, TX  78041 JEFF LOCKE, PARTS MGR
PHONE: 956.722.5182 lockej@rush-enterprises.com
FAX: 956.717.2447
PARTS MANAGER
esantos@powellwatson.com R.D.O. EQUIPMENT CO.

5400 N. IH 35
PRECISION  FLUIDS INC SAN ANTONIO, TX 78218
5230 BRITTMOORE RD PHONE: 877.469.4847
HOUSTON, TEXAS 77041 FAX: 210.661.2435
PHONE: 713-896-0606 CHRISTI OFFUTT
FAX: 713-896-0610 coffutt@rdoequipment.com
keithg@precisionfluids.com

RON TURLEY ASSOCIATES
PRONTO MUFFLER SHOP 20823 N. 19TH AVE STE 4
910 MADISON PHOENIX, AZ  85027
LAREDO, TEXAS 78040 PHONE: 800.279.0549
PHONE: 956.722.5572 FAX: 623.582.1747
FAX: 956.722.7624 JAN SMITH
ARMANDO ESPARZA jansmith@rtafleet.com
pshops@sbcglobal.net

ROTEX TRUCK SERVICE CENTER INC
RAMIREZ TIRE CENTER 11901 SARA RD
2719 SAN BERNARDO LAREDO, TEXAS 78045
LAREDO, TX  78041 PHONE: 956-722-1250
PHONE: 956.724.6842 FAX: 956-727-7835
FAX:  956.796.0535 ANDY ROSAS
gramirez701@yahoo.com andyr@andys-air.com



ROYAL MANUFACTURING SAM'S CLUB 8156
COMPANY LP 4810 SAN BERNARDO
P.O. BOX 200152 LAREDO, TEXAS 78041
SAN ANTONIO, TX 78220 PHONE: 956-725-5300
PHONE: 210-337-2720 FAX: 956-725-0263
FAX: 210-337-2451 ARACELI MATA
BOB KELIEHOR, TERRITORY MGR agmata.s08156.us@samsclub.com
CELL: 361-319-1248
normanw@royalmfg.com SAMES MOTOR CO.

6001 SAN DARIO
R.P.M SMALL ENGINE LAREDO, TX  78041
307 W. HILLSIDE PHONE:  956.721.4700
LAREDO, TX 78041 PARTS MANAGER
PHONE: 956.791.0022 javierg@sames.net
FAX: 956.791.0023
RAUL MONARREZ SAN ANTONIO BRAKE & CLUTCH
rpmparts@yahoo.com dba TEXAS FLEET SUPPLY

902 AVENUE B
RSC EQUIPMENT SAN ANTONIO, TX  78215
1013 EMERALD VALLEY DR. PHONE: 210.226.0254
LAREDO, TEXAS 78043 FAX:  210.226.2043
PHONE: 956-523-0179 JOE POLLIAM
FAX: 956-523-0293 jgm@sabrake.com
luis.lozano@rscrental.com jhp@sabrake.com

RUSH BUS CENTERS SANCHEZ AUTO WORLD OF LAREDO
8511 IH 10 EAST, LOT 1 802 CONVENT
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78219 LAREDO, TX  78040
210-310-1423 DIRECT PHONE: 956.722.4975
210-860-9692 CELL FAX: 956.722.4999
210-662-2656 FAX ALBERTO SANCHEZ
gamboar@rush-enterprises.com

SANTEX TRUCK CENTER
SAFELITE AUTO GLASS 1380 ACKERMAN ROAD
612 AMISTAD DR SAN ANTONIO, TX  78219
LAREDO, TEXAS 78041 PHONE:  210.661.8371
PHONE: 956-726-0477 FAX:  210.477.2548
karen.albert@safelite.com JAMES HENRY

jhenry@santextrucks.com
SALAZAR RADIATOR SHOP
316 W. SAUNDERS SAFETY GLASS
LAREDO, TEXAS 78041 1601 MARKET
PHONE: 956.724.5216 LAREDO, TX  78041
FAX: 956-726-7733 PHONE: 956.723.5593
HOMER SANCHEZ FAX: 956.723.8693
homer.sanchez@safelite.com ROGER GARCIA

safety@sbcglobal.net



SAFETY-KLEEN SOUTHWEST BUS SALES
1311 E. TAMARACK 10807 JONES ROAD
MCALLEN, TX  78501 HOUSTON, TX  77065-4299
PHONE: 956.682.1951 PHONE: 713.816.0599
FAX:  956.630.6728 FAX: 281.517.1924
LEO CHAPA JIM FINLAY
leo.chapa@safety-kleen.com jfinlay@swbus-coach.com

SCHOOL BUS PARTS SCHAEFFER MFG CO
P.O. BOX 477 PO BOX 12214
HUNTSVILLE, TX  77340 ST LOUIS, MO 63157
PHONE:  936.435.1211 PHONE: 800-325-9962
FAX: 936.435.1050 FAX: 800-553-0072
PARNELL bernoil@wildblue.net
sbptexas@sbcglobal.net

STATE INDUSTRIAL PRODUCTS
SEARS ROBUCK AND CO. 3100 HAMILTON AVE
5300 SAN DARIO CLEVELAND, OH  44114
LAREDO, TEXAS 78041 PHONE: 800.782.2436
PHONE: (956) 726-2128 FAX: 888.771.9670
FAX:  (956) 726-2113 JIM VINSON
ANA VILLARREAL customerservice@stateindustrial.com
rguti30@searshc.com

T & W TIRE
SOUTHERN TIRE MART 5834 IH 10 EAST
8115 LAS CRUCES SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78219
LAREDO, TEXAS 78045 PHONE: 210-661-8271
PHONE: 956-718-1050 FAX: 210-661-8276
FAX: 956-718-1052 JON THEISSEN
BOBBY HARMS jtheissen@tandwtire.com
bharms@stmtires.com
stm68@stmtires.com TCI - TIRE CENTERS, LLC

14202 TRANSPORTATION AVE.
SOUTH TEXAS AUTO REBUILDERS INC LAREDO, TEXAS 78045
2720 GUADALUPE PHONE: (956) 722-3409
LAREDO, TEXAS 78041 FAX: (956) 722-4851
PHONE: 956-723-8711 FRANCISCO PADILLA, MGR
FAX:956-723-1768 tci630@tirecenters.com
JOE VILLARREAL JERRY GONZALEZ
FRANCO VILLARREAL jerry.gonzalez@tirecenters.com
sotxsuto@yahoo.com tci630mgr@tirecenters.com



TEXAS CORRECTIONAL IND. VEHICLE MAINTENANCE PROGRAM, INC
PO BOX 4013 3595 N. DIXIE HWY., BAY #7
HUNTSVILLE, TEXAS 77342 Boca Raton, FL 33431
PHONE: 936-437-8960 PHONE: 561.362.6080
FAX: 936-437-6126 FAX: 561.362.7994 
DALE POPP LINDI BROOKS
dale.popp@tdcj.state.tx.us lindi@vmpparts.com

TEX STAR PROFESSIONAL SERVICE WAL-MART - AUTOMOTIVE DEPT.
P.O.BOX 2131  5610 SAN BERNARDO
BROWNWOOD,TX  76804-2131 LAREDO, TEXAS 78041
PHONE: 325.641.2787 PHONE: (956) 791-9803
FAX: 325.641.2787 FAX: 719-9874
ALVARO ALVARADO ATTN: ALBERT OBREGON
al@txstarpro.com
liz@txstarpro.com WALMART AUTOMOTIVE DEPT. 

2320 BOB BULLOCK LOOP 20
TEXAS ALTERNATOR STARTER SERVICE LAREDO, TEXAS 78040
PO BOX 9131 JOE OROSCO
AUSTIN, TEXAS 78766
PHONE: 512-836-6601 WINGFOOT COMMERCIAL TIRE 
FAX: 512-836-7885 SYSTEMS, LLC
JOEL MCADAMS 11802 FM 1472, STE. B
jmcadams@texasalternator.com LAREDO, TEXAS   78045

PHONE:  (956) 724-6294
THE GOODYEAR TIRE & FAX:  (956) 724-8994
 RUBBER CO. FRANK PAYNE//
5290 FM 537 DAGO MALDONADO
FLORESVILLE, TEXAS 78114 CRISTAN WEAVER
MOBILE 210-602-3919 wf040sls@wingfootct.com
FAX: 830-393-6133 pgage@wingfootct.com
tom_welfel@goodyear.com wcarlile@wingfootct.com

cwever@wingfootct.com
TIM'S
405 BOOMTOWN WILLIAM GENERAL REPAIRS
LAREDO, TX  78043 309 W. SAN JOSE
PHONE: 956.728.1000 LAREDO, TX 78040
FAX: 956.763.0360 PHONE: 956.723.5432
CHRIS CARROLL williamsgeneralrep@sbcglobal.net

TRY AUTO PAINTS WORLDWIDE AUTOMATION INC
202 W. SAUNDERS 920 SANTA MARIA AVE.
LAREDO, TX  78041 LAREDO, TEXAS 78040
PHONE: 956.722.5545 PHONE: 956-727-0441
FAX:  956.724.3930 FAX: 956-723-6258
MARIBEL RODRIGUEZ MR F. CAVAZOS
tryautopaint@sbcglobal.net info@worldwideautomation.com



ZEP
10727 IH 35
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78233
PHONE: 210-650-9111
FAX: 210-650-0246
DAVID COLLINS
david.collins@zep.com



Board Approval 
Awarding of Bids/Proposals 

September 16, 2009 
 
 
RFP#  068-2009 Automotive Parts & Supplies    
 
Recommendation: 
Requesting approval to purchase from the best bidder(S)/ offer(S) meeting specifications as follows:  
       
  Recommended Vendor (S)   Est. Annual Amount 
   
                             Upholstery                        See Tabulation 
  Belco Supply 
  Chalks Truck Parts 
 
                             Auto / Bus Parts 
             Andys Auto & Bus 
  Chalks Truck Parts 
  Laredo Wholesale 
  Cc Batteries 
  O’reillys Auto Parts 
  Rush Truck Center  
  Texas Fleet Supply 
  Gonzalez Auto Parts 
  Texas Alternator 
  Batteries Plus 
  Fleet Pride 
  Cummins 
  Diesel Injection 
  Family Chevrolet 
  Longhorn Bus Sales 
  One Stop Bus Stop 
  Napa Auto Parts 
  Rotex Truck Center 
 
                             Cleaning Chemicals 
  Gonzalez Auto Parts 
  O’reillys Auto Parts 
  Belco 
  Chalks Truck Parts 
  Zep 
                   State Industrial Products 

 American Sales             
 
 
Administration Distributed One Hundred Twenty-Eight (128) Proposals & Advertised On August 2, 2009 & August 
9, 2009.  Twenty Two (23) Proposals Were Received On August 19, 2009 @ 3:00 P.M. at The UISD Service Center 
Purchasing Department.  
 
Budget Information: 
2009-2010 Transportation Department  
 
Resource Personnel:  
Joe Aranda, Executive Director of Transportation 
Danny Trevino, Transportation Operations Supervisor 
Cordelia Flores Jackson, Director of Purchasing 
Hector Cavazos, Purchasing Manager 
 
 





% OFF CATALOG PRICE:

% OFF LIST PRICE:

% OFF SHELF PRICE:

% OFF CATALOG PRICE:

% OFF LIST PRICE:

% OFF SHELF PRICE:

% OFF CATALOG PRICE:

% OFF LIST PRICE:

% OFF SHELF PRICE:

% OFF CATALOG PRICE: Note:  Received 2 No bids
% OFF LIST PRICE:

% OFF SHELF PRICE: 0%

ZEP
33%

33%

33%

TEXAS FLEET SUPPLY
0%

0%

UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
AUTOMOTIVE PARTS & SUPPLIES

RFP 068 - 2009

CC BATTERY CHALK TRUCK
AMERICAN SALES & 

SERVICE ANDY'S AUTO & BUS AIR INC BATTERIES PLUS BELCOVENDORS 
N/A 50%0% N/A N/A 15%

50% 50%0% 20% Carrier Transcold A/C part N/A 15%

GONZALEZ AUTO PARTS
COST + 25%

N/A 50%0% N/A 10% 15%

N/A
DIESEL INJECTION FAMILY CHEVROLET

N/A

FLEET PRIDE

OREILLYONE STOP BUS STOP NAPA AUTO PARTS

Laredo Wholesale Auto Parts
N/A 15-25%

60% OFF Cummins Filters 25% N/A N/A 30-60% 25-50%

CUMMINS

N/A

N/A

RUSH

N/A N/A N/A N/AN/A

LONGHORN BUS

truck parts

ROTEX
0%

NATIONAL FLEET

N/A

35% 41% OR BETTER

N/A N/A

20% International bus and 

NATIONAL FLEET N/A N/A

30%

30%

30%

N/A

VENDORS 

VENDORS 

VENDORS 

N/A

N/A

N/A

N./A

TEXAS ALTERNATOR
30%



A-1 AUTO SHOP ADRIANS AUTO MACHINE
3410 E SAUNDERS 1503 PARK ST.
LAREDO, TEXAS 78041 LAREDO, TEXAS 78040
PHONE: 956-725-9119 PHONE: 956.723.2856
n_garibay@a-1autostop.com FAX: 956.723.2856

MIGUEL HERNANDEZ 
A & B WHEEL ALIGNMENT SPECIALIST
3419 SPRINGFIELD AVE AIRGAS SOUTHWEST
LAREDO, TEXAS 78041 2519 GUADALUPE
PHONE: 956-729-0371 LAREDO, TEXAS 78043
GILBERTO BRIONES PHONE: 956-722-8411

FAX: 956-723-8970
A TO Z TIRE & BATTERY J ANGEL LINCON
2310 E. SAUNDERS STE 105 joseangellincon@airgas.com
LAREDO, TX  78041 juan.gutierrez@airgas.com
PHONE: 956.722.5213
PAGER: 956.344.3717 ALLEN SAMUELS CHEVROLET

UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
AUTOMOTIVE PARTS AND SUPPLIES

RFP 068-2009

PAGER: 956.344.3717 ALLEN SAMUELS CHEVROLET
FAX: 956.722.6399 2118 S. PADRE ISLAND DRIVE
ddees@atoztire.com CORPUS CHRISTI, TX  78416-1100

PHONE: 361.884.5234/800.242.3249
ACE AUTO SERVICE FAX: 361.854.0855
2804 CLARK BLVD jgarza@asag.net
LAREDO, TEXAS 78043
PHONE: 956-723-7433 AMERICAN SALES & SERVICE

PO BOX 61610
ACCESS CHEVROLET LTD SAN ANGELO, TEXAS 76906
620 E. MAIN ST / P.O.BOX 311 PHONE: 325-658-5824
ROBSTOWN, TX  78380 FAX: 325-659-1864
PHONE: 361.387.7577 SHANNON W. RUSHING
FAX:  361.387.7583 sales@americansalesandservice.com
GLENN RACHUI
grachui@accesschevrolet.com

ANDY'S AUTO AIR
ADVANCE AUTO PARTS 11901 SARA LN
3219 SAN BERNARDO RD LAREDO, TX  78045
LAREDO, TEXAS 78041 PHONE: 956.722.7321
PHONE: 956-712-9932 FAX: 956.727.7835
FAX: 956-712-9581 ROBERT ROSAS

robert@andys-air.com



AUTO BODY TOOLMART BORDER TRANSMISSION PARTS
2545 MILLENNIUM DR 1419 SPRINGFIELD
ELGIN, IL 60124 LAREDO, TEXAS 78040
PHONE: 800-382-1200 PHONE: 956.726.0171
FAX: 866-656-1245 FAX: 956.726.3018
MARISOL LAZARO JAIME RODRIGUEZ 
marisol@abtm.com btp@stx.rr.com

AUTO ZONE BUCKS WHEEL & EQUIPMENT
5419 MCPHERSON 220 S. COMMERCIAL ST
LAREDO, TX  78041 FORT WORTH, TX  76107
PHONE: 956.728.0371 PHONE: 800.433.5613
DIRECT:  956.728.7291 FAX: 817.338.0505
robert.maldonado@autozone.com SANDRA LAXSON

bucks_1@charterinternet.com
AVCO ENTERPRISES, LTD
BATTERIES PLUS BULLSEYE AUTOGLASS
7609 MCPHERSON STE 1 5827 NORTH GATE LANE
LAREDO, TX  78041 LAREDO, TEXAS 78401
PHONE: 956.722.2887 PHONE:
FAX: 956.722.3436 FAX 956-791-5200
ALFREDO VILLARREAL, JR PHIL SANCHEZALFREDO VILLARREAL, JR PHIL SANCHEZ
bp9157@batteriesplus.net phil_sanchez@hotmail.com

AVERY OIL COMPANY BIGSTARBRANDING
219 DUVAL ST 4009 NACO PERRIN
SAN ANTONIO, TX  78208-1956 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78217
PHONE:  210.222.1308 PHONE:210-590-2662
FAX: 210.222.1353 FAX: 210-590-2663
MARIA WHITE CONTACT: DWAYNE
averyoil@averyoil.com dwayne@bigstarbranding.com

BELCO SUPPLY BUS PARTS WAREHOUSE
5886 DEZAVALA ROAD STE 102-502 PO BOX 441
SAN ANTONIO, TX  78249 MANLIUS, NY 13104
PHONE: 210.690.3280 PHONE: 800-635-5567
FAX:  210.690.3875 FAX: 877-682-4443
LUIS BELTRAN sales@buspartswarehouse.com
sales@belcosupply.com

CUMMINS SOUTHERN PLAINS
BETOS WINDSHIELD MOBILE SERVICE 6226 PAN AM EXPRESSWAY N
1606 SAN BERNARDO AVE SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78218
LAREDO, TEXAS 78040 PHONE: 800-361-4884
PHONE: 956-723-6013 FAX: 210-655-3865
betoswindshield@att.net DANIEL C. HOLBROOK

daniel.c.holbrook@cummins.com



CASANOVA SPEED STOP D & D AUTOMOTIVE PARTS
318 HOUSTON ST 2401 MARKETS ST
LAREDO, TX  78040 LAREDO, TEXAS 78040
PHONE: 956.727.8573 PHONE: 956-722-6688
FAX: 956.727.8731 FAX: 956-725-8804
CARLOS CASANOVA DAVID MENDIOLA
marcel@casanova-trans.com DAVID VELA

jrchino28@hotmail.com
C.C. BATTERY CO, INC mendr78@hotmail.com
3513 AGNES ST hopieve@hotmail.com
CORPUS CHRISTI, TX  78405
PHONE: 361.882.5561 D.RODRIGUEZ AUTO INSPECTION
FAX:  361.882.9163 1301 LAFAYETTE
KENNY TURNER LAREDO, TX  78040
ccbattery@aol.com PHONE: 956.712.4335
wecrankem@aol.com DANIEL RODRIGUEZ

CITY RADIATOR DIESEL INJECTION SALES & SERVICE
1715 SAN BERNARDO 1050 SE LOOP 410 
LAREDO, TEXAS 78041 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78220
PHONE: 956.723.3312 PHONE: 210-648-4500

FAX: 210-648-0015FAX: 210 648 0015
CHALK'S TRUCK PARTS CONTACT: JAVIER HERNANDEZ
838 MCCARTY DR CONTACT: MICHAEL EICHMAN
HOUSTON, TX  77029 jhernandez@dieselinjection.com
PHONE: 800.231.5061 meichman@dieselinjection.com
FAX:  713.672.2665
RICHARD DAVIS DISCOUNT AUTO GLASS
rdavis@chalks.com 1900 JUSTO PENN
aheiser@chalks.com LAREDO, TX  78041

PHONE: 956.727.7807
COMMERCIAL REBUILD, INC FAX: 956.727.7907
P.O. BOX 4806 ANTONIO VIDAL
VICTORIA, TX  77903 daglaredo@sbcglobal.net
PHONE: 361.578.0219
FAX: 361.578.2326 DISCOUNT TIRE
GARY BURNS 7301 MCPHERSON RD
ldn333@yahoo.com LAREDO, TX 78041

PHONE: 956-796-0117
CRUZ AUTO GLASS sales@discounttire.com
2701 FLORES AVE
LAREDO, TEXAS 78040 DR LOUIES WINDSHIELD REPAIR
PHONE: 956-722-2530 PHONE: 956-724-1327
cruzautoglass@yahoo.com drlouies@stx,com



DUTCH GLO-CHEMICALS FLEETPRIDE INTERNATIONAL LTD
P.O. BOX 574 123 FLECHA LANE 
DEVINE, TX  78016 LAREDO, TEXAS 78045
PHONE: 830.665.2823 PHONE: 956-722-0761
FAX: 830.663.3934 FAX: 956-722-0750
dutchglo@aol.com RAYMUNDO MALDONADO

raymundo.maldonado@fleetpride.com
DURHAM SCHOOL SERVICES, L.P.
9011 MOUNTAIN RIDGE DR STE 200 FREIGHTLINER WESTERN 
AUSTIN, TX  78759 STAR OF LAREDO, LTD
PHONE: 512.343.6292 12002 FM 1472
FAX: 512.342.2806 LAREDO, TX 78045
PATRICIA DURHAM PHONE: 956-723-7473
info@durhamschoolservices.com FAX: 956-723-6530

ANGEL ORTEGA
EXCLUSIVE WINDSHIELD REPAIR /LUCIANO MALDONADO
PHONE: 956-286-2271 lmaldonado@opuskane.com

aortega@opuskane.com
rmendiola@opuskane.com

FEDERAL TIRE INC
1310 BARTLETT FRENCH ELLISON
LAREDO, TX  78043 8402 MILO RDLAREDO, TX  78043 8402 MILO RD
PHONE: 956.791.8473 LAREDO, TEXAS 78045
FAX: 956.722.8807 PHONE: 956-727-7886
VALENTINE LOPEZ FAX: 956-727-7114
federalt@stx.rr.com jescobar@frenchellison.com

FIRESTONE TIRE & FULL SERVICE AUTO PARTS
 SERVICE CENTERS 1605 E. HILLSIDE STE 1
1020 SAN BERNARDO LAREDO, TX  78041
LAREDO, TEXAS 78040 PHONE: 956.726.6977
PHONE: (956) 723-5516 FAX: 956.726.6925
FAX: 723-6737 RICK LEDEZMA
JOSE GONZALEZ loc11@fullserviceap.com
jodowney@bfrc.com

GCR TIRE CENTERS
FIRESTONE 8115 LAS CRUCES DRIVE 
502 E CALTON RD LAREDO, TEXAS 78045
LAREDO, TEXAS 78041 PHONE: 956-729-7077
PHONE: 956-726-1613 FAX: 956-729-7017
CARY HOWARD JOHNNY GARCIA 
lizziegirl46@aol.com ESTHER MEDRANO

johnnygarcia@gcrtires.com
esthermedrano@gcrtires.com
mariopaez@gcrtires.com



GATEWAY AUTO GLASS HOLLON OIL COMPANY
502 GUADALUPE 1300 DAVENPORT
LAREDO, TX  78041 WESLACO, TX 78596
PHONE: 956.723.2016 PHONE: 956-968-9581
FAX: 956.723.2564 FAX: 956-969-2976
GREGORIO REYES JR DAVID MORENO

dmoreno@hollomail.com
GONZALEZ AUTO PARTS
4220 SAN BERNARDO HYDROTEX
LAREDO, TX  78041 1825 MONETARY LANE
PHONE: 956.726.9766 CARROLLTON, TX  75006
FAX: 956.726.9760 PHONE: 800.527.9439
JOSEPH A. GAGE FAX: 800.333.8461
gap@gapauto.net DWIGHT GLEAVES

msmith@hydrotexlube.com
GRAINGER dgleaves@hydrotexlube.com
LAREDO, TX 78041
PHONE: 956.717.0050; 956.566.0388 INTERNATIONAL SALES, INC
FAX: 956.682.9121 1119 SAN EDUARDO
PAT SANTORE LAREDO, TX  78040
pat.santore@grainger.com PHONE: 956.725.7373

FAX:  956.725.7374FAX:  956.725.7374
GRAY'S WHOLESALE TIRE EVA SHOULTS
201 N. RUPERT shoultse@bizlaredo.rr.com
FORTH WORTH, TEXAS   76113
PHONE: 800-392-8604 J&B INDUSTRIES
FAX: 713-937-7399 2100 J & B DRIVE
jnewton@graystire.com SAN BENITO, TX  78586
sherry@graystire.com PHONE: 956.399.4003
govtsales@graystire.com FAX: 956.399.9470

CALVIN R. BURGESS
GUERRA AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES jbchems@aol.com
107 FLECHA LN
LAREDO, TX 78045 JAMES AUTOMOTIVE
PHONE: 956-723-6461 3212 N. ARKANSAS
FAX: 956-717-8535 LAREDO, TX  78043
ALFONSO GUERRA PHONE: 956.722.3653
guerraauto@aol.com FAX: 956.723.1066

ANDRES MARTINEZ
HEAVY DUTY BUS PARTS
17850 I-45 JASPER ENGINES
WILLIS, TX  77318 6618 PETRO PARK 
PHONE: 936.344.9957 HOUSTON, TEXAS 77041
FAX: 936.344.9963 PHONE: 800-827-7455
DON BILLINGSLEY FAX: 812-634-1820
don@directbus.com BRIAN FLANAGAN

bflanagan@jasperengines.com



JESSE MARTINEZ AUTO CENTER LAREDO QUICK TRASH LUBE 
GOODYEAR & CAR WASH
1301 SAN BERNARDO 2522 HWY 83 SOUTH
LAREDO, TEXAS 78040 LAREDO, TEXAS 78046
PHONE: (956) 723-4722 PHONE: 956-728-0386
FAX: 956-723-9588 FAX: 956-729-7004
jessem@lmtonline.com OSCAR SALINAS

augie_71@hotmail.com
JESSIE MARTINEZ
555 W. HILLSIDE LAREDO WHOLESALE AUTO PARTS
LAREDO, TX  78041 4115 FREE TRADE
PHONE: 956.722.7574 LAREDO, TX  78045
FAX: 956.723.5957 PHONE: 956.722.6481
ROBERT MARTINEZ FAX:  956.791.3163
parts@hillsideauto.net JUAN ANGEL VALLEJO, JR

lwsjvallejo@stx.rr.com
JESSIE MARTINEZ AUTO SOUTH
520 S ZAPATA HWY 83 LEO'S ENGINE SERVICE
LAREDO, TX  78043 318 W. MAPLE LP
PHONE: 956.722.5106 LAREDO, TX  78041
FAX:  956.722.7982 PHONE: 956.727.2243FAX:  956.722.7982 PHONE: 956.727.2243
JORGE MARTINEZ LEONEL GUTIERREZ
parts@jrmartinezauto.com

LIFETIME FILTER MANUFACTURING INC
K&N MOBILE DISTRIBUTION SYSTEMS 1005 KATYLAND DR
4909 RONDO DR KATY, TX 77493
FT. WORTH TX PHONE: 281-391-8060
PHONE: 817-626-2885 FAX: 281-391-1243
FAX: 817-624-3721 TONI AUCOIN
JOHNNY MAURICE www.lifetimefilter.com
skelly@kandnelectric.com

LONGHORN BUS SALES
L & R TRANSMISSION 6921 HOMESTEAD RD
1001 SAUNDERS HOUSTON, TX  77028
LAREDO, TEXAS 78041 PHONE: 800.392.5356
PHONE: 956.722.3042 FAX:  713.631.6965
jazy87@hotmail.com theider@lhb-tx.com

LAREDO MUFFLER SHOP
1520 SAN BERNARDO LAREDO AUTO PAINT
LAREDO, TEXAS 78040 1718 SAN BERNARDO
PHONE: 956.722.1522 LAREDO, TEXAS 78040

PHONE: 956-722-2449



LUBRICATION ENGINEERS INC NARVAEZ WHEEL ALIGNMENT
3851 AIRPORT FREEWAY 301 SAUNDERS ST
FORT WORTH, TX  76111 LAREDO, TEXAS 78041
PHONE: 800.537.7683 PHONE: 956-722-4819
FAX: 800.228.1143
MIKE CALK NATIONAL BUS 
m.calk@le-inc.com SALES & LEASING INC

27749 FM 149
MID AMERICA RESEARCH CHEM RICHARDS, TX  77873
2470 14TH AVE PHONE: 936.851.2691
P.O. BOX 927 FAX:  936.851.2691
COLUMBUS, DE  68601 KELLEY KETOSKI
PHONE: 800.228.8508 kketkoski@nationalbussales.com
FAX: 402.563.1290
STEVEN F. FREMAREK NATIONAL CHEMICAL LABORATORIES
marci@marci.com 401 N 10TH STREET

PHILADELPHIA, PA 19123
MIKE'S PAINT PLACE PHONE: 800-628-2436
6410 POLARIS DR. FAX: 215-922-5517
LAREDO, TEXAS 78041 JUAN HENRY
PHONE: 956-729-8080 jhenry@nclonline.comPHONE: 956 729 8080 jhenry@nclonline.com
collision@mikespaintplace.com jsocha@nclonline.com

MORALES MACHINE SHOP ONE STOP BUS STOP, INC
801 N. ARKANSAS 1440 S. LOOP 12
LAREDO, TEXAS 78040 IRVING, TX  75060
PHONE: 956.722.4485 PHONE: 800.460.2877
jessem@lmtonline.com FAX: 972.554.0883

CHERYL GAINES
NANIS AUTO GLASS cgaines@onestopbusstop.com
1216 S URBAHN AVE
LAREDO, TX 78046 O'REILLY AUTO PARTS
PHONE: 956.753.8181 233 S. PATTERSON
JESUS CHAPA SPRINGFIELD, MO  65802
NO EMAIL PHONE: 417.874.7131

FAX: 800.925.0899
NAPA AUTO & TRUCK PARTS DOUG BENNETT
501 W CALTON RD dbennett@oreillyauto.com
LAREDO, TEXAS 78045
PHONE: 956-712-4840 OSCAR' S GARAGE & INSPECTION
FAX: 956-712-4844 205 W. SAUNDERS
EDITH LAREDO, TEXAS 78041
eddyr7@hotmail.com PHONE: 956.722.4132



PAUL YOUNG AUTO MALL RUSH BUS CENTER NUMBER 2
3701 E. SAUNDERS PO BOX 1030 
LAREDO, TX  78041 CONVERSE, TEXAS 78109
PHONE: 956.727.1192 PHONE: 210-310-1423
PARTS MANAGER FAX: 210-662-2656
joe@paulyoungautogroup.com JACQUES VAN HEERDEN

vanheerdenj@rushenterprises.com
PEP BOYS
4401 SAN DARIO RUSH-TRUCK CENTERS OF TEXAS
LAREDO, TX  78041 10216 UNION PACIFIC BLVD
PHONE: 956.725.0033 LAREDO, TX  78045
FAX:  956.726.9142 PHONE: 956.724.7383
PEDRO A. VASQUEZ FAX: 956.717.1709
mngr0775@pepboys.com CINDY MARTINEZ

martinezclar@rush-enterprises.com
POWELL WATSON MOTORS INC LEWIS WOODUL, GENERAL MGR
IH 35 N @ MANN ROAD woodull@rush-enterprises.com
LAREDO, TX  78041 JEFF LOCKE, PARTS MGR
PHONE: 956.722.5182 lockej@rush-enterprises.com
FAX: 956.717.2447
PARTS MANAGER
esantos@powellwatson.com R.D.O. EQUIPMENT CO.esantos@powellwatson.com R.D.O. EQUIPMENT CO.

5400 N. IH 35
PRECISION  FLUIDS INC SAN ANTONIO, TX 78218
5230 BRITTMOORE RD PHONE: 877.469.4847
HOUSTON, TEXAS 77041 FAX: 210.661.2435
PHONE: 713-896-0606 CHRISTI OFFUTT
FAX: 713-896-0610 coffutt@rdoequipment.com
keithg@precisionfluids.com

RON TURLEY ASSOCIATES
PRONTO MUFFLER SHOP 20823 N. 19TH AVE STE 4
910 MADISON PHOENIX, AZ  85027
LAREDO, TEXAS 78040 PHONE: 800.279.0549
PHONE: 956.722.5572 FAX: 623.582.1747
FAX: 956.722.7624 JAN SMITH
ARMANDO ESPARZA jansmith@rtafleet.com
pshops@sbcglobal.net

ROTEX TRUCK SERVICE CENTER INC
RAMIREZ TIRE CENTER 11901 SARA RD
2719 SAN BERNARDO LAREDO, TEXAS 78045
LAREDO, TX  78041 PHONE: 956-722-1250
PHONE: 956.724.6842 FAX: 956-727-7835
FAX:  956.796.0535 ANDY ROSAS
gramirez701@yahoo.com andyr@andys-air.com



ROYAL MANUFACTURING SAM'S CLUB 8156
COMPANY LP 4810 SAN BERNARDO
P.O. BOX 200152 LAREDO, TEXAS 78041
SAN ANTONIO, TX 78220 PHONE: 956-725-5300
PHONE: 210-337-2720 FAX: 956-725-0263
FAX: 210-337-2451 ARACELI MATA
BOB KELIEHOR, TERRITORY MGR agmata.s08156.us@samsclub.com
CELL: 361-319-1248
normanw@royalmfg.com SAMES MOTOR CO.

6001 SAN DARIO
R.P.M SMALL ENGINE LAREDO, TX  78041
307 W. HILLSIDE PHONE:  956.721.4700
LAREDO, TX 78041 PARTS MANAGER
PHONE: 956.791.0022 javierg@sames.net
FAX: 956.791.0023
RAUL MONARREZ SAN ANTONIO BRAKE & CLUTCH
rpmparts@yahoo.com dba TEXAS FLEET SUPPLY

902 AVENUE B
RSC EQUIPMENT SAN ANTONIO, TX  78215
1013 EMERALD VALLEY DR. PHONE: 210.226.0254
LAREDO, TEXAS 78043 FAX:  210.226.2043
PHONE: 956-523-0179 JOE POLLIAMPHONE: 956 523 0179 JOE POLLIAM
FAX: 956-523-0293 jgm@sabrake.com
luis.lozano@rscrental.com jhp@sabrake.com

RUSH BUS CENTERS SANCHEZ AUTO WORLD OF LAREDO
8511 IH 10 EAST, LOT 1 802 CONVENT
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78219 LAREDO, TX  78040
210-310-1423 DIRECT PHONE: 956.722.4975
210-860-9692 CELL FAX: 956.722.4999
210-662-2656 FAX ALBERTO SANCHEZ
gamboar@rush-enterprises.com

SANTEX TRUCK CENTER
SAFELITE AUTO GLASS 1380 ACKERMAN ROAD
612 AMISTAD DR SAN ANTONIO, TX  78219
LAREDO, TEXAS 78041 PHONE:  210.661.8371
PHONE: 956-726-0477 FAX:  210.477.2548
karen.albert@safelite.com JAMES HENRY

jhenry@santextrucks.com
SALAZAR RADIATOR SHOP
316 W. SAUNDERS SAFETY GLASS
LAREDO, TEXAS 78041 1601 MARKET
PHONE: 956.724.5216 LAREDO, TX  78041
FAX: 956-726-7733 PHONE: 956.723.5593
HOMER SANCHEZ FAX: 956.723.8693
homer.sanchez@safelite.com ROGER GARCIA

safety@sbcglobal.net



SAFETY-KLEEN SOUTHWEST BUS SALES
1311 E. TAMARACK 10807 JONES ROAD
MCALLEN, TX  78501 HOUSTON, TX  77065-4299
PHONE: 956.682.1951 PHONE: 713.816.0599
FAX:  956.630.6728 FAX: 281.517.1924
LEO CHAPA JIM FINLAY
leo.chapa@safety-kleen.com jfinlay@swbus-coach.com

SCHOOL BUS PARTS SCHAEFFER MFG CO
P.O. BOX 477 PO BOX 12214
HUNTSVILLE, TX  77340 ST LOUIS, MO 63157
PHONE:  936.435.1211 PHONE: 800-325-9962
FAX: 936.435.1050 FAX: 800-553-0072
PARNELL bernoil@wildblue.net
sbptexas@sbcglobal.net

STATE INDUSTRIAL PRODUCTS
SEARS ROBUCK AND CO. 3100 HAMILTON AVE
5300 SAN DARIO CLEVELAND, OH  44114
LAREDO, TEXAS 78041 PHONE: 800.782.2436
PHONE: (956) 726-2128 FAX: 888.771.9670
FAX:  (956) 726-2113 JIM VINSONFAX:  (956) 726 2113 JIM VINSON
ANA VILLARREAL customerservice@stateindustrial.com
rguti30@searshc.com

T & W TIRE
SOUTHERN TIRE MART 5834 IH 10 EAST
8115 LAS CRUCES SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78219
LAREDO, TEXAS 78045 PHONE: 210-661-8271
PHONE: 956-718-1050 FAX: 210-661-8276
FAX: 956-718-1052 JON THEISSEN
BOBBY HARMS jtheissen@tandwtire.com
bharms@stmtires.com
stm68@stmtires.com TCI - TIRE CENTERS, LLC

14202 TRANSPORTATION AVE.
SOUTH TEXAS AUTO REBUILDERS INC LAREDO, TEXAS 78045
2720 GUADALUPE PHONE: (956) 722-3409
LAREDO, TEXAS 78041 FAX: (956) 722-4851
PHONE: 956-723-8711 FRANCISCO PADILLA, MGR
FAX:956-723-1768 tci630@tirecenters.com
JOE VILLARREAL JERRY GONZALEZ
FRANCO VILLARREAL jerry.gonzalez@tirecenters.com
sotxsuto@yahoo.com tci630mgr@tirecenters.com



TEXAS CORRECTIONAL IND. TRY AUTO PAINTS
PO BOX 4013 202 W. SAUNDERS
HUNTSVILLE, TEXAS 77342 LAREDO, TX  78041
PHONE: 936-437-8960 PHONE: 956.722.5545
FAX: 936-437-6126 FAX:  956.724.3930
DALE POPP MARIBEL RODRIGUEZ
dale.popp@tdcj.state.tx.us tryautopaint@sbcglobal.net

TEX STAR PROFESSIONAL SERVICE VEHICLE MAINTENANCE PROGRAM, INC
P.O.BOX 2131  3595 N. DIXIE HWY., BAY #7
BROWNWOOD,TX  76804-2131 Boca Raton, FL 33431
PHONE: 325.641.2787 PHONE: 561.362.6080
FAX: 325.641.2787 FAX: 561.362.7994 
ALVARO ALVARADO LINDI BROOKS
al@txstarpro.com lindi@vmpparts.com
liz@txstarpro.com

WAL-MART - AUTOMOTIVE DEPT.
TEXAS ALTERNATOR STARTER SERVICE 5610 SAN BERNARDO
PO BOX 9131 LAREDO, TEXAS 78041
AUSTIN, TEXAS 78766 PHONE: (956) 791-9803
PHONE: 512-836-6601 FAX: 719-9874
FAX: 512-836-7885 ATTN: ALBERT OBREGONFAX: 512 836 7885 ATTN: ALBERT OBREGON
JOEL MCADAMS
jmcadams@texasalternator.com WALMART AUTOMOTIVE DEPT. 

2320 BOB BULLOCK LOOP 20
TEXAS FLEET SUPPLY LAREDO, TEXAS 78040
129 FLECHA LANE JOE OROSCO
LAREDO, TEXAS 78045
PHONE: 956-723-2231 WINGFOOT COMMERCIAL TIRE 
FAX: 956-729-7517 SYSTEMS, LLC
JAMES G MC CORMICK 11802 FM 1472, STE. B

LAREDO, TEXAS   78045
THE GOODYEAR TIRE & PHONE:  (956) 724-6294
 RUBBER CO. FAX:  (956) 724-8994
5290 FM 537 FRANK PAYNE//
FLORESVILLE, TEXAS 78114 DAGO MALDONADO
MOBILE 210-602-3919 CRISTAN WEAVER
FAX: 830-393-6133 wf040sls@wingfootct.com
tom_welfel@goodyear.com pgage@wingfootct.com

wcarlile@wingfootct.com
TIM'S cwever@wingfootct.com
405 BOOMTOWN
LAREDO, TX  78043 WILLIAM GENERAL REPAIRS
PHONE: 956.728.1000 309 W. SAN JOSE
FAX: 956.763.0360 LAREDO, TX 78040
CHRIS CARROLL PHONE: 956.723.5432

williamsgeneralrep@sbcglobal.net



WORLDWIDE AUTOMATION INC
920 SANTA MARIA AVE.
LAREDO, TEXAS 78040
PHONE: 956-727-0441
FAX: 956-723-6258
MR F. CAVAZOS
info@worldwideautomation.com

ZEP
10727 IH 35
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78233
PHONE: 210-650-9111
FAX: 210-650-0246
DAVID COLLINS
david.collins@zep.com



Board Approval 
Awarding of Bids/Proposals 

September 16, 2009 
 

Renewal  
 
RFP No. 2008-054 Drinking Water       
 
Recommendation: 
Requesting approval to purchase from the best bidder(S)/ offer(S) meeting specifications as follows:  
       
  Recommended Vendor   Est. Annual Amount 
  Laredo Spring Water Ozarka  See Tabulation 
         
      

 
 
      

Administration Distributed Two (2) Proposals & Advertised On May 25, 2008 & June 1, 2008.  One (1) Proposal 
Was Received On June 11, 2008 @ 3:00 P.M. at The UISD Service Center Purchasing Department.  
 
 
Budget Information: 
2009-2010 Energy/Environmental Management 
 
Resource Personnel:  
Cesar Trevino, Director of Energy/Environmental Management 
Cordelia Flores Jackson, Director of Purchasing 
Hector Cavazos, Purchasing Manager 
Karina Mendoza, Procurement Officer 
 
 





LAREDO SPRING WATER
OZARKA

EST. MTHLY 
QTY

27  Water Dispenser Rental 

2400 5-Gallon Purified Drinking Water $4.99

27 Cup Dispenser NO CHARGE

80 Cups (1,000 per case) $.015 CUP

8 Bottle Storage Racks NO CHARGE/ ON LOAN

Replacement cost for Water Dispenser     NO CHARGE
Broken Spigots NO CHARGE
Service Call Charge     NO CHARGE

$4.00

SECTION I.

UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT 
DRINKING WATER 

RFP 2008-054

SECTION II

DESCRIPTION 

VENDOR(S) 



MAILING LIST

LAREDO SPRING WATER/OZARKA
P.O. BOX   450071
805 GALE
LAREDO, TEXAS   78045
PHONE:  (956) 727-0794
FAX: (956) 712-3049
LETICIA SERNA
lsw-inc@hotmail.com

CULLIGAN WATER CONDITIONING
3020 E. LOCUST
LAREDO, TEXAS   78041
PHONE:  (956) 727-1207
FAX:  (956) 727-1985
sheri@culliganlaredo.com

UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
DRINKING WATER 

RFP 2008-054




