AGENDA ITEM

BOARD OF TRUSTEES
AGENDA
Workshop x Regular Special
(A) Report Only Recognition

Presenter(s):

Briefly describe the subject of the report or recognition presentation.

(B) X Action Item

Presenter(s): ISMAEL MIJARES, DEPUTY SUPERINTENDENT FOR BUSINESS & FINANCE
LUIS VELEZ, PURCHASING DIRECTOR
Briefly describe the action required.

CONSIDER AND TAKE APPROPRIATE ACTION ON THE REQUEST TO AWARD SEALED
PROPOSAL NO. 240103 FOR CHARTER BUS TRANSPORTATION SERVICES AND THE
BOARD DELEGATES THE SUPERINTENDENT OR DESIGNEE THE AUTHORITY TO MAKE
RELATED BUDGETED PURCHASES OF GOODS OR SERVICES AS PER BOARD POLICY
CH.

(C) Funding source: Identify the source of funds if any are required.

BUDGETED FUNDS

(D) Clarification: Explain any question or issues that might be raised regarding
this item.

SEE ATTACHED MEMORANDUM




2\ EAGLE PAss INDEPENDENT ScHOOL DISTRICT

MEMORANDUM
To: Mr. Ismael Mijares, Deputy Superintendent for Business and Finance
Luis A. Vélez
From: Mr. Luis A. Vélez, Purchasing Director 2023.04.04 09:29:11
-05'00'
Date: Monday, April 3, 2023

Subject: Recommendation on Sealed Proposal Number 240103 for Charter
Bus Transportation Services

Based on the submitted proposals, the Department of Purchasing recommends
that Sealed Proposal 240103 for Charter Bus Transportation Services be
awarded in accordance with the specifications and requirements of the proposal
and as per the attached Tabulation Sheet.

If you have any questions or need more information regarding this matter, please
contact me at the Purchasing Department.

587 Madison Street ® EAGLE Pass, TExas 78852 @ TerL (830) 773-5181 @  WWW.EAGLEPASSISD.NET

F-280

An EquaL OrrorTuniTY EMPLOYER



EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 240103 - CHARTER BUS TRANSPORTATION SERVICES

TABULATION SHEET

‘ RETURN # OF CHARTER ILER (6 IMPERIAL BUS| KERRVILLE REGENT

! DATE OF TRIP DATE BUSES GROUP DESTINATION Elgg:&chfE COMPANY. BUS OKTOURS | R CHARTERS COACH

ElPaso, TX San Antoalo, TX San Antonlo, TX San Antonlo, TX Laredo, TX San Antonle, TX.

1 8/5/2023 8/5/2023 y ~ EPHS VOLLEYBALL UVALDE, TX. $1,690.00 1$1,875.00 $2,890.00 $1,900.00 $2,850.00 $2,371.40

2 8/8/2023 8/8/2023 1 EPHS VOLLEYBALL LAREDO, TX. $1,820.00 $2,275.00 $3,500.00 $2,000.00 $3,000.00 $2,991.80

3 8/8/2023 8/8/2023 1 CC WINN VOLLEYBALL LAREDO, TX. $1,820.00 $2,275.00 $3,500.00 $2,000.00 $3,000.00 $2,991.80

4 | 8/10/2023 | 8/12/2023 1 EPHS VOLLEYBALL GEORGETOWN, TX. $3,185.00 $5,850.00 $6,300.00 $4,200.00 $6,500.00 $5,944.00

5 8/10/2023 | 8/12/2023 1 CC WINN VOLLEYBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $2,145.00 $4,500.00 $6,300.00 $4,200.00 $5,200.00 $5,944.00
6 8/10/2023 | 8/11/2023 1 EPHS CROSS COUNTRY EDCOUCH, TX. $3,445.00 $3,900.00 NO BID $3,600.00 $6,000.00 $4,846.20
7 8/10/2023 8/11/2023 1 CC WINN CROSS COUNTRY EDCOUCH, TX. $3,445.00 $3,900.00 NO BID $3,600.00 $6,000.00 $4,846.20
8 8/11/2023 | 8/11/2023 2 CC WINN FRESHMAN FOOTBALL | CARRIZO SPRINGS, TX. $3,380.00 $4,400.00 $5,450.00 $4,000.00 $5,700.00 $4,432.60

9 | 8/11/2023 | 8/11/2023 2 CC WINN JV FOOTBALL CARRIZO SPRINGS, TX. $3,380.00 $4,400.00 $5,450.00 $4,000.00 $5,700.00 $4,432.60
10 | 8/11/2023 | 8/11/2023 2 CC WINN VARSITY FOOTBALL CARRIZO SPRINGS, TX. $3,380.00 $4,400.00 NO BID $4,000.00 $5,700.00 $4,432.60
11 | 8/15/2023 | 8/15/2023 1 EPHS VOLLEYBALL LAREDO, TX. $1,820.00 $2,250.00 $3,500.00 $2,000.00 $3,000.00 $2,991.80
12 | 8/15/2023 | 8/15/2023 1 CC WINN VOLLEYBALL LAREDO, TX. $1,820.00 $2,250.00 $3,500.00 $2,000.00 $3,000.00 $2,991.80
13 | 8/17/2023 | 8/19/2023 1 CC WINN VOLLEYBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $2,145.00 $5,400.00 $5,800.00 $4,200.00 $5,200.00 $5,944.00
14 | 8/17/2023 | 8/18/2023 1 EPHS CROSS COUNTRY MCALLEN, TX. $3,445.00 $3,900.00 NO BID $3,600.00 $6,000.00 $4,897.90
15 | 8/17/2023 | 8/18/2023 1 CC WINN CROSS COUNTRY MCALLEN, TX. $3,445.00 $3,900.00 NO BID $3,600.00 $6,000.00 $4,897.90
16 | 8/18/2023 | 8/18/2023 2 CC WINN FRESHMAN FOOTBALL | CARRIZO SPRINGS, TX. $3,380.00 $4,400.00 NO BID $4,000.00 $5,700.00 $4,432.60
17 | 8/18/2023 | 8/18/2023 2 CC WINN JV FOOTBALL DELRIO, TX. $3,380.00 $4,400.00 $5,780.00 $3,600.00 $5,700.00 $4,639.40
18 | 8/18/2023 | 8/18/2023 2 CC WINN VARSITY FOOTBALL DEL RIO, TX. $3,380.00 $4,400.00 $5,780.00 $3,600.00 $5,700.00 $4,639.40
19 | 8/18/2023 | 8/19/2023 1 EPHS VOLLEYBALL FLORESVILLE, TX. $2,210.00 $3,750.00 $4,500.00 $3,400.00 $4,450.00 $4,096.00

| 20 | 8/22/2023 | 8/22/2023 1 EPHS VOLLEYBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $2,145.00 $2,100.00 $3,780.00 | $2,000.00 $3,200.00 $3,102.00
| 21 | 8/22/2023 | 8/22/2023 1 CC WINN VOLLEYBALL CARRIZO SPRINGS, TX. $1,690.00 $1,975.00 $2,520.00 $2,000.00 $2,850.00 $2,216.30
| 22 | 8/24/2023 | 8/26/2023 1 CC WINN VOLLEYBALL LAREDO, TX. $1,820.00 $6,000.00 $6,045.00 $4,200.00 $5,000.00 $5,944.00
| 23 | 8/25/2023 | 8/26/2023 1 EPHS VOLLEYBALL LAREDO, TX. $1,820.00 $4,400.00 $4,200.00 $3,400.00 $4,000.00 $4,096.00
| 24 | 8/25/2023 | 8/26/2023 2 EPHS CROSS COUNTRY ~ LAREDO, TX. $3,640.00 $8,800.00 $8,400.00 $6,400.00 $8,000.00 $8,192.00
25 | 8/25/2023 | 8/26/2023 2 CC WINN CROSS COUNTRY LAREDO, TX. $3,640.00 $8,800.00 NO BID $6,400.00 $8,000.00 $8,192.00

| 26 | 8/26/2023 | 8/26/2023 2 EPJH CROSS COUNTRY DEL RIO, TX. $3,380.00 $4,550.00 NO BID $6,000.00 $5,700.00 $4,639.40
27 | 8/26/2023 | 8/26/2023 2 MJH CROSS COUNTRY DEL RIO, TX. $3,380.00 $4,550.00 NO BID $6,000.00 $5,700.00 $4,639.40
28 | 8/26/2023 | 8/26/2023 2 EPHS JV CROSS COUNTRY DEL RIO, TX. $3,380.00 $4,550.00 NO BID $6,000.00 $5,700.00 $4,639.40
29 | 8/26/2023 | 8/26/2023 2 CC WINN JV CROSS COUNTRY DEL RIO, TX. $3,380.00 $4,550.00 NO BID $6,000.00 $5,700.00 $4,639.40

' 30 | 8/28/2023 | 8/28/2023 1 MJH VOLLEYBALL LAREDO, TX. $1,820.00 $2,300.00 $3,500.00 $2,000.00 $3,000.00 $2,991.80
| 31| 8/31/2023 | 8/31/2023 2 CC WINN FRESHMAN FOOTBALL UVALDE, TX. $3,380.00 $4,000.00 $5,370.00 $4,000.00 $5,700.00 $4,742.80
32 | 8/31/2023 | 8/31/2023 2 CC WINN JV FOOTBALL UVALDE, TX. $3,380.00 $4,400.00 $5,370.00 $4,000.00 $5,700.00 $4,742.80
33 9/1/2023 9/1/2023 1 EPHS CHEER & DANCE BOERNE, TX. $2,210.00 $3,575.00 NO BID $2,800.00 $3,550.00 $3,560.50
34 | 9/1/2023 9/1/2023 5 EPHS BAND BOERNE, TX. $11,050.00 NO BID NO BID $14,000.00 $17,750.00 $17,802.50
35 9/1/2023 9/1/2023 2 EPHS VARSITY FOOTBALL BOERNE, TX. $4,420.00 $3,575.00 NO BID $5,600.00 $7,100.00 $7,121.00
36 | 9/1/2023 9/2/2023 1 EPHS CROSS COUNTRY KERRVILLE, TX. $2,210.00 $7,200.00 NO BID $3,200.00 $4,400.00 $3,896.00
37 9/1/2023 9/2/2023 1 CC WINN CROSS COUNTRY KERRVILLE, TX. $2,210.00 $7,200.00 NO BID $3,200.00 $4,400.00 $3,896.00

| 38 9/2/2023 9/2/2023 1 EPHS VOLLEYBALL LAREDO, TX. $1,820.00 $2,900.00 NO BID $2,800.00 $3,000.00 $2,991.80
[ 39 19/2/2023 | 9/2/2023 1 CC WINN VOLLEYBALL LAREDO, TX. $1,820.00 $2,900.00 | NOBID * $2,800.00 $3,000.00 | $2,991.80
40 9/2/2023 9/2/2023 2 EPJH CROSS COUNTRY CRYSTAL CITY, TX. $3,380.00 NO BID NO BID $6,000.00 $5,700.00 $4,032.60

Please note shaded price denotes recommended vendor.
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EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 240103 - CHARTER BUS TRANSPORTATION SERVICES

TABULATION SHEET
RETURN # OF CHARTER SEASSIC IMPERIAL BUS| KERRVILLE REGENT
DATE OF TRIP DATE BUSES GROUP DESTINATION Elélgi:(l:\l:ﬁ COMPANY BUS OK TOURS R CHARTERS COACH

Kl Paso, TX San Antonlo, TX San Antonlo, TX San Antonlo, TX Laredo, TX San Antenlo, TX

41| 9/2/2023 | 9/2/2023 | 2 | MHCROSSCOUNTRY _ CRYSTAL CITY, TX. $3,380.00 NOBID | NOBID $6,000.00 $5,700.00 $4,032.60
42 9/2/2023 9/2/2023 2 EPHS JV CROSS COUNTRY CRYSTAL CITY, TX. $3,380.00 NO BID NO BID $6,000.00 $5,700.00 $4,032.60
43 | 9/2/2023 9/2/2023 2 CC WINN JV CROSS COUNTRY CRYSTAL CITY, TX. $3,380.00 NO BID NO BID $6,000.00 $5,700.00 $4,032.60
44 9/7/2023 9/7/2023 2 EPHS FRESHMAN FOOTBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $4,290.00 $5,200.00 NO BID $4,200.00 $6,400.00 $6,204.00
45 9/7/2023 9/7/2023 2 EPHS JV FOOTBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $4,290.00 NO BID NO BID $4,200.00 $6,400.00 $6,204.00

| 46 9/7/2023 9/7/2023 1 EPHS VOLLEYBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $2,145.00 $2,775.00 $3,730.00 $2,100.00 $3,200.00 $3,102.00
|47 | 9/7/2023 9/7/2023 1 MJH VOLLEYBALL DEL RIO, TX. $1,690.00 $2,375.00 $2,670.00 $2,100.00 $2,850.00 $2,319.70
48 9/8/2023 9/8/2023 1 EPHS CHEER & DANCE SAN ANTONIO, TX. $2,145.00 $3,500.00 NO BID $2,650.00 $3,200.00 $3,102.00
49 | 9/8/2023 9/8/2023 5 EPHS BAND SAN ANTONIO, TX. $10,725.00 NO BID NO BID $14,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,510.00
50 9/8/2023 9/8/2023 2 EPHS VARSITY FOOTBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $4,290.00 $7,000.00 NO BID $5,200.00 $6,400.00 $6,204.00
51| 9/8/2023 9/8/2023 1 CC WINN VOLLEYBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $2,145.00 NO BID NO BID $2,400.00 $3,200.00 $3,102.00

| 52 9/9/2023 9/9/2023 1 EPHS VOLLEYBALL SOMERSET, TX. $1,820.00 $2,875.00 $3,060.00 $2,700.00 $3,200.00 $3,095.20
| 53 | 9/11/2023 9/11/2023 1 EPJH VOLLEYBALL LAREDO, TX. $1,820.00 $2,585.00 $3,500.00 $2,200.00 $3,000.00 $2,991.80
54 | 9/11/2023 | 9/11/2023 1 MJH VOLLEYBALL DEL RIO, TX. $1,690.00 $2,175.00 $2,670.00 $1,800.00 $2,850.00 $2,319.70
55| 9/12/2023 | 9/12/2023 2 EPJH 7TH FOOTBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $4,290.00 $5,400.00 $7,000.00 $4,200.00 $6,400.00 $6,204.00
56 | 9/12/2023 | 9/12/2023 2 EPJH 8TH FOOTBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $4,290.00 $5,800.00 $7,000.00 $4,200.00 $6,400.00 $6,204.00
57 | 9/12/2023 9/12/2023 2 MJH 7TH FOOTBALL LAREDO, TX. $3,640.00 NO BID NO BID $4,200.00 $6,000.00 $5,983.60
58 | 9/12/2023 | 9/12/2023 2 MJH 8TH FOOTBALL LAREDO, TX. $3,640.00 NO BID NO BID $4,200.00 $6,000.00 $5,983.60
59 | 9/12/2023 | 9/12/2023 1 EPHS VOLLEYBALL CRYSTAL CITY, TX. $1,690.00 NO BID $2,550.00 $2,300.00 $2,850.00 $2,016.30
60 | 9/14/2023 | 9/14/2023 2 EPHS FRESHMAN FOOTBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $4,290.00 $5,400.00 NO BID $4,600.00 $6,400.00 $6,204.00
61 | 9/14/2023 | 9/14/2023 2 EPHS JV FOOTBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $4,290.00 NO BID NO BID $4,600.00 $6,400.00 $6,204.00
62 | 9/14/2023 9/14/2023 1 EPHS CHEER & DANCE ALICE, TX. $2,210.00 NO BID NO BID $2,300.00 $3,800.00 $3,612.20
63 | 9/14/2023 9/14/2023 5 EPHS BAND ALICE, TX. $11,050.00 NO BID $22,175.00 $14,000.00 $19,000.00 $18,061.00
64 | 9/14/2023 | 9/14/2023 2 EPHS VARSITY FOOTBALL ALICE, TX. $4,420.00 $6,000.00 NO BID $5,600.00 $7,600.00 $7,224.40
65 | 9/14/2023 | 9/14/2023 2 CC WINN FRESHMAN FOOTBALL LAREDO, TX. $3,640.00 NO BID NO BID $5,600.00 $6,000.00 $5,983.60
66 | 9/15/2023 | 9/15/2023 1 CC WINN CHEER & DANCE LAREDO, TX. $1,820.00 $2,800.00 NO BID $2,600.00 $3,000.00 $3,095.20
67 9/15/2023 9/15/2023 5 CC WINN BAND LAREDO, TX. $9,100.00 NO BID $18,925.00 $13,000.00 $14,000.00 $15,476.00
68 | 9/15/2023 | 9/15/2023 2 CC WINN VARSITY FOOTBALL LAREDO, TX. $3,640.00 $5,800.00 NO BID $5,200.00 $6,000.00 $6,190.40

| 69 | 9/15/2023 | 9/15/2023 1 CC WINN VOLLEYBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $2,145.00 NO BID NO BID $2,800.00 $3,200.00 $3,102.00
| 70 | 9/15/2023 | 9/16/2023 1 EPHS CROSS COUNTRY COLLEGE STATION, TX. $4,550.00 $6,000.00 NO BID $3,950.00 $6,300.00 $5,208.10
71 | 9/15/2023 | 9/16/2023 1 CC WINN CROSS COUNTRY COLLEGE STATION, TX. $4,550.00 NO BID NO BID $3,950.00 $6,300.00 $5,208.10
72 | 9/16/2023 | 9/16/2023 1 EPHS VOLLEYBALL LAREDO, TX. $1,820.00 $3,000.00 $3,785.00 $2,800.00 $3,000.00 $3,095.20
73 | 9/16/2023 | 9/16/2023 2 EPJH CROSS COUNTRY DILLEY, TX. $3,640.00 NO BID $6,600.00 $5,600.00 $6,000.00 $5,311.50
74 | 9/16/2023 9/16/2023 2 MJH CROSS COUNTRY DILLEY, TX. $3,640.00 NO BID $6,600.00 $5,600.00 $6,000.00 $5,311.50

| 75| 9/16/2023 | 9/16/2023 2 EPHS JV CROSS COUNTRY DILLEY, TX. $3,640.00 $4,600.00 NO BID $5,600.00 $6,000.00 $5,311.50
76 | 9/16/2023 | 9/16/2023 2 CC WINN JV CROSS COUNTRY DILLEY, TX. $3,640.00 NO BID NO BID $5,600.00 $6,000.00 $5,311.50

| 77 | 9/18/2023 9/18/2023 1 EPJH VOLLEYBALL DEL RIO, TX. $1,690.00 $2,100.00 $2,670.00 $1,900.00 $2,850.00 $2,319.70
78 | 9/19/2023 9/19/2023 2 MJH 7TH FOOTBALL LAREDO, TX. $3,640.00 $5,200.00 $7,000.00 $4,000.00 $6,000.00 $6,190.40

79 | 9/19/2023 | 9/19/2023 2  MJHS8THFOOTBALL _ LAREDO,TX. $3,640.00 ~ NOBID | $7,000.00 | $4,000.00 | $6,000.00 - $6,190.40

80 | 9/20/2023 | 9/20/2023 2 EPHS FRESHMAN FOOTBALL SAN MARCOS, TX. $4,680.00 $6,400.00 $9,300.00 $5,000.00 $7,800.00 $7,431.20

Please note shaded price denotes recommended vendor.
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EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 240103 - CHARTER BUS TRANSPORTATION SERVICES

TABULATION SHEET
RETURN # OF CHARTER CESIC IMPERIAL BUS| KERRVILLE REGENT
DATE OF TRIP DATE BUSES GROUP DESTINATION Elg:’:i:g::ﬁ COMPANY BUS OK TOURS | R CHARTERS COACH
ElPaso, TX San Antonlo, TX San Antonlo, TX San Antonlo, TX Laredo, TX San Antonio, TX.
81 | 9/20/2023 | 9/20/2023 2 EPHS JV FOOTBALL SAN MARCOS, TX. ~ $4,680.00 NO BID NO BID $5,000.00 $7,800.00 $7,431.20

| 82 | 9/20/2023 | 9/20/2023 2 CC WINN JV FOOTBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $4,290.00 $5,200.00 $7,000.00 $5,000.00 $6,400.00 $6,204.00
83 | 9/22/2023 | 9/22/2023 1 CC WINN VOLLEYBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $2,145.00 $2,700.00 $4,045.00 $2,650.00 $3,200.00 $3,102.00
84 | 9/23/2023 | 9/23/2023 1. EPHS VOLLEYBALL LAREDO, TX. $1,820.00 $2,675.00 $3,785.00 $2,650.00 $3,000.00 $2,991.80
85 | 9/23/2023 | 9/23/2023 2 EPHS CROSS COUNTRY CASTROVILLE, TX. $3,640.00 $5,350.00 $7,365.00 $5,600.00 $6,400.00 $5,880.20
86 | 9/23/2023 | 9/23/2023 2 CC WINN CROSS COUNTRY CASTROVILLE, TX. $3,640.00 NO BID $7,305.00 $5,600.00 $6,400.00 $5,880.20
87 | 9/23/2023 | 9/23/2023 2 EPJH CROSS COUNTRY CASTROVILLE, TX. $3,640.00 NO BID NO BID $5,600.00 $6,400.00 $5,880.20

| 88 | 9/23/2023 | 9/23/2023 2 MJH CROSS COUNTRY CASTROVILLE, TX. $3,640.00 NO BID NO BID $5,600.00 $6,400.00 $5,880.20
| 89 | 9/26/2023 | 9/26/2023 1 EPHS VOLLEYBALL LAREDO, TX. $1,820.00 $2,600.00 $3,500.00 $2,100.00 $3,000.00 $2,991.80
90 | 9/27/2023 | 9/27/2023 2 MJH 7TH FOOTBALL CARRIZO SPRINGS, TX. $3,380.00 $4,200.00 $5,040.00 $4,000.00 $5,700.00 $4,432.60
91 | 9/28/2023 | 9/28/2023 2 CC WINN FRESHMAN FOOTBALL CASTROVILLE, TX. $3,640.00 $5,400.00 $6,680.00 $4,400.00 $6,400.00 $5,880.20
92 | 9/28/2023 | 9/28/2023 1 EPJH VOLLEYBALL LAREDO, TX. $1,820.00 $2,700.00 $3,500.00 $2,400.00 $3,000.00 $2,991.80
93 | 9/29/2023 | 9/29/2023 1 CC WINN CHEER & DANCE CASTROVILLE, TX. $1,820.00 NO BID $3,682.00 $2,700.00 $3,200.00 $2,940.10
94 | 9/29/2023 | 9/29/2023 5 CC WINN BAND CASTROVILLE, TX. $9,100.00 NO BID NO BID $16,000.00 $16,000.00 $14,700.50

| 95 | 9/29/2023 | 9/29/2023 2 CC WINN VARSITY FOOTBALL CASTROVILLE, TX. $3,640.00 $6,600.00 $7,362.00 $6,400.00 $6,400.00 $5,880.20
96 | 9/29/2023 | 9/29/2023 1 CC WINN VOLLEYBALL CASTROVILLE, TX. $1,820.00 NO BID $3,682.00 $2,800.00 $3,200.00 $2,940.10
97 | 9/30/2023 | 9/30/2023 2 EPHS CROSS COUNTRY UVALDE, TX. $3,380.00 $4,550.00 $5,780.00 $5,600.00 $5,700.00 $4,742.80
98 | 9/30/2023 | 9/30/2023 2 CC WINN CROSS COUNTRY UVALDE, TX. $3,380.00 NO BID $5,780.00 $5,600.00 $5,700.00 $4,742.80
99 | 9/30/2023 | 9/30/2023 2 EPJH CROSS COUNTRY UVALDE, TX. $3,380.00 NO BID NO BID $5,600.00 $5,700.00 $4,742.80
100| 9/30/2023 | 9/30/2023 | 2 MJHCROSSCOUNTRY | UVALDE, TX. $3,380.00 NO BID NO BID $5,600.00 $5,700.00 $4,742.80
101| 10/3/2023 | 10/3/2023 1 EPHS VOLLEYBALL LAREDO, TX. $1,820.00 $2,400.00 $3,500.00 $2,200.00 $3,000.00 $2,991.80
102| 10/4/2023 | 10/4/2023 2 EPJH 7TH FOOTBALL LAREDO, TX. $3,640.00 $5,200.00 $7,000.00 $4,400.00 $6,000.00 $5,983.60
1103| 10/4/2023 | 10/4/2023 2. EPJH 8TH FOOTBALL LAREDO, TX. $3,640.00 $5,200.00 NO BID $4,400.00 $6,000.00 $5,983.60
104| 10/4/2023 | 10/4/2023 2 MJH 7TH FOOTBALL DEL RIO, TX. $3,380.00 $4,400.00 $5,340.00 $4,400.00 $5,700.00 $4,639.40
105| 10/5/2023 | 10/5/2023 2 CC WINN JV FOOTBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $4,290.00 $5,550.00 $7,460.00 $4,400.00 $6,400.00 $6,204.00
106| 10/6/2023 | 10/6/2023 1 EPHS CHEER & DANCE LAREDO, TX. $1,820.00 $3,200.00 NO BID $3,200.00 $3,000.00 $2,991.80
107| 10/6/2023 10/6/2023 5 EPHS BAND LAREDO, TX. $9,100.00 NO BID $18,925.00 $16,000.00 $14,000.00 $14,959.00
1108| 10/6/2023 10/6/2023 2 EPHS VARSITY FOOTBALL LAREDO, TX. $3,640.00 $6,000.00 NO BID $6,400.00 $6,000.00 $5,983.60
1109| 10/6/2023 | 10/6/2023 1 CC WINN VOLLEYBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $2,145.00 NO BID NO BID $3,200.00 $3,200.00 $3,102.00
|110| 10/10/2023 | 10/10/2023 2 MJH 8TH FOOTBALL UVALDE, TX. $3,380.00 $4,370.00 $5,340.00 $4,000.00 $5,700.00 $4,742.80
111| 10/11/2023 | 10/11/2023 2 EPJH 7TH FOOTBALL LAREDO, TX. $3,640.00 $4,950.00 $7,000.00 $4,400.00 $6,000.00 $5,983.60
112| 10/11/2023 | 10/11/2023 2 EPJH 8TH FOOTBALL LAREDO, TX. $3,640.00 $4,950.00 $7,000.00 $4,400.00 $6,000.00 $5,983.60
113| 10/12/2023 | 10/12/2023 2 CC WINN FRESHMAN FOOTBALL LAREDO, TX. $3,640.00 $4,950.00 $7,000.00 $4,600.00 $6,000.00 $5,983.60
114| 10/12/2023 |10/12/2023 2 CC WINN JV FOOTBALL LAREDO, TX. $3,640.00 $4,950.00 $7,000.00 $4,600.00 $6,000.00 $5,983.60
115| 10/13/2023 | 10/13/2023 1 EPHS CHEER & DANCE LAREDO, TX. $1,820.00 $3,400.00 NO BID $2,800.00 $3,000.00 $2,991.80
|116| 10/13/2023 |10/13/2023 5 EPHS BAND LAREDO, TX. $9,100.00 NO BID $18,925.00 $16,000.00 $14,000.00 $14,959.00
117| 10/13/2023 | 10/13/2023 2 EPHS VARSITY FOOTBALL LAREDO, TX. $3,640.00 $6,775.00 NO BID $5,600.00 $6,000.00 $5,983.60
118| 10/13/2023 | 10/13/2023 1 CC WINN CHEER & DANCE LAREDO, TX. $1,820.00 NO BID NO BID $2,800.00 $3,000.00 $2,991.80
119 10/13/2023 | 10/13/2023 5 CC WINN BAND LAREDO, TX. $9,100.00 NO BID NO BID $16,000.00 $14,000.00 $14,959.00

1120 10/13/2023 | 10/13/2023 2 CC WINN VARSITY FOOTBALL LAREDO, TX. $3,640.00 NO BID NO BID $6,400.00 $6,000.00 $5,983.60
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EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 240103 - CHARTER BUS TRANSPORTATION SERVICES

TABULATION SHEET
RETURN # OF CHARTER (AR IMPERIAL BUS| KERRVILLE REGENT
DATE OF TRIP DATE BUSES GROUP DESTINATION EI&I;I)GAACI‘:'CE COMPANY. BUS OKTOURS | RCHARTERS COACH
ElPaso, TX San Antonlo, TX. San Antonfo, TX San Antonlo, TX. Laredo, TX San Antonio, TX
1121| 10/13/2023 | 10/13/2023 1 CC WINN VOLLEYBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $2,145.00 NO BID NO BID $3,100.00 $3,200.00 $3,102.00
122| 10/13/2023 | 10/13/2023 2 EPHS CROSS COUNTRY TBA NO BID NO BID NO BID $6,200.00 NO BID NO BID
123| 10/13/2023 | 10/13/2023 2 CC WINN CROSS COUNTRY TBA NO BID NO BID NO BID $6,200.00 NO BID NO BID
124 10/17/2023 | 10/17/2023 2 MJH 7TH FOOTBALL UVALDE, TX. $3,380.00 $4,400.00 $5,340.00 $4,000.00 $5,700.00 $4,742.80
125| 10/17/2023 | 10/17/2023 1 EPHS VOLLEYBALL LAREDO, TX. $1,820.00 $2,600.00 $3,500.00 $2,200.00 $3,000.00 $2,991.80
126| 10/18/2023 | 10/18/2023 2 EPHS FRESHMAN FOOTBALL LAREDO, TX. $3,640.00 $4,900.00 $7,000.00 $4,400.00 $6,000.00 $5,983.60
127| 10/18/2023 | 10/18/2023 2 EPHS JV FOOTBALL LAREDO, TX. $3,640.00 $4,900.00 $7,000.00 $4,400.00 $6,000.00 $5,983.60
|128| 10/19/2023 | 10/19/2023 2 EPJH 7TH FOOTBALL DEL RIO, TX. $3,380.00 $4,400.00 $5,340.00 $4,000.00 $5,700.00 $4,639.40
[129] 10/19/2023 | 10/19/2023 2 EPJH 8TH FOOTBALL DEL RIO, TX. $3,380.00 $4,600.00 $5,340.00 $4,000.00 $5,700.00 $4,639.40
1130 10/19/2023 | 10/19/2023 2 CC WINN JV FOOTBALL VON ORMY, TX. $3,640.00 NO BID NO BID $5,200.00 $3,200.00 $6,345.50
131| 10/20/2023 | 10/20/2023 1 CC WINN VOLLEYBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $2,145.00 $2,775.00 $3,730.00 $2,800.00 $3,200.00 $3,102.00
132| 10/23/2023 | 10/24/2023 1 EPHS CROSS COUNTRY CORPUS CHRISTI, TX. $2,730.00 $4,700.00 $5,100.00 $3,800.00 $5,100.00 $4,174.10
133| 10/23/2023 | 10/24/2023 1 CC WINN CROSS COUNTRY CORPUS CHRISTI, TX. $2,730.00 $4,700.00 $5,100.00 $3,800.00 $5,100.00 $4,174.10
1134 | 10/24/2023 | 10/24/2023 2 MJH 8TH FOOTBALL DEL RIO, TX. $3,380.00 $4,395.00 $5,340.00 $4,000.00 $5,700.00 $4,639.40
135 10/24/2023 | 10/24/2023 1 EPHS VOLLEYBALL DELRIO, TX. $1,690.00 $2,200.00 $2,670.00 $1,900.00 $5,700.00 $2,319.70
136| 10/26/2023 | 10/26/2023 2 EPJH 7TH FOOTBALL UVALDE, TX. $3,380.00 $4,400.00 $5,340.00 $5,600.00 $5,700.00 $4,742.80
137| 10/26/2023 | 10/26/2023 2 EPJH 8TH FOOTBALL UVALDE, TX. $3,380.00 $4,600.00 $5,340.00 $5,600.00 $5,700.00 $4,742.80
1138 10/26/2023 | 10/26/2023 2 CC WINN FRESHMAN FOOTBALL LAREDO, TX. $3,640.00 $5,350.00 NO BID $5,600.00 $6,000.00 $5,983.60
|139| 10/27/2023 | 10/27/2023 1 EPHS CHEER & DANCE LAREDO, TX. $1,820.00 $3,300.00 NO BID $3,200.00 $3,000.00 $2,991.80
140| 10/27/2023 | 10/27/2023 5 B EPHS BAND LAREDO, TX. $9,100.00 NO BID $18,925.00 $16,000.00 $14,000.00 $14,959.00
141| 10/27/2023 | 10/27/2023 2 EPHS VARSITY FOOTBALL LAREDO, TX. $3,640.00 $3,300.00 NO BID $6,400.00 $6,000.00 $5,983.60
142| 10/27/2023 | 10/27/2023 1 CC WINN CHEER & DANCE LAREDO, TX. $1,820.00 NO BID NO BID $3,200.00 $3,000.00 $2,991.80
143 | 10/27/2023 | 10/27/2023 5 CC WINN BAND LAREDO, TX. $9,100.00 NO BID NO BID $16,000.00 $14,000.00 $14,959.00
144 | 10/27/2023 | 10/27/2023 2 CC WINN VARSITY FOOTBALL LAREDO, TX. $3,640.00 NO BID NO BID $6,400.00 $6,000.00 $5,983.60
145| 11/1/2023 | 11/1/2023 2 EPHS FRESHMAN FOOTBALL DEL RIO, TX. $3,380.00 $4,395.00 $5,340.00 $4,000.00 $5,700.00 $4,639.40
|146| 11/1/2023 11/1/2023 2 EPHS JV FOOTBALL DELRIO, TX. $3,380.00 $4,550.00 $5,340.00 $4,000.00 $5,700.00 $4,639.40
1147| 11/2/2023 11/2/2023 2 CC WINN JV FOOTBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $4,290.00 $5,150.00 $7,560.00 $5,400.00 $6,400.00 $6,204.00
148| 11/3/2023 | 11/4/2023 1 EPHS CROSS COUNTRY ROUND ROCK, TX. $2,925.00 $6,000.00 $5,900.00 NO BID $5,350.00 $4,096.00
149| 11/3/2023 | 11/4/2023 1 CC WINN CROSS COUNTRY ROUND ROCK, TX. $2,925.00 $6,000.00 $5,900.00 NO BID $5,350.00 $4,096.00
150| 11/10/2023 | 11/10/2023 1 EPHS CHEER & DANCE SAN ANTONIO, TX. $2,145.00 $3,200.00 NO BID NO BID $3,200.00 $3,102.00
151| 11/10/2023 | 11/10/2023 5 EPHS BAND SAN ANTONIO, TX. $10,725.00 NO BID $20,225.00 NO BID $15,000.00 $15,510.00
152| 11/10/2023 | 11/10/2023 2 EPHS VARSITY FOOTBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $4,290.00 $3,200.00 NO BID NO BID $6,400.00 $6,204.00
153| 11/10/2023 | 11/10/2023 1 CC WINN CHEER & DANCE SAN ANTONIO, TX. $2,145.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $3,200.00 $3,102.00
|154| 11/10/2023 | 11/10/2023 5 CC WINN BAND SAN ANTONIO, TX. $10,725.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $15,000.00 $15,510.00
155| 11/10/2023 | 11/10/2023 2 CC WINN VARSITY FOOTBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $4,290.00 $6,400.00 NO BID NO BID $6,400.00 $6,204.00
156| 11/11/2023 | 11/11/2023 1 EPHS CHEER & DANCE SAN ANTONIO, TX. $2,145.00 $3,200.00 NO BID NO BID $3,200.00 $3,102.00
157| 11/11/2023 | 11/11/2023 5 EPHS BAND SAN ANTONIO, TX. $10,725.00 NO BID $20,225.00 NO BID $15,000.00 $15,510.00
158| 11/11/2023 | 11/11/2023 2 EPHS VARSITY FOOTBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $4,290.00 $6,500.00 NO BID NO BID $6,400.00 $6,204.00
159| 11/11/2023 |11/11/2023 | 1 CC WINN CHEER & DANCE SAN ANTONIO, TX. $2,145.00 NOBID | NOBID NO BID $3,200.00 $3,102.00
160| 11/11/2023 |11/11/2023 5 CC WINN BAND SAN ANTONIO, TX. $10,725.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $15,000.00 $15,510.00
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EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 240103 - CHARTER BUS TRANSPORTATION SERVICES

TABULATION SHEET
RETURN # OF CHARTER Gssre IMPERIAL BUS| KERRVILLE REGENT
DATE OF TRIP DATE BUSES GROUP DESTINATION Elgg;:chfE COMPANY BUS OKTOURS | R CHARTERS COACH
ElPaso, TX San Antonfo, TX San Antonlo, TX. San Antonlo, TX Laredo, TX San Antonio, TX
|161| 11/11/2023 | 11/11/2023 2 CC WINN VARSITY FOOTBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $4,290.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $6,400.00 $6,204.00
|162| 11/17/2023 | 11/17/2023 1 EPHS CHEER & DANCE SAN ANTONIO, TX. $2,145.00 $3,200.00 NO BID NO BID $3,200.00 $3,102.00
|163| 11/17/2023 | 11/17/2023 5 EPHS BAND SAN ANTONIO, TX. $10,725.00 NO BID $20,225.00 NO BID $15,000.00 $15,510.00
164| 11/17/2023 | 11/17/2023 2 EPHS VARSITY FOOTBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $4,290.00 $6,500.00 NO BID NO BID $6,400.00 $6,204.00
165| 11/17/2023 | 11/17/2023 1 CC WINN CHEER & DANCE SAN ANTONIO, TX. $2,145.00 $3,300.00 NO BID NO BID $3,200.00 $3,102.00
166| 11/17/2023 | 11/17/2023 5 CC WINN BAND SAN ANTONIO, TX. $10,725.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $15,000.00 $15,510.00
167 | 11/17/2023 | 11/17/2023 2 CC WINN VARSITY FOOTBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $4,290.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $6,400.00 $6,204.00
168| 11/18/2023 | 11/18/2023 1 EPHS CHEER & DANCE SAN ANTONIO, TX. $2,145.00 $3,200.00 NO BID NO BID $3,200.00 $3,102.00
169 | 11/18/2023 | 11/18/2023 5 EPHS BAND SAN ANTONIO, TX. $10,725.00 NO BID $20,225.00 NO BID $15,000.00 $15,510.00
170 11/18/2023 | 11/18/2023 2 EPHS VARSITY FOOTBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $4,290.00 $6,500.00 NO BID NO BID $6,400.00 $6,204.00
171| 11/18/2023 | 11/18/2023 1 CC WINN CHEER & DANCE SAN ANTONIO, TX. $2,145.00 $3,350.00 NO BID NO BID $3,200.00 $3,102.00
172| 11/18/2023 |11/18/2023 5 CC WINN BAND SAN ANTONIO, TX. $10,725.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $15,000.00 $15,510.00
173| 11/18/2023 | 11/18/2023 2 CC WINN VARSITY FOOTBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $4,290.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $6,400.00 $6,204.00
174| 11/24/2023 |11/24/2023 1 EPHS CHEER & DANCE SAN ANTONIO, TX. $2,145.00 $3,300.00 NO BID NO BID $3,200.00 $3,102.00
175| 11/24/2023 | 11/24/2023 5 EPHS BAND SAN ANTONIO, TX. $10,725.00 NO BID $20,225.00 NO BID $15,000.00 $15,510.00
176| 11/24/2023 |11/24/2023 2 EPHS VARSITY FOOTBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $4,290.00 $6,000.00 NO BID NO BID $6,400.00 $6,204.00
1177 11/25/2023 | 11/25/2023 i CC WINN CHEER & DANCE SAN ANTONIO, TX. $2,145.00 $3,300.00 NO BID NO BID $3,200.00 $3,102.00
[178| 11/25/2023 | 11/25/2023 5 CC WINN BAND SAN ANTONIO, TX. $10,725.00 NO BID $20,225.00 NO BID $15,000.00 $15,510.00
\‘ 179| 11/25/2023 | 11/25/2023 2 CC WINN VARSITY FOOTBALL SAN ANTONIO, TX. $4,290.00 $6,000.00 NO BID NO BID $6,400.00 $6,204.00
1180

Approval:

Mr. Samuel Mijares, Su

perintendent of Schools
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