Name of Bidder
Quanity Description CONTRACT PAPER GROU PAPER EXPRESS ENTRAL MICHIGAN PAPE XPEDEX
60# 11 x 17 Offset  |16.82/33,640.00  |14.55/29,100.00 |14.81/29,640.00 |15.00/30,000.00
2000M |White
60# 8.5 x 11 Offset  |7.376/2,950.47 6.70/2,680.00 7.13/2,852.00 7.25/2,900.00
400M |White
60# 11 x 17 Offset  |18.50/1,850.00 NO BID 18.45/1,845.00 18.45/1,845.00
100M |Blue
60# 11 x 17 Offset  |18.50/1,850.00 NO BID 18.45/1,845.00 18.45/1,845.00
100M |Yellow
67# 11 x 17 Pink 33.56/1,678.00 NO BID 31.92/1,596.00 32.90/1,646.00
50M  |Vellum
67# 11 X 17 Blue 33.56/1.675.00 NO BID 31.92/1,596.00 32.90/1,646.00
50M  |Vellum
67# 11 X 17 Yellow
50M  |Vellum 33.56/1,678.00 NO BID 31.92/1,596.00 32.90/1,646.00
67# 11 X 17 Green
50M  |Vellum 33.56/1,678.00 NO BID 31.92/1,596.00 32.90/1,646.00
65# 11 X 17 Terra
25M |Green Cover 48.64/1,216.00 NO BID 47.02/1,175.50 48.00/1,200.00
65# 11 X 17 Re-Entry
25M  |Red Cover 48.64/1,216.00 NO BID 47.02/1,175.50 48.00/1,200.00
65# 11 X 17 Orbit
25M |Orange Cover 48.64/1,216.00 NO BID 47.02/1,175.50 48.00/1,200.00
65# 11 X 17 Neptune
25M  |Blue/Aqua Cover 48.64/1,216.00 NO BID AQUA 45.40/1,135|48.00/1,200.00
Grand Total $51,866.40 $31,780.00 $47,227.50 $47,974.00
Sworn and Notarized Familial
Disclosure Statement YES YES YES YES
Identification of Reponsibility COMPLETE COMPLETE COMPLETE COMPLETE
Vendor Profile COMPLETE COMPLETE COMPLETE COMPLETE
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