
Boston, MA
Line Description QTY UOM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended

1

COLOR COPY PAPER; 8 
1/2 X 11; PASTEL; 20 
LB.; COST FOR 1-39 
CTNS 1 RM $3.75 $3.75 $4.16 $4.16 $3.69 $3.69 $3.95 $3.95

2

COLOR COPY PAPER; 8 
1/2 X 11; PASTEL; 20 
LB.; COST FOR 40+ 
CTNS (PALLET) 1 RM $3.75 $3.75 $3.92 $3.92 $3.59 $3.59 $3.80 $3.80

3

COLOR COPY PAPER; 8 
1/2 X 14; PASTEL; 20 
LB.; COST FOR 1-39 
CTNS 1 RM $5.18 $5.18 $5.61 $5.61 $4.89 $4.89 $5.25 $5.25

4

COLOR COPY PAPER; 8 
1/2 X 14; PASTEL; 20 
LB.; COST FOR 40+ 
CTNS (PALLET) 1 RM $5.18 $5.18 $5.28 $5.28 $4.47 $4.47 $5.14 $5.14

5

COLOR COPY PAPER; 
11 X 17; PASTEL; 20 
LB.; COST FOR 1-39 
CTNS 1 RM $8.03 $8.03 $8.82 $8.82 $7.69 $7.69 $8.26 $8.26

6

COLOR COPY PAPER; 
11 X 17; PASTEL; 20 
LB.; COST FOR 40+ 
CTNS (PALLET) 1 RM $8.03 $8.03 $8.30 $8.30 $7.19 $7.19 $8.08 $8.08

7

COLOR COPY PAPER; 8 
1/2 X 11; PASTEL; 67 
LB.; COST FOR 1-39 
CTNS 1 RM $4.35 $4.35 $4.53 $4.53 $4.81 $4.81 no bid

8

COLOR COPY PAPER; 8 
1/2 X 11; PASTEL; 67 
LB.; COST FOR 40+ 
CTNS (PALLET) 1 RM $4.35 $4.35 $4.26 $4.26 $4.45 $4.45 no bid

9

COLOR COPY PAPER; 8 
1/2 X 14; PASTEL; 67 
LB.; COST FOR 1-39 
CTNS 1 RM $6.30 $6.30 no bid no bid no bid

10

COLOR COPY PAPER; 8 
1/2 X 14; PASTEL; 67 
LB.; COST FOR 40+ 
CTNS (PALLET) 1 RM $6.30 $6.30 no bid no bid no bid

11

COLOR COPY PAPER; 
11 X 17; PASTEL; 67 
LB.; COST FOR 1-39 
CTNS 1 RM $9.15 $9.15 $9.55 $9.55 no bid no bid

12

COLOR COPY PAPER; 
11 X 17; PASTEL; 67 
LB.; COST FOR 40+ 
CTNS (PALLET) 1 RM $9.15 $9.15 $8.99 $8.99 no bid no bid

13

COLOR COPY PAPER; 8 
1/2 X 11; NEON; 20 
LB.; COST FOR 1-39 
CTNS 1 RM $6.40 $6.40 $5.48 $5.48 $5.20 $5.20 no bid

14

COLOR COPY PAPER; 8 
1/2 X 11; NEON; 20 
LB.; COST FOR 40+ 
CTNS (PALLET) 1 RM $6.40 $6.40 $5.15 $5.15 $4.75 $4.75 no bid

15

COLOR COPY PAPER; 8 
1/2 X 14; NEON; 60 
LB.; COST FOR 1-39 
CTNS 1 RM $9.25 $9.25 $8.92 $8.92 no bid no bid
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16

COLOR COPY PAPER; 8 
1/2 X 14; NEON; 60 
LB.; COST FOR 40+ 
CTNS (PALLET) 1 RM $9.25 $9.25 $8.39 $8.39 no bid no bid

17
COLOR COPY PAPER; 
11 X 17; NEON; 60 LB.; 
COST FOR 1-39 CTNS 1 RM $13.35 $13.35 $14.03 $14.03 no bid no bid

18

COLOR COPY PAPER; 
11 X 17; NEON; 60 LB.; 
COST FOR 40+ CTNS 
(PALLET) 1 RM $13.35 $13.35 $13.20 $13.20 no bid no bid

19

COLOR COPY PAPER; 8 
1/2 X 11; NEON; 65 
LB.; COST FOR 1-39 
CTNS 1 RM $6.50 $6.50 $6.94 $6.94 $7.42 $7.42 no bid

20

COLOR COPY PAPER; 8 
1/2 X 11; NEON; 65 
LB.; COST FOR 40+ 
CTNS (PALLET) 1 RM $6.50 $6.50 $6.53 $6.53 $6.89 $6.89 no bid

21

COLOR COPY PAPER; 8 
1/2 X 14; NEON; 65 
LB.; COST FOR 1-39 
CTNS 1 RM $9.35 $9.35 no bid no bid no bid

22

COLOR COPY PAPER; 8 
1/2 X 14; NEON; 65 
LB.; COST FOR 40+ 
CTNS (PALLET) 1 RM $9.35 $9.35 no bid no bid no bid

23
COLOR COPY PAPER; 
11 X 17; NEON; 65 LB.; 
COST FOR 1-39 CTNS 1 RM $13.50 $13.50 $13.88 $13.88 no bid no bid

24

COLOR COPY PAPER; 
11 X 17; NEON; 65 LB.; 
COST FOR 40+ CTNS 
(PALLET) 1 RM $13.50 $13.50 $13.06 $13.06 no bid no bid

25
WHITE COPY PAPER; 8 
1/2 X 11; 20 LB.; COST 
FOR 1-39 CTNS 1 RM $2.73 $2.73 $3.03 $3.03 $2.667 $2.667 $2.55 $2.55

26

WHITE COPY PAPER; 8 
1/2 X 11; 20 LB.; COST 
FOR 40+ CTNS 
(PALLET) 1 RM $2.73 $2.73 $2.86 $2.86 $2.475 $2.475 $2.45 $2.45

27
WHITE COPY PAPER; 8 
1/2 X 14; 20 LB.; COST 
FOR 1-39 CTNS 1 RM $3.72 $3.72 $4.49 $4.49 $3.797 $3.797 $3.51 $3.51

28

WHITE COPY PAPER; 8 
1/2 X 14; 20 LB.; COST 
FOR 40+ CTNS 
(PALLET) 1 RM $3.72 $3.72 $4.23 $4.23 $3.624 $3.624 $3.38 $3.38

29
WHITE COPY PAPER; 
11 X 17; 20 LB.; COST 
FOR 1-39 CTNS 1 RM $5.85 $5.85 $7.07 $7.07 $6.158 $6.158 $5.51 $5.51

30

WHITE COPY PAPER; 
11 X 17; 20 LB.; COST 
FOR 40+ CTNS 
(PALLET) 1 RM $5.85 $5.85 $6.65 $6.65 $5.85 $5.85 $5.38 $5.38

31
WHITE COPY PAPER; 8 
1/2 X 11; 67 LB.; COST 
FOR 1-39 CTNS 1 RM $4.12 $4.12 $4.29 $4.29 $3.59 $3.59 no bid
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32

WHITE COPY PAPER; 8 
1/2 X 11; 67 LB.; COST 
FOR 40+ CTNS 
(PALLET) 1 RM $4.12 $4.12 $4.03 $4.03 $3.39 $3.39 no bid

33
WHITE COPY PAPER; 8 
1/2 X 14; 67 LB.; COST 
FOR 1-39 CTNS 1 RM $6.00 $6.00 $5.77 $5.77 no bid no bid

34

WHITE COPY PAPER; 8 
1/2 X 14; 67 LB.; COST 
FOR 40+ CTNS 
(PALLET) 1 RM $6.00 $6.00 $5.43 $5.43 no bid no bid

35
WHITE COPY PAPER; 
11 X 17; 67 LB.; COST 
FOR 1-39 CTNS 1 RM $8.70 $8.70 $9.06 $9.06 $8.99 $8.99 no bid

36

WHITE COPY PAPER; 
11 X 17; 67 LB.; COST 
FOR 40+ CTNS 
(PALLET) 1 RM $8.70 $8.70 $8.53 $8.53 $8.29 $8.29 no bid

37

WHITE COPY PAPER; 8 
1/2 X 11; 3-HOLE 
PUNCH; 20 LB.; COST 
FOR 1-39 CTNS 1 RM $2.93 $2.93 $3.53 $3.53 $3.082 $3.082 $2.85 $2.85

38

WHITE COPY PAPER; 8 
1/2 X 11; 3-HOLE 
PUNCH; 20 LB.; COST 
FOR 40+ CTNS 
(PALLET) 1 RM $2.93 $2.93 $3.33 $3.33 $2.932 $2.932 $2.65 $2.65

39

WHITE COPY PAPER; 8 
1/2 X 11; 20 LB.; COST 
FOR 1-39 CTNS; LOW 
PACKED CARTON @ 5 
REAMS (2,500 SHEETS 
IN CARTON) 1 RM $3.00 $3.00 $3.69 $3.69 $3.184 $3.184 $3.35 $3.35

40

WHITE COPY PAPER; 8 
1/2 X 11; 20 LB.; COST 
FOR 40+ CTNS 
(PALLET); LOW 
PACKED CARTON @ 5 1 RM $3.00 $3.00 $3.47 $3.47 $2.958 $2.958 $3.16 $3.16

41

WHITE COPY PAPER; 8 
1/2 X 11; 20 LB.; COST 
FOR 1-39 CTNS  
Georgia Pacicic G19-
999705LA 1 RM no bid no bid $3.214 $3.214 $2.65 $2.65

42

WHITE COPY PAPER; 8 
1/2 X 11; 20 LB.; COST 
FOR 40+ CTNS 
(PALLET)                                 
Georgia Pacific G19-
999705LA 1 RM no bid no bid $2.919 $2.919 $2.45 $2.45

43

RECYCLED WHITE 
COPY PAPER; 8 1/2 X 
11; 20 LB.; COST FOR 
1-39 CTNS 1 RM $3.23 $3.23 no bid $3.063 $3.063 $3.49 $3.49

44

RECYCLED WHITE 
COPY PAPER; 8 1/2 X 
11; 20 LB.; COST FOR 
40+ CTNS (PALLET) 1 RM $3.23 $3.23 $3.71 $3.71 $2.87 $2.87 $3.38 $3.38

45

RECYCLED WHITE 
COPY PAPER; 8 1/2 X 
14; 20 LB.; COST FOR 
1-39 CTNS 1 RM $4.32 $4.32 no bid $4.189 $4.189 $4.75 $4.75
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46

RECYCLED WHITE 
COPY PAPER; 8 1/2 X 
14; 20 LB.; COST FOR 
40+ CTNS (PALLET) 1 RM $4.32 $4.32 $5.02 $5.02 $3.92 $3.92 $4.48 $4.48

47

RECYCLED WHITE 
COPY PAPER; 11 X 17; 
20 LB.; COST FOR 1-39 
CTNS 1 RM $7.00 $7.00 no bid $5.924 $5.924 $7.47 $7.47

48

RECYCLED WHITE 
COPY PAPER; 11 X 17; 
20 LB.; COST FOR 40+ 
CTNS (PALLET) 1 RM $7.00 $7.00 $7.88 $7.88 $5.514 $5.514 $7.05 $7.05

49

RECYCLED WHITE 
COPY PAPER; 8 1/2 X 
11; 67 LB.; COST FOR 
1-39 CTNS 1 RM no bid $4.29 $4.29 no bid no bid

50

RECYCLED WHITE 
COPY PAPER; 8 1/2 X 
11; 67 LB.; COST FOR 
40+ CTNS (PALLET) 1 RM no bid $4.03 $4.03 no bid no bid

51

RECYCLED WHITE 
COPY PAPER; 8 1/2 X 
14; 67 LB.; COST FOR 
1-39 CTNS 1 RM no bid $5.77 $5.77 no bid no bid

52

RECYCLED WHITE 
COPY PAPER; 8 1/2 X 
14; 67 LB.; COST FOR 
40+ CTNS (PALLET) 1 RM no bid $5.43 $5.43 no bid no bid

53

RECYCLED WHITE 
COPY PAPER; 11 X 17; 
67 LB.; COST FOR 1-39 
CTNS 1 RM no bid $9.06 $9.06 no bid no bid

54

RECYCLED WHITE 
COPY PAPER; 11 X 17; 
67 LB.; COST FOR 40+ 
CTNS (PALLET) 1 RM no bid $8.53 $8.53 no bid no bid

55

RECYCLED WHITE 
COPY PAPER; 8 1/2 X 
11; 3-HOLE PUNCH; 
20 LB.; COST FOR 1-39 
CTNS 1 RM $3.49 $3.49 no bid $2.965 $2.965 $3.50 $3.50

56

RECYCLED WHITE 
COPY PAPER; 8 1/2 X 
11; 3-HOLE PUNCH; 
20 LB.; COST FOR 40+ 
CTNS (PALLET) 1 $3.49 $3.49 $3.94 $3.94 $2.76 $2.76 $3.30 $3.30

57

RECYCLED WHITE 
COPY PAPER; 8 1/2 X 
11; 20 LB.; COST FOR 
1-39 CTNS; LOW 
PACKED CARTON @ 5 
REAMS (2,500 SHEETS 
IN CARTON) 1 RM no bid no bid no bid $3.58 $3.58

58

RECYCLED WHITE 
COPY PAPER; 8 1/2 X 
11; 20 LB.; COST FOR 
40+ CTNS (PALLET); 
LOW PACKED CARTON 
@ 5 REAMS (2,500 
SHEETS PER CARTON) 1 RM no bid no bid no bid $3.38 $3.38
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59

GREEN BAR PAPER; 20 
LB; 1/2 GREENBAR IN 
SIZE; 14 7/8 X 11; 
COST FOR 1-39 CTNS 1 RM $29.70 $29.70 no bid $46.62 $46.62 no bid

60

GR N AR PAP R; 0 
LB; 1/2 GREENBAR IN 
SIZE; 14 7/8 X 11; 
COST FOR 40+ CTNS 
(PALLET) 1 RM $28.60 $28.60 no bid $42.39 $42.39 no bid

61

ENVELOPES, SIZE #9 
REGULAR, 24#, size 3 
7/8" x 8 7/8",  
BOX/500 1 BOX $8.50 $8.50 $10.85 $10.85 no bid no bid

62

ENVELOPES, #9 
REGULAR, 24#, size 3 
7/8" x 8 7/8", 
CARTON/2500 1 CTN $42.50 $42.50 $47.75 $47.75 no bid no bid

63

ENVELOPES, #10 
REGULAR, 24#, size 4 
1/8" x 9 1/2",  
BOX/500 1 BOX $8.50 $8.50 $10.85 $10.85 no bid no bid

64

ENVELOPES, #10 
REGULAR, 24#, size 4 
1/8" x 9 1/2", 
CARTON/2500 1 CTN $42.50 $42.50 $47.75 $47.75 no bid no bid

65

ENVELOPES, #11 
REGULAR, 24#, size 4 
1/2" x 10 3/8", 
BOX/500 1 BOX $17.10 $17.10 $21.29 $21.29 no bid no bid

66

ENVELOPES, #11 
REGULAR, 24#, size 4 
1/2" x 10 3/8",  
CARTON/2500 1 CTN $85.50 $85.50 $93.83 $93.83 no bid no bid

67
ENVELOPES, #12 
REGULAR, 24#, size 4 
3/4" x 11", BOX/500 1 BOX $25.10 $25.10 $31.08 $31.08 no bid no bid

68

ENVELOPES, #12 
REGULAR, 24#, size 4 
3/4" x 11", 
CARTON/2500 1 CTN $125.50 $125.50 $137.00 $137.00 no bid no bid

69

ENVELOPES, #9, 
BUSINESS WINDOW, 
24#, envelope size 3 
7/8" x 8 7/8", window 
pane size 1 1/8" x 4 
1/2", BOX/100 1 BOX no bid no bid no bid no bid

70

ENVELOPES, #9, 
BUSINESS WINDOW, 
24#, envelope size 3 
7/8" x 8 7/8", window 
pane size 1 1/8" x 4 
1/2", BOX/500 1 BOX $9.70 $9.70 $12.48 $12.48 no bid no bid

71

ENVELOPES, #9, 
BUSINESS WINDOW, 
24#, envelope size 3 
7/8" x 8 7/8", window 
pane size 1 1/8" x 4 
1/2", CARTON/2500 1 CTN $48.50 $48.50 $55.00 $55.00 no bid no bid
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72

NV OP S, # 0, 
BUSINESS WINDOW, 
24#, envelope size 4 
1/8" x 9 1/2", window 
pane size 1 1/8" x 4 1 BOX no bid no bid no bid no bid

73

ENVELOPES, #10, 
BUSINESS WINDOW, 
24#, envelope size 4 
1/8" x 9 1/2", window 
pane size 1 1/8" x 4 
1/2", BOX/500 1 BOX $10.15 $10.15 $12.48 $12.48 no bid no bid

74

ENVELOPES, #10, 
BUSINESS WINDOW, 
24#, envelope size 4 
1/8" x 9 1/2", window 
pane size 1 1/8" x 4 
1/2", CARTON/2500 1 CTN $50.75 $50.75 $55.00 $55.00 no bid no bid

75
ENVELOPES, 6 X 9, 
BUSINESS WINDOW; 
BOX/500 1 BOX no bid no bid no bid no bid

76
ENVELOPES, 9 X 12; 
BUSINESS WINDOW; 
BOX/500 1 BOX no bid no bid no bid no bid

77

DISCOUNT (%) OFF OF 
MISCELLANEOUS 
PAPER (NOT LISTED IN 
BID) 1

per-
cent 
off 15 15 30 16

78 CATALOG DISCOUNT 
(%) 1

per-   
cent 
off 15 15 30 no bid

Total $833.00 Total $831.48 Total $252.375 Total $118.75
Low bid
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