
                               No.___________________ 

    

 

 

Topic: Consideration for approval of Bids, Proposals, and Qualifications  
 

Submitted by: Ms. Cordelia Flores-Jackson     of: Purchasing Department  
 

Approved for transmittal to school board: June 17, 2009                              
                                                                           

Recommendations: 
 
Staff recommends the UISD board of trustees approve the following Bids, Proposals, & Qualifications as 
presented: 
 
Bids/Proposals/Qualifications 
 
District Wide: 
RFP 004-2009  Automotive Lifts & Equipment for United High School Auto Shop 
RFP 014-2009  District Wide Library Book Replacement Initiative 
RFP 027-2009  General Merchandise/Groceries/Film Development 
 
Facilities & Maintenance: 
RFP 039-2009  Safety Equipment & Supplies 
RFP 041-2009  Architectural Signs 
RFP 042-2009  Heavy Equipment Rental Services 
 
Renewals: 
RFP 2008-033  Athletic Supplies & Equipment 
 
Rationale: 
Staff has complied with all applicable federal, state and local purchasing policies and procedures in 
obtaining pricing information for the items listed above.   Staff is recommending the awards based on 
being the best value to the district. 
 
Budgetary Information: 
The budget includes the funds for these purchases 
 
Board Policy Reference and Compliance 
CH local – purchasing and acquisition 
Texas education code 44.031 

UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT 
AGENDA ACTION ITEM



Summary of Recommendation(s)

Bidsl Proposalsl Qualifications

District Wide
RFP 004-2009 Recommended Vendor(s)
Automotive Lifts & Equipment for United High School Auto Shop Affordable Auto Equipment Inc. $1,989.00

Arnold Oil Company $16,887.00
Ca~ Turner Equipment $5,690.00
Midwest Technology $5,068.20
Northstar Equipment $39,880.00

PSI $1,525.00
RFP 014-2009 Recommended Vendor(s)
Distrid Wide Library Book Replacement Initiative Follett Book Co (books for secondary libraries)

$691,712.30
Mackin Company ( books for elementary libraries)

$520,126.00
RFP 027-2009 Recommended Vendor(s)
General Merchandise/Groceries/Film Development Casa Guero Downtowm

Denco Photo
HEB Grocery
Sam's Club
Wal-mart

Facilities & Maintenance
RFP 039-2009 Recommended Vendor(s)
Saftey Equipment & Supplies Primary Vendors

Alamo Iron Works
JJJ International

Secondary Vendor
Airgas

Fisher Science Education
See Attached Tabulation

RFP 041-2009 Recommended Vendor(s)
Architedural Signs Primary Vendor

Vulcan Signs

Secondary Vendor
JJJ International

See Attached Tabulation

RFP 042-2009 Recommended Vendor(s)
Heavy Equipment Rental Service RSC Equipment Rentals Services

See Attached Tabulation

Renewals
RFP 2008-033 Recommended Vendor(s)
Athletic Supplies & Equipment Aluminum Athletic Equipment Co.

Adolph Kiefer & Assoc.

Alert Services

Bakka Sports
Bill Guthrie Sports

Clarke Distributing Co

Fast Dry Corp

Flaghouse

Goldmedal Sports
GTM Sportswear

Gilman Gear

Medco Supply

Leslie G

Ilenry Schein

The Neff Company

Pro Look Sports

Riddell Sports

School llealth

Sports Decals

Sports Supply Group

Swimshops of the Southwest

Team Sports of Texas

The Sports Center of Laredo

Toledo Physical Education Supply

T-Shirt Gallery & Sports

Woody's Sporting Goods

Bill Fritz Sports
See Attached Tabulation



Board Approval 
Awarding of Bids/Proposals 

JUNE 17, 2009 
 
 
RFP 004-2009 Automotive Lifts & Equipment for United High School Autoshop  
                                  
Recommendation: 
Requesting approval to purchase from the best bidder(s)/ offer(s) meeting specifications as follows:  
   
                                         
  Recommended Vendor                              Amount                                   
          Affordable Auto Equipment Inc.   $1,989.00 
         Arnold Oil Company     $39,880.00 
         Carl Turner Equipment    $5,690.00 
         Midwest Technology     $5,068.20 
         Northstar Equipment     $39,880.00 

        PSI       $1,525.00     
                                  

     
      

Administration distributed seventeen (17) proposals and advertised on April 5, 2009 and April 12, 2009.   Seven (7) 
proposals were received on April 27, 2009 @ 3:00 p.m. at the UISD Service Center Purchasing Department.  
 
 
Budget information: 
2009-2010 District-Wide New United High School Budget         $128,419.37 
2008- PERSONAL PROPERTY FINANCIAL CONTRACTUAL OBLIGATION (PPFCO) PROCEEDS 
        $26,990.80 
 
Resource personnel:  
Rodolfo Segovia, United High School Auto Tech Instructor 
Sam Sanchez, CTE Coordinatro 
Cordelia Flores Jackson, Director of Purchasing 
Hector Cavazos, Purchasing Manager 
Karina Mendoza Guerra, Procurement Officer 



 
 
 

Alicia G. Carrillo, Director 
Career and Technical Education 

 
 
 
 

To:         Cordelia Flores Jackson, Purchasing Director 
 From:    Alicia G. Carrillo, Career and Technical Education Director  AGC 
Date:      June 3, 2009 
Subject:  Automotive Lift and Auto Shop Equipment for United High School 
 
 
On June 1, 2009 at 8:30 a.m., the committee met to discuss the bids for the 
automotive lift and auto shop equipment for United High School.  All items were 
awarded to the lowest bidder meeting specifications with the exception of items 2-5.  
These items were awarded to the second lowest bidder because of additional 
warranty coverage the bidder is providing which is a value added to the District.  
There were no bidders for item six b. UISD’s Purchasing department will prepare 
an RFCQ to procure that kit. Based on the information gathered by the purchasing 
department and with input from the committee, we have selected the following 
vendors.  
 

Arnold Oil Company    $16,887.00

Northstar Equipment    $39,880.00

Midwest Technology    $5,068.20
 
Affordable Auto 
Equipment Inc.  $1,989.00

PSI    $1,525.00
 
Carl Turner 
Equipment    $5,690.00
 
The committee members consisted of: 
Rodolfo Segovia, United High School Auto Tech Instructor 
Sam Sanchez, CTE Coordinator 
Karina Mendoza, Purchasing Buyer 
Cordelia Jackson, Purchasing Director    

 



United Independent School District

RFP 004-2009 
Automotive Lifts and Auto Shop Equipment for United High School

Description Est. Price Extension Model Proposed Price Extension Model Proposed Price Extension Model Proposed Price Extension Model Proposed Price Extension Model Proposed Price Extension Model Proposed Price Extension Model Proposed

Qty

1

4-Post Complete True 

Alignment w/8LBs 

Center Rolling Jack   

Ref:  Hunter L421 1 ############ $20,592.00 As Specified  $   16,887.00 $16,887 As Specified No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid ############ 18,762.00$    Hunter L421-43 17,550.00$        17,550.00$    As Specified

2

4-Post Service Lift 

with 2 Center Sliding 

Jack 8 Lbs (#S100077)            

Ref:  Rotary SMO14L 1 7,525.00$  $7,525.00 HD-14X Blue 10,812.00$  ########### As Specified 11,552.00$              ########### As Specified ########### ########### As Specified No Bid No Bid No Bid 6,760.28$  6,760.28$       As Specified 7,900.00$           7,900.00$       Challenger 

3

2-Post Surface Mount 

Symmetrical Lift                

Ref:  Rotary SPO12 1 5,145.00$  $5,145.00 XPR-12C Blue 5,885.00$     5,885.00$ As Specified 6,345.00$                 6,345.00$ As Specified 6,267.00$ 6,267.00$ As Specified No Bid No Bid No Bid 6,868.00$  6,868.00$       As Specified 5,500.00$           5,500.00$       Challenger 

4

2-Post Surface Mount 

Symmetrical Lift                 

Ref:  Rotary SPO10 1 3,245.00$  $3,245.00 XPR-10CX Blue 4,040.00$     4,040.00$ As Specified 4,547.00$                 4,547.00$ As Specified 3,912.00$ 3,912.00$ As Specified No Bid No Bid No Bid 4,075.00$  4,075.00$       As Specified 3,395.00$           3,395.00$       Challenger 

5

2-Post Surface Mount 

Asymmetrical Lift             

Ref:  Rotary SPOA10 1 3,250.00$  $3,250.00 XPR-10ACX Blue 4,040.00$     4,040.00$ As Specified 4,547.00$                 4,547.00$ As Specified 3,912.00$ 3,912.00$ As Specified No Bid No Bid No Bid 4,075.00$  4,075.00$       As Specified 3,395.00$           3,395.00$       Challenger 

6

Stick Welding Package  

Ref: Miller Dialarc 250 

AC/DC 3 2,049.00$  $6,147.00 As Specified No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,338.62$  4,015.86$  Miller 907-017 No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,825.00$           5,475.00$       As Specified

6A

Running Gear for stick 

welder Ref:  041-580 3 330.00$      $990.00 As Specified No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 257.40$      772.20$      As Specified No Bid No Bid No Bid 355.00$               1,065.00$       As Specified

6B

Accesory Kit for 

Welder 3 NO Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

7

Industrial Duty 

Avrasive Blast Cabinet                                               

Ref:  Dee Blast Model 

50 1 1,989.00$  $1,989.00 ALC40413 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3,744.00$  3,744.00$  Dee Blast DB050 No Bid No Bid No Bid 4,070.00$           4,070.00$       As Specified

8

Coolant System Service 

Center  Ref: Viper 

Coolant System Service 

Center VPRAF325 1 1,945.00$  $1,945.00 As Specified No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,925.00$                 1,925.00$ As Specified 2,150.00$ 2,150.00$ GloPyn Ravvac3 No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,525.00$  1,525.00$       

Robinaircool tech 

75700 2,100.00$           2,100.00$       As Specified

9

Disc Drum Lathe 

Package                                

Ref: Hunter BL505D-

AB & 20-1667-1 

QuickChuck Level III 1 7,449.00$  $7,449.00 As Specified 6,580.00$     6,580.00$ As Specified  $                  5,690.00 $5,690 

Ammco Lathe 

Pack 5,728.00$ 5,728.00$ 

Ammco 4000B-

SP  w/Kit No Bid No Bid No Bid 6,843.43$  6,843.43$       

Hunter BL505D-

AB&20-1667-1 6,400.00$           6,400.00$       As Specified

10

Ref:Hobart Handler 

125  1 711.00$      $711.00 FPW 1444-0308 No Bid No Bid No Bid 450.00$                     450.00$     As Specified No Bid No Bid No Bid 280.14$      280.14$      As Specified No Bid No Bid No Bid 380.00$               380.00$           As Specified

11

Hand Held Diagnostic 

Machine for Scan, Gas, 

and Scope with Heavy 1 7,415.00$  $7,415.00 As Specified No Bid No Bid No Bid DNMS DNMS DNMS 6,848.00$ 6,848.00$ 

OTC-

3780,3864,342

1-94,3421-54 No Bid No Bid No Bid 8,788.75$  8,788.75$       As Specified 5,990.00$           5,990.00$       As Specified

12

Alignment Kit                         

Ref:  Hunter #20-

2177-1 1 4,333.00$  $4,333.00 As Specified 3,750.00$     3,750.00$ As Specified No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3,770.00$  3,770.00$       As Specified 3,600.00$           3,600.00$       As Specified

13

Wall Mounts Sensor 

Camera Kit                                     

Ref:  Hunter #H-

S401WM 1 ############ $11,600.00 As Specified 10,271.00$  ########### As Specified No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid ############ 10,407.00$    As Specified 10,100.00$        10,100.00$    As Specified

*

Carl Turner Equipment

One Vendor submitted a "No Bid on the items listed above

Myers Tire Supply Midwest Technology PSI Northstar EquipmentVendors Affordable Auto Equipment Inc. Arnold Oil Company







BOARD APPROVAL 
AWARDING OF BIDS/PROPOSALS 

JUNE 17, 2009 
 
 
RFP 014-2009 DISTRICT WIDE LIBRARY BOOK REPLACEMENT INITATIVE  
                                  
RECOMMENDATION: 
REQUESTING APPROVAL TO PURCHASE FROM THE BEST BIDDER(S)/ OFFER(S) MEETING 
SPECIFICATIONS AS FOLLOWS:  
   
             
                              VENDORS                                                     EST. AMOUNT                                   
           
   FOLLETT BOOK COMPANY   $691,712.30 

              (TO SUPPLY THE BOOKS FOR THE SECONDARY LIBRARIES) 
                                           
   MACKIN COMPANY   $520,126.00 
   (TO SUPPLY THE BOOKS FOR THE ELEMENTARY LIBRARIES) 

 
 

      
ADMINISTRATION DISTRIBUTED SIXTEEN (16) PROPOSALS AND ADVERTISED ON APRIL11, 2009 
AND APRIL 12, 2009.  FOUR (4) PROPOSALS WERE RECEIVED ON APRIL 22, 2009 @ 3:00 P.M. AT THE 
UISD SERVICE CENTER PURCHASING DEPARTMENT.  
 
 
BUDGET INFORMATION: 
2008- PERSONAL PROPERTY FINANCIAL CONTRACTUAL OBLIGATION (PPFCO) PROCEEDS 
 
RESOURCE PERSONNEL:  
NIDIA RODRIGUEZ, UNITED HIGH SCHOOL LIBRARIAN 
LAURA GONZALEZ, WASHINGTON MIDDLE SCHOOL LIBRARIAN 
ANALINE JOHNSON, CENTENO ELEMENTARY SCHOOL LIBRARIAN 
SANDRA BENAVIDES, LIBRARIAN SCIENCE DIRECTOR 
CORDELIA FLORES JACKSON, DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING 
HECTOR CAVAZOS, PURCHASING MANAGER 
KARINA MENDOZA, PROCURMENT OFFICER 
 



 
 
 

Sandra G. Benavides 
Professional & Staff Development, Library Science & Special Projects 

 
 
 
 

To:         Cordelia Flores Jackson 
                       Purchasing Director 
  
From:     Sandra Guillén Benavides 
                Professional & Staff Development, Library Science & Special Projects 
 
Date:      June 3, 2009 
 
Subject:  Library Book Replacement Plan Bid Award 
 
 
 
The District’s financial investment in the Library Book Replacement Plan is going 
to contribute to enhanced library collections and the success of our students. 
 
On May 25, 2009, the committee heard the vendor’s presentations.  Based on the 
presentations and the scope of their inventory the committee has selected the 
following two vendors. 
 

Follett Book Company-to supply the books for the secondary libraries 
               Mackin Compnay-to supply the books for the elementary libraries 
 
The two vendors met all the specifications of the bid and provide the best value.   
 
The committee members consisted of: 
Nidia Rodriguez, United High School Librarian 
Laura Gonzalez, Washington Middle School Librarian 
Analine Johnson, Centeno Elementary School Librarian 
Sandra Benavides, Library Science Director 
Karina Mendoza, Purchasing Buyer 
Cordelia Jackson, Purchasing Director 
      
              

 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



United Independent  School District
RFP 014-2009

District Wide Library  Book Replacement Initiative

Catalog Discount BTSB Catalog Price 10%
Ref lects 30% Discount
f rom publisher list 
price, plus prebinding charge

*Free Shipping *Free processing on bid items

*Free MARC records *Free Shipping
*Free Order Typing Serv ice *Enhanced MARC records for every  title including the 526 reading program tag *Free Thef t Detection
*Collection Development Assistance *Apllication of  Barcode with protective label attached *Free Kapco covers for paperbacks
*Collection Analy sis Rev iew *Protective My lar on books with dust jackets attached
*Duplicate Check Serv ice *Spine Label with protective label attached
*Free Thef t Detection *Thef t Detection
*Assistance in shelv ing *Free Shipping

*Prices are guaranteed for 60 day s
*Local representation *Free thef t detections
*Free MARC recods electronically  to each school *Free shipping and deliv ery
*Free Funding Source name in the MARC record at the 852 tag
*AR labels will contain the author, reading lev el, point value and quiz number
*No Separate fee for prebinding books *Free Kapco covers for paperbacks
*Free training for ordering online,collection dev elopment *Will hav e crew to assist with shelv ing
*No additional fees for books not normally  carried in inv entory , titles with little
 or no discount or small publishers
*Free replacement of  any  book at no charge that is damaged in shipment or
 otherwise not in compliance with the order
*No minimum order requirement
*No restocking charge
*Can prov ide lists of  titles that hav e receiv ed recommendations and/or awards, 
apart f rom their regular catalog
*Free stamping in each book as specif ied by  each campus
*Free Kapco covers on all paperback books
*Folletbounds are unconditional lif etime guaranteed.
*Free replacements if  librarian is unhappy  with book
*Fill rate of  98% based on historical data
*Assistance in shelv ing
*Free Lexile Lev els
*9th Grade campus will receiv e 20 f ree play away  audiobooks
*New Ebook Reader Training at no cost
*New Ebook Reader (f ree program installed at all libraries and will be installed
at all campuses over the summer

*Free stamping in a designated area 
as specif ied by  librarians

Vendor Bound to Stay Bound Follet Library Resources Gumdrop Books Mackin Library 

Value Added 
Services

*Automated Processing & Cataloging with thef t detection of fered at no charge  - 
this is a $1.28 per book sav ings

*Free processing,shelf  ready .  Free 
basic plus cataaloging and processing 
serv ices. Thisincludes a full MARC 
record on disk orv ia email, and 
applied barcode label, applied spine 
label, reading program label, my lar 
covers on all jacketed books 
andonepropert y  label applied to each 
item.

Vendor Bound to Stay Bound Follet Library Resources Gumdrop Books Mackin Library 

Follett Library  Resources, Inc. online cataloging prices ref lect up to 45% 
discount of f  publisher's list prices, with an average 15% discount. Our online 
catalog, ref lects discounted net prices for books.  

Add 8% of f  already  discounted of  up 
to 40%







BOARD APPROVAL 
AWARDING OF BIDS/PROPOSALS 

JUNE 17, 2009 
 

 
RFP NO. 027-2009 GROCERIES/GENERAL MERCHANDISE/FILM PROCESSING  
 
RECOMMENDATION: 
REQUESTING APPROVAL TO PURCHASE FROM THE BEST BIDDER(S)/ OFFER(S) MEETING 
SPECIFICATIONS AS FOLLOWS:  
    
  APPROVED VENDORS 
 
  CASA GUERO - DOWNTOWN 
  DENCO PHOTE 

H.E.B. GROCERY CO     SEE TABULATION 
  SAM’S CLUB 
  WALMART  
 

 
      

ADMINISTRATION DISTRIBUTED EIGHT (8) PROPOSALS AND ADVERTISED ON APRIL 05, 2009 AND 
APRIL 12, 2009.  FIVE (5) PROPOSALS  WERE RECEIVED ON APRIL 22, 2009 @ 3:00 P.M. AT THE UISD 
SERVICE CENTER PURCHASING DEPARTMENT.  
 
 
BUDGET INFORMATION: 
2009-2010 DISTRICT WIDE  
 
RESOURCE PERSONNEL:  
CORDELIA FLORES JACKSON, DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING 
HECTOR CAVAZOS, PURCHASING MANAGER 
KARINA MENDOZA, PROCURMENT OFFICER 
 





0-249 0%
250-499 5%
500-999 10%

1,000 or more 15%

Amt of Items that need to 
be purchased

% Discount

% Off Shelf Price
PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT

0% 0%

WALMART

NOTES Discount on General Mechandise:

0%0-15%

VENDORS
CASA GUERO - DOWNTOWN DENCO PHOTO HEB GROCERY SAMS CLUB

0%

RFP 027-2009
GROCERIES / GENERAL MERCHANDISE / FILM DEVELOPMENT

UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT



DENCO PHOTO LA PELUQUITA ‐ CASA GUERO NORTH
1119 TAYLOR ST 906 HILLSIDE RD
LAREDO, TEXAS 78041 PHONE: 956‐712‐8100
PHONE: 956‐791‐8126 FAX: 956‐712‐8109 ATTN: GRACIE
FAX: 956‐725‐3686 CONTACT: GRACIE
CONTACT: FRANK MEURER CONTACT: DANIEL VILLARREAL
denco1@sbcglobal.net daniel@casaqueroonline.com

Please also send by fax to Gracie.
H.E.B.
646 S. MAIN SAMS CLUB
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78204 4810 SAN BERNARDO
PHONE: 210‐938‐8527 LAREDO, TEXAS 78041
FAX: 210‐938‐7501 PHONE: 956‐725‐5164
CONTACT: ERIC LOPEZ FAX: 956‐725‐0263
lopez.eric@heb.com CONTACT: ARACELI MATA

agmata.s08156.us@samsclub.com
H.E.B.
1301 GUADALUPE STREET WAL MART 
LAREDO, TEXAS 78041 2320 BOB BULLOCK LOOP
PHONE:  956‐724‐1126 LAREDO, TEXAS 78045

PHONE: 956‐791‐3303
LA PELUQUITA ‐ CASA GUERO, INC FAX: 956‐791‐0264
1224 ZARAGOZA ST. CONTACT: JOSUE CARILLO
LAREDO, TEXAS 78040
PHONE: 956‐722‐0211 WALGREENS 
FAX: 956‐722‐3640 2219 E. SAUNDERS STREET
CONTACT: LANCE VILLARREAL 1119 GUADALUPE
guero@grandecom.net LAREDO, TEXAS 78043

PHONE:  956‐729‐7994

UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT 
GROCERIES/ GENERAL MERCHANDISE/ FILM PROCESSING

RFP 027‐2009



BOARD APPROVAL 
AWARDING OF BIDS/PROPOSALS 

JUNE 17, 2009 
 
 
RFP NO. 039-2009 SAFETY EQUIPMENT & SUPPLIES      
 
RECOMMENDATION: 
REQUESTING APPROVAL TO PURCHASE FROM THE BEST BIDDER(S)/ OFFER(S) MEETING 
SPECIFICATIONS AS FOLLOWS:  
   
   
PRIMARY VENDORS    AMOUNT 
 
ALAMO IRON WORKS     SEE ATTACHED TABULATION 
JJJ INTERNATIONAL SAFETY 
    

       
SECONDARY VENDORS   AMOUNT 

 
AIRGAS SOUTHWEST    SEE ATTACHED TABULATION 
FISHER SCIENCE EDUCATION 

      
 
ADMINISTRATION DISTRIBUTED FORTY-SEVEN (47) PROPOSALS AND ADVERTISED ON MAY 16, 
2009 AND MAY 17, 2009.  NINE (9) PROPOSALS WERE RECEIVED ON MAY 28, 2009 @ 3:00 P.M. AT THE 
UISD SERVICE CENTER PURCHASING DEPARTMENT.  
 
 
BUDGET INFORMATION: 
2009-2010 FACILITES MAINTENANCE & OPERATIONS DEPARTMENT 
 
RESOURCE PERSONNEL:  
JUAN DAVILA, DIRECTOR OF FACILITIES MAINTENANCE & OPERATIONS  
CORDELIA FLORES, DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING 
HECTOR CAVAZOS, PURCHASING MANAGER 
VENESA NAVARRA, PROCURMENT OFFICER 
 





VENDORS
PERCENTAGE DISCOUNTS
% OFF CATALOG PRICE:
% OFF LIST PRICE
% OFF SHELF PRICE

BACK SUPPORT BELTS UNIT PRICE BRAND UNIT PRICE BRAND UNIT PRICE BRAND UNIT PRICE BRAND UNIT PRICE BRAND UNIT PRICE BRAND UNIT PRICE BRAND UNIT PRICE BRAND UNIT PRICE BRAND
MEDIUM E57 11382 $15.64 Alegro 7130‐02 Valeo 2198402
LARGE E57 11383 $13.64 Alegro 7130‐03 Valeo 2198403
XL‐LARGE E57 11384 $13.11 Alegro 7130‐04

XXL‐LARGE E57 11385 $21.74 Valeo $7.70

XXXL‐LARGE $10.00 E57 11386
$27.97 

(detachable 
suspender straps)

$8.36

WORK GLOVES CLOTH AND LEATHER

MEDIUM GLOVES – CLOTH  RAD 64057101 $6.44 (12 pk) $3.60
LARGE GLOVES – CLOTH RAD 64057100 $6.78 (12 pk) $0.80 Wells Lamont $3.96

MEDIUM GLOVES – LEATHER RAD 64057593 $23.62 (12 pk)
LARGE GLOVES – LEATHER RAD 64057594 $23.62 (12 pk)

SAFETY GLASSES ‐ CLEAR CRE CL110 $2.03 $1.65 $3.31 Bandido S1730 $2.50 AO Safety $0.68 $1.70 Valeo 2811100
SAFETY GLASSES – DARK CRE CL112 $2.48 $1.81 $4.00 Bandido S1731 $9.00 Dewalt $0.89
SAFETY FACE SHIELDS CLEAR / TINTED

SAFETY FACE SHIELDS ‐ CLEAR IWR 3940 $4.50 $9.97 Sperian $5.00 Huntsman 3000122 $19.70 $12.00 AO Safety $0.95 $8.50 Crews
SAFETY FACE SHIELDS ‐ TINTED IWR 394DLG $4.67 $5.93 Huntsman 3000123 $20.70 $16.88 AO Safety $2.06
GENERAL ITEMS

HARD HAT (BUMP CAPS) $6.60 RAD 64051020 $11.30 MSA $9.53 MSA $11.17 MSA 454733 $12.10 $5.45 AO Safety $3.30 Pyramex Safety $8.00 Valeo 2851730

EAR PLUGS FOAM  (100/BOX) (NRR‐32) $17.73 HLI LL‐30 $19.43 Howard Light $20.99 (200 bx) Three M $18.59 (200 bx) Moldex 6600 $29.50 $12.00 (80 pk) AO Safety $16.25 (laser 30) Howard Light

DUST MASK (100 PER BOX) $3.43 (50 bx) CRE RPDM1 $8.68 (50 bx) SAS $8.53 (20 pk) Three M $4.24 (50 bx) Gerson 316‐1501 $15.30 $16.00 AO Safety $2.90 SAS Safety

CAUTION TAPE IN ROLL $6.35 RAD 64055720 $9.89 C.H. Hanson $24.54 Brady $6.75 (1000 ft) Empire 77‐0201 $11.30 $6.00 (1000 ft) EVC $7.40 North Safety
NECK SHADE STANDARD WHITE ELASTIC 
HEAD BAND STYLE

$1.55 OCC 971‐KHK $5.19 Occunomix $7.90 $1.55 Occunomix

CHAIN SAW CHAPS MARMAC BRAND              
X‐LARGE 38" LENGTH

$49.53 E50 JE9439 $114.51 Steel Grip $30.00 $110.57 Conder $85.00 Elvex

SAFETY GAS CAN 5‐GALLON (TYPE 2) ¾” FLEX 
NOZZLE

$56.59 JTR 10828 $62.80 Just Rite $14.31 Blitz 81022 $37.00 $111.51 Eagle  $56.50

SAFETY GAS CAN 2‐GALLON (TYPE 2) 11/32” 
FLEX NOZZLE

$61.59 JTR 10527 $69.09 Just Rite
$8.51            

(1.4 gl & 3/4)
Blitz 81005 $29.00 $108.47 Eagle  $61.80

SAFETY GAS CAN 3‐GALLON (TYPE 2) ¾” 
FLEXIBLE SPOUT

$55.93 JTR 10728 $62.62 Just Rite $9.97 (2.8 gl) Blitz 81010 $33.00 $108.89 Justrite $55.80

NOTES

TWO (2) VENDORS SUBMITTED A "NO BID"

no bid

no bid

no bid

20%                           
(EXCLUDES 'ND' ITEMS)

Ergodyne

P.I.P

Sperian

no bid

$18.71

$0.51

no bid

no bid

no bid

Anchor 1110

Anchor 2100

no bid

no bid

Protective 
Industrial 
Products

Radians

Fibre‐Metal

‐
0%

7%

SAFETY GLASSES EYE PROTECTION CLEAR / TINTED –DARK

no bid

no bid

$10.00
Valeo

$1.33

‐‐ 0% ‐ 0%
0%

$17.25

$10.00 JJJ

$12.75 $7.10

25%
‐ 10% 0%

SAF‐T‐GLOVE SCHOOL NURSE SUPPLY WEST TEXAS WAREHOUSE

UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT 
SAFETY EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES 

RFP 039‐2009

AIRGAS ALAMO IRON WORKS FISHER SCIENCE EDUCATION GULF COAST PAPER

$8.90

$14.10
MCR

$2.90

no bid

JJJ INTERNATIONAL  LOWE'S

bracket for shields $7.61

no bid

no bid

10% off web prices 40% ‐ 50% 30% 10%

$0.91

‐
16%
‐

$0.36

$1.00

$0.76

Pyramex Safety

$10.80
Saf‐T‐Glove

‐ ‐

$0.37

$1.31

0%

MCR

AWP

$9.10 Dura Worx

no bid

Crews

MCR

Pyramex Safety no bid

no bid

no bid

Tru‐Vision

Just Rite

$16.20

$25.00 (12 pk)

$7.25

no bid

no bid

Valeo 2198404

Valeo 2865800

Valeo 2840100

no bid

no bid

no bid











BOARD APPROVAL 
AWARDING OF BIDS/PROPOSALS 

JUNE 17, 2009 
 
 
RFP 041-2009 ARCHITECHTURAL SIGNS  
                                  
RECOMMENDATION: 
REQUESTING APPROVAL TO PURCHASE FROM THE BEST BIDDER(S)/ OFFER(S) MEETING 
SPECIFICATIONS AS FOLLOWS:  
   
             
                              PRIMARY VENDOR                                    AMOUNT                                   
           
   VULCAN SIGNS    SEE TABULATION 
 

                      
 SECONDARY VENDOR  AMOUNT 

  
JJJ INTERNATIONAL    SEE TABULATION 

 
 
 
 

      
ADMINISTRATION DISTRIBUTED THIRTY-TWO (32) PROPOSALS AND ADVERTISED ON MAY 16, 200 
AND MAY 17, 2009.  THREE (3) PROPOSALS WERE RECEIVED ON MAY 28, 200 @ 3:00 P.M. AT THE 
UISD SERVICE CENTER PURCHASING DEPARTMENT.  
 
 
BUDGET INFORMATION: 
2009-2010 FACILITIES & OPERATIONS 
 
 
RESOURCE PERSONNEL:  
JUAN A. DAVILA, DIRECTOR OF FACILITIES MAINTENANCE & OPERATIONS 
CORDELIA FLORES JACKSON, DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING 
HECTOR CAVAZOS, PURCHASING MANAGER 
VENESA NAVARRO, PROCURMENT OFFICER 
 





SECTION II. INDICATIVE ALUMINUM SIGNS EST QTY
12"X18" PARKING RESERVED PERMIT  75 $12.70 $25.00 $9.10
12"X18" NO PARKING SIGN 75 $11.70 $25.00 $8.26
12"X 18" RESERVED PARKING SIGN 75 $12.70 $28.00 $9.10
18"X18" CUSTOM SIGN 2 COLOR ALUMINUM 20 $14.70 $29.00 $17.35
18"X24" BILINGUAL 3 COLOR WARNING SIGN 50 $22.70 $30.00 $28.16
24"X30" SPEED LIMIT SIGN 50 $24.70 $42.00 $30.10
24" STOP DIAMOND SIGN 40 $18.70 $58.00 $33.75

POST 12 GA 11 FT 150 $19.00 $26.50 $28.90                   
(13 gauge post/bundles of 37)

U CLAMP EXTRUDED  300 $4.29 $7.00 $2.50

TWO (2) VENDORS SUBMITTED A NO BID

UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
ARCHITECTURAL SIGNS

RFP 041‐2009

JJJ INTERNATIONAL  NU‐TECH IMAGE VULCAN SIGNS

5%

TABULATION

VENDORS

SECTION I:  PERCENTAGE DISCOUNTS
% OFF CATALOG PRICE
% OFF LIST PRICE
% OFF SHELF PRICE

30% 0%







BOARD APPROVAL 
AWARDING OF BIDS/PROPOSALS 

JUNE 17, 2009 
 

 
RFP NO. 042-2009 HEAVY EQUIPMENT RENTAL SERVICES       
 
RECOMMENDATION: 
REQUESTING APPROVAL TO PURCHASE FROM THE BEST BIDDER(S)/ OFFER(S) MEETING 
SPECIFICATIONS AS FOLLOWS:  
       
  RECOMMENDED VENDOR   EST. ANNUAL AMOUNT 
  RSC EQUIPMENT RENTALS SERVICES  SEE TABULATION 

 
 
      

ADMINISTRATION DISTRIBUTED TWENTY-ONE (21) PROPOSALS AND ADVERTISED ON MAY 16, 
2009 AND MAY 17, 2009.  ONE (1) PROPOSAL WAS RECEIVED ON MAY 28, 2009 @ 3:00 P.M. AT THE 
UISD SERVICE CENTER PURCHASING DEPARTMENT.  
 
 
BUDGET INFORMATION: 
2009-2010 FACILITIES MAINTENANCE & OPERATIONS DEPARTMENT  
 
RESOURCE PERSONNEL:  
JUAN DAVILA, DIRECTOR OF FACILITIES MAINTENANCE & OPERATIONS DEPARTMENT 
CORDELIA FLORES JACKSON, DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING 
HECTOR CAVAZOS, PURCHASING MANAGER 
VENESSA NAVARRO, PROCUREMENT OFFICER 
 
 





 SECTION I:  PERCENTAGE DISCOUNTS

VENDOR RSC EQUIPMENT RENTAL

Concrete Finisher 36"

$200.00
$975.00

$150.00 $375.00

$200.00 $400.00

UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
HEAVY EQUIPMENT RENTAL SERVICES

RFP 042‐2009

SECTION II: GENERAL EQUIPMENT

% off CATALOG PRICE
% off LIST PRICE
% off SHELF PRICE

0%                                                                          
(have no published price lists)

COST PER WEEK COST PER MONTH

Saw Concrete 13 HP
Push Around Manlift (GENIE) 23" to 25"
Push Around Manlift (GENIE) 30" to 33"

Automatic Level #AX‐1 for Elevation w/ Legs
Concrete Finisher 48"
Dozer STD Track 70 HP
Air Pavement Breaker 30# w/ Moil Boint 1" X 4 1/4"

#MP 60 FH (BOOM) 60" Lift
Motorgrader #730 A
Ditchwitch Trencher #4500
# L 35 Backhole Tractor
Dump Truck 6 1/2 yd
Motorgrader #710 A
#460 Trencher UIT 4" BOOM
Front End Loader Mod #821 13 CAB‐H & A 3.5‐Y

$112.00

$150.00
$275.00 (25 ft)

20" to 30"Height Manlift (GENIE)

$600.00 (Std Case 580L)
$900.00

$300.00 (30 ft)
$900.00 (60 ft)

$650.00 (RT 40)

$1500.00 (JD 544)

$2,200.00

$1,700.00
$1,395.00

$400.00
$2,750.00
$225.00

$400.00
$450.00
$550.00

$2,000.00

$3,900.00
Scissor: 20 ft $275.00 / 30 ft $290.00

no bid

no bid
case version of Ditchwitch (4 ft)

20 ft $390.00 / 30 ft $460.00







BOARD APPROVAL 
AWARDING OF BIDS/PROPOSALS 

JUNE 17, 2009 
 

 
RFP NO. 2008-033 ATHLETIC SUPPLIES RENEWALS      
 
RECOMMENDATION: 
REQUESTING APPROVAL TO PURCHASE FROM THE BEST BIDDER(S)/ OFFER(S) MEETING 
SPECIFICATIONS AS FOLLOWS:  
            
VENDORS: 
ALUMINUM ATHLETIC EQUIPMENT (AAE)   ADOLPH KIEFER & ASSOCIATES 
ALERT SERVICES    BAKKA SPORTS 
BILL FRITZ SPORTS    BILL GUTHRIE SPORTS 
CLARK DISTRIBUTING CO   FAST DRY CORPORATION 
FLAGHOUSE     GILMAN GEAR       
GOLD METAL SPORTS    GTM SPORTSWEAR 
HENRY SCHEIN    LESLIE G 
MEDCO SUPPLY CO    THE NEFF COMPANY 
PRO LOOK SPORTS    RIDDELL SPORTS  
SCHOOL HEALTH    SPORTDECALS 
SPORT SUPPLY GROUP    SWIM SHOPS OF THE SOUTHWEST 
TEAM SPORTS OF TEXAS   THE SPORTS CENTER OF LAREDO 
TOLEDO PHYSICAL EDUCATION SUPPLY T-SHIRT GALLARY & SPORTS 
      WOODY’S SPORTING GOODS 
     
          

 
 
SEE TABULATION 

 
 
 

ADMINISTRATION DISTRIBUTED ONE HUNDRED AND EIGHTEEN (118) PROPOSALS AND 
ADVERTISED ON MAY 31, 2008 AND JUNE 1, 2008.  THIRTY TWO (32) PROPOSALS WERE RECEIVED 
ON JUNE 11, 2008 @ 3:00 P.M. AT THE UISD SERVICE CENTER PURCHASING DEPARTMENT.  
 
 
BUDGET INFORMATION: 
2009-2010 ATHLETIC DEPARTMENT 
 
RESOURCE PERSONNEL:  
ROBERTO CRUZ,  DIRECTOR OF ATHLETICS 
CORDELIA FLORES JACKSON, DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING 
HECTOR CAVAZOS, PURCHASING MANAGER 
KARINA MENDOZA, PROCUREMENT OFFICER 
VENESA NAVARRO, PROCUREMENT OFFICER 
 


















	Bids/Proposals/Qualifications
	Rationale:
	The budget includes the funds for these purchases



