
ECTOR COUNTY INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

Bid Request Number Bid #10-25

Title Printshop Paper

Open Date 7/16/2010 8:01:00 AM Central

Close Date 8/2/2010 2:00:00 PM Central

Line 1 #10-24 White Regular Envelopes

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Service Office Supplies, Inc. 36 CS $18.95 $682.20

QUILL CORPORATION 36 CS $27.45 $988.20

Graphic Equipment & Supply 36 CS $30.98 $1,115.28

Western Paper Company 36 CS $35.08 $1,262.88

Line 2 #10-24 Window White Envelopes

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Graphic Equipment & Supply 18 Cartons $36.95 $665.10

Western Paper Company 18 Cartons $41.70 $750.60

Service Office Supplies, Inc. 18 Cartons $44.75 $805.50

QUILL CORPORATION 18 Cartons $48.15 $866.70

Line 3

8.5 x 11 - 20# Carbonless Reverse


4-Part (NCR or Imation only)

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Western Paper Company 36 cartons $66.95 $2,410.20

Graphic Equipment & Supply 36 cartons $211.50 $7,614.00

QUILL CORPORATION 36 cartons No Bid

Service Office Supplies, Inc. 36 cartons No Bid

Line 4 8.5 x 11 - 67# Vellum Bristol Salmon

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

QUILL CORPORATION 8 cartons No Bid

Graphic Equipment & Supply 8 cartons No Bid

Western Paper Company 8 cartons No Bid

Service Office Supplies, Inc. 8 cartons No Bid

Western Paper Company (Alt 1) 8

cartons $35.84 $286.72 8.5 x 11-90 Salmon Exact Index by Wausau, 2m 

sheets per case 

Line 5 11 x 17 - 67# White Vellum Bristol

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification



Western Paper Company 10 cartons $32.14 $321.40

Graphic Equipment & Supply 10 cartons $32.84 $328.40

Service Office Supplies, Inc. 10 cartons $55.48 $554.80

QUILL CORPORATION 10 cartons No Bid

Line 6 8..5 x 11  60# Text, Fuscia

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

QUILL CORPORATION 40 cartons $30.90 $1,236.00

Graphic Equipment & Supply 40 cartons $61.25 $2,450.00

Western Paper Company 40 cartons $66.95 $2,678.00

Service Office Supplies, Inc. 40 cartons No Bid

Line 7

8.5 x 11 - 20# Salmon


(Hammermill, G.P., Colorsource)

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Western Paper Company 40 Cartons $37.40 $1,496.00

Graphic Equipment & Supply 40 Cartons $40.50 $1,620.00

Service Office Supplies, Inc. 40 Cartons $53.70 $2,148.00

QUILL CORPORATION 40 Cartons No Bid

Service Office Supplies, Inc. (Alt 1) 40

Cartons $46.80 $1,872.00 UNV 11210 salmon paper, 8.5x11, 20#; $4.68 per 

ream; $46.80 per carton

Line 8

8.5 x 11 - 20# Pink


(Hammermill, G.P., Colorsource)

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

QUILL CORPORATION 20 Cartons $37.40 $748.00

Western Paper Company 20 Cartons $37.40 $748.00

Graphic Equipment & Supply 20 Cartons $40.50 $810.00

Service Office Supplies, Inc. 20 Cartons $53.70 $1,074.00

Service Office Supplies, Inc. (Alt 1) 20

Cartons $46.40 $928.00 Sparco 8.5x11 pink copy paper; $4.64 per ream; 

$46.84 per carton

Line 9 8.5 x 11 - 67# Vellum Bristol Blue

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Graphic Equipment & Supply 8 cartons $31.50 $252.00

Western Paper Company 8 cartons $32.14 $257.12

QUILL CORPORATION 8 cartons $45.68 $365.44

Service Office Supplies, Inc. 8 cartons $57.28 $458.24

Line 10 8.5 x 11 - 67# Vellum Bristol Orchid



Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Western Paper Company 8 cartons $32.14 $257.12

Service Office Supplies, Inc. 8 cartons No Bid

QUILL CORPORATION 8 cartons No Bid

Graphic Equipment & Supply 8 cartons No Bid

Line 11 8.5 x 11 - 67# Vellum Bristol Pink

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Graphic Equipment & Supply 8 cartons $31.50 $252.00

Western Paper Company 8 cartons $32.14 $257.12

Service Office Supplies, Inc. 8 cartons No Bid

QUILL CORPORATION 8 cartons No Bid

Line 12 8.5 x 11 - 67# Vellum Bristol Gold

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Graphic Equipment & Supply 8 cartons $31.50 $252.00

Western Paper Company 8 cartons $32.14 $257.12

Service Office Supplies, Inc. 8 cartons No Bid

QUILL CORPORATION 8 cartons No Bid

Line 13 8.5 x 11 - 67# Vellum Bristol Yellow

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Graphic Equipment & Supply 8 cartons $31.50 $252.00

Western Paper Company 8 cartons $32.14 $257.12

QUILL CORPORATION 8 cartons $45.68 $365.44

Service Office Supplies, Inc. 8 cartons $57.28 $458.24

Line 14 8.5 x 11 - 67# Vellum Bristol Green

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Graphic Equipment & Supply 8 cartons $31.50 $252.00

Western Paper Company 8 cartons $32.14 $257.12

Service Office Supplies, Inc. 8 cartons $57.28 $458.24

QUILL CORPORATION 8 cartons No Bid

Line 15 8.5 x 11 - 67# Vellum Bristol Gray

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Graphic Equipment & Supply 8 cartons $31.50 $252.00

Western Paper Company 8 cartons $32.14 $257.12

QUILL CORPORATION 8 cartons $45.68 $365.44

Service Office Supplies, Inc. 8 cartons $57.28 $458.24



Line 16 8.5 x 11 - 67# Vellum Bristol Ivory

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

Graphic Equipment & Supply 8 cartons $31.50 $252.00

Western Paper Company 8 cartons $32.14 $257.12

QUILL CORPORATION 8 cartons $45.68 $365.44

Service Office Supplies, Inc. 8 cartons No Bid

Line 17 8.5 x 11 - 67# Vellum Bristol Salmon

Name QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification

QUILL CORPORATION 8 cartons No Bid

Graphic Equipment & Supply 8 cartons No Bid

Western Paper Company 8 cartons No Bid

Service Office Supplies, Inc. 8 cartons No Bid

Western Paper Company (Alt 1) 8

cartons $35.84 $286.72 8.5 x 11-90 Salmon Exact Index, 2000 sheets per 

case

AWARDED VENDOR

Item bid did not meet specifications


