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Certificates - Black Ink (500) 26.47 98.27 40.00 29.12 30.00
Certificates - Black Ink (1,000) 35.21 120.24 70.00 33.28 42.00
Certificates - Black Ink (2,000) 48.26 157.57 100.00 38.90 65.00
Certificates - Colored Ink (500) 40.03 138.36 55.00 42.33 90.00

Certificates - Colored Ink (1,000) 48.78 178.46 100.00 44.26 165.00
Certificates - Colored Ink (2,000) 61.82 205.52 180.00 62.92 315.00

Certificates - Black with One Color Ink (500) 61.43 121.22 55.00 48.94 90.00
Certificates - Black with One Color Ink (1,000) 71.54 157.57 100.00 54.75 165.00
Certificates - Black with One Color Ink (2,000) 87.65 187.53 180.00 74.93 315.00

Envelopes - 6" X 9" (500) 30.44 51.27 40.00 32.86 60.90
Envelopes - 6" X 9" (1,000) 40.98 72.73 70.00 41.08 90.75
Envelopes - 6" X 9" (2,000) 9,000 57.52 258.84 104.62 470.79 100.00 450.00 50.96 229.32 155.70 700.65

Envelopes - 9" X 12" Catalog or Booklet with Black Ink (500) 33.74 66.27 45.00 32.86 81.30
Envelopes - 9" X 12" Catalog or Booklet with Black Ink (1,000) 44.28 72.73 75.00 41.08 136.20
Envelopes - 9" X 12" Catalog or Booklet with Black Ink (2,000) 5,500 60.81 167.23 89.62 246.46 120.00 330.00 50.96 140.14 165.10 454.03
Envelopes - 10" X 13" Catalog or Booklet with Black Ink (500) 33.74 66.27 50.00 32.86 81.30

Envelopes - 10" X 13" Catalog or Booklet with Black Ink (1,000) 44.28 72.73 80.00 41.08 136.20
Envelopes - 10" X 13" Catalog or Booklet with Black Ink (2,000) 5,500 60.81 167.23 89.62 246.46 120.00 330.00 50.96 140.14 165.10 454.03

Envelopes - #10 with Black Ink (500) 28.86 66.27 35.00 32.86 60.90
Envelopes - #10 with Black Ink (1,000) 32.86 72.73 65.00 41.08 90.75
Envelopes - #10 with Black Ink (2,000) 133,000 44.16 2,936.64 89.62 5,959.73 95.00 6,317.50 50.96 3,388.84 155.70 10,354.05
Envelopes - #10 with Colored Ink (500) 44.17 81.72 40.00 44.62 152.45

Envelopes - #10 with Colored Ink (1,000) 48.34 88.18 70.00 51.48 167.75
Envelopes - #10 with Colored Ink (2,000) 2,500 59.47 74.34 105.07 131.34 100.00 125.00 61.78 77.23 210.00 262.50
NCR Receipts Numbering - 2 Part (500) 20.67 230.80 NO BID 26.00 45.00

NCR Receipts Numbering - 2 Part (1,000) 24.90 374.85 NO BID 31.20 60.00
NCR Receipts Numbering - 2 Part (2,000) 33.34 566.20 NO BID 41.60 80.00
NCR Receipts Numbering - 3 Part (500) 22.54 301.60 NO BID 26.00 50.00

NCR Receipts Numbering - 3 Part (1,000) 25.56 481.43 NO BID 31.20 65.00
NCR Receipts Numbering - 3 Part (2,000) 37.13 765.85 NO BID 41.60 85.00
NCR Receipts Numbering - 4 Part (500) 21.96 371.61 NO BID 26.00 55.00

NCR Receipts Numbering - 4 Part (1,000) 27.46 561.73 NO BID 31.20 70.00
NCR Receipts Numbering - 4 Part (2,000) 40.92 1,205.45 NO BID 41.60 90.00

Folders - Black Ink Outside Only (500) 46.04 797.00 591.04 83.20 NO BID
Folders - Black Ink Outside Only (1,000) 1,000 64.09 64.09 1,015.00 1,015.00 867.16 867.16 104.00 104.00 NO BID NO BID
Folders - Black Ink Outside Only (2,000) 87.96 1,649.00 1,311.37 124.80 NO BID

Folders - Black Ink Inside and Outside (500) 71.38 1,587.00 4,747.76 166.40 NO BID
Folders - Black Ink Inside and Outside (1,000) 99.36 1,215.00 NO BID 208.00 NO BID
Folders - Black Ink Inside and Outside (2,000) 12,000 141.75 850.50 1,869.00 11,214.00 NO BID NO BID 249.60 1,497.60 NO BID NO BID

Business Cards - Black Ink (250) 13.06 26.50 25.00 17.50 28.55
Business Cards - Black Ink (500) 13.90 32.50 45.00 30.00 30.85

Vinyl Banners with Grommets Black Ink (Per Sq. Ft.) NO BID 7.00 4.57 3.75 3.25
Vinyl Banners with Grommets Full Color (Per Sq. Ft.) NO BID 7.00 4.77 3.75 3.25

Coil Binding (Bind Only) 8.5 X 11 (13mm-20mm) 0.70 1.88 - 4.23 NO BID 0.85 1.00
Coil Binding (Bind Only) 8.5 X 11 (6mm-12mm) 0.84 1.88 - 4.23 NO BID 1.50 1.20

$4,518.86 $19,283.77 $8,419.66 $5,577.27 $11,962.76


