AGENDA ITEM
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(A)

(B)

©

(D)

BOARD OF TRUSTEES
AGENDA

Workshop Regular Special

Report Only Recognition

Presenter(s):

Briefly describe the subject of the report or recognition presentation.

X Action Item

Presenter(s): ISMAEL MIJARES, DEPUTY SUPERINTENDENT FOR BUSINESS & FINANCE

LUIS VELEZ, PURCHASING DIRECTOR
Briefly describe the action required.

ONSIDER AND TAKE APPROPRIATE ACTION ON THE REQUEST TO AWARD
SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 200606 FOR MUSIC INSTRUMENTS AND SUPPLIES AND
E BOARD DELEGATES THE SUPERINTENDENT OR DESIGNEE THE AUTHORITY
O MAKE RELATED BUDGETED PURCHASES OF GOODS OR SERVICES AS PER
OARD POLICY CH.

Funding source: Identify the source of funds if any are required.

BUDGETED FUNDS

Clarification: Explain any question or issues that might be raised regarding
this item.

SEE ATTACHED MEMORANDUM




P EAGLE Pass INDEPENDENT ScHOOL DISTRICT

Hasked fro Eecellence

MEMORANDUM

To: Mr. Ismael Mijares, Deputy Superintendent for Business and Finance
I'-,; Digitally signed by Luis Velez

From: Mr. Luis A. Vélez, Purchasing Director s Date: 2019.07.16 232401

Date: July 16, 2019

Subject: Recommendation on Sealed Proposal Number 200606 for Music

Instruments and Supplies

Based on the submitted proposals, the Department of Purchasing recommends that Sealed
Proposal Number 200606 for Music Instruments and Supplies be awarded in accordance with
the specifications and requirements of the proposal and as per the attached Tabulation Sheet.

If you have any questions or need more information regarding this matter, please contact me at
the purchasing department.

1420 Eipson Roap @  Eacre Pass, Texas 78852 @  Ter (830) 773-5181 @  WwW.EAGLEPASSISD.NET

F-280

AN EquaL OprorTuNITY EMPLOYER



EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 200606 - MUSIC INSTRUMENTS AND SUPPLIES

TABULATION SHEET

item | . |

i

lanalGulre | W PEpper A i '
De’g?‘.d?-e‘.‘.-ta’?_; e Pg:pper faan Olivas Music Taylor Music Inc.
No. JLEGEE Sl Ine ;
EAGLE PASS HIGH SCHOOL INSTRUMENTS

1 PEARL ALTO FLUTE 201 SERIES No Bid No Bid $992.50 $959.00 $1,096.85

ADAMS PROFESSIONAL SERIES GEN I

i i ; 2,911.00 ,965.

- HAMMERED COPPER TIMPANI “29 L No Bid pLEIS 0 3 »2,965.00

ADAMS PROFESSIONAL SERIES GEN I

HAMMERED COPPER TIMPANI “26
Bi i { 2,666. 2,720.6
3 COEHE TN ERIDG No Bid No Bid $2,553.00 $2,666.00 $ 0
YAMAHA YMP-202s MARCHING
i i 1,283. i $1,260.
4 B ESHEGHE No Bid No Bid $1,283.00 No Bid 51,260.20
LATIN PERCUSSION LP PERFORMER
5 SERIES 3 PIECE CONGA AND BONGA SET No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
WITH CHROME HARDWARE

HO EDIATE FRENCH
6 LHIRIES 'NHTégxl $2,699.95 No Bid $2,347.00 $2,313.00 $2,313.80
7 SELMER 400 SERIES TENOR SAX $1,329.99 No Bid $1,077.00 $1,050.00 $1,050.75
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EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 200606 - MUSIC INSTRUMENTS AND SUPPLIES

TABULATION SHEET

I;i;n Qty Des'criptloﬁ : Deigach]»-gustars, ) ! Iwas Music . : T.é.\lz.tor Music Inc. Washigeg":f:rMusic
8 |1 YAMA:'&ELZIS;MS:TC;;H'NG No Bid No Bid $2,157.50 No Bid $2,156.80
o | 1| vammvaswemb s | oo | sesmso | woms (U
g | ¢ [PMAHATERSE ‘Q’B?ER'ES WALVES/S No Bid No Bid $4,574.50 No Bid $4,454.45
17 | 1 YAMAHA YCL-450 CLARINET Bb No Bid No Bid $997.50 $933.00 $959.45
12 |1 ADA'\gllMSESSVTﬁ:E égﬁgi‘;i?ﬂimms No Bid No Bid $4,449.50 L _5:2:'5.940:9.00. $2,955.50
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EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 200606 - MUSIC INSTRUMENTS AND SUPPLIES
TABULATION SHEET

Jtem | i ars, | LW, _ I'washington Music
. . il Music Inc. D
No. Qty Description __ f Ollvas M‘u_sic : Taylor Music In conto
C.C. WINN HIGH SCHOOL INSTRUMENTS
1|1 F. HORN-HOLTON 379 $2,999.95 No Bid $2,093.50 $2,511.00 $2,516.25
TAMBOURINE-BLACK SWAMP 12” SINGLE
. . . . |
2 1 ST No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $180.00
TAMA CONCERT TOMS-12X10 TAMA
DOUBLE HEADED CONCERT TOM
No Bid Bi No Bi i :
3 | 1| TRANSPARENT BLACK BURST #TAM- S o Bid s No Bid SN
CCLT12DTPB
TAMA CONCERT TOMS-14X12 TAMA __
DOUBLE HEADED CONCERT TOM il :
4 |1 No Bid No Bi Bi i 1832500
TRANSPARENT BLACK BURST HTAM- o o Bid ok Hanie el
CCLT14DTPB
PEARL CONCERT BASS DRUM W/STAND-
36X16 CONCERT BASS DRUM WITH
No Bid Bi 1,641.50 .
> | 1 | STBDF36 FIELD SUSPENDED STAND-PEA- i No Bid »L, #1,259.05
PBE3616/F46
PEARL CONCERT BASS DRUM W/STAND- L
36X18 CONCERT BASS DRUM WITH e
Bi No Bid 1,651.50 00 1,294,
& | 1 | sTBDF36 FIELD SUSPENDED STAND-PEA- Ne:Bid o8 »1,651.5 ekedrad 200 #1,298:25
PBE3618/F46
LDJIAN 16" ANTINOPLE .
7 | 1| ZLDJAN1E"KCONST No Bid No Bid $275.00 No Bid $236.00

SUSPENDED CYMBAL-ZIL-K1022
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EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 200606 - MUSIC INSTRUMENTS AND SUPPLIES

TABULATION SHEET

Item e .it‘if‘Jn Delgado Guitars, | J.W. Pepper & Son, | Washington Music
No.. e Le e | Center
ZILDJIAN 16" ORIENTAL CHINA TRASH i
: No Bi ' ! }
8 EYMBALZIL-ADETE No Bid o Bid $202.00 No Bid $166.00
PEARL C-930 STRAIGHT CYMBAL STAND . .
9 PEA-CI30 No Bid No Bid $343.50 $180.00
PEARL S-1030L CONCERT SNARE DRUM
1 i i 40.5 .
0 STAND PEA-S1030L No Bid No Bid $340.50 $309.00
PEARL PHILHARMONIC AFRICAN
11 MAHOGONY CONCERT SNARE DRUM- No Bid No Bid $511.00 $502.10
14X6.5 PEA-PHX1465210
ADAMS 3.0 OCTAVE CONCERT
12 VIBRAPHONE WITH FIELD FRAME & NO No Bid No Bid $3,352.00 $3,351.10
MOTOR ADM-VCSF30
ADAMS 3.5 OCTAVE SOLOIST
13 ROSEWOOD XYLOPHONE (XSHV35) ADM- No Bid No Bid $2,199.50 $2,191.90
XSHV35
ADAMS 3.0 OCTAVE CONCERT
14 VIBRAPHONE WITH FIELD FRAME & NO No Bid No Bid $7,866.00 $8,025.80
MOTOR ADM-VCSF30M
15 DW 5500D HI-HAT STAND No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 200606 - MUSIC INSTRUMENTS AND SUPPLIES

TABULATION SHEET

| : i Delgado Guitars, | J.W. Pep . R ) Washin onMi:s"t
tem ' - Description ega‘ S Hlterss | W FERDEnEROn I Music Taylor M B 5r 3'E
Now e - ; S C . Incoa : conan s  Center
DW 5000 SERIES ACCELERATOR BASS bl
. . N Bid . 0.
16 | 1 SR BEbAL BUEBETtoABA No Bid No Bid 0 Bi No Bid $175.00
ADAMS 4.3 OCTAVE ALPHA SERIES
17 | 1 | ROSEWOOD MARIMBA ADM-MAHA43- No Bid No Bid $6,622.00 $6,756.35
9xXX
ADAMS 4.3 OCTAVE ARTIST SERIES
18 | 1 ROSEWOOD MARIMBA WITH FIELD No Bid No Bid $8,695.50 $8,738.05
FRAME ADM-MAHF43
Bid notes:

* Proposed all alternate instruments
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