
Item #1103C

Cenveo San Antonio Right Image

1 2,186.94$                       2,512.00$                           

3,483.34$                       4,990.00$                           

2 794.12$                          875.00$                              

1,784.31$                       2,450.00$                           

3 1,319.07$                       127.20$                              

2,221.16$                       189.10$                              

9,886.86$                       586.00$                              

4 355.54$                          214.15$                              

408.82$                          304.15$                              

5 910.34$                          506.50$                              

2,079.15$                       2,173.03$                           

6 399.17$                          122.40$                              

421.30$                          185.00$                              

7 no bid 536.04$                              

no bid 563.85$                              

8 no bid 40.13$                                

no bid 52.13$                                

9 no bid 23.84$                                

no bid 256.34$                              

10 no bid 33.44$                                

no bid 69.46$                                

11 no bid 72.32$                                

no bid 200.48$                              

no bid 287.06$                              

12 no bid 18.26$                                

no bid 101.67$                              

13 no bid 10.14$                                

no bid 79.40$                                

no bid 16.68$                                

no bid 135.40$                              

14 no bid 174.80$                              

no bid 312.60$                              

15 no bid 1,331.29$                           

no bid 3,079.51$                           

16 1,255.77$                       2,950.00$                           

1,439.06$                       3,450.00$                           

17 no bid 113.85$                              

no bid 410.50$                              

no bid 176.65$                              

no bid 659.95$                              

no bid 224.85$                              

no bid 853.80$                              

18 1,384.34$                       2,075.70$                           

1,404.86$                       2,119.90$                           

1,441.84$                       3,043.20$                           

1,462.36$                       3,109.90$                           

Availability of Services 40 20.00                              40.00                                  

Pricing 40 32.20                              35.00                                  

Catalog Response 20 -                                  20.00                                  

100 52.2 95


