Proposal Project:

Plumbing Parts, Supplies, & Service

Proposal Project Number: 0712-26
Date: December 21, 2007

Section 1: Plumbing Parts

& Supplies
Perceniage
Percentage Percentage Discount
Percentage Discount Discount Amount -|Discount AmountfAmount -  |Percentage
Amount - Parts & Parts & Supplies |- Equipment (In- |Equipment |Mark-up on
Supplies (In-store) (Catalog) store) (Catalog) |Refrigerant
Arlington Pipe &

Supply 20% 20% 20% 20% No Mark-up
Dyna Ten 0% 0% 0% 0% 30% Mark-up
Industrial

Equipment 0-60% 0-60% 0-60% 0-60% N/A
Lowe's of Keller 10% N/A 10% N/A N/A
Mark's Plumbing 0% 0% 0% 0% N/A

Tn price of
repair - see

Plumb Tech 0% 0% 0% 0% below

Roanoke
Winnelson Co 0% 0% 0% 0% 0%
Southwest A/C &
Plumbing 20% 20% 20% 20% 20%
Winston Water
Cooler Varies Varies Varies Varies N/A

**Parts & Supplies awarded to all vendors that responded to those categories**




Proposal Project:

Plumbing Parts, Supplies, & Service

Proposal Project Number: 0712-26
Date: December 21, 2007

Section 2: Plumbing Service

& Repair
Other
basic Materials/Supplies
Holiday | service percentage mark-
Minimum Service Call Technician per | Helper per | Overtime per | per hour call Response up (based on
Charge Trip Charge hour rate hour rate hour rate rate charges Time wholesale prices)
Arlington Pipe &
Supply No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid [ NoBid [ No Bid No Bid
30% mark-up on
greater than
$1000.00. 25%
Time spent per quarter More than|mark-up on less
Dyna Ten hour N/A $65.00 $65.00 $97.50 $97.50 N/A |4 hours |than $1000.00
Industrial
Equipment No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid [ NoBid [ No Bid No Bid
Lowe's of Keller No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid [ NoBid [ No Bid No Bid
Mark's Plumbing No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid [ NoBid [ No Bid No Bid
In price | In price
In price of In price of |of repair -| of repair
In price of repair{ repair - see repair - see see - see
*Plumb Tech $89.50 see below below $25.00 below below below 1 hour 20% mark-up
Roanoke
Winnelson Co No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | NoBid | No Bid No Bid
Southwest A/C &
Plumbing $58.00 None $95.00 $48.00 $125.00 $125.00 | N/A | 4hours | 20% mark-up
Winston Water
Cooler No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid [ NoBid [ No Bid No Bid

*Plumb Tech pricing:

*Hydro Jetting: $175.00 per hr *Grease & Septic Pumping: $0.27 per gallon

*Video Inspect & Locate: $225.00 per hr *Gas Testing: $225.00 per hr, plus permits

*Water Leak Locates: $225.00 per hr

*Cable Drain Cleaning: $89.50 per drain
*Plumbing Repairs: 89.50 per hr

* Southwest A/C & Plumbing = Primary for service & repair * Plumb Tech & Dyna Ten = Secondary for service & repair *
* Plumb Tech = Cleaning of grease traps *




