Southfield Public Schools

Bid No. 25.02

Asbestos Abatement at Levey Middle School

Bids Due: 10:00 A.M., Wednesday, April 23, 2025

BID TABULATION

environmental group

Bid Opening: 10:00 A.M., Wed lay, April 23, 2025
BID RESULTS Bidder Ack led, Bid No. 25.02 Bid No. 25.02 Bid No. 25.02 Bid No. 25.02 Bid No. 25.02 Bid No. 25.02
Contractor / Planholder BB } IRAN’ FRDS| PBM | Al ‘ A2 ~ Qualified Base Bid Per Man-Hour Rate Per Linear Foot/Per Fitting Electrical Power Water Mobilization
BDS Environmental, LLC Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes VYes Yes $315,000.00 $99.00 $25.00 $6,000.00 $3,000.00 $750.00
Dore & Associates, Inc. Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes $476,600.00 $98.80 $30.00 $7,800.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00
Environmental Maintenance Engineers, Inc. Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes $328,000.00 $85.00 $35.00 $12,000.00 $2,000.00 $600.00
Environmental Specialty Services, Inc. Yes Yes Yes VYes Yes Yes Yes $515,000.00 $122.82 $40.00 $8,500.00 $2,500.00 $1,500.00
Global Green Services Group, LLC Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes $493,600.00 $99.00 $30.00 $12,000.00 $2,500.00 $1,500.00
Quality Environmental Services, Inc. Yes Yes Yes Yes VYes Yes Yes $335,000.00 $98.00 $28.00 $3,500.00 $2,500.00 $900.00
Qualified Abatement Services, Inc. Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes $467,000.00 $100.00 $35.00 $14,000.00 $6,000.00 $1,200.00
Total Environmental Services, LLC Yes Yes VYes VYes Yes Yes Yes $302,400.00 $90.00 $30.00/$40.00 $8,000.00 $3,500.00 $900.00
Certified Abatement Services, Inc. -- - - -- - --- --- No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Mid-Michigan Management, LLC - - - - - - - No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Trust Thermal Abatement, Inc. - - - - - - No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Low Bid Amount $302,400.00 $85.00 $25.00 $3,500.00 $2,000.00 $600.00
Total Environmental Services, | Environmental Maintenance ) Quality Environmental Environmental Maintenance | Environmental Maintenance
Low Bidder LLC Engineers, Inc. BDS Environmental, LLC Services, Inc. Engineers, Inc. Engineers, Inc.

Notes:

1 - The low submitted bid(s) is highlighted.

2 - Qualified Bid: All necessary acknowledgements have been made and a bid bond has been submitted.

3 - All bids opened by Mr. Joseph Winters, Arch Environmental Group, Inc.; Mr. Pedro Pacheco, Arch Environmental Group, Inc.; and Mr. Jesse Sutton, Southfield Public Schools and accepted by Southfield Public Schools.

Courtesy of Arch Environmental Group, Inc.

4:28 PM, 4/23/2025




