Bid Tabulation
Musical Instruments
March 10, 2010

Tarpley Music
Company

4  Tuba, Jupiter, 378L $7,908.00
11 French Horn, Yamaha, YHR-567 $21,967.00
1 Concert Bass Drum w/stand, Ludwig, LECB36X8WF $1,179.00
1 Concert Xylophone, Majestic, X5640P $2,324.00
3 Beginning Percussion Kit, Yamaha, SCK300 No Bid

2 Bassoon, Fox, Model IV $9,196.00
2 Oboe, Jupiter, 355 [ $2,194.00|
3 Roland HP-207 Digital Concert Piano with Bench (black) No Bid

Boxed items indicate low bid that met specifications.
Note that the pianos bid by Jent's did not meet specifications.
Total of amount of purchase based on low bidder prices = $56,989.00

Jent's House
of Music

$9,870.00
$27,214.00
No bid
$2,963.00
$1,041.00
$11,594.00
$2,646.00
$9,000.00

The Woodwind  Amarillo Piano
& Brasswind & Education

$7,920.00 No Bid
$21,978.00 No Bid
$1,375.00 No Bid
No Bid No Bid
$864.00 No Bid
$8,556.00 No Bid
$2,320.00 No Bid

No Bid | $11,997.00]




