		Workshop	х	Regular		Special
A)		Report Only				Recognition
Pi	resenter(s	):				
Ві	riefly desc	ribe the subjec	ct of the rep	ort or recog	nition presen	tation.
	<u> </u>				<u> </u>	
В)	х	Action Item	1			
Pr	resenter(s					R BUSINESS AND FI
		LUIS VE	LEZ, PURCHA	SISTANT SUPE SING DIRECTO		R BUSINESS AND FI
<b>B</b>	riefly desc	LUIS VE  Cribe the action  ND TAKE APPRO	L <b>EZ, PURCHA</b> 1 <b>required.</b> PRIATE ACTI	ON ON THE RE	R EQUEST TO AWA	RD SEALED
B C P S	riefly desc Onsider al Roposal n Uperinten	LUIS VE Tribe the action ND TAKE APPRO O. 130621 FOR TO DENT OR DESIGN	LEZ, PURCHAS 1 required. PRIATE ACTI PRTILLAS ANI NEE THE AUT	ON ON THE RED THE BOARD HORITY TO M	EQUEST TO AWA DELEGATES THI AKE RELATED B	RD SEALED
B C P S	riefly desc Onsider al Roposal n Uperinten	LUIS VE Cribe the action ND TAKE APPRO O. 130621 FOR TO	LEZ, PURCHAS 1 required. PRIATE ACTI PRTILLAS ANI NEE THE AUT	ON ON THE RED THE BOARD HORITY TO M	EQUEST TO AWA DELEGATES THI AKE RELATED B	RD SEALED
B C P S P	Criefly desc CONSIDER AI ROPOSAL N UPERINTEN URCHASES (	LUIS VE Tribe the action ND TAKE APPRO O. 130621 FOR TO DENT OR DESIGN	TEQUITED TEQUITED TO THE ACTION TO THE ACTION THE ACTIO	ON ON THE RED THE BOARD HORITY TO ME BOARD POL	EQUEST TO AWA DELEGATES THI AKE RELATED B JCY CH.	RD SEALED
B C P Si P	Criefly desc CONSIDER AI ROPOSAL N UPERINTEN URCHASES (	LUIS VE cribe the action ND TAKE APPRO O. 130621 FOR TO DENT OR DESIGN OF GOODS OR SE	TEQUITED TEQUITED TO THE ACTION TO THE ACTION THE ACTIO	ON ON THE RED THE BOARD HORITY TO ME BOARD POL	EQUEST TO AWA DELEGATES THI AKE RELATED B JCY CH.	RD SEALED
B C P Si P	criefly desc CONSIDER AN ROPOSAL N UPERINTEN URCHASES O	LUIS VE cribe the action ND TAKE APPRO O. 130621 FOR TO DENT OR DESIGN OF GOODS OR SE	TEQUITED TEQUITED TO THE ACTION TO THE ACTION THE ACTIO	ON ON THE RED THE BOARD HORITY TO ME BOARD POL	EQUEST TO AWA DELEGATES THI AKE RELATED B JCY CH.	RD SEALED
B C P Si P	criefly desc CONSIDER AN ROPOSAL N UPERINTEN URCHASES O	LUIS VE cribe the action ND TAKE APPRO O. 130621 FOR TO DENT OR DESIGN OF GOODS OR SE	TEQUITED TEQUITED TO THE ACTION TO THE ACTION THE ACTIO	ON ON THE RED THE BOARD HORITY TO ME BOARD POL	EQUEST TO AWA DELEGATES THI AKE RELATED B JCY CH.	RD SEALED
B C P S' P	criefly descriptions of the consideration of the co	LUIS VE cribe the action ND TAKE APPRO O. 130621 FOR TO DENT OR DESIGN OF GOODS OR SE	n required. PRIATE ACTI PRIATE ACTI PRILLAS ANI NEE THE AUT RVICES AS PE	ON ON THE RED THE BOARD HORITY TO MER BOARD POL	EQUEST TO AWA DELEGATES THI AKE RELATED B JICY CH.	RD SEALED E UDGETED

## EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 130621 TORTILLAS

		EXQUISITA TORTILLAS,		LITA TORT	TILLA	SARITA'S TORTILLA		FLOWERS BAKING CO.			
DESCRIPTION	INC.*			FACTORY		FACTORY II			OINOTINA I		MISSION FOODS
YELLOW CORN TORTILLAS	NO BID		\$		2.50	\$	6.00	\$		1.24	NO BID
COUNT PER PACKAGE				50					30		
UNIT COST			\$		0.0500		0.0600	\$		0.0413	
WHITE CORN TORTILLAS (MASECA)	\$	2.65	\$		2.50	\$	6.00		NO BID		NO BID
COUNT PER PACKAGE	100			50							
UNIT COST	\$	0.02650	\$		0.0500		0.0600				
FLOUR TORTILLAS	NO BID		\$		2.40	\$	8.50	\$		1.45	NO BID
COUNT PER PACKAGE			V2.53	30				180	20		
UNIT COST			\$		0.0800		0.0850	\$		0.0725	
WHEAT TORTILLAS	\$	1.40	\$		2.40	\$	11.00	\$		1.38	NO BID
COUNT PER PACKAGE	20	~~~		30					10		
UNIT COST	\$	0.0700	\$		0.0800		0.1100	\$		0.1380	

COST COMPARISON (Based on 100 Ct.)	EXQUI	SITA TORTILLAS, INC.*	LA	VILLITA TORTILLA FACTORY	SARITA'S TORTILLA FACTORY INC.	FLOWERS BAKING CO. OF SAN ANTONIO, LLC	MISSION FOODS
YELLOW CORN TORTILLAS	\$	-	\$	5.00	\$ 6.00	\$ 4.13	N/A
WHITE CORN TORTILLAS (MASECA)	\$	2.6500	\$	5.00	\$ 6.00	\$ -	N/A
FLOUR TORTILLAS	\$	딸	\$	8.00	\$ 8.50	\$ 7.25	N/A
WHEAT TORTILLAS	\$	7.00	\$	8.00	\$ 11.00	\$ 13.80	N/A

COST COMPARISON (Based on Estimated 2012-13 Consumption as of June 2013)	EXQUISITA TORTILLAS, INC.*	LA V	ILLITA TORTILLA FACTORY	s	SARITA'S TORTILLA FACTORY INC.	FLOWERS BAKING CO. OF SAN ANTONIO, LLC	MISSION FOODS
YELLOW CORN TORTILLAS (303,150)	N/A	\$	15,157.50	\$	18,189.00	N/A	N/A
WHITE CORN TORTILLAS (208,450)	N/A	\$	10,422.50	\$	12,507.00	N/A	N/A
FLOUR TORTILLAS (558,900)	N/A	\$	44,712.00	\$	47,506.50	N/A	N/A
WHEAT TORTILLAS (28,400)	N/A	\$	2,272.00	\$	3,124.00	N/A	N/A
TOTAL COST	N/A	\$	72,564.00	\$	81,326.50	N/A	N/A
TOTAL COST DIFFERENCE (vs Low Bid)	N/A		N/A	\$	8,762.50	N/A	N/A

## **PROPOSAL NOTES:**

1. \* Not Bid as Specified-Flower's Baking Company of San Antonio and Exquisita Tortillas, Inc. did not provide a bid for all tortillas and Proposal specifies award of contract to one (1) vendor.

Approved By:

GILBERT GOMZALEZ SUPPRINTENDENT