BOARD OF TRUSTEES AGENDA

	Worksh	ор	Regular		Special							
	Report	Only			Recognition							
1	Presenter(s):											
	Briefly describe the se	ubject of the re	eport or reco	gnition presen	tation.							
X Action Item												
١	Presenter(s):				Presenter(s): ISMAEL MIJARES, DEPUTY SUPT. FOR BUSINESS AND FINANCE LUIS VELEZ, PURCHASING DIRECTOR							
Briefly describe the action required.												
ı												
	Briefly describe the a CONSIDER AND TAKE AR NO. 251901 ON MANUAL SUPERINTENDENT OR D OF GOODS OR SERVICES	PPROPRIATE ACT LABOR SERVICES ESIGNEE THE AU	TION ON THE R AND THE BOA THORITY TO M	RD DELEGATES 7	ГНЕ							
	CONSIDER AND TAKE AF NO. 251901 ON MANUAL SUPERINTENDENT OR D	PPROPRIATE ACT LABOR SERVICES ESIGNEE THE AU AS PER BOARD P	TION ON THE REAND THE BOATHORITY TO MOLICY CH.	RD DELEGATES 1 IAKE RELATED B	THE UDGETED PURC							
	CONSIDER AND TAKE AF NO. 251901 ON MANUAL SUPERINTENDENT OR D OF GOODS OR SERVICES	PPROPRIATE ACT LABOR SERVICES ESIGNEE THE AU AS PER BOARD P	TION ON THE REAND THE BOATHORITY TO MOLICY CH.	RD DELEGATES 1 IAKE RELATED B	THE UDGETED PURC							
	CONSIDER AND TAKE AF NO. 251901 ON MANUAL SUPERINTENDENT OR D OF GOODS OR SERVICES Funding source: Iden	PPROPRIATE ACT LABOR SERVICES ESIGNEE THE AU AS PER BOARD P	TION ON THE REAND THE BOATHORITY TO MOLICY CH.	RD DELEGATES 1 IAKE RELATED B	THE UDGETED PURC							
	CONSIDER AND TAKE AF NO. 251901 ON MANUAL SUPERINTENDENT OR D OF GOODS OR SERVICES Funding source: Iden	PPROPRIATE ACT LABOR SERVICES ESIGNEE THE AU AS PER BOARD P	TION ON THE RAND THE BOATHORITY TO MOLICY CH.	RD DELEGATES T	THE UDGETED PURC							



Eagle Pass Independent School District

MEMORANDUM

To:

Mr. Ismael Mijares, Deputy Superintendent for Business and Finance

From:

Mr. Luis A. Vélez, Purchasing Director

Luis Vélez

2025.02.04 15:53:07

Date:

Monday, February 3, 2025

Subject:

Recommendation on Sealed Proposal Number 251901 for

Manual Labor Services

Based on the submitted proposals, the Department of Purchasing recommends that Sealed Proposal 251901 for Manual Labor Services be awarded in accordance with the specifications and requirements of the proposal and as per the attached Tabulation Sheet.

If you have any questions or need more information regarding this matter, please contact me at the Purchasing Department.

EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT REQUEST FOR PROPOSAL NO. 251901 - MANUAL LABOR SERVICES TABULATION SHEET

	DESCRIPTION (price per hour unless otherwise noted):	GT PAINTING AND REMODELING EAGLE PASS, TX		FRANCISCO CARMONA EAGLE PASS, TX		LARRY'S COMMERCIAL & RESIDENTIAL PLUMBING EAGLE PASS, TX	
1	ELECTRICAL (RATE PER HOUR)	\$	35.00	NO BID		NO BID	
2	PLUMBING (RATE PER HOUR)	\$	35.00		NO BID	\$	15.00
3	CARPENTRY (RATE PER HOUR)	\$	25.00		NO BID	NO BID)
4	MASONRY (RATE PER HOUR)	\$	25.00		NO BID	NO BID)
5	WELDING (RATE PER HOUR)	\$	40.00	\$	85.00	NO BID)
6	PAINTERS (RATE PER HOUR)	\$	25.00		NO BID	NO BID)
7	ROOFING REPAIR (RATE PER HOUR)	\$	25.00	\$	75.00	NO BID)
8	SUSPENDED CEILING (RATE PER HOUR)	\$	25,00		NO BID	NO BID)
9	DRYWALL AND INSULATION (RATE PER HOUR)	\$	20.00		NO BID	NO BID)
10	CONCRETE LABOR/CEMENT MASON (RATE PER HOUR)	\$	20.00		NO BID	NO BID)
11	CONCRETE FINISHERS	\$	25.00	-701	NO BID	NO BID)
12	CONCRETE FORM SETTERS	\$	20.00		NO BID	NO BIL)
13	CONCRETE REBAR SETTERS	\$	20.00		NO BID	NO BIL)
14	FENCE INSTALLATION/REPAIR	\$	20.00	\$	65.00	NO BIE)
15	MATERIAL HAULING (INCLUDING EQUIPMENT FEE)	\$	25.00		NO BID	NO BIE)
16	GROUND LEVELING (INCLUDING EQUIPMENT FEE)	\$	40.00		NO BID	NO BIE)