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BOARD OF TRUSTEES
AGENDA

Workshop

X Regular Special

Report Only Recognition

Presenter(s):

Briefly describe the subject of the report or recognition presentation.

X Action Item

Presenter(s): ISMAEL MIJARES, DEPUTY SUPERINTENDENT FOR BUSINESS AND FINANCE
LUIS VELEZ, PURCHASING DIRECTOR

Briefly describe the action required.

CONSIDER AND TAKE APPROPRIATE ACTION ON THE REQUEST TO AWARD SEALED PROPOSAL
NO. 163007 FOR MUSIC INSTRUMENTS AND SUPPLIES AND THE BOARD DELEGATES THE

SUPERINTENDENT OR DESIGNEE THE AUTHORITY TO MAKE RELATED BUDGETED PURCHASES
OF GOODS OR SERVICES AS PER BOARD POLICY CH.

Funding source: Identify the source of funds if any are required.

BUDGETED FUNDS

Clarification: Explain any question or issues that might be raised regarding
this item.

SEE ATTACHED MEMORANDUM




P EAGLE Pass INDEPENDENT ScHOOL DiIsTRICT

Pasted, fro ecellence
To: Mr. Ismael Mijares, Deputy Superintendent for Business and Finance
Digitally signed by Luis A.
From: Luis A. Vélez, Purchasing Director Vélez
: Date: 2015.06.29 09:42:49
Date: Monday, June 29, 2015 -05'00"
Subject: Recommendation on Sealed Proposal Number 163007 for Music

Instruments and Supplies

Based on the submitted proposals, the Department of Purchasing recommends that
Sealed Proposal Number 163007 for Music Instruments and Supplies be awarded
in accordance with the specifications and requirements of the proposal and as per
the attached Tabulation Sheet.

If you have any questions or need more information regarding this matter, please
contact me at the purchasing department.

1420 Eipson Roap @  EacLe Pass, Texas 78852 @  Ten (830) 773-5181 @  WWW.EAGLEPASSISD.NET

F-280

An Equar OprortuniTy EMPLOYER



EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 163007 - MUSIC INSTRUMENTS AND SUPPLIES

TABULATION SHEET
Item aty. Detes) Alamo Music Carolyn Nussbaum | High School Music | J.W. Pepper and McCormick's Edunmﬁor:ahlnusic Olivas Music Perbolaing A Misic Taylor Music Washington Music
No. | Saton Music Co. Service Son, Inc. Enterprises tond 2 s Center
Company
14° X 12" CHAMPIONSHIP CARBON PLY FFX MARCHING SNARE ' " " i
1 6 DRUM CHROME - PEARL FFXC1412/C No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $728.00 No Bid No Bid 5717.00 $717.00
6-8-10-12-13" PMTCC CHAMPIONSHIP CARBON CORE MARCHING
2 4 TENORS IN BLACK W/SILVER BURST W/ ALUMINUM HARDWARE - No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,163.00 No Bid No Bid $1,119.00 $1,138.00
PEARL PMTCCEB023/A368
16" X 14" PBOML CHAMPIONSHIP MAPLE MARCHING BASS DRUM
3 1 IN BLACK SILVER BURST W/ ALUMINUM HARDWARE - PEARL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $478.00 No Bid No Bid $433.00 $438.00
PBOML1614/A368
18" X 14" PBOML CHAMPIONSHIP MAPLE MARCHING BASS DRUM
4 1 IN BLACK SILVER BURST W/ ALUMINUM HARDWARE - PEARL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $507.00 No Bid No Bid 5460.00 $467.00
PBOMLIB14/A363
20" X 14" PBOML CHAMPIONSHIP MAPLE MARCHING BASS DRUM
5 1 IN BLACK SILVER BURST W/ ALUMINUM HARDWARE - PEARL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $538.00 No Bid No Bid $491.00 $499,00
PBDML2014/A368
24" X 14" PBDOML CHAMPIONSHIP MAPLE MARCHING BASS DRUM
[ i IN BLACK SILVER BURST W/ ALUMINUM HARDWARE - PEARL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $586.00 No Bid No Bid $540.00 $548.00
PBOML2414/A368
28" X 14" PBDML CHAMPIONSHIP MAPLE MARCHING BASS DRUM
T 1 IN BLACK SILVER BURST W/ ALUMINUM HARDWARE - PEARL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $652.00 No Bid No Bid 5606.00 $615.00
PBDML2B14/A368
8 6 CORPS EXTREME CX AIRFRAM SNARE CARRIER - PEARL CX5-1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $191.00 No Bid No Bid $175.00 5183.00
9 | gy | MR STEMECR ERRAM TENORCATRER W/ EACE SAR: REATL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $210.00 No Bid No Bid $195.00 $204.00
10 S | CORPS EXTREME CX AIRFRAME BASS DRUM CARRIER - PEARL CXB-1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $191.00 No Bid No Bid $175.00 $183.00
MARCHING SNARE STAND - ADIUSTABLE LEGS FOR BLEACHERS OR . _ i i : e
11 6 LEVEL SURFACES - PEARL MSS-3000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5$121.50 No Bid No Bid $114.00 $117.00
MARCHING TOM TENOR STAND - ADJUSTABLE LEGS FOR . . . " " " ;
12 ] 4 BLEACHERS OR LEVEL SUREALES - PEARL MTS.3000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $134.00 No Bid No Bid $128.00 $131.00
MARCHING BASS DRUM STAND - ADJUSTABLE LEGS FOR BLEACHERS, . . . " . )
13 5 OR LEVEL SURFACES - PEARL MBS-3000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $132.00 No Bid No Bid 5125.00 $129.00
14 6 MARCHING CASE FOR 13/14" SNARE - PEARL PD-1412 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $93.75 No Bid No Bid 569.95 $72.00
15 4 QUAD/QUINT/SEXTET CASE - PEARL PD-8004 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $157.00 No Bid No Bid $139.00 5138.00
16 1 167 X 147 BASS DRUM CASE - PEARL PD-1614 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $99.00 No Bid No Bid $76.00 $77.00
17 | 1 187X 14" BASS DRUM CASE - PEARL PD-1814 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $99.00 No Bid No Bid $79.00 $80.00
18 1 20" X 14" BASS DRUM CASE - PEARL PD-2014 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $109.75 No Bid No Bid 587.00 $89.00
19 1 24" X 14" BASS DRUM CASE - PEARL PD-2414 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $128.25 No Bid No Bid $106.00 $108.00
20 1 28" X 14" BASS DRUM CASE - PEARL PD-2814 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $141.25 No Bid No Bid $120.00 $122.00
21 6 GREY COVER FOR 14" SNARE - PEARL MDCG14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $39.75 No Bid No Bid $30.95 $31.00
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EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 163007 - MUSIC INSTRUMENTS AND SUPPLIES

TABULATION SHEET
Item Carolyn Nussbaum | High School Music | J.W. Pepper and McCormick’s Hatiaps] Washington Music
No. Qty. Description Alamo Music Music Co. sarvten Gy Entamprises Educational Music Olivas Music Peripole Inc. Romeo Music Taylor Music Conter
Company

22 | 4 | GREYCOVERFOR 8-10-12-13 TENOR DRUMS - PEARL MDCG8023 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $49.75 No Bid No Bid $41.95 $43.00
2311 GREY COVER FOR 16" BASS DRUM - PEARL MDCG 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $42.00 No Bid No Bid $32.95 $34.00
24 1 GREY COVER FOR 18 BASS DRUM - PEARL MDCG18 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $42.00 No Bid No Bid 532.95 5$34.00
25 1 GREY COVER FOR 20" BASS DRUM - PEARL MDCG20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $46.00 No Bid No Bid $36.95 538.00
26 1 GREY COVER FOR 247 BASS DRUM - PEARL MDCG24 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 548.60 No Bid No Bid 5$39.95 5$41.00
27 | 1 GREY COVER FOR 28" BASS DRUM - PEARL MDCG28 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $49.95 No Bid No Bid 541,95 $43.00
2|1 GREY COVER FOR 16" BASS DRUM - PEARL MDCG16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $42.00 No Bid No Bid $32.95 $34.00
29 [ 1 [TREWORKSDBCLASSIC e e MaPE T No Bid No Bid $199.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $159.00 $215,00
g | s | TRENORSTRES HARGSRD o BN OHIME Chse- M Tw: Na 8id No Bid $43.00 No Bid No 8id No Bid No 8id No Bid No Bid $35.00 $60.00
31 i | PEARL TRAP TABLE 1B X 24 - PTT-1824W No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $138.00 No Bid No Bid 589.00 $107.00
32 [ 2 | BLACK SWAP ROCK MAPLE WOOD BLOCK LRG - MWB1 BLA-MWB1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $39.00 $60.00
38 | 8 |t | T GHT BOURLE BRACED $102.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid No Bid $95.00
34 | 2 | BLACK SWAP 10° DOUBLE ROW TAMBOURINE TC1 MODEL BLATCL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $149.00 $205.00
35 1 LP MULTI GUIRO LP452 $45.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $38.00 $40.00
36 2 | LP AFUCHE/CABASA - STANDAR WOOD (LP234A) MODEL LP-LP234A $35.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $30.00 $35.00
37 1 PRESONUS STUDIO LIVE 24.4 DIGITAL MIXER 24 CHANNEL $2,350.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,730.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,300.00 No Bid 52,289.00
38 1 YAMAHA STANDARD SERIES TIMPANI YAM TP4304CL $8,095.00 No Bid $8,099.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $7,997.50 No Bid No Bid $7,997.00 $7,797.00
ag | g [RIEUANHCHOCTAVE ””‘;ﬁg’;ﬁ;mm“w'm BARMODELl ¢y 291.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,748.00 No Bid No Bid $1,424.00 $1,850.00
40 | 3 [PUAMICHOSTMEMMENONI RTMESWIHEAM MO s1m0100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,748.00 No Bid No Bid §1,424.00 $1,850.00
41 | 1 | WEISS BELL TREE - MOUNTABLE WITH STEEL FRAM MODEL SW-450 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $180.00 No Bid
42 1 WEISS STEEL SLEIGH BELLS MODEL CRL-SLEIGHBELLS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $28.00 No Bid
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EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 163007 - MUSIC INSTRUMENTS AND SUPPLIES

TABULATION SHEET

National

"N':' aty. Deseription Alamo Music c“"x‘;:“’c':“"“ High m”“"‘ "w‘;nm and ’:nm“" Educational Music | Ofivas Music Peripole Inc. Romeo Music | Taylor Music w“"':::‘::f”“"‘
il e Company

agu| iz | Bakewawe bslvisszsaenlip i S No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid $69.00 $100.00
44 1 2 LP CLAVE - TRADITIONAL MAPLE (LP262) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.95 $14.00
a5 [ 4 [FUPIANLITKCONSTANTINOPLE SUSPENDED CYMBAL MODEL 21- $302.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $293.99 $316.80 No Bid No Bid $282.00 $280.00
a6 4 ZILDJIAN K DARK THIN CRASH CYMBAL 16* K0913 $198.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $197.69 $216.00 No Bid No Bid 5$164.00 $190.00
a7 1 4 ZILDJIAN 107 A CUSTOM SPLASH CYMBAL MODEL ZIL-A20542 $111.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $104.03 $117.20 No Bid No Bid $82.00 $100.00
48 | 4 ZILDJIAN 18"A CUSTOM CRASH CYMBAL MODEL ZIL -A20516 $206.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $203.00 §221.20 No Bid No Bid $170.00 $195.00
49 4 ZILDJIAN 10" K SPLASH CYMBAL MODEL ZIL-KD858 $211.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5113.43 $126.00 No Bid No Bid £92.00 $110.00
50 | 4 | TUDIANIECLASSICORCHESTRAL SUSPENDED CrMsaL MooeL $202.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $192.01 $235.00 No Bid No Bid $182.00 $205.00
51| 4 ZILDIAN GRIENTAL CHINE 167 $189.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $207.80 No Bid No Bid $145.00 $165.00
§F || A PLOMR AR OISR TiROE: SASHDRD CIMBAL MODEL 21 $339,00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $337.56 $369,50 No Bid No Bid $326.00 $325.00
53 | a. | SACKSWAMPLONCERT e i FNARCDRUM MQDEL BLA- No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $787.00 No Bid
54 3 | PEARLS-1030L CONCERT SNARE DAUM STAND MODEL PEA-5103L No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $113.70 No Bid No Bid $99.00 $107.00
55 || ! |[RATPHRHATHMONIC CORCERTNATE DRUM SOUD SHELMARLS No Bid No 8id No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $757.00 NoBid No Bid $760.00 $775.00
B B e v No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $664.50 No Bid No Bid $466.00 $474.00
spi| 4 | IEPHSRNMERE O LOING BSOS STARCITEM No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,494.00 No Bid
55| 4 | SAOSHOUNTDONIE CONG TTAND STANRAROITER N No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $177.00 $190.00
7 O ) Ml it i R No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $77.00 585.00
B0 | | R o orL M3 A or D No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,419.00 No Bid No Bid $2,333.00 $2,371.00
Gl [ 1 | YAWAHAMOSSMUSC ERODUCTION SYHTHESIZER MAN: MOXFS $1,491.00 No Bid $1,385.00 No Bid $1,661.95 No Bid $1,278.00 No Bid $1,378.00 No Bid $1,357,00

(FOR JAZZ BAND)
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EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 163007 - MUSIC INSTRUMENTS AND SUPPLIES

TABULATION SHEET
Item Carolyn Nussbaum | High School Music | J.W. Pepper and McCormick's Nacsl ‘Washington Music
Qty. Description Alamo Music Educational Music Olivas Music Peripole Inc. Romeo Music Taylor Music
No. Music Co. Service Son, Inc. Enterprises Center
Company
PEARL TENOR DRUMS MIDNIGHT BLACK - PEA-PMTMG80234N/A46
1 W/ CHROME HARDWARE WITH CARRIER PEA-CXT-1 W/ CASE PEA- No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,121.00 No Bid No Bid $1,259.00 $1,419.00
PDBO0A

2 YAMAHA TENOR SAX YTS INTERMERDIATE 51,917.00 No Bid $1,879.00 No Bid No Bid $1,864.07 $2,994.50 No Bid No Bid $1,828.00 $1,827.00
3 HOLTON H378 INTERMEADIATE FRENCH HORN 52,345.00 No Bid $2,283.00 No Bid No Bid $2,229.63 $2,255.00 No Bid No Bid $2,199.00 $2,192.00
4 BUFFET CRAMPTON R13 8B CLARINET $2,631.00 No Bid $2,529.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,475.00 No Bid No Bid 52,349,00 $2,758.00
5 TROMBONE PRELUDE BY CONN - SELMER TB711 $309.00 No Bid $345.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $299.00 No Bid No Bid $305,00 $295.00
6 YAMAHA YEP-321 4 VALVE EUPHONIUM - SILVER $1,921.00 No Bid $1,877.00 No Bid No Bid $1,868.93 $1,908.00 No Bid No Bid $1,844.00 $1,832.00
7 YAMAHA HD-200 HARMONY DIRECTOR $1,101.00 No Bid $975.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $949.50 No Bid $980.00 $877.00 $979.00
8 PICCOLO GEMEINHARDT MODEL 4P STANDARD $488.00 $650.00 $543.00 No Bid No Bid $425.00 $499.50 No Bid No Bid $459.00 $467.00
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