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MIS Board of School Trustees
Mansfield Independent School District

26-007 Child Nutrition Serving Line Supplies DATE: 8/26/2025

ACTION ITEM

BACKGROUND:

We request that the MISD Board of Trustees approve the recommendation as
made by the Purchasing Department for awarding the 26-007 Child Nutrition
Serving Line Supplies. Completed proposal requests for RFP 26-007 were
received prior to the closing at 2:00 p.m. on July 30", 2025.

CONSIDERATIONS:

The purpose of this Request for Proposals was to solicit a qualified purchaser for
Child Nutrition Serving Line Supplies. Mansfield ISD invited 120 suppliers and
received 6 responses to this bid.

RECOMMENDATION:

“The Purchasing Department recommends the awarding Imperial Dade and Sam
Tell and Son Inc as listed in tabulation.



1 |School Lunch Tray (500 per case)
Supplier QTY uom Estimated Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description urer er#
Veritiv Operating Company 7000 Cases Dueto tariffs and supply chain reshoring the S} PACTIV YTHBO500SGBX
Imperial Dade (Imperial Bagand P: 7000 Cases $21.28 $148,960.00 PACTIV YTHBO500SGBX
Brady Industries of Texas, LLC 7000 Cases $24.20 $169,400.00 PACTIV YTHBOS500SGBX
[ALT2] Veritiv Operating Company 7000 Cases $28.18 $197,260.00 Darnel - Foam 5 Compartment Lunch Tray, 50( Darnell DU2014501
[ALT1] Veritiv Operating Company 7000 Cases $28.98 $202,860.00 Spring Grove 5 Compartment Lunch Tray, PP, : Spring Grove TBD
Complete Supply Inc 7000 Cases $33.04 $231,280.00 PACTIV YTHBO500SGBX
Sam Tell and Son Inc 7000 Cases $33.75 $236,250.00 PACTIV YTHB0500SGBX
[ALT1] Daxwell 35000 Cases $7.40 $259,000.00 10"x8" Bagasse Tray, 5-Compartment, 100/Cas Daxwell E10006183

2 IHeavy Duty Cutlery Kits (1000 per case)
Supplier Q1Y uomMm Estimated Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description urer er#
Veritiv Operating Company 4000 Cases Due to tariffs and supply chain reshoring the S Victoria Bay VBCUK18B
[ALT1] Daxwell 8000 Cases $9.95 $79,600.00 PP Medium Weight Fork Soupspoon Milk-Stray Daxwell B10006307
Imperial Dade (Imperial Bagand P: 4000 Cases $23.80 $95,200.00 Victoria Bay VBCUK18B
Sam Tell and Son Inc 4000 Cases $27.47 $109,880.00 Victoria Bay VBCUK18B
[ALT1] Veritiv Operating Company 4000 Cases $30.62 $122,480.00 Spring Grove Heavy Duty Cutlery Kit, Fork - Spc Spring Grove V02936
Complete Supply Inc 4000 Cases No Bid Victoria Bay VBCUK18B

3 |Microwave Containers (50 per pack)
Supplier QTY uUomMm Estimated Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
[ALT1] Complete Supply Inc 667 CASE $52.17 $34,797.39 6"X 8"X 1.5" 28 OZ RECTANGULAR CONTAINER EMPRESS EMBL28RT
Sam Tell and Son Inc 2000 Pack $36.45 $72,900.00 Thisitem isacombo;itincludes both containe Cube Plastics CR-928BB
Imperial Dade (Imperial Bagand Pi 2000  Pack $47.11 $94,220.00 Cube Plastics CR-928BB
Complete Supply Inc 2000 Pack No Bid CubePlastics CR-928BB
Daxwell 2000 Pack No Bid Cube Plastics CR-928BB
Veritiv Operating Company 2000 Pack No Bid Cube Plastics CR-928BB

4 |Microwave Container Lids (50 per pack, must pair with Line 3)
Supplier QTY uom Estimated Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description urer f: er#
[ALT1] Complete Supply Inc 667  CASE $52.17 $34,797.39 6"X8"X1.5" 28 OZ RECTANGULAR CONTAINER E EMPRESS EMBL28RT
Imperial Dade (Imperial Bagand Pi 2000  Pack $36.15 $72,300.00 Cube Plastics CRL-92
Sam Tell and Son Inc 2000 Pack $36.45 $72,900.00 Thisitem isacombo;itincludesboth containe Cube Plastics CRL-92
Daxwell 2000 Pack No Bid Cube Plastics CRL-92
Veritiv Operating Company 2000 Pack No Bid Cube Plastics CRL-92
Complete Supply Inc 2000 Pack No Bid Cube Plastics CRL-92

5 |Fni| Pan C iners (100 per case)
Supplier QTY uUomM Estimated Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description urer er#
[ALT1] Imperial Dade (Imperial Bag 225  Case $34.72 $7,812.00 Sameas Western Plastics Victoria Bay VBHXDSP
[ALT1] Daxwell 225 Case $44.17 $9,938.25 Aluminum Pan, Half Steam Table, Deep100/ca Daxwell 110002293
Veritiv Operating Company 225 Case $101.88 $22,923.00 Western Plastics 5116
Sam Tell and Son Inc 225  Case $129.80 $29,205.00 Western Plastics 5116
Complete Supply Inc 225  Case No Bid Western Plastics 5116

6 |Four Compartment Container (360 per case)
Supplier QTY uom Estimated Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
Imperial Dade (Imperial Bag and P: 75 Case $61.62 $4,621.50 PACTIV Y6S324C
Brady Industries of Texas, LLC 75 Case $64.81 $4,860.75 PACTIV ¥65324C
Sam Tell and Son Inc 75 Case $90.38 $6,778.50 PACTIV Y65324C
Daxwell 75 Case No Bid PACTIV Y65324C
Veritiv Operating Company 75 Case No Bid PACTIV Y65324C
Complete Supply Inc 75 Case No Bid PACTIV Y65324C

7 |Four Compartment Ci Lid (360 per case, must fit Line 6)
Supplier QTY uom Estimated Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes urer er#
Imperial Dade (Imperial Bag and P: 75 Case $34.92 $2,619.00 PACTIV 6SFLY
Brady Industries of Texas, LLC 75 Case $37.75 $2,831.25 PACTIV 6SFLY
Sam Tell and Son Inc 75 Case $51.23 $3,842.25 PACTIV B6SFLY
Daxwell 75 Case No Bid PACTIV 6SFLY
Veritiv Operating Company 75 Case No Bid PACTIV 6SFLY
Complete Supply Inc 75 Case No Bid PACTIV B6SFLY

8 IOven Safe Bowl - 14-150z Capacity (500 per case)
Supplier QTY uUomM Estimated Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes urer er#
Imperial Dade (Imperial Bagand Pi 175  Case $46.55 $8,146.25 PACTIV PEP5613RxP
Brady Industries of Texas, LLC 175  Case $48.95 $8,566.25 PACTIV PEP5613RxP
Sam Tell and Son Inc 175 Case $68.31 $11,954.25 PACTIV PEP5613RxP
Daxwell 175 Case No Bid PACTIV PEP5613RxP
Veritiv Operating Company 175 Case No Bid PACTIV PEP5613RxP
Complete Supply Inc 175  Case No Bid PACTIV PEP5613RxP

9 ]Oven Safe Bowl - 20-220z Capacity (500 per case)
Supplier QTY uom Estimated Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
Imperial Dade (Imperial Bag and P: 40 Case $72.86 $2,914.40 PACTIV PEP5713RxP
Brady Industries of Texas, LLC 40 Case $76.60 $3,064.00 PACTIV PEP5713RxP
Sam Tell and Son Inc 40 Case $106.92 $4,276.80 PACTIV PEP5713RxP
Daxwell 40 Case No Bid PACTIV PEP5713RxP
Veritiv Operating Company 40 Case No Bid PACTIV PEP5713RxP
Complete Supply Inc 40 Case No Bid PACTIV PEP5713RxP
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