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LAREDO, TEXAS

Topie: Consideration for approval of RFP 2012-002 Telecommunications Services (E-Rate 15)

Submitted by: Cordelia Jackson / Hector Perez Of: Purchasing Department / Information Technology Department

Approved for transmittal to school board: March 6, 2012

Recommendation:

Administration brings for your approval Request for Proposals RFP 2012-002 “Telecommunications Services
(E-Rate 15)” and recommends award as follows:

3 Year Contracts

Section 1 High Speed Special Circuits/ POTS NetSpan Corporation

Section 2 Internet Service Smartcom Telephone, LLC

Section 3 Cellular Phone Service Sprint Communications Company, L.P.
Rationale:

Staft has complied with all applicable federal, state and local purchasing policies and procedures in obtaining
information for the item listed above. Staff is recommending the award based on being the best value to the
district. We will be submitting an application for funding to the Universal Service Administrative Company
(USAC) E-Rate for the telecommunications services presented. The deadline to submit the funding application is
March 20, 2012.

Budgetary Information:
The budget includes the funds for these purchases

Board Policy Reference and Compliance
CH local — purchasing and acquisition

CH legal — purchasing and acquisition

Texas Education Code 44.031




Board Approval
Awarding of Bids/Proposals
March 6, 2012

RFP 2012-002 Telecommunications Services (E-Rate 15)

Recommendation:

Requesting approval to purchase from the best bidder(s)/ offer(s) meeting specifications as
follows:

Recommended Vendor(s) Est. Annual Amount

Section I: High Speed Special Circuits/ POTS
NetSpan Corporation $61,714.80

Section IlI: Internet Service
Time Warner Cable $89, 760.00

Section I11: Cellular Phone Service
Sprint Communications Company See Attached Tabulation

Administration distributed one hundred and two (102) proposals and advertised on January 22,
2012, and January 29, 2012. Seven (7) proposals were received on February 21, 2012, at 3:00
p.m. at the UISD Service Center Purchasing Department.

Budget Information:
2012-2013Technology Department matching funds E-Rate 15 proceeds

Resource Personnel:

Hector Perez, Executive Director of Information Technology
Rene Cruz, Director of Technology

Casey King, Telecommunications System Supervisor
Cordelia Flores Jackson, Director of Purchasing

Hector Cavazos, Purchasing Manager
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FOR CHILDREN

UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

Hector J. Perez
Executive Director of Information Technology

MEMORANDUM

To: Mrs. Cordelia Jackson
Director of Accounting

From: Mr. Hector J. Perez HIP
Executive Director of Information Technology
Date: March 1%, 2012
Subject: Recommendation on RFP Number 2012 — 002 Telecommunications Services

The following is to recommend to award RFP number 2012 — 002 on telecommunications
services to the following vendors:

ltem Recommended Vendor

Section 1. High Speed Special Circuits NetSpan Corporation
And POTs Lines

Section Il. Internet Service Smartcom Telephone, LLC.
100 Mb Instructional Connection

Section Il1. Cellular Phone Service Sprint Communications Company, L.P.

The vendors submitted the best value and met all specifications as stated on the request
for proposal. We will be submitting an application for funding to the Universal Service
Fund (E-Rate). Please see attached tabulation and do not hesitate to call me at extension
6370 if you have any questions on this matter.

201 Lindenwood Drive - Laredo, Texas 78045 - (956) 473-6370 - Fax (956) 473-6411 - E-Mail: hperez@uisd.net



I. High Speed Special Circuits/ POTS

United Independent School District
Telecommunication Services (E-Rate 15)

RFP 2012 - 002 BAFO

Vendors AT&T* Conterra NetSpan Smartcom Sprint Time Warner Verizon
Unit
POTS Lines Monthly Annual Monthly | Annual Monthly Annual Monthly Annual Monthly | Annual Monthly | Annual Monthly | Annual
3 Yr Contract 142 log li . . . .
Yriontract 242 analog fines 142 | $3,14530 | $37,743.60 No Bid $3,542.90 | $42,514.80 | $4,230.18 | $50,762.16 No Bid No Bid No Bid
distributed to 46 locations
T-1 Circuits Monthly Annual Monthly | Annual Monthly Annual Monthly Annual Monthly | Annual Monthly | Annual Monthly | Annual
4-Administration - . . . .
. 4 No Bid $800.00 $9,600.00 $860.20 $10,322.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Link House
3 Yr Contract $1,659.48 $19,913.76
2-Administration - . . . .
;‘;g:;:al ‘on 2 No Bid $800.00 | $9,60000 | $368.26 | $4,419.12 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Section Total Annual Cost $57,657.36 No Bid $61,714.80 $65,503.68 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Section Total Annual Cost - No taxes . . . .
. $57,657.36 No Bid $38,257.44 $44,472.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
and Fees for all Companies
Il. Internet Service
AT&T* Conterra NetSpan Smartcom Sprint Time Warner Verizon
Vendors
Monthly Annual Monthly Annual Monthly Annual Monthly Annual Monthly | Annual Monthly Annual Monthly | Annual
Instructional ISP
3 Yr. Contract for 100 MB Instructional $2,734.72 | $32,816.64 No Bid No Bid $2,100.00 | $25,200.00 No Bid $3,360.00 | $40,320.00 No Bid
Connection
Section Total - Annual Cost $32,816.64 Incomplete Bid No Bid $25,200.00 No Bid $40,320.00 No Bid

* = At & t did not provide Tax and Fee information




11l. Cellular Phone Service

United Independent School District

Telecommunication Services (E-Rate 15)

RFP 2012 - 002 BAFO

Vendors

AT&T

Conterra

NetSpan

Smartcom

Sprint

Time Warner

Verizon

Cell Phone Plans

Est. Qty

Monthly

Annual

Monthly Annual

Monthly Annual

Monthly Annual

Monthly

Annual

Monthly Annual

Monthly

Annual

Total monthly service charge on
proposed plan for 350 Active
units

350

7,875.00

$94,500.00

Monthly Service Charge for Push
to talk only

350

$5.00

$21,000.00

Insurance Plan for Cell Phones,
Monthly charge per unit

350

$6.99

$29,358.00

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

$7,227.00

$86,724.00

Included in cell service

$6.00

$25,200.00

NO BID

$11,546.50

$138,558.00

Included in cell service

$6.99

$29,358.00

Data Plans

Monthly

Cost

Cost

Cost

Monthly

Cost

Monthly

Monthly Wireless internet Data
Card (USB 3g/4g wireless
modem)

Unit

$45.00

Simply Everything Package
(Unlimited Data/Voice/ Text
Package per month

Unit

DNMS

Monthly Pricing per Unit for
unlimited internet usage per
unit

Unit

$15.00

GPS: Monthly pricing to be per
unit with all additional cost
including applicable Data Plans
if Necessary for Basic GPS
Functionality

Unit

$19.99

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

$42.99

$90.67

NO BID

$11.34

NO BID

$37.99

$108.88

$35.99

$23.99




United Independent School District
Telecommunications Services (E-Rate 15)

RFP 2012-002

Abtech Systems Inc
2728 Loker Ave W
Caslsbad, CA 92008
Phone: 760-827-5100
Fax: 760-603-0148
info@abtechsys.com

ACS Dataline LP

1826 Kramer Ln, Ste M

Austin, Texas 78758

Phone: 512-837-4400

Fax: 512-837-6767

Glynn Barker
glynn.barker@acsdataline.com

Advance Business Technologies
PO Box 689

League City, TX 77573

Phone: 281-898-1041

Tim O'Neill

www.advancedbt.com

Advance Communications & Cabling
120 Market St.
Georgetown, TX 78626
Phone: 512-869-4600
Phone: 361-814-3041
Fax: 512-863-4762
Fax: 361-244-3963
Heather Davis
heatherdavis@ac-c.net
Kent Taylor
kenttaylor@ac-c.net
Www.ac-c.net

Amer.com

4500 140 th Ave.N # 101
Clearwater, FL 33726
Phone: 800-262-9703
Fax: 800-314-6805
sales@amer.com

Anixter

3522 Paesanos

San Antonio, Texas
Phone: 210-408-8031
Fax: 210-641-5065
Gerardo Carlos
gerardo.carlos@anixter.com

Best Computers Suppliers
895 E. Patriot Blvd # 110
Reno, NV 89511

Phone: 800-544-3472

Fax: 800-829-4881

Kay Curran
sales@theschoolsupplies.com

Apple Computer, Inc
2420 Ridgepoint Dr
Austin, Texas 78754
Phone: 800-800-2775
Fax: 512-674-2992
Bids Management
bids@apple.com

AT&T Global Services

5711 McPherson Rd. Ste 204
Laredo, TX 78041

Phone: 956-721-5547

Fax: 956-857-3145

Connie Blake

cs3961@att.com

Baford Technologies Inc
PO Box 781362

San Antonio, Texas 78278
Phone: 210-863-7213
Ashish D, Khamkar
akhamkar@yahoo.com

Bass Computer Inc

10558 Bissonnet St.
Houston, Texas 77099
Phone: 281-776-6700

Fax: 281-776-6737

Diego Cervantes
diego@basscomputers.com

Best Products Company
1800 Exeter Court
Arlington, Texas 76017
Phone: 972-337-3805
Fax: 817-394-1662
Elanor Czaika
customerservice@bestproductsco




Borderlan

PO Box 385

San Marcos, CA 92079
Phone: 760-736-8100
Fax: 206-237-2455
Falicia Smith
sales@borderlan.com

Bueno Integrated Technologies Inc
801 Business Parkway

Richardson, TX 75081

Phone: 972-235-9211

Fax: 972-235-3530

Ed Bueno
eddie.bueno@bitsales.com

Calence LLC

2712 N McColl Rd
McAllen, TX 78501
Phone: 480-889-9500
Phone: 956-687-3794
Fax: 480-212-7400

Fax: 956-687-5428

Diana Berger
diana.berger@calence.com
diana.berger@insight.com
www.calence.com

Avant Datacomm

400 Corporate Circle Ste. H
Golden CO 80401

Scott Bergren
sbergren@avantdata.com

Communication Expert
33711 Admiral Ste A

El Paso, TX 79925
Phone: 915-593-8765
Fax: 915-592-9372
Patricia Pedregon
Danny Pedregon
drp452@aol.com

Clear Technologies

1199 S. Beltine Rd. Ste. 120
Coppell, Texas 75019

Phone: 972-906-7537

Fax: 972-906-7543

Angela Thomas
athomas@cleartechnologies.net
marketing@cleartechnologies.net

Comm USA

PO Box 1849

Laredo, TX 78044
Phone: 956-717-2256
Fax: 956-722-1752
Fermine Alfaro
fermin@comm-usa.com

Computer Command Corp
708 E Goodwin

Victoria, Texas 77901

Phone: 361-573-4305

Fax: 361-576-4259

Hugh Hanes
hhanes@computercommand.c

Computer Express
4422 N. McCall Ste. 11
McAllen, TX 78504
Phone: 956-688-8127
Fax: 956-467-0204
Ivan Iglesias

ivan@cetx.com

kristin@cetx.com

Computer Supplies

7377 Convoy Court, Ste.A
San Diego, CA 92111
Phone: 858-268-7370

Fax: 858-268-7371

Ken Jain
bids@computersupplies.com

Computer Solutions/ Microac
7550 IH 10 West, Ste 120

San Antonio, TX 78229

Phone: 800-531-3858 Ext 35
Fax: 210-369-0389

Matt Harris
mharris@convergencecable.co

Convergence Cabling

812 Justin Lane

Austin, TX 78757

Phone: 512-451-1716

Fax: 512-451-1164

Matt Hines
matt.hines@convergencecable
John Lawarence
jlawrence@convergencecable.:




CDI Technology Services
PO Box 8331146

San Antonio, TX 78283
Phone: 210-488-9066

Fax: 210-488-9025
Joseph Weyel
info@cdi-tech.net

CDW Government Inc
230 N Milwaukee Ave
Vernon Hills, IL 60061
Phone: 800-808-4239
Fax: 847-419-6200
Mark Ellis
bids@cdwg.com

www.cdwg.com

Conterra Ultra Broadband, LLC
2101 Rexford Rd Ste 200 E
Charlotte, NC 28211

Phone: 704-365-6701

Fax: 704-365-6702

Steve Parry
Saleslnquiries@Conterra.com

Communications Supply Corporation
12899 Wetmore

San Antonio, Texas 78247

Phone: 210-366-3648

Fax: 210-366-4067

Coy Christal

cchristal@gocsc.com

Jay Mong

jmong@gocsc.com

Daxwell, LLC

2825 Wilcrest Dr. Ste 500
Houston, Texas 77042
Phone: 281-669-0622
Fax: 281-669-0617
Sarah Kirby
sarah.kirby@daxwell.com

Desert Communications, Inc
7355 Remco Circle, Ste 102
El Paso, TX 79912

Phone: 915-584-1287

Fax: 915-581-7697
wyatt@descominc.com

Digital Precision

8200 Pat Booker Rd #359
San Antonio, Texas 78233
Phone: 210-573-9870
Fax: 210-662-8038

Rod Tanner
rtanner@inetx.com

Directron.Com
10402 Harwin Drive
Houton, TX

Phone: 713-773-9898
Fax: 713-773-9393
Michael Chang, PhD

academic_sales@directron.us

Electra Link Inc

12217 Water Park Rd
Austin, TX 78759

Phone: 512-835-6475
Fax: 512-835-6481
Robert Drosche
rdrosche@electralink.com

En Pointe Technologies
1120 Capital Hwy 220
Austin, TX 78746

Phone: 512-330-3207
Fax: 512-306-7311
govsales@enpointe.com

Enterasys Network, Inc
50 Minuteman Rd.
Andover, MA 01810
Phone: 978-684-1000
Fax: 978-684-1658
Greg Blum
support@enterasys.com
partners@enterasvs.com

ePowered Schools

317 Houston Street, Ste E
Manhattan, KS 66502
bids@epoweredschools.com




Expanets

6925 Portwest Dr. Ste 100
Houston, TX 77024

Phone: 281-260-100

Fax: 713-690-5674

Cathy Hundley
cathy.hundley@expanets.com

First Line Communications
PO Box 104

25020 Blanco Rd

San Antonio, TX 78258

Noe A Esparza

Fisk Technologies
8964 Broadway

San Antonio, TX 78217
Phone: 210-832-2489
Cell: 210-286-1348

Fax: 210-828-6434
Robert Trammell
rtrammell@fiskcorp.com
hflechtner@fiskcorp.com

Flair

6300 La Colma Dr. Ste 510
Austin, Texas 78752

Phone: 512-342-9990

Fax: 512-342-9992

Ray Combs
rcombs@austin.flairdata.com

Gaggle Net

PO Box 1361
Bloomington, IL 61702
Phone: 800-288-7750
Fax: 309-663-5025
Mark Elder
mark@gaggle.net
admin@gaggle.net
mike@gaggle.net
www.gaggle.net

Genesis Networks Inc
14220 Northbrook Dr.
San Antonio, TX 78232
Phone: 210-489-6644
Fax: 210-489-6612
Cell: 210-482-0077
Rene Rodriguez

rene.rodriguez@genesisnet.com

Global Data System

9430 Research Blvd. Ste 140
Austin, Texas 78759

Phone: 512-231-9902 x 2102
Fax: 512-423-7007

Diana Berger
info@getgds.com

Global PC Net

6423 McPherson Ste.3
Laredo, TX 78041
Phone: 956-791-9999
Fax: 956-728-6905
Eduardo Canamar
ecanamar@globalpc.net

Global Technologies
5719 Springfield, Ste 3D
Laredo, Texas 78041
Phone: 956-729-8324
Fax: 210-579-8320
Jose A Flores llI
jflores@globalltx.com

Greater Texas Cabling

12407 N Mopac Expwy #100-3
Austin, TX 78788

Phone: 512-246-9551

Fax: 512-246-3999

Jennifer Nooner
info@greatertexas.net

HEB Wireless

646 S Main Ave W2
San Antonio, TX 78127
Phone: 210-559-9885
Fax: 866-267-2931
www.hebwireless.com
wireless@heb.com

Image Net Office System
6050 North Course
Houston, TX 77072

Phone: 832-775-1200

Fax: 832-775-1239

Lee Roberson
jroberson@imagenetos.com




Intech

PO Box 691364

San Antonio, TX 78269
Phone: 210-690-0000

Fax: 210-690-0200

Juan Flores Jr.
kreyher@intechsouthwest.com

Intercom Communications
1815 Houston St

Laredo, TX 78040

Phone: 956-724-3705

Fax: 956-717-1569

Gispson
intercom@border.com

IBM

7100 Highlands Pkwy 016-08
Smyrna, GA 30082

Phone: 800-425-1751 x 2172
Fax: 800-242-6329
Randolph Graham
ews@us.ibm.com

Inacom

911 W Anderson Lane, Ste 200
Austin, TX 78757

Phone: 512-266-7000

Laurie Hunter
inacominfo@inacom.com

Integrity Communications, Ltd

PO Box 260154

Corpus Christi, TX 78426
Phone: 361-242-1000
Fax: 361-242-9300
Jason Evans
jana@integritycd.com

INX Inc

1955 Lakeway Dr Ste 220
Lewisville, TX 75057
Phone: 512-795-8811
Fax: 512-795-8844
Roderick Tanner Jr
rtanner@inxi.com
WWW.inxi.com

IT Assets

304 N Meridian Ste 15
Phone: 405-227-0694
Fax: 405-415-6786
Michael Smith

Laura Mullican
sales@itassets.org

JEH-EAS Inc

dba: Stars Information Soluti
10102 Huebner Rd

San Antonio, TX 78240
Phone: 210-490-9156

Fax: 210-490-5753

David Granato
daveg@starstek.com

K12 Discount

PO Box 2558

1301 Ridgway Rd

Pine Bluff, AR 71603
Phone: 877-512-3472
Fax: 870-536-7949
James Pascale
jamesp@kl2discount.com

Lodde Business Systems
6728 San Pedro

San Antonio, Texas 78216
Phone: 210-824-0177
Fax: 210-824-0154
Patricia Bachman

pat@lodde.com

Mac Professionals

30275 Hudson Dr.

Novi, MI 48377

Phone: 248-893-0738

Cell: 248-229-9658

Fax: 248-893-0747

George Zayed
george@theprosgroup.com

Mandaree Enterprise

PO Box 1030

New Town, North Dakota 5876
Trena Baker
trena.baker@mandaree.com

Micrographic Imaging, Inc
PO Box 34417

San Antonio, TX 78265
Phone: 210-656-0238

Fax: 210-653-6226

Mario A. Ray
mario@micrographic.com

Micro System Enterprises, In
3221 West Alberta

Edinburg, TX 78521

Phone: 956-994-3033

Fax: 956-994-3381
ssanchez@mseng.com




M 1 Networks Inc

6019 McPherson Rd # 10
Laredo, Texas 78041
Phone: 956-718-1005
Fax: 956-718-1090
Marco Solis
marcos@mJlnetworks.net

Midwest internet Consulting Group Inc
dba: Schoolcenter

1075 Reed Station Rd

Carbondale, IL 62902

Phone: 888-642-4448

Fax: 618-351-1996

Kendall Inman
kinman@schoolcenter.com

Modern Imaging Solutions

22122 Sherman Way Ste. 209

Conoga Park, CA 91303

Phone: 800-511-7585

Fax: 888-317-5807

Jocelyn Calmada
jocelync@modernimagingsolutions.com

More Direct

2908 Wisteria

McAllen, TX 78504
Phone: 956-655-2545
Fax: 956-992-0577
iiglesias@moredirect.com

Netgineer Data Systems, Inc
6448 Hwy 280 E. F 107
Austin, TX 78723

Phone: 512-415-1522

Fax: 512-453-1673

Sam Perez Jr.
sperez@netgineer.com

Netsync Network Solutions
2600 W Loop South Ste. 510
Houston, TX 77027

Phone: 713-218-5000

Phone: 866-974-5959

Fax: 713-664-9964

Wayne Richmond
sales@netsyncnetwork.com
www.nhetsyncnetwork.com
wrichmond@netsyncnetwork.com
srodriguez@netsyncnetwork.com

Net Versant - Texas, Inc
1421 Whales Ste. 303
Pslugerville, TX 78660
Phone: 800-826-1979
Fax: 512-615-0671
Jason Hollen
info@netversant.com

Netview Technologies, Inc
7240 Brittmoore Rd. Ste 118
Houston, TX 77041

Phone: 713-896-0500 x 224
Fax: 713-515-8008

Pete Osborn
posborn@netviewtechnologies.col

Nextire One

2800 Post Oak Blvd Ste 200
Houston, TX 77056

Phone: 713-307-4000

Fax: 713-307-7270

Charlotte Elliott
charlotte.elliott@blackbox-vs.c(

NSX Technologies, Inc
dba: Mac Exchange
27326 Jefferson Ave #12
Temecula, CA 92590
Phone: 888-650-4488
Phone: 909-296-1000
Fax: 909-296-6333
William T McKelvie
todd@macx.com

Presidio Corp

2601 Pelican Ave
McAllen, TX 78504
Phone: 956-791-9292
Fax: 956-971-9293
Freeman Johnson
flohnson@presidio.com
Jackie Arnett
jarnett@presidio.com

QA Systems, Inc
6620 Manor Rd
Austin, TX 78723
Phone: 800-331-4132
Fax: 512-637-8811
liliag@gasystems.com




RGC & Associates

115 Travis St

Suite 1500

San Antonio, Texas 780205
Phone: 830-229-5016

SA Office: 888-400-7422
Ron Clontz
rclontz@rgca.net

RZ Communications
1400 Smith Rd

Austin, TX 78721
Phone: 512-636-1929
Fax: 512-386-7350

Joe Charro
jcharro@rzaustin.com
Andrew Ramirez
aramirez@rzaustin.com

RX Technology

3370 Nacogdoches. Ste 136
San Antonio, TX 78217
Phone: 210-828-6081

Fax: 210-828-8419

Mark Rizzo
mrizzo@rx-tech.com
rikajimenez@satx.rr.com

Scantron Corp

34 Parker

Irving, CA 92618

Phone: 800-722-6876 x 7537
Fax: 949-639-7710

Karen Murray
karen_murray@scantron.com

Sequel Data Systems
11824 Jollyville RD, Ste 400
Austin, TX 78759

Phone: 512-918-8841

Fax: 512-918-8843

Chris Case
chris.case@sequeldata.com

Sigma Systems Inc
2201 Midway Rd # 316
Carrollton, TX 75006
Phone: 972-934-9300
Fax: 972-934-0090
Melissa Gregory
mgray@sigmapc.com

Sprint Solutions, Inc

5262 S Staples, Ste 150
Corpus Christi, TX 78411
Phone: 361-533-0256

Fax: 956-828-0428

Patti McKenna, Public Sector M
patti.mckenna@sprint.com
Dominic Montalvo
dominic.montalvo@sprint.com

Supa Tech Inc

17304 Preston Rd Ste 800 RM|
Dallas, TX 75252

Phone: 972-238-8958

Fax: 972-238-7842

Sue Glover

Eric Glover

Tech Depot

6 Cambridge Dr

Trumbull, CT 06611

Phone: 800-625-9866

Fax: 203-615-7006

John Taritian
merchandising@techdepot.con

Trillion

9208 Waterford Centre Blvd, Si
Austin, TX 78758

Phone: 512-334-4080

Fax: 512-334-4099

David Jolly
david.jolly@trillion.net

Tri-County Communications,
1421 East Pike

Weslaco, Texas 78596

Phone: 877-550-8440

Fax: 956-447-0622

Charles Parent
sales@tricountycom.com

Ture Technology

8200 Springwood Dr, Ste 260
Irving, TX 75063

Phone: 972-432-0100

Fax: 972-432-0500
info@truetechnology.com




TigerDirect.Com

7795 W Flagler St

Miami, FL 33144

Phone: 888-768-4437

Fax: 305-415-4311

Marcos Martinez
marcos.martinez@tigerdirect.com

TCR Communications
1416 Houston

Laredo, TX 78040
Phone: 956-724-5201
Fax: 956-726-3154
Martin Resendez Jr
tcrcomm@yahoo.com

TRC Computer Services
11933 Network Blvd

San Antonio, TX 78249
Phone: 210-696-8556
Fax: 210-696-5488

Luis Barragan
info@hts-tx.com

TFE - Technology For Education
8225 Central Park Drive

Waco, TX 76712

Phone: 254-776-5563

Fax: 254-299-1396

Daniel Kronke

daniel.kronke @tfe-waco.com

Technical Laboratory Systems
1113 Ave B

Katy, TX 77493

Phone: 200-445-1088

Fax: 281-391-1113

Edgar Villarreal
sherri@tech-labs.com

Telecore Digital Solution
Phone: 956-661-0400
Charles Jimenez
dnstx@aol.com

The Cabling Experts

2701 Vine

McAllen, TX 78509

Phone: 956-638-4827
Pedro E. Guadarrama
pguadarrama@hotmail.com

The Wire Guy

2418 Baltimore
Laredo, Texas 78041
Phone: 956-740-4049
Cell: 956-744-0164
Raul Patino
twireg@yahoo.com

Tyler Technologies, Inc
5949 Sherry Lane Ste 1400
Dallas, TX 75225

Phone: 972-713-3700

Fax: 972-713-3741
info@tylerworks.com

Tyler Technologies, Inc

370 US Route One

Falmouth, ME 04105

Phone: 800-772-2260

Fax: 207-781-2981

Adam Griffiths
adam.griffiths@tyler-works.con

Time Warner Cable

1313 W Cable Rd

Laredo, Texas 78041
Phone: 956-721-0600
Fax: 956-721-0609

Cell: 956-226-0896

Kyle Rudnick
kyle.rudnick@twcable.com

Verizon Wireless

7600 Montpellier Rd

Laurel, MD 20723

Michael Maiorana
donald.chapa@verizonwireless

Vira Montes Group, Inc
1308 Rockwell Ct

Austin, Texas 78726
Phone: 512-249-9140

Fax: 512-249-9140

Arny Viramontes
arny@viramontesgroup.com




Vira Business Solutions LLP
1649 World Trade Center Loop
Laredo, Texas 78045

Phone: 956-242-4554

Juan Villarreal
juan@virabusiness.com

Way Tech, LLC

dba: Silicon Mountain Memory
2300 Central Ave Ste D

Boulder, CO 80301

Phone: 888-745-6866 x 124
Fax: 303-938-1166

Kevin Richards
krichards@smmdirect.com

West Technologies
10965 Long Branch Dr
Austin, Texas 78736
Phone: 512-301-1462
Fax: 512-301-1457

Jay Thomas
jay.thomas@buywest.com
linda@buywest.com




