Event Number

3865

Organization

Collin College Purchasing

Event Title

Annual Contract for Printer,
Copier, Scanner, Fax Machine,
Cartridges, Ribbons, Repair and
Service

Workgroup

CCCCD

Event Description

Collin College

Event Owner

Suzzen Stroman

Event Type ITB Email sstroman@collin.edu
Issue Date 7/29/2015 3:40:00 PM Central [Phone 1(972) 758-3882
Close Date 8/18/2015 3:45:00 PM Central [Fax 1(972) 377-1082

LD Products, Inc.

Encon Systems Inc.

Limitless Office Products

Recommended Award

Repair and Service:

1. No Bid

Cartridges and Ribbons:
1. Submitted all required
documents

2. Delivery time 3-5 days
3. Not located within a 50
mile radius

Repair and Service:

1. Did not submit required
documents

Cartridges and Ribbons:

1. Did not submitted all
required documents ;
submitted their catalog price

Repair and Service:

1. Did not submit required
documents

Cartridges and Ribbons:

1. Submitted all required
documents

2. Delivery time 2 days

3. Located within a 50 mile
radius

Repair and Service:

1. No Award (rebidding
service separately)
Cartridges and Ribbons: 2.
Limitless Office Product
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3865 (Annual Contract for Printer, Copier, Scanner, Fax Machine, Cartridges, Ribbons, Repair and Service)

LD Products

Encon Systems

Limitless Office

Products
Line # |Description % Discount % Discount % Discount
1 Repair and Service: No Award No Award No Award

2.1 |Apple No Bid 12|No Bid

2.2 |Brother 15 28 20
2.3 |Canon 15 34 20
2.4 |Copystar No Bid 20 20
2.5 |Dell 15 14 2
2.6 |[Elite No Bid 60 20
2.7 |Epson 15 10 7
2.8 |Hewlett Packard 15 42 15
2.9 [Konica Minolta 15 30 20
2.10 |Kyocera 15 23 20
2.11 |Lexmark 15 33 20
2.12 |Oce No Bid 30 10
2.13 |Panasonic 15 30 20
2.14 |Premier No Bid 55 20
2.15 |Ricoh 15 20 20
2.16 |Sharp 15 25 20
2.17 |Xerox 15 31 20
3.1 |Apple 40 40 35
3.2 [Brother 40 60 35
3.3 |[Canon 40 50 35
3.4 |[Copystar No Bid 50 35
3.5 (Dell 40 49 35
3.6 |Elite No Bid 60 35
3.7 |Epson 40 48 35
3.8 [Hewlett Packard 40 62 35
3.9 [Konica Minolta 40 45 35
3.10 [Kyocera 40 40 35
3.11 ([Lexmark 40 48 35
3.12 [Oce 40 39 35
3.13 [Panasonic 40 39 35
3.14 [Premier No Bid 59 35
3.15 |Ricoh 40 42 35
3.16 |Sharp 40 42 35
3.17 |Xerox 40 46 35




