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BOARD OF TRUSTEES
AGENDA
Workshop X Regular Special
Report Only Recognition

Presenter(s):

Briefly describe the subject of the report or recognition presentation.

X Action Item

Presenter(s): ISMAEL MIJARES, ASSISTANT SUPERINTENDENT FOR BUSINESS AND FINANCE
LUIS VELEZ, PURCHASING DIRECTOR

Briefly describe the action required.

CONSIDER AND TAKE APPROPRIATE ACTION ON THE REQUEST TO AWARD SEALED PROPOSAL
NO. 140615 FOR MUSIC INSTRUMENTS AND SUPPLIES AND THE BOARD DELEGATES THE

SUPERINTENDENT OR DESIGNEE THE AUTHORITY TO MAKE RELATED BUDGETED PURCHASES
OF GOODS OR SERVICES AS PER BOARD POLICY CH.

Funding source: Identify the source of funds if any are required.

BUDGETED FUNDS

Clarification: Explain any question or issues that might be raised regarding
this item.

SEE ATTACHED MEMORANDUM




P EacLE Pass INDEPENDENT ScHOOL DISTRICT

Hlarted frv Cecellence
To: Mr. Ismael Mijares, Assistant Superintendent for Business and Finance
Digitally signed by Luis A.
From: Luis A. Vélez, Purchasing Director Vélez
Date: 2014.06.26 14:34:11
Date: Wednesday, June 25, 2014 -05'00°
Subject: Recommendation on Sealed Proposal Number 140615 for Music

Instruments and Supplies

Based on the submitted proposals, the Department of Purchasing recommends that
Sealed Proposal Number 140615 for Music Instruments and Supplies be awarded in
accordance with the specifications and requirements of the proposal and as per the

attached Tabulation Sheet.

If you have any questions or need more information regarding this matter, please
contact me at the purchasing department.

1420 EipsoN Roap @  EacLE Pass, Texas 78852 @ T (830) 773-5181 @  WW\W.EAGLEPASSISD.NET
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EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 140615
MUSIC INSTRUMENTS AND SUPPLIES

HIGH NATIONAL
ALAMO |BROOK MAYS| SCHOOL |J.W.PEPPER| EDUCATIONAL | NORTHEAST [THE MARIACHI
ITEM RESCRIETION MUSICE | MUSIC | MUSICSVC,|&SON,INC.[  MUSIC | MUSIC, INC. | CONNECTION
INC COMPANY
CC WINN HIGH SCHOOL BAND
BUFFET CRAMPON B12 STUDENT
! Bb CLARINET $ 43000|$ 41000|$ 409.00| nomD [§  40625| wnoBID NO BID
2 |SELMER 1430LP Bb BASS CLARINET| ¢ | 393 00 | § 142500 | ¢ 1,41900| noso |§  13s650| wosiD NO BID
, | SELMER LAVOIXII BARITONE
SAXOPHONE $3,398.00 | $ 346000 |$ 342700 oD |$ 329300 NOBID NO BID
4| SELMER(PARIS) JUBILEE SERIES I
BARITONE SAXOPHONE $ 9,899.00 | $ 10,099.00 | $ 9,997.00| NoBID [§ 9599.00| NoBID NO BID
.| FRENCH HORN HOLTON FARKAS
H179 $3,099.00 | $ 35000 312300 NoBID |$ 299830| wNoBID NO BID
.| YAMARA YMP-204MS MARCHING
MELLOPHONE $1,250.00| NOBID [$124800[ nNoBID |$ 1211408 123300 NoBID
” MARCHING BARITONE KING
11275P IN KEY OF Bb $1,789.00 | $ 1,800.00 | $ 1,777.00| NoBiD [$ 171660 NOBID NO BID
5| MARCHING TROMBONE KANSTUL
955-2 nosD | NosiD |$151800| noBiD |s 153200 NoBID NO BID
o [TUBAPROFESSIONAL BB ROTARY,
A4 SIZEYAMAHAYBB-641 | ¢ ¢ 040.00| NoBID |$589700| nosp |$  5767.50| NosD NO BID
10 |PRESOUNDSTUDIOLIVE 24.8.2ALL1 ¢ 5 yac 00| nNosiD | noBiD | NoBID NO BID NO BID NO BID

SOUND MACHINE SM-5-HBM-

N HBMCD NO BID NO BID S 3,199.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

ALL TERRAIN ELECTRONIC
12 KEYBOARD FRAME/SYNTHESIZER

CART NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
13 MUSIC STANDS MANHASSET
M48T NO BID NO BID S 186.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

EAGLE PASS HIGH SCHOOL BAND

1 YAMAHA YSL-448G TROMBONE | $ 1,139.00 NO BID $ 1,133.00 NO BID S 1,093.25 NO BID NO BID

YAMAHA YMP-204 SERIES
MARCHING F MELLOPHONE $ 1,259.00 NO BID $ 1,248.00 NO BID $ 1,211.40 | $ 1,233.00 NO BID

BACH 42BO STRADIVARIUS SERIES

F ATTACHMENT $2,196.00 | § 2,233.00 | $ 2,183.00 NO BID 2,124.25 NO BID NO BID

[0

4 HOLTON H379 FRENCH HORN $2,459.00 [ S 2,499.00 | $ 2,449.00 NO BID 2,377.00 NO BID NO BID

SELMER PARIS REFERENCE 54
TENOR SAX $ 5,090.00 | $ 5,170.00 | $ 6,177.00 NO BID S 4,919.50 NO BID NO BID

SELMER PARIS SERIES Il MODEL
6 SS5AF JUBILEE EDITION BARITONE

SAX $ 8,931.00 [ $ 9,200.00 | $ 9,093.00 NO BID S 8,749.00 NO BID NO BID

7 YAMAHA YBB-641 PROFESSIONAL
ROTARY TUBA $ 6,049.00 NO BID $ 5,897.00 NO BID S 5,767.50 NO BID NO BID
8 YANIGASAWA ALTO SAX A991 $2,285.00 | $ 3,050.00 | $ 3,027.00 NO BID S 2,903.40 NO BID NO BID

Please note shaded areas denote recommended product and provider. TABULATION SHEET PAGE 1 OF 1



