BOARD OF TRUSTEES AGENDA

	A							
	Workshop	Regular		Special				
	Report Only			Recognition				
P	resenter(s):							
E	riefly describe the subject of the	report or recog	nition present	ation.				
L								
	X Action Item							
P		DEPUTY SUPERINT		ISINESS AND FINAN				
ı	Briefly describe the action require							
F	CONSIDER AND TAKE APPROPRIATE ACTION ON THE REQUEST TO AWARD SEALED PROPONO. 161306 FOR TECHNOLOGY HARDWARE SUPPLIES AND THE BOARD DELEGATES THE							
ŀ	SUPERINTENDENT OR DESIGNEE THE A DF GOODS OR SERVICES AS PER BOARI	UTHORITY TO MA						
	OF GOODS ON SERVICES AS FER BOARD	TOLICI CII.						
=	unding course. Identify the course							
Γ	unding source: Identify the source BUDGETED FUNDS	e or rungs ir any	y are required	•				
	BODGETED FONDS							
L								
t	larification: Explain any question is item.	or issues that n	night be raise	d regarding				
	SEE ATTACHED MEMORANDUM							

To: Mr. Ismael Mijares, Deputy Superintendent for Business and Finance

Digitally signed by Luis

From: Luis A. Vélez, Purchasing Director Date: 2015.07.14

10:36:46 -05'00' Monday, June 29, 2015 Date:

Subject: Recommendation on Sealed Proposal Number 161306 for

Technology Hardware Supplies

Based on the submitted proposals, the Department of Purchasing recommends that Sealed Proposal Number 161306 for Technology Hardware Supplies be awarded in accordance with the specifications and requirements of the proposal and as per the attached Tabulation Sheet.

If you have any questions or need more information regarding this matter, please contact me at the purchasing department.

Marked for Excellence

EAGLE PASS INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT SEALED PROPOSAL NO. 161306 - TECHNOLOGY HARDWARE SUPPLIES TABULATION SHEET

	Item	Description	Estimated		OFFICE DEPOT	THE TREE HOUSE, INC.
	No.		Quantity		Office Del Of	
1	C001	CARTRIDGE, BLACK TONER	100	\$	136.53	\$ 54.20
2	-	CARTRIDGE, BLACK TONER	100		44.99*	\$ 61.00
3		CARTRIDGE, CYAN (BLUE) TONER	80		82.73*	\$ 85.80
4		CARTRIDGE, YELLOW TONER	80		63.79*	\$ 85.80
5	C005	CARTRIDGE, MAGENTA (RED) TONER	80		82.73*	\$ 85.80
6	C006	CARTRIDGE, BLACK TONER	50	\$	300.99	\$ 106.90
7	C007	CARTRIDGE, CYAN (BLUE) TONER	30		115.75*	\$ 158.80
8	C008	CARTRIDGE, YELLOW TONER	30		115.75*	\$ 158.80
9	C009	CARTRIDGE, MAGENTA (RED) TONER	30		115.75*	\$ 158.80
10	T036	CD RECORDABLES	10	\$	129.99	NO BID
11	T054	CARTRIDGE, BLACK LASER TONER	200	\$	135.26	\$ 53.80
12	T056	CARTRIDGE, BLACK TONER	40		47.94*	\$ 81.10
13	T060	CARTRIDGE, BLACK TONER	20		29.42*	\$ 160.00
14	T061	CARTRIDGE, CYAN (BLUE) TONER	20	\$	286.33	\$ 205.00
15		CARTRIDGE, MAGENTA (RED) TONER	30	\$	286.33	\$ 205.00
16	T063	CARTRIDGE, YELLOW TONER	10	\$	257.70	\$ 205.00
17	T064	CARTRIDGE, BLACK INKJET	100	\$	19.79	\$ 19.70
18		CARTRIDGE, COLOR INKJET	20	-	25.99*	\$ 28.00
19		CARTRIDGE, BLACK TONER	200	\$	219.41	\$ 54.00
20		CARTRIDGE, BLACK INKJET	20	-	20.49*	\$ 28.10
21		CARTRIDGE, COLOR INKJET	30	\$	29.99	\$ 29.50
22		CARTRIDGE, BLACK TONER	70	\$	219.41	\$ 61.20
23		CARTRIDGE, CYAN (BLUE) TONER	40	7	37.62*	\$ 67.10
24		CARTRIDGE, YELLOW TONER	40	_	42.99*	\$ 67.10
25		CARTRIDGE, MAGENTA (RED) TONER	40		42.99*	
26		CARTRIDGE, BLACK TONER	60		29.42*	
27		CARTRIDGE, CYAN (BLUE) TONER	10	\$	161.99	
28		CARTRIDGE, YELLOW TONER	30	\$		
29		CARTRIDGE, MAGENTA (RED) TONER	20	\$	129.99	
30		CARTRIDGE, MAGENTA (RED) TONER CARTRIDGE, BLACK TONER			161.99	\$ 113.20
31		CARTRIDGE, CYAN (BLUE) TONER	20	\$	189.84	\$ 153.55
32		CARTRIDGE, YELLOW TONER	10	\$	269.93	\$ 203.00
33		CARTRIDGE, TELLOW TONER CARTRIDGE, BLACK TONER	10	\$	187.69	\$ 203.00
34		CARTRIDGE, BLACK TONER CARTRIDGE, CYAN (BLUE) TONER	300	\$	219.41	\$ 54.40
35		CARTRIDGE, CTAN (BLOE) TONER CARTRIDGE, YELLOW TONER	250	\$	122.99	\$ 50.00
36			250	\$	82.73	\$ 50.00
37		CARTRIDGE, MAGENTA (RED) TONER	250	\$	223.99	\$ 50.00
500		CARTRIDGE, BLACK TONER	125	_	21.82*	\$ 70.00
38		CARTRIDGE, CYAN (BLUE) TONER	125	\$	117.84	\$ 84.05
40		CARTRIDGE, YELLOW TONER	125		76.99*	\$ 84.05
		CARTRIDGE, MAGENTA (RED) TONER	125		16.99*	\$ 84.05
41		CARTRIDGE, BLACK TONER	20		21.82*	\$ 143.00
42		CARTRIDGE, MAGENTA (RED) TONER	1	\$	194.79	\$ 175.00
43		CARTRIDGE, BLACK TONER	60	\$	171.99	\$ 114.15
44		CARTRIDGE, CYAN (BLUE) TONER	40		117.84*	\$ 209.80
45		CARTRIDGE, YELLOW TONER	40		71.19*	\$ 209.80
46		CARTRIDGE, MAGENTA (RED) TONER	30		16.99*	\$ 209.80
47		DUSTER, AIR	700	\$	21.59	NO BID
48		LAMP, PROJECTOR (EPSON 97/98)	1	\$	145.99	NO BID
49	V	LAMP, PROJECTOR (EPSON 83C)	20	\$	246.99	\$ 114.15
50		LAMP, PROJECTOR (EPSON 84)	150	\$	298.99	\$ 114.15
51	1567	MOUSE, OPTICAL	80	\$	6.25	NO BID

Proposal Notes:

Prices are per unit cost

For items not highlighted, the Purchasing Department recommends not awarding that item and re-quoting

* Not bid as specified