
        No.  

  

 

TOPIC:    Approval of Updated Tabulation for RFP 042-2021 Milk & Juice that includes adjusted costs 

   

 due to third party extraordinary changes and inflationary costs.  This RFP was approved on September 15, 2021  

 

at the Regular Board Meeting. 

 

SUBMITTED BY: Ms. Cordelia Flores-Jackson   of: Purchasing Department   

 

APPROVED FOR TRANSMITTAL TO SCHOOL BOARD: December 15, 2021 

 

RECOMMENDATION: 

 

Staff recommends the UISD board of trustees approve the updated tabulation for RFP 042-2021 Milk & Juice 

that includes price increase’s ranging from 2% to 6 % effective January 1, 2022.  This service is provided by 

Oak Farms/Hygeia Dairy to service the Child Nutrition Department, District Wide.  Please see documentation 

justifying the increase provided by the vendor. 

 

 

 

RATIONALE: 

 

Staff has complied with all applicable federal, state and local purchasing policies and procedures in obtaining 

pricing information for the items listed above.  Staff is recommending the award based on being the best value 

to the district. 

 

 

BUDGETARY INFORMATION:  

 

Child Nutrition Funds 

 

 

 

 

POLICY REFERENCE & COMPLIANCE:      

CH local – Purchasing and Acquisition 

CH legal – Purchasing and Acquisition 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT 

AGENDA ACTION ITEM 



 
Board Approval 

Awarding of Bids/Proposals 

December 15, 2021 

 

REVISED 

RFP 042-2021 Milk & Juice 

 

Recommendation: 

Requesting approval to purchase from the best bidder(s)/ offer(s) meeting specifications as follows:  

       

Recommended Vendor(s)                                                     Est. Annual Amount 
    

        Oak Farms/Hygeia Dairy  $2,855,472.70 

        (Dean Dairy Fluid, LLC)  (New Dispensers being provided by vendor) 

        

              

Administration distributed One Hundred and Thirty Seven (137) proposals and advertised on Saturday, June 

27, 2021, and Sunday, June 28, 2021. One proposal was received on July 14, 2021 at 3:00pm at the UISD 

Service Center Purchasing Department.  

 

 

Budget Information: 

2021-2022 Child Nutrition Department 

 

 

 

 

Resource Personnel:  

Raul Ramirez, Director of Child Nutrition Department 

Ana L. Gutierrez, Accounting Manager 

Cordelia Flores-Jackson, Director of Purchasing 

Karina Mendoza-Guerra, Manager of Purchasing 

Michelle Pizaña-Barrera, Procurement Officer 

 





Total Price

(New Dispensers)
$2,855,472.70

Line # Description QTY UOM Unit Extended

1
1/2 Pint Unflavored Skim Milk

with brand new dispensers
350000 EA $0.2567 $89,845.00

2
1/2 pint unflavored 1% fat milk

with brand new dispensers
3100000 EA $0.2621 $812,510.00

3
1/2 pint strawberry fat free

with brand new dispensers
900000 EA $0.2581 $232,290.00

4
1/2 pint Chocolate fat free

with brand new dispensers
3400000 EA $0.2581 $877,540.00

5
1/2 pint unflavored Soy milk

with brand new dispensers
500 EA No Bid

6
1/2 pint unflavored Lactose-Free Milk product 

with  brand new dispensers
11000 EA $0.5862 $6,448.20

7
1/2 pint Chocolate Soy milk

with a brand new dispensers
500 EA No Bid

8
1/2 pint Vanilla Soy Milk

with brand new dispensers
500 EA No Bid

9
1/2 pint Vanilla Almond milk

with brand new dispensers
500 EA No Bid

10

6oz Frozen Orange Juice (100% natural from 

concentrate) delivered to the food production 

center with brand new dispensers
850000 EA $0.2477 $210,545.00

11

4oz Frozen Orange Juice (100% fruit juice) delivered 

to the food production center 

with a brand new dispensers

2000000 EA $0.1798 $359,600.00

11 ALT1
4oz Fresh Orange Juice

with brand new dispensers
2000000 EA $0.1476

12

4oz Frozen Apple Juice (100% fruit juice) delivered to 

the food production center 

with brand new dispensers

800000 EA $0.1798 $143,840.00

12 ALT1
40z Fresh Apple Juice

with brand new dispensers
800000 EA $0.1476

13
4oz Yogurt Strawberry

with brand new dispensers
115000 EA $0.3561 $40,951.50

14
4oz Yogurt Strawberry-Banana

with brand new dispensers
115000 EA $0.3561 $40,951.50

15
4oz Yogurt Cherry

with brand new dispensers
115000 EA No Bid

16
4oz Yogurt Raspberry

with brand new dispensers
115000 EA No Bid

17
4oz Yogurt Horchata

with brand new dispensers
115000 EA $0.3561 $40,951.50

OAK FARMS / HYGEIA DAIRY 

(Dean Dairy Fluid, LLC)

RFP 042-2021

MILK & JUICES

September 1, 2021 - August 31, 2022
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Total Price

(New Dispensers)
$2,855,472.70

Line # Description QTY UOM Unit Extended

18
1/2 pint unflavored skim milk

with previously used dispensers
350000 EA $0.239 $83,650.00

19
1/2 pint unflavored 1% fat milk

with previously used dispensers
3100000 EA $0.2444 $757,640.00

20
1/2 pint Strawberry Fat Free

with previously used dispensers
900000 EA $0.2404 $216,360.00

21
1/2 pint Chocolate Fat Free

with previously used dispensers
3400000 EA $0.2404 $817,360.00

22
1/2 pint unflavored Soy milk

with previously used dispensers
500 EA No Bid

23
1/2 pint unflavored Lactose-Free milk product with 

previously used dispensers
11000 EA $0.57 $6,270.00

24
1/2 pint Chocolate Soy milk

with previously used dispensers
500 EA No Bid

25
1/2 pint Vanilla Soy milk

with previous used dispensers
500 EA No Bid

26
1/2 pint Vanilla Almond milk

with previously used dispensers
500 EA No Bid

27

6oz Frozen Orange Juice (100% natural from 

concentrate) delivered to the Food Production 

Center with previously used dispensers
850000 EA $0.2396 $203,660.00

28

4oz Frozen Orange Juice (100% Fruit Juice) delivered 

to the Food Production Center with previously used 

dispensers
2000000 EA $0.1717 $343,400.00

28 ALT1
4oz Fresh Orange Juice

with previously used dispensers
2000000 EA $0.1395

29

4oz Frozen Apple Juice (100% Fruit Juice) delivered 

to the Food Production Center with previously used 

dispensers

800000 EA $0.1717 $137,360.00

29 ALT1
4oz Fresh Apple Juice

with previously used dispensers
800000 EA $0.1395

30
4oz Yogurt Strawberry

with previously used dispensers
115000 EA $0.348 $40,020.00

31
4oz Yogurt Strawberry-Banana

with previously used dispensers
115000 EA $0.348 $40,020.00

32
4oz Yogurt Cherry

with previously used dispensers
115000 EA No Bid

33
4oz Yogurt Raspberry

with previously used dispensers
115000 EA No Bid

34
4oz Yogurt Horchata

with previously used dispensers
115000 EA $0.348 $40,020.00

35 Half gallon of 1% low fat milk 1 EA $2.1096 $2.1096

36 Percentage Discount of List Price 1 EA 30% 30%

37 Gallon of 1% low fat milk 1 EA $4.1892 $4.1892

ALTERNATIVE PRICING FOR FRESH ORANGE & APPLE  

JUICES IN 4 0Z  CONTAINERS

Storage longevity is 21 days. Can be delivered to 

warehouse or directly to school campus at no additional 

cost

Brand New Dispensers will be used for 36 months

NOTE
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