
                                                 
  

    

 

Vicksburg Community Schools 

 2020 Bond projects 
 

Bid Package Award Recommendation 
 

Series No. 2 Release No.1A  
 
March 7, 2022 
 
 
Vicksburg Community Schools received 3 proposals for 1 bid package that was solicited as Series 2 
Release 1A, part of the 2020 Bond Projects on March 1, 2022. 
 
B.P. 26.1- Electrical Improvements – 3 proposals Received (see attached Bid Tab). 
 
Below is our final review, evaluation and award recommendation.  
 

B.P. 26.1 – Electrical Improvements  

The Bid Package Work Scope consists of: Removal of existing electrical gear and feeders from the 
existing boiler room to the existing transformer.  Service Panels will be upsized to 3000A capacity to 
adequately supply future mechanical improvement needs as well as any future building improvements.  
Additional work associated with this project includes the replacement of the hollow metal exterior 
boiler room door and the interior concrete stairs in the boiler room.  These stairs will be replaced with 
new metal grating stairs.  An alternate to provide temporary power for a portion of the building that is 
expected to be under construction at the same time this service upgrade is taking place was also 
requested with this proposal.     
 
Bid Package: 26.1 Electrical Improvements – VCS Middle School 

                                  

Moore Electrical               Base bid:   $259,667.00 
               Alternate 1:   $  22,323.00 

               Total Current Proposed Contract Amount     $281,990.00         
 

We are recommending that this bid package be awarded to Moore Electrical 

 
As always, we appreciate the opportunity to manage this bidding process for the district, provide our 
recommendations, evaluations and look forward to a successful completion of the above noted project.  
 
Sincerely, 
 
 
 
Chad Kandow 
Project Manager 

 
 
 

 
 

 
 
 



All BID PACKAGES -   Indian Lake Elementary

CONTRACTOR
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NOTES:

Bid Package 26.1

Buist No Bid  $               -    $                -    $                -    No Bid -$                        

Moore Electric 259,667.00$             $    22,323.00  $               -    $                -    $                -    $        259,667.00 281,990.00$           X X X X X

CT Electric No Bid  $               -    $                -    $                -    No Bid -$                        

Nitro Electric No Bid  $               -    $                -    $                -    No Bid -$                        

Hi-Tech Electric 265,202.00$             $    24,000.00  $               -    $                -    $                -    $        265,202.00 289,202.00$           X X X X X

Kalamazoo Electric 430,000.00$             $    10,000.00  $               -    $                -    $                -    $        430,000.00 440,000.00$           X X X X X

Oswalt Electric No Bid  $               -    $                -    $                -    No Bid -$                        

259,667.00$     281,990.00$        

(259,667.00)$       (281,990.00)$          

BID TABULATION DETAIL

Tuesday, March 1, 20222020 Bond Projects Series 2 Release 1A - VCS Middle School Electrical Service Upgrade

  Aparent Low Base Bid  

 Over/Under  Over/Under 

 Base Bid & Alternates Apparent Low 

ALTERNATES BID VALIDITY CHECK-LIST  (X = Provided)


