
ECTOR COUNTY INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT 
ODESSA , TEXAS 

PRINT SHOP PAPER SUPPLIES 
OPENED FRIDAY MAY  22, 2009 
TABULATION SHEET- BID #09-37 

 
 ITEM 

 
DOMTAR 

RIS PAPER 

 
GRAPHIC 

EQUIPMENT 
 OLMSTED 

KIRK PAPER
XEROX 

 
WESTERN 

PAPER 
XPEX 

 
1  
 

 
no bid 

 
$60.10 per case 
$19,232.00 

$58.70 per cs 
$18,784.00* 

no bid $59.60 per cs 
$19,072.00 

$59.10 sub  
not accepted 

 
2  
 

 
no bid 

 
$60.75 per case 
$7,290.00 

$47.50 per cs 
$5700.00* 

no bid $63.55 per cs 
$7,626.00 

$46.86 sub 
not accepted 

 
3  
 

 
$34.49 per case 

 
$35.50 per case 
$9,940.00 

$33.95 per cs 
$9506.00* 

$36.96 per cs 
$10,348.80 

$36.45 per cs 
$10,206.00 

$35.27 per cs 
$9,875.60 

 
4 
 

 
$30.64 per case 

 
$28.02/$29.00cs 
$2,310.20* 

$27.60/$29.00 
$2334.00 

no bid no bid no bid 

 
5  
 

 
$32.10 per 
case* 

 
$40.63 per case 
$1,625.70 

$36.00 per cs 
$1,440.00 

no bid $39.75 per cs 
$1590.00 

$38.66 per cs 
$1,546.40 

 
6  
 

 
$37.92 per case 

 
$40.21 per case 
$$804.20 

$37.80 per cs 
$756.00 

$42.00 per cs 
$840.00 

$39.32 per cs 
$1,590.00 

$36.46  * 
$729.20 

 
7 
 

 
$29.12 per case 

 
$29.05 per case 
$1,162.00 

$27.60 per cs 
$1,104.00* 

no bid $39.54 per cs 
$1,181.60 

$27.71 
$1,108.40 

 
8  
 

 
no bid 

 
$29.95 per case 
$293.50* 

$33.36 per cs 
$333.60 

no bid no bid $33.46 per cs 
$334.60 

   



9 
 

no bid $56.06 per case 
$560.60 

$67.05 per cs 
$670.50 

no bid no bid $48.56 per cs 
$485.60* 

 
10 
 

 
no bid 

 
$36.15 per case 
$1,446.00 

$31.90 per cs 
$1276.00* 

no bid $38.68 per cs 
$1,547.20 

$34.44 per cs 
$1,377.60 

 
11 
 

 
no bid 

 
$43.03 per case 
$645.45 

$38.25 per cs 
$573.75* 

no bid $46.15 per cs 
$692.25 

$41.00 per cs 
$615.00 

 
12 
 

 
no bid 

 
$26.60 per case 
$79.80 

$23.30 per cs 
$69.90* 

no bid no bid no bid 

 
13 
 

 
no bid 

 
$100.68 per case 
$302.04 

$80.96 per cs 
$242.89* 

no bid no bid no bid 

 
14 
 

 
no bid 

 
$92.38 per case 
$277.14 

$79.79 per cs 
$239.37* 

no bid no bid no bid 

 
15 
 

 
no bid 

 
$37.68 per case 
$37.68* 

$53.75 per cs 
$53.75 

$118.00 $59.70 $155.33 

 
16 
 

 
no bid 

 
$62.70 per case 
$627.00 

$122.00 per 
cs 
$1220.00 

no bid $55.25 per cs 
552.50* 

no bid 

 
17 
 

 
no bid 

 
$37.68 per case 
$188.40* 

$89.25 per cs 
$446.25 

$89.25 per cs 
$446.25 

$55.25 per cs 
$276.25 

no bid 

 
* Successful Bidder 


