Bid Request Number

Bid #10-34

Title School Store Supplies
Open Date 8/27/2010 8:00:01 AM Central
Close Date 9/10/2010 2:00:00 PM Central
Batteries, AAA 8/PKO
Line 1 DUR MN2400B8Z
Name QTY UOoM Unit Price |Mfar MfgNo Alternate Specification
STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY CO" 1 per 8/pk $1.60
QUILL CORPORATIONA 1 per 8/pk $3.60
Buffalo Business Products 1 per 8/pk $9.60
S & T Enterprises 1 per 8/pk No Bid
Baker Office Products (Alt 1)* 1 per 8/pk $5.90 EVEREADY |E92BP8 BATTERIES, AAA, 8PK
SSI # 0901650
School Specialty (Alt 1) 1 per 8/pk $8.75 ENERGIZER |E92FP-12
Batteries, AA 8/PK O
Line 2 DUR MN1500B8Z
Name QTY UuoMm Unit Price |Mfar MfgNo Alternate Specification
STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY CO" 1 per 8/pk $1.53
QUILL CORPORATION 1 per 8/pk $3.60
Buffalo Business Products 1 per 8/pk $8.29
S & T Enterprises 1 per 8/pk No Bid
SSI #0901660
0
School Specialty (Alt 1) 1 per 8/pk $3.24 ENERGIZER |[E91BP-4
Baker Office Products (Alt 1)* 1 | per8/pk $5.90 EVEREADY |E91BP8 BATTERIES AA, 8PK
Batteries, C 8/PKO
Line 3 DUR MN1400VR8Z
Name QTY UuoM Unit Price |Mfar MfgNo Alternate Specification
STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY CO" 1 per 8/pk $2.47
QUILL CORPORATION 1 per 8/pk $6.10
Buffalo Business Products 1 per 8/pk $15.36
S & T Enterprises 1 per 8/pk No Bid
SSI #0901680
School Specialty (Alt 1)* 1 per 8/pk $3.24 ENERGIZER |090168
Baker Office Products (Alt 1) 1 per 8/pk $10.89 EVEREADY |E93FP8 BATTERIES, C, 8PK
Batteries, D 8/PKUO
Line 4 DUR MN1300VR8Z
Name QTY UuoMm Unit Price |Mfar MfgNo Alternate Specification
STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY CO 1 |EA per 8/pk $3.37
QUILL CORPORATION 1 |EA per 8/pk $6.10
Buffalo Business Products 1 [EA per 8/pk $15.51
S & T Enterprises 1 |EA per 8/pk No Bid
SSI #0901690
School Specialty (Alt 1)* 1 [EA per 8/pk $3.24 ENERGIZER |E95BP-2
Baker Office Products (Alt 1) 1 |EAper8/pk  $10.89 EVEREADY |E95FP8 BATTERIES, D, 8PK
Batteries, 9-Volt 4/PKO
Line 5 DUR MN16RT4Z
Name QTY uoMm Unit Price |Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification
STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY CO” 1 [EA per 4/pk $4.93
QUILL CORPORATION” 1 |EA per 4/pk $6.10
Buffalo Business Products 1 [EAperd/pd $15.51
S & T Enterprises 1 |[EA per 4/pk No Bid
Baker Office Products (Alt 1)* 1 [EAperd/pd $10.89 EVEREADY |522FP4 BATTERIES, 9V, 4PK
SSI #09017200
School Specialty (Alt 1) 1 [EA per 4/pk $0.00 ENERGIZER |522BP




Binder, I" D-ring, non stick Vue,
Whiteld
Binder, 1" D-ring, non stick Vue,
BlackO

Line 6 UNV 20742, 20741

Name QTY UoM Unit Price |Mfar MfgNo Alternate Specification

QUILL CORPORATION” 1 EA $1.51

Baker Office Products* 1 EA $2.09

Buffalo Business Products 1 EA $3.14

School Specialty 1 EA No Bid

S & T Enterprises 1 EA No Bid
Binder, 1.5" D-ring, non stick Vue,
Whiteld
Binder, 1.5" D-ring, non stick Vue,
BlackO

Line 7 UNV 20744,20743

Name QTY UoM Unit Price |Mfar MfgNo Alternate Specification

QUILL CORPORATION”? 1 EA $2.15

Baker Office Products* 1 EA $2.44

Buffalo Business Products 1 EA $4.19

School Specialty 1 EA No Bid

S & T Enterprises 1 EA No Bid
Binder, 2" D-ring, non stick Vue,
White Binder(J
Binder, 2" D-ring, non stick Vue,
Black BinderO

Line 8 UNV 20746,20745

Name QTY UoM Unit Price |Mfar MfgNo Alternate Specification

Buffalo Business Products* 1 EA $2.75

Baker Office Products 1 EA $2.89

QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA $3.04

School Specialty 1 EA No Bid

S & T Enterprises 1 EA No Bid
Binder, 3" D-ring, non stick Vue,
White
Binder, 3" D-ring, non stick Vue,
Black[

Line 9 UNV 20748,20747

Name QTY UoM Unit Price |Mfar MfagNo Alternate Specification

Baker Office Products* 1 EA $3.47

QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA $3.94

Buffalo Business Products 1 EA $5.60

School Specialty 1 EA No Bid

S & T Enterprises 1 EA No Bid
Binder, 4" D-ring, non stick Vue,
White
Binder, 4" d-ring, non stick Vue,
BlackO

Line 10 UNV 20994,20995

Name QTY UoM Unit Price |Mfar MfgNo Alternate Specification

Baker Office Products* 1 EA $4.37

QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA $5.93

Buffalo Business Products 1 EA $10.78

School Specialty 1 EA No Bid

S & T Enterprises 1 EA No Bid




Binder, 5" D-ring, non stick Vue,
Whiteld
Binder, 5" D-ring, non stick Vue,
BlackO

Line 11 UNV 20997,20998
Name QTY UoM Unit Price |Mfar MfgNo Alternate Specification
Baker Office Products* 1 EA $8.17
Buffalo Business Products 1 EA $12.32
QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA $16.00
School Specialty 1 EA No Bid
S & T Enterprises 1 EA No Bid
Clips, 5/8" Binder, 12/bx[
Line 12
Name QTY UOoM Unit Price |Mfar MfgNo Alternate Specification
QUILL CORPORATION” 1 EA $0.12
School Specialty* 1 EA $0.29
STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY CO 1 EA $0.38
Baker Office Products 1 EA $0.49
Buffalo Business Products 1 EA $0.57
S & T Enterprises 1 EA No Bid
Discs, CD-RW Re-writable Discs[
Line 13 IMA 40955
Name QTY UoM Unit Price |Mfar MfgNo Alternate Specification
STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY CO" 1 EA $0.52
Buffalo Business Products* 1 EA $0.76
QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA $3.36
Baker Office Products 1 EA $7.27
School Specialty 1 EA $8.93
S & T Enterprises 1 EA No Bid
Eraser, Pink Pearl, large, 12/bx0
Line 14 Papermate |70521
Name QTY UuoMm Unit Price |Mfar MfgNo Alternate Specification
STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY CO" 1 BX $3.53
QUILL CORPORATION” 1 BX $4.02
School Specialty* 1 BX $4.19
Baker Office Products 1 BX $4.59
Buffalo Business Products 1 BX $5.93
S & T Enterprises 1 BX No Bid
Eraser, Clic Eraser(J
Line 15 PEN ZE22
Name QTY UoM Unit Price |Mfar MfagNo Alternate Specification
Baker Office Products* 1 EA $0.88
Buffalo Business Products 1 EA $1.60
School Specialty 1 EA $1.69
S & T Enterprises 1 EA No Bid
QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA No Bid
File Folders, Letter, Manila, 2 ply, 1/3
cut, 100/bx0
Line 16
Name QTY uoMm Unit Price |Mfgr MfgNo Alternate Specification
School Specialty* 1 EA $5.48
QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA $6.47
STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY CO 1 EA $6.49
Baker Office Products 1 EA $9.37
Buffalo Business Products 1 EA $11.90
S & T Enterprises 1 EA No Bid




Folder, Pocket w/fasteners, 25/bx,
asst. colors

Line 17
Name QTY UoM Unit Price |Mfar MfgNo Alternate Specification
School Specialty* 1 EA $4.75
STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY CO 1 EA $4.86
QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA $6.45
Baker Office Products 1 EA $7.68
Buffalo Business Products 1 EA No Bid
S & T Enterprises 1 EA No Bid
Markers, Dry Erase, 4 color set,
chisel, EXPOO
Line 18 Sanford 80074
Name QTY UoM Unit Price |Mfar MfgNo Alternate Specification
STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY CO" 1 EA $2.50
QUILL CORPORATION”? 1 EA $2.81
Baker Office Products* 1 EA $2.91
School Specialty 1 EA $2.94
Buffalo Business Products 1 EA $4.71
S & T Enterprises 1 EA No Bid
Paper, Notebook Filler Paper, 10.5 x
8, white[
Line 19
Name QTY UuoM Unit Price |Mfar MfgNo Alternate Specification
Baker Office Products* 1 EA $1.41
Buffalo Business Products 1 EA $1.53
QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA $2.02
School Specialty 1 EA $2.34
STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY CO 1 EA $2.52
S & T Enterprises 1 EA No Bid
Pen, Highlighter, yellow, 12/bx
Line 20
Name QTY UoM Unit Price |Mfar MfagNo Alternate Specification
STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY CO" 1 EA $1.38
School Specialty* 1 EA $1.43
QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA $2.65
Baker Office Products 1 EA $2.69
Buffalo Business Products 1 EA $5.28
S & T Enterprises 1 EA No Bid
Pen, Highlighter, 6 color setl]
Line 21
Name QTY UuoMm Unit Price |Mfar MfgNo Alternate Specification
School Specialty* 1 EA $0.71
STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY CO 1 EA $0.77
QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA $2.65
Buffalo Business Products 1 EA $2.72
S & T Enterprises 1 EA No Bid
Baker Office Products 1 EA No Bid
Pencil, #2 w/eraser, 12/bx0
Line 22
Name QTY UoM Unit Price |Mfar MfgNo Alternate Specification
School Specialty* 1 EA $0.41
STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY CO 1 EA $0.42
Buffalo Business Products 1 EA $0.46
Baker Office Products 1 EA $0.48
QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA $0.55
S & T Enterprises 1 EA No Bid




Power Strip, 4 ft., 6 outputD

Line 23 Kensington
Name QTY UoM Unit Price |Mfar MfgNo Alternate Specification
STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY CO" 1 EA $3.63
Baker Office Products* 1 EA $4.47
School Specialty 1 EA $6.86
Buffalo Business Products 1 EA $7.55
QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA $8.40
S & T Enterprises 1 EA No Bid
Surge Protector, 10 ft., 6 output
Clamp-onO
Line 24 Belkin
Name QTY UoM Unit Price |Mfar MfgNo Alternate Specification
STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY CO" 1 EA $10.39
School Specialty* 1 EA $30.31
S & T Enterprises 1 EA No Bid
QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA No Bid
Buffalo Business Products 1 EA No Bid
Baker Office Products 1 EA No Bid
Laser Labels, 1 x 2 5/8" white, 30
Line 25 labels/sheet
Name QTY UuoM Unit Price |Mfar MfgNo Alternate Specification
School Specialty* 1 EA $4.48
STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY CO 1 EA $5.13
Baker Office Products 1 EA $5.49
Buffalo Business Products 1 EA $14.61
QUILL CORPORATION 1 EA $20.21
S & T Enterprises 1 EA No Bid

*Awarded Vendor

“District cannot meet minimum order requirements or vendor did not meet specifications.




