VENDOR ROLL SINGLE KC TOILET | TOTAL

TOWEL FOLD TISSUE

TOWEL

ALLIED 44,225 4,185 NO BID 48,410
EAGLE
COLMAN 44,200 4,704 55,753.60 104,657.60
WOLF
ARNOLD 44,250 4,365 NO BID 48,615
SALES
GORDON NO VOID VOID VOID
FOODS FAMILIAL

DISCLOSURE

STATEMENT
BATTLE & 46,600 4,182 NO BID 50,782
BATTLE
APAC 41,125 4,620 54,678.40 100,423.40
SUPPLY PRO 40,725 4,032 58,016 102,773
EMPIRE 44,350 5,598 56,000 105,948
EQUIPMENT
QUILL 65,625 6,525 NO BID 72,150
HP 42,125 4,092 55,171.20 101,388.20
PRODUCTS
XPEDX 41,415 4,653 55,686.40 101,764.40
HARRINGTON 142,475 15,897 156777.60 315,149.60
NICHOLS 41,750 4,401 57,164.80 103,315.80
CENTRAL 59,250 5,409 NO BID 64,740
POLY
2500 SUPPLY PRO ROLL 40,725 16.29
CARTONS TOWELS CARTON
300 CARTON | SUPPLY PRO SINGLE 4,032 13.44

FOLD CARTON
TOWELS

2240 APAC TOILET 54,678.40 2441
CARTONS SISSUE CARTON
TOTAL: 99,435.40




