Woodshop Bid Summary

ShopBot Grizzly Industrial Minook Grain & Lumber
Qty Description Unit Price |Total Price| Unit Price | Total Price | Unit Price Total Price
2 Grizzly GO733 - 18" x 47" Heavy-Duty Wood
Lathe no bid no bid $ 2,385.00| $ 4,770.00 no bid no bid
1 DEWALT
15 Amp Corded 12 in. Double Bevel Sliding no bid nobid |$ 699.00($ 699.00 no bid no bid
Compound Miter Saw with XPS tachnology
2 Shop Fox W1865 - 20" 5 HP Planer with
Helical Cutterhead no bid no bid S 3,702.15| $ 7,404.30 no bid no bid
2 Grizzly G0490ZX - 8" Jointer with Spiral
Cutterhead no bid no bid S 1,976.84| $ 3,953.68 no bid no bid
1 Shop Fox W1730 Oscillating Edge Sander
Professional-grade edge sanding. no bid no bid S 2,475.00| $ 2,475.00 no bid no bid
1 Grizzly G0539 - 37" 15 HP 3-Phase Wide-Belt
Sander no bid no bid $14,665.50| $ 14,665.50 no bid no bid
1 Sawstop table saw (The 3HP, 1ph, 230v
configuration with a 36" Industrial T-Glide no bid nobid [$ 5154.00|$ 5,154.00 no bid no bid
Fence)
3 Saw stop - 27" In-Line Router Table RT-TGP
no bid no bid S 1,384.00| $ 4,152.00 no bid no bid
2 M18 5.0ah Battery 10 Pack
no bid no bid no bid no bid $1,117.47 $2,234.94
2 PACKOUT M18 Battery Rack
no bid no bid no bid no bid $17.28 $34.56
6 Milwaukee
2805-20 M18 FUEL™ 1/2" Drill/Driver w/ ONE- no bid no bid no bid no bid $232.97 $1,397.82
KEY™
4 2857-20 M18 FUEL™ 1/4" Hex Impact Driver
w/ ONE-KEY™ no bid no bid no bid no bid $215.54 $862.16
2 Milwaukee
M18 FUEL 18V Lithium-lon Brushless Cordiess| no bid no bid no bid no bid $202.58 $405.16
1/2 in. Hammer Drill/Driver (Tool-Onlv)
2 Husky (does not have to be brand specific, just
hardwood top) 46 in. W x 18 in. D 9-Drawer no bid no bid 1108.87 2217.74 no bid no bid
Gloss Orange Mobile Workbench Cabinet with
1 WEN 4214T 5-Amp 12-Inch Variable Speed
Cast lron Benchtop Drill Press with Laser and no bid no bid 427.5 427.5 no bid no bid
Worl Light
1 3'w x 4'h x 2'l Powder Spray Booth [Kool Koat]
SKU -KKSB342 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
1 1 PRS5 Alpha 96-48-8 5HP ATC 230V 3PH
Shop Bot 4'x 8' CNC $48,596.33 | $48,596.33 | $21,293.95| $ 21,293.95 no bid no bid
machine w/ vacuum hold down svstem. Control
SubTotal $48,596.33| $48,596.33| $55,271.81| $67,212.67 $1,785.84 $4,934.64
Installation $9,825.00{ $9,825.00| $108,158.62| $129,655.34 $0.00 $0.00
Delivery $1,800.00] $1,800.00f $6,488.95 $6,488.95 $0.00 $0.00
Total $60,221.33| $60,221.33| $218,405.04| $257,696.33 $1,785.84 $4,934.64




Metal Fabrication and Welding Bid Summary

Weldstar Grizzly Industrial |
Qty Description Unit Price| Total Price | Unit Price |Total Price
1 Uline -Cantilever Rack - Single Sided, 80 x 49 x 96"
no bid no bid no bid no bid
1 Uline - Add-On Unit for Single Sided Cantilever Rack, 52 x 49 x 96"
no bid no bid no bid no bid
1 Uline - Pallet Rack Starter Unit - 96 x 48 x 96"
no bid no bid no bid no bid
2 T27621 Grizzly 32" Professional English Wheel
$1,806.38 $3,612.76 $2,195.00 | $4,390.00
1 Grizzly G0542 - 48" 12-Gauge Pan and Box Brake
$9,002.87 | $9,002.87 $2,695.50 | $2,695.50
1 Grizzly - T32957 52" Sheet Metal Shear
$4,857.98 $4,857.98 $2,695.50 | $2,695.50
1 Grizzly G0811 - 9" x 16" 1-1/2 HP Horizontal Metal-Cutting
Bandsaw - 9"-10" capacity $5,937.53 | $5,937.53 $3,865.50 | $3,865.50
1 Grizzly G0971 - 51" Powered Slip Roll
$5,969.92 $5,969.92 $3,955.50 | $3,955.50
1 KNAACK Piano-Style Jobsite Box: 66 in W x 30 in D x 54 1/2 in
H, 48 cu ft, Recessed Padlock, Tan on casters $2,797.01 | $2,797.01 no bid no bid
2 Lincoln Electric - Prism® Mobile w/Mechanized Cleaning 13 ft.
MERYV 16 One-Pak® $8,415.94 | $16,831.88 no bid no bid
K4384-7
4 Lincoln Etectric - POWER MIG® 360MP Multi-Process Welder
Education One-Pak® $8,383.66 | $33,534.64 no bid no bid
K4778-1
1 Lincoln Electric - HydroGuard® Bench Welding Rod Oven -
115/120 V $3,017.76 | $3,017.76 no bid no bid
K2942-1
3
$1,244.00 $3,732.00 $427.50 $1,282.50
2 CART-24" CYLINDER CAPACITY-FIRE WALL- Oxy-Acetylene
Cart $1,577.50 $3,155.00 no bid no bid
2 Harris - Model 85-801-510 Deluxe HMD combination ironworker®
kit $274.76 $549.52 no bid no bid
3 WEN TV434 4.25 in. Industrial Strength Benchtop and Drill
Press Tilting Angle Vise $3,058.72 [ $9,176.16 $52.83 $158.49
3 Grizzly G0865 - 8" Bench Grinder with LED Lights
$594.00 $1,187.48 $125.95 $377.85
1 1 BT1D ROLLER GUIDED BEND TESTERS - Fisher Engineering
$4,488.75 | $4,488.75 no bid no bid
2 Metabo 4-1/2-5-Inch Angle Grinder, 11 Amp, 11,000 RPM, Lock-
on Slide Switch, Made in $166.71 $333.42 no bid no bid
1 DGP-PG3-A: Piranha Ill Tungsten Grinder (Grinds Tungsten
Diameters .040", 1/16", 3/32", 1/8", 5/32" & 3/16") $1,675.00 | $1,675.00 no bid no bid
4 Uline - Mobile Steel Assembly Table with Bottom Shelf (on casters)
- 60 x 36" no bid no bid no bid no bid
Subtotal $63,268.49| $109,859.68 | $16,013.28 |519,420.84
Installation $1,000.00 | $1,000.00 $0.00 $0.00
Delivery $500.00 $500.00 $500.00 $2,587.85
Total $64,768.49| $111,359.68 | $16,513.28 |$22,008.69




Construction Lab Bid Summary

Minooka Grain & Lumber Grizzly
Qty Description Unit Price Total Price Unit Price |Total Price
4 2833-20 M18 FUEL™ 6-1/2" Circular Saw (Tool Only) $197.89 $791.44 no bid no bid
4 2737-20 M18 FUEL D-Handle Jig Saw $197.60 $790.40 no bid no bid
2 2836-20 M18 FUEL Oscillating Multi Tool $214.90 $429.80 no bid no bid
2 48-11-1851 M18 5.0ah Battery 10 Pack $1,117.47 $2,234.94 no bid no bid
3 2736-21HD M18 FUEL 8-1/4" Table Saw Kit $616.66 $1,849.98 no bid no bid
3 48-08-0561 Folding Table Saw Stand $136.13 $408.39 no bid no bid
3 2739-21HD M18 FUEL 12" Dual Bevel Sliding Compound Miter $854.27 $2,562.81 no bid no bid
3 48-08-0551 Folding Miter Saw Stand $222.07 $666.21 no bid no bid
3 2745-20 M18 FUEL 30 Degree Framing Nailer $394.20 $1,182.87 no bid no bid
3 2743-20 M18 FUEL™ 15ga Finish Nailer $312.85 $938.55 no bid no bid
2 48-22-8497 Large PACKOUT Wall Plate $39.32 $78.64 no bid no bid
2 48-22-8496 $19.38 $38.76 no bid no bid
2 48-59-1809 PACKOUT 6 Bay Rapid Charger $220.52 $441.04 no bid no bid
2 48-22-8339 PACKOUT M18 Battery Rack $17.28 $34.56 no bid no bid
2 48-22-8343 PACKOUT Tool Station $31.32 $62.64 no bid no bid
2 48-22-8063 PACKOUT Large Bin Set $11.61 $23.22 no bid no bid
2 48-22-8342 PACKOUT Compact Wall Basket $18.36 $36.72 no bid no bid
1 272320 Router N18 Crdls $171.94 $171.94 no bid no bid
1 283820 MILWAUKEE Cordless Compact Router: M18, Bare $318.58 $318.58 no bid no bid
3 283720 M18 Orbital Sander Mil $197.60 $592.80 no bid no bid
3 274620 Nailer Brad 18GA M18 $274.32 $822.96 no bid no bid
6 2805-20 M18 FUEL™ 1/2" Drill/Driver w/ ONE-KEY ™ $232.97 $1,397.82 no bid no bid
4 2857-20 M18 FUEL™ 1/4" Hex Impact Driver w/ ONE-KEY™ $215.54 $862.16 no bid no bid
2 Mfr. Model 1000 KNAACK Piano-Style Jobsite Box: 66 in W x no bid no bid no bid no bid
1 Uline - Cantilever Rack - Single Sided, 82 x 61 x 120" no bid no bid no bid no bid
I Uline - Add-On Unit for Single Sided Cantilever Rack, 54 x 61 x no bid no bid no bid no bid
2 Husky (does not have to be brand specific, just hardwood top)
16 ln W x"1LSri‘n.“D‘?,-Drfv_vrer Gloss Orange Mobile Workbench no bid no bid $1,108.87 $2,217.74
2 SawStop T31731 - 1-1/2 HP 120V Jobsite Saw PR
no bid no bid $1,699.00 $3,398.00
SubTotal $6,032.78 $16,737.23| $2,807.87 $5,615.74
Installation $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Delivery $0.00 $0.00 $744.00 $744.00
Total $6,032.78 $16,737.23| $3,551.87 $6,359.74




Auto Shop Bid Summary

Automotive Specialists

Minooka Grain & Lumber

Qty Description Unit Price Total Price
6 Milwaukee - 3061-20 no bid no bid $1,208.74 $7,252.44
6 Milwaukee - M18™ 3/8" Compact Impact Wrench with no bid no bid $220.62 $1,323.72
6 2805-22 no bid no bid $232.97 $1,397.82
1 RFE02 Hunter Road Force Elite Balancer with TDC Laser $19,245.00 $19,245.00 no bid no bid
2 Hunter TCX51CEN Center Clamp Tire Changer with Bead | $16,998.00 $16,998.00 no bid no bid
1 WAG73
Hunter Aligner with Premium Compact Cabinet & 24" $17,097.00 $17,097.00 no bid no bid
Widescreen LCD.
1 HawkEye Elite cameras mounted to cabinet column fit
most service bay applications $15,955.00 $15,955.00 no bid no bid
when connected to a WARZX or WARRX system
1 Inkjet Color Printer and Printer Shelf Kit- Works with
generation Ill (LCD), generation IV $859.00 $859.00 no bid no bid
{4 0D TouchSeraan - SIWT and PETY and nanaration \/
4 John Dow 18-Gallon Self-Evacuating Portable Oil Drain no bid no bid no bid no bid
1 John Dow 180-Gal Used Qil Storage with Double-Wall no bid no bid no bid no bid
SubTotal $70,154.00 $70,154.00 $1,662.33 $9,973.98
Installation $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Delivery $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Total $70,154.00 $70,154.00 $1,662.33 $9,973.98




Fire Sciences Bid Summary

Air One Equipment

Item Quantity [Notes Unit Price |Total Price
Structural Boot - Rubber - Servus |30 *Various sizes will be required
$195.00 $5,850.00
Structural Helmet - Cairns/
Bullard/ MSA - Bourkes shield |30 et | PRI
Fire Helmet Shield - Leather 30 “Minook? Fire Science” Artwork to be sent upon bid $52.00 $1,560.00
Structural Glove - Vanguard Cuff |30 *Various sizes will be required $65.00 $1,950.00
Thermal Hood -Majestic Pac Il - |30 $55.00 $1,650.00
Rlaclk _ -
Turnout Coat - Lightweight, prefer |30 *Various sizes will be required $1,734.00 $52,050.00
Rlack : i : :
Turnout Pants - Lightweight, 30 *Various sizes will be required $1,430.00 $42,900.00
Drafaor RBlack ‘ : L :
Turnout Gear Rack - Doublesided 10 Mobile Racks; caster wheels $2,069.00 $20,690.00
PRoadyv Pacl : - ‘ :
5" Hose - No brand request/ 6 600’ with Storz Fitting $776.00 $4,656.00
uallonas
2 1/2" Hose - No Brand, S'"Q,'f 8 400’ Single Jacket $23200 | $1,856.00
liackot . Oranne if wvnit havo i
.1 3/4" Hose - No'Brand, smgle 8 400’ Single Jacket $171.00 $1,368.00
iarkot . Oranae if vt haveo it
Spanner Wrenches - No Pref 4 $30.25 $121.00
Hydrant Wrenches - No Pref 2 $56.00 $112.00
Combination Nozzle - No Pref 4 $968.00 $3,872.00
Smooth Bore Nozzle - No Pref 4 $494.00 $1,976.00
Pic Head Axe - No Pref - 4 Not to exceed 8 Ibs. $72.00 $288.00
Coamnneite Handlo
Halligan Bar - No Pref - 4 $235.00 $940.00
Camnneite Handlge : :
Flat Head Axe - No Pref - 4 Not to exceed 8 Ibs. $70.00 $280.00
Comnneite Handlae i .
Sledge Hammer - No Pref 4 Not to exceed 8 Ibs. $46.00 $184.00
Camnangcita Handloc & -
New York Hook - No Pref 2 6’ Hook $115.00 $230.00
New York Hook - No Pref 2 8’ Hook $149.00 $298.00
BLS EMS Kit - No Pref 4 Includes supplies no bid no bid
Biood Pressure Cuff - No Pref 8 no bid no bid
Stethoscope - No Pref 8 no bid no bid
Spinal Immobilization Board - No |4 no bid no bid
I Drof
Spinal Immobilization Board 4 no bid no bid
iIStranc . Nn Prof
Cervical Collars - No Pref 4 no bid no bid
Subtotal $9,419.25 | $154,981.00
Installation $0.00 $0.00
Delivery $500.00 $500.00




