ECTOR COUNTY INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

Bid Request Number Bid #12-003
Title Plumbing Repair Parts
Open Date 1/25/2012 8:01:01 AM Central
Close Date 211472012 3:00;00 PM Central
Line ltems
Regal Flushometer W/C
Line 1 #11¢0
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended  Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
MARK'S PLUMBING PARTS” 24 EA $87.50 $1,620.00
SLOAN #0380153/REGAL 110
XL
Best Plumbing Specialties 24 EA $70.21 $1,685.04 BEST #44495
interline Brands, Inc 24 EA $74.99 $1,799.76 8X-214080, SLOAN
Morrison Supply Comapny 24 EA $76.35 $1,832,40
McCoy?s Building Supply 24 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster $81.00
Regal Flushometer
Line 2 Urinal #186
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
MARK'S PLUMBING PARTS* 24 EA $67.50 $1,620.00
interline Brands, Inc 24 EA $66.36 $1,664.64 $X-214114, SLOAN
SLOAN #3082653/REGAL 186
XL
Best Plumbing Specialties 24 EA $70.21 $1,685.04 BEST #45522
Morrison Supply Comapny 24 EA $76.35 $1,832.40
McCoy?s Building Supply 24 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster $81.00
Guide Assembly #A-163-
Line 3 A
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
SLOAN #0301237/A-163-A
Best Plumbing Specialties* 500 EA $0.97 $485.00 BEST #44406
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 500 EA $0.99 $495.00
Interline Brands, Inc 500 EA $1.23 $615.00 §X-98715, SLOAN
Morrison Supply Comapny 500 EA $3.70 $1,850.00
McCoy?s Building Supply 500 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster $1.13
Handle Complete #B-32-
Line 4 A
Name QTY UOM  UnitPrice  Extended Alternate Specification ~ Note to Buyer
MARK'S PLUMBING PARTS* 32 EA $6.27 $200.64
SLOAN #3301448/B-32-A
Best Plumbing Specialties 32 EA $6.80 $217.60 BEST #44410
Interline Brands, inc 32 EA $7.68 $245.76 5X-91835, SLOAN
Morrison Supply Comapny 32 EA $10.80 $345.60
McCoy ?s Building Supply 32 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster $7.81
Relief Valve W/C #A-18-
Line § AC
Name QTY UQOM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
SLOAN #0301129/A-18-AC
Best Plumbing Specialties* 288 EA $2.07 $586.16 BEST #44403
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 288 EA $3.47 $999.36
Morrison Supply Comapny 288 EA $4.53 $1,304.64
Interfine Brands, Inc 288 EA $8.94 $2,574.72 S$X-80084, SLOAN
McCoy?s Building Supply 288 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster $2.45

Line 6

Relief Valve Urinal #A-19.

AU




Name Q1Y UOM  Unit Price Extended Alternale Specification Note to Buyer
SLOAN #0301130/A-18-AU
Best Plumbing Specialties* 250 EA $2.07 $517.50 BEST #44404
Interline Brands, Inc 250 EA $2.29 $572.50 $X-8417, SLOAN
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 250 EA $3.47 $867.50
Morrison Supply Comapny 250 EA $4.53 $1,132.50
McCoy7s Building Supply 250 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster $2.45
Vacuum Breaker #V-551-
Line7 A
Name QrY UCOM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Interline Brands, Inc® 200 EA $1.30 $260.00 S$X-93385,SLOAN
SLOAN #3323192/V-551-A
Best Plumbing Specialties 200 EA $1.34 $268.00 BEST #48805
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 200 EA $1.78 $356.00
Morrison Supply Comapny 200 EA $3.50 $700.00
McCoy?s Building Supply 200 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster $1.45
Handle Repair Kit #8-50-
Line 8 A
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
SLOAN #5302305/B-50-A
Best Plumbing Specialties* 300 EA $1.50 $450.00 BEST #44413
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 300 EA $1.53 $459.00
Interline Brands, inc 300 EA $1.7¢ $537.00 5X-90498, SLOAN
Morrison Supply Comapny 300 EA $3.85 $1,185.00
McCoy?s Building Supply 300 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster $1.72
Flushvalve Inside Cover
Line 9 #A-T1
Name QTY UCM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
SLOAN #0301121/A-71
Best Plumbing Specialties* 24 EA $1.31 $31.44 BEST #45504
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 24 EA $1.34 $32.16
Interline Brands, Inc 24 EA $1.48 $35.52 §X-82221, SLOAN
Morrison Supply Comapny 24 EA $5.80 $139.20
McCoy?s Building Supply 24 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster $1.48
Flushvaive Qutside
Cover
Line 10 Chrome #A.72
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
SLOAN #0301172PK/A-T2
Best Plumbing Specialties* 1M EA $13.93 $153.23 BEST #45502
Interline Brands, Inc 11 EA $15.13 $166.43 5X-92213, SLOAN
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 11 EA $15.56 $171.16
Morrison Supply Comapny 11 EA $16.45 $180.95
McCoy?s Building Supply 11 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster $19.01
Line 11 Stop Repair ? #3308856
Name QY UOM \UnitPrice  Extended Alternate Specification  Note to Buyer
Intertine Brands, Inc* 36 EA $3.52 $126.72 5X-98475, SLOAN
SLOAN #3308856/H-543-A8D
Best Plumbing Specialties 36 EA $6.19 $222.84 BEST #66095566
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 38 EA $6.83 $24588
Morrison Supply Comapny 36 EA $8.37 $301.32
McCoy?s Building Supply 36 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster $4.62
Line 12 Snap Ring  #H-552
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification Note fo Buyer
SLOAN #5308381/H-552
Best Plumbing Specialties* 24 EA $0.41 $9.84 BEST #43259
Interline Brands, Inc 24 EA $0.44 $10.56 5X-99846, SLOAN
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 24 EA $0.47 $11.28
Morrison Supply Comapny 24 EA $0.60 $14.40
McCoy?s Building Supply 24 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster $0.46

Line 13

#42 O-Ring #H-553




Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
MARK'S PLUMBING PARTS* 100 EA $0.04 $4.00
SEAL DYNAMICS, INC. #AS-123-
70D BUNA
Best Plumbing Specialties 100 EA $0.11 $11.00 BEST #43260
Interline Brands, Inc 100 EA $0.14 $14.00 S$X-61309, STERLING SEAL
Morrison Supply Comapny 100 EA $0.73 $73.00
McCoy?s Building Supply 100 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster $0.02
Old Style Stop Kit ?
Line 14 #3308853
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Interline Brands, Inc* 50 EA $3.52 $176.00 SX-98467, SLOAN
SLOAN VALVE #3308856/H-543-
ASD
Best Plumbing Specialties 50 EA $6.19 $309.50 BEST #88095566
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 50 EA $6.83 $341.50
Morrison Supply Comapny 50 EA $8.37 $418.50
McCoy?s Building Supply 50 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster $4.83
Old Style Stop Kit 1
Line 15 #3308856
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Interline Brands, Inc* 28 EA $3.52 $98.56 SX-98475, SLOAN
SLOAN VALVE #3308853/H-541-
ASD
Best Plumbing Specialties 28 EA $6.19 $173.32 BEST #88095563
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 28 EA $6.83 $191.24
Morrison Supply Comapny 28 EA $8.37 $234.36
McCoy?s Building Supply 28 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster $4.62 RT Dygert
Old Style Stop Kit 1
Line 16 #3308856
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Interline Brands, Inc* 28 EA $3.52 $98.56 S$X-98475, SLOAN
SLOAN #3308853/H-541-ASD
Best Plumbing Specialties 28 EA $6.19 $173.32 BEST #88095563
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 28 EA $6.83 $191.24
Morrison Supply Comapny 28 EA $8.37 $234.36
McCoy?s Building Supply 28 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster $4.62
Line 17 Diaphram Kit #A-156-AA
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
SLOAN #5301189/A-156-AA
Best Plumbing Specialties™ 500 EA $4.86 $2,430.00 BEST #44399
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 500 EA 35.79 $2,895.00
Interline Brands, Inc 500 EA $5.80 $2,900.00 S$X-98483, SLOAN
Morrison Supply Comapny 500 EA $9.42 $4,710.00
McCoy?s Building Supply 500 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster $3.32
Handicap Handle #B-73-
Line 18 A
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
SLOAN #0302390/B-73-A
Best Plumbing Specialties* 6 EA $10.61 $63.66 BEST #44456
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 6 EA $10.79 $64.74
Interline Brands, Inc 6 EA $11.50 $69.00 §X-232413, SLOAN
Morrison Supply Comapny 6 EA $14.34 $86.04
McCoy?s Building Supply 6 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster $12.03
#1 Royal Blue
Compound
Close Couple Gasket
Line 19 31/4" x21/4" x 11/16
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer




MARK'S PLUMBING PARTS®* 100 EA $0.74 $74.00
Morrison Supply Comapny 100 EA No Bid
Best Plumbing Specialties 100 EA No Bid
Interline Brands, Inc 100 EA No Bid
McCoy?s Building Supply 100 EA No Bid
C/C TANK GASKET E-Z FLO #36251
Best Plumbing Specialties (/ 100 EA $0.51 $51.00 FIT/ALL BEST #.51
Plumbmaster $0.40 Alt, Not accepted
#2 Royal Blue
Compound
Close Couple Gasket
Line 20 35/16" x 2 /8" x 15/16
Name QIY UGOM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
MARK S PLUMBING PARTS* 100 EA $0.77 $77.00
Morrison Supply Comapny 100 EA No Bid
Best Plumbing Specialties 100 EA No Bid
Interline Brands, inc 100 EA No Bid
McCoy?s Building Supply 100 EA No Bid
C/C TANK GASKET RPM PRODUCTS #W-208C
Best Plumbing Specialties (4 100 EA $0.84 $84.00 CRANE BEST #55506
Plumbmaster $0.53 Alt. Not accepted
1955ct Bemis Elongated,
Line 21 Plastic Toilet Seat
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Spegification Note to Buyer
Interline Brands, Inc* 100 EA $16.41 $1,641.00 S$X-239434, BEMIS MFG
Morrison Supply Comapny 100 EA $18.05 $1,805.00
BEMIS MFG CO #1955CT-000
Best Plumbing Specialties 100 EA $18.40 $1.840.00 BEST #62147
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 100 EA $18.89 $1,889.00
Manufacturere Bemis, Tru Value
McCoy?s Building Supply 100 EA $22.99 $2,293.00 #141407, SKU 23200010
Plumbmaster $17.86
S5558CT Bemis Round
Line 22 Plastic Toilet Seat
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification Note o Buyer
intertine Brands, Inc* 50 EA $15.85 $792.50 SX-118802, BEMIS MFG
Morrison Supply Comapny 50 EA $19.43 $971.50
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 50 EA $21.65 $1,082.50
BEMIS MFG CO #855SSCT-000
Best Plumbing Specialties 50 EA $21.70 $1,085.00 BEST #62452
McCoy?s Building Supply 50 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster $31.08
V-500-AA Vacuum
Breaker Assembly 1-1/2"
x 24-112"
Line 23
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buver
SLOAN #0323016/V-500-AA
Best Plumbing Specialties* 12 EA $27.40 $328.80 BEST #48814
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 12 EA $29.58 $354.96
interline Brands, Inc 12 EA $29.76 $357.12 SX-18234, SLOAN
Morrison Supply Comapny 12 EA $37.08 $444.96
McCoy?s Building Supply 12 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster $31.08
V-500-AA Vacuum
Breaker Assembly 1-1/2"
x 9"
Line 24
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Interline Brands, Inc* 12 EA $10.91 $130.92 $X-92585, SI.LOAN
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 12 EA $13.18 $158.16
SLOAN #5323007/V-500-AA
BEST #88100716
**CQ 6 REQUIRED, PRICE PER
Best Plumbing Specialties 12 EA $13.56 $162.72 EACH*™
Morrison Supply Comapny 12 EA $18.34 $220.08
McCoy?s Building Supply 12 EA $27.13 $325.56 Crgill # 3066743
Plumbmaster $10.68




V-500-AA Vacuum
Breaker Assembly 1-1/4"

x 9"
Line 25
Name QTY UCM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Interline Brands, inc” 12 EA $10.23 $122.76 8X-92577, SLOAN
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 12 EA $13.18 $158.16
SLOAN #5323006/V-500-AA
BEST #88100715
“*CQ 6 REQUIRED, PRICE PER
Best Plumbing Specialties 12 EA $13.55 $162.60 EACH*™
Morrison Supply Comapny 12 EA $18.34 $220.08
McCoy?s Building Supply 12 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster $10.68
V-500-AA Vacuum
Breaker Assembly 3/4" x
g
Line 26
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification Note o Buyer
Interline Brands, Inc* 12 EA $10.91 $130.92 5X-92551, SLOAN
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 12 EA $13.18 $158.16
SLOAN #5323005/V-500-AA
BEST #88100714
“*CQ 6 REQUIRED, PRICE PER
Best Plumbing Specialties 12 EA $13.55 $162.60 EACH*"
Morrison Supply Comapny 12 EA $18.34 $220.08
McCoy?s Building Supply 12 EA $27.31 $327.72 True Value #662809
Plumbmaster $10.68
\ Solenoid Repair Kit
Line 27
Name Qry UOM  Unit Price Exiended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
SLOAN #3305043/EL-128-A
Best Plumbing Specialties” 6 EA $14.68 $88.08 BEST #45571
interline Brands, In¢ 6 EA $15.94 39564 SX-1668918, SLOAN
MARK?8 PLUMBING PARTS 6 EA $15.99 $95.94
Morrison Supply Comapny 6 EA $19.86 $119.186
MecCoy?s Building Supply 6 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster $16.67
C-Ring
Line 28
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Interline Brands, Inc* 12 EA $0.14 $1.68 8X-72447, STERLING SEAL
SLOAN #0305135/EL-110
Best Plumbing Specialties 12 EA $0.35 $4.20 BEST #89260240
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 12 EA $0.37 $4.44
Morrison Supply Comapny 12 EA $0.73 $8.76
McCoy?s Building Supply 12 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster $0.48
3/4" Slip Joint Angle
Stop Assembly
Line 29
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
SLOAN #0388025/H-710-A
Best Plumbing Specialties” 12 EA $27 98 $335.76 BEST #48851
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 12 EA $29.39 $352.68
interline Brands, Inc 12 EA $30.38 $364.56 $X-99788, SLOAN
Morrison Supply Comapny 12 EA $37.88 $454.56
McCoy?s Building Supply 12 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster $34.09
1" Slip Joint Angle Stop
Assembly
Line 30
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
SLOAN #0388022/H-710-A
Best Plumbing Specialties” 12 EA $27.98 $335.76 BEST #99101800
Interline Brands, Inc 12 EA $31.57 $378.84 8X-99770, SLOAN
Morrison Supply Comapny 12 EA $37.88 $454.56
MARK?8 PLUMBING PARTS 12 EA $39.74 $476.88
McCoy?s Building Supply 12 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster $34.09
Kohler Brass Urinal
Flange 2" IPT Bolts on
6" center Complete Kit
Line 31
[Name QTY UOM UniPrice  Exended Aftermate Specification _Note fo Buyer




KOHLER #18766

Best Plumbing Specialties” 12 EA $26.72 $320.64 BEST #99310722
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 12 EA $33.42 $401.04
Morrison Supply Comapny 12 EA No Bid
Interline Brands, Inc 12 EA No Bid
McCoy?s Building Supply 12 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster No Bid
American Standard
Brass Urinal Flange 2"
Bolts on 4” center
Complete Kit
Line 32
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
MARK'S PLUMBING PARTS* 12 EA $20.61 $247.32
AMERICAN STANDARD #047082-
0070A
Best Plumbing Specialties 12 EA $24.59 $295.08 BEST #95042193
Interline Brands, Inc 12 EA No Bid
McCoy?s Building Supply 12 EA No Bid
Morrison Supply Comapny 12 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster No Bid
#2 NoSeep Wall Mount
Wax Ring Water Closet
Line 33
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Morrison Supply Company* 24 EA $1.26 $30.24
HARVEY CO #004005
Best Plumbing Specialties 24 EA $2.29 $54.96 BEST #52211
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 24 EA $3.28 $78.72
Interline Brands, In¢ 24 EA No Bid
McCoy?s Building Supply 24 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster No Bid
1" x 3/4" Brass Spud
Assembly
Line 34
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Interline Brands, Inc* 12 EA $2.00 $24.00 SX-789684, SEXAUER
KISSLER #57-0510
Best Plumbing Specialties 12 EA $3.36 $40.32 BEST #56613
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 12 EA $3.92 $47.04
Marrison Supply Comapny 12 EA $8.09 $97.08
McCoy?s Building Supply 12 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster $0.39 Lavelle
T-4/4" x 1-1/4" Brass
Spud Assembly
Line 36
Name QTY UOM UnitPrice  Extended Alternate Specification  Note to Buyer
Interline Brands, Inc” 38 EA $2.64 $95.04 $X-78931, SEXAUER
KISSLER #57-0515
Best Plumbing Specialties 36 EA $4.46 $160.56 BEST #56603
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 38 EA $4.71 $169.56
Morrison Supply Comapny 36 EA $8.02 $288.72
McCoy?s Building Supply 38 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster $2.71
1-1/4" x 3/4" Brass Spud
Assembly
Line 36
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Interline Brands, Inc* 12 EA $2.38 $28.56 S§X-78972, SEXAUER
PASCO #962
Best Plumbing Specialties 12 EA $348 $41.52 BEST #99081774
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 12 EA $4.71 $56.52
Morrison Supply Comapny 12 EA $9.29 $111.48
McCoy?s Building Supply 12 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster $2.16 Plumbmaster
1-4/12" x 1-1/4" Brass
Spud Assembly
Line 37
Name QTY UOM UnitPrice  Extended Alternate Specification =~ Note to Buyer
Interling Brands, Inc* 12 EA $2.76 $33.12 SX-78998, SEXAUER
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 12 EA $4.99 $59.88
Morrison Supply Comapny 12 EA $6.02 $72.24
Best Plumbing Specialties 12 EA No Bid
McCoy?s Building Supply 12 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster $2.78




1-1/2" x 1-1/2" Brass

Spud Assembly
Line 38
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification Note o Buyer
Interline Brands, Inc* 36 EA $3.87 $139.32 S$X-78949, SEXAUER
PASCO #959
Best Plumbing Specialties 36 EA $4.38 $157.68 BEST #56602
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 36 EA $5.48 $197.28
Morrison Supply Comapny 36 EA $8.41 $302.76
McCoy?s Building Supply 36 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster $3.63 Plumbmaster
3/4" Kohler Old Style
Urinal Spud
Line 39
Name QTY UGCM  LUnit Price Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
MARK'S PLUMBING PARTS* 12 EA $39.85 $478.20
Morrison Supply Comapny 12 EA No Bid
Best Plumbing Specialties 12 EA No Bid
Interfine Brands, Inc 12 EA No Bid
McCoy?s Building Supply 12 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster $42.57
#1 Urinal plug 3/4" x
29/32 fits American
Standard & Kohler
Line 40
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Interline Brands, Inc* 12 EA $1.14 $13.68 5X%-81119, SEXAUER
MARK?8 PLUMBING PARTS 12 EA $1.83 $21.96
DANCO #41128
Best Plumbing Specialties 12 EA $2.31 $27.72 BEST #49973
Morrison Supply Comapny 12 EA No Bid
McCoy?s Building Supply 12 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster No Bid
#2 Urinal plug 1/2" x 1"
fits Crane
Line 41
Name QrY UOM  Unit Price Extended  Alternate Specification Note fo Buyer
Interline Brands, Inc* 12 EA $2.30 $27.60 SX-61127, SEXAUER
DANCO #41127
Best Plumbing Specialties 12 EA $2.43 $29.16 BEST #49971
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 12 EA $3.84 $46.08
Morrison Supply Comapny 12 EA No Bid
McCoy?s Building Supply 12 EA No Bid
Plumbrmaster $1.28 Plumbmaster
#3 Urinal plug 3/4" x 5/8”
fits Kohler (since 1962)
Line 42
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
DANCO #41128
Best Plumbing Specialties* 12 EA $2.07 $24.84 BEST #45972
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 12 EA $4.40 $52.80
Interline Brands, Inc 12 EA $4.95 $59.40 SX-51987, TAPCO
McCoy?s Building Supply 12 EA No Bid
Marrison Supply Comapny 12 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster No Bid
#4 Urinal plug 1/2" x 3/4"
fits American Standard
& Elger
Line 43
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
DANCO #41126
Best Plumbing Specialties* 12 EA $2.14 $25.68 BEST #49970
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 12 EA $6.27 $75.24
Morrison Supply Comapny 12 EA No Bid
Interline Brands, Inc 12 EA No Bid
McCoy?s Building Supply 12 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster $1.25 Plumbmaster
1-1/2" Royal Blue
Compound Slip Joint
Washer
Line 44
Name QTY UOM UnitPrice  Extended Alternate Specification ~ Note to Buver
RPM PRODUCTS #W533
Best Plumbing Specialties? 100 EA $0.26 $26.00 BEST #87518




MARK'S PLUMBING PARTS* 100 EA $0.33 $33.00
Morrison Supply Comapny 100 EA No Bid
Interline Brands, Inc 100 EA No Bid
McCoy?s Building Supply 100 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster No Bid
1-1/2" x 1-1/4" Royal
Blue Compound Slip
Joint Washer
Line 45
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
RADIATOR SPECIALTY CO
#W535
Best Plumbing Specialties? 100 EA $0.20 $20.00 BEST #87508
MARK'S PLUMBING PARTS* 100 EA $0.27 $27.00
Morrison Supply Comapny 100 EA No Bid
Interline Brands, Inc 100 EA No Bid
McCoy?s Building Supply 100 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster No Bid
1-1/4” Royal Blue
Compound Slip Joint
Washer
Line 46
Name Q7Y UOM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
MARK'S PLUMBING PARTS® 100 EA $0.19 $10.00
SIQUX CHIEF #995-5
Best Plumbing Specialties 100 EA $0.26 $286.00 BEST #87516
Interline Brands, Inc 100 EA No Bid
McCoy?s Building Supply 100 EA No Bid
Morrison Supply Comapny 100 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster
3/4" Slip Joint Washer
Line 47
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended  Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
SLOAN #53086113/F-5
Best Plumbing Specialties” 50 EA $0.33 $16.50 BEST #43233
Morrison Supply Comapny 50 EA $11.31 $565.50
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 50 EA $0.00 $0.00
interline Brands, Inc 50 EA No Bid
McCoy?s Building Supply 50 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster $0.36
1-1/2" Poly Flanged
washer
Line 48
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
SFS #2778
Best Plumbing Specialties” 50 EA $0.07 $3.50 BEST #87501
Morrison Supply Comapny 50 EA $0.10 $5.00
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 50 EA $0.12 $6.00
Interline Brands, Inc 50 EA $0.12 $6.00 SX-63628, PLASTIC RESOURCE
McCoy?s Building Supply 50 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster $0.07
1-1/2"" Beveled Slip Joint
Washer
Line 49
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification Note {o Buyer
Morrison Supply Company™ 50 EA $0.10 $5.00
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 50 EA $0.14 $7.00
ABRASS AMERICA#SPM-100
Best Plumbing Specialties 50 EA $0.23 $11.50 BEST #87496
Interting Brands, Inc 50 EA No Bid
McCoy?s Building Supply 50 EA No Bid
RPM PRODUCTS
Plumbmaster $0.03 BEST #87518
1-1/4" Beveled Slip Joint
Washer
Line 50
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Morrison Supply Company® 50 EA $0.10 $5.00
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 50 EA $0.14 $7.00
ABRASS AMERICA #SPM-200
Best Plumbing Specialties 50 EA $0.26 $13.00 BEST #87498
Interline Brands, Inc 50 EA No Bid
McCoy?s Building Supply 50 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster $0.07 RPM




3/8 comp.x 3/8"x 12"
comp. Braided Stainless
Steel Supply Line

Line §1
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
WATTS ANDERSON BARROWS
#SPCC12-66CP
Best Plumbing Specialties* 12 EA $1.33 $15.96 BEST #70417
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 12 EA $2.14 $25.68 23232
interline Brands, Inc 12 EA $2.54 $30.48 S$X-253781, FLUIDMASTER
Morrison Supply Comapny 12 EA $4.13 $49.56
Orgill # 0067116 PP23850 Plumb
McCoy?s Building Supply 12 EA $4.79 $57.48 Pak, SKU # 24200512
Plumbmaster $2.59
318 comp.x 3/8"x 20"
comp. Braided Stainless
Steel Supply Line
Line §2
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
SAVARD PLUMBING #C000406
Best Plumbing Specialties* 24 EA $2.23 $53.52 BEST #70416001
interline Brands, Inc 24 EA $3.56 $85.44 SX-253807, FLUIDMASTER
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 24 EA $3.81 $91.44 03232
Orgitl # 2587748 PP23851 Plumb
McCoy?s Building Supply 24 EA $5.99 $143.76 Pak, SKU # 24200520
Morrison Supply Comapny 24 EA $6.39 $153.36
Plumbmaster $2.99
3/8" comp. x 1/2"x 12"
FIP Braided Stainless
Steel Supply Line
Line 53
Name Q1Y UOM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buver
SAVARD PLUMBING #C000016
Best Plumbing Specialties™ 12 EA $1.58 $18.96 BEST #70154001
13800
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 12 EA $1.79 $21.48
Interline Brands, Inc 12 EA $2.32 $27.84 SX-253831, FLUIDMASTER
Morrison Supply Comapny 12 EA $3.10 $37.20
Orgill # 4194809, Worldwide
McCoy7s Building Supply 12 EA $4.14 $49.68 Sourcing 53812123L
Plumbmaster $2.39

Line 54

3/8" comp. x 1/2"x 20"
FIP Braided Stainless
Steel Supply Line




Name QTY UCM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
SAVARD PLUMBING #C000018
Best Plumbing Specialties* 24 EA $1.80 $43.20 BEST #70155001
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 24 EA $1.97 $47.28
Interline Brands, Inc 24 EA $2.54 $60.96 SX-253849, FLUIDMASTER
Morrison Supply Comapny 24 EA $4.02 $96.48
Orgill # 4205852 Worldwide
McCoy?s Building Supply 24 EA $5.11 $122.64 Sourcing 53812203L
Plumbmaster $2.59
3/8 comp.x 7/8"x 12"
Closet Braided Stainless
Steel Supply Line
Line §5
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
SAVARD PLUMBING #C000530
Best Plumbing Specialties* 12 EA $1.43 $17.16 BEST #70157001
Intertine Brands, Inc 12 EA $2.58 $30.96 SX-278457, WATTS ANDERSON
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 12 EA $2.69 $32.28 26273
Morrison Supply Comapny 12 EA $3.10 $37.20
McCoy?s Building Supply 12 EA $6.49 $77.88 Tru Value # 139448
Plumbmaster $2.59
17 ga. 1-1/4" Chrome P-
Trap
Line 56
Name QTY UGCM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Interline Brands, Inc* 24 EA $7.75 $186.00 SX-131417, SEXUAER
JB PRODUCTS #101
Best Plumbing Specialties 24 EA $7.90 $189.60 BEST #80104
04477
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 24 EA $12.73 $305.52
McCoy ?s Building Supply 24 EA $17,89 $431.76 True Value # 104330
Morrison Supply Comapny 24 EA $18.19 $460.56
Plumbmaster $15.39
17 ga. 1-1/2" Chrome P-
Trap
Line 57
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
JB PRODUCTS #1056
Best Plumbing Specialties™ 24 EA $10.68 $256.32 BEST #80110
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 24 EA $13.72 $329,28
Interline Brands, Inc 24 EA $18.05 $433.20 SX-86181, KEENEY MFG
McCoy?s Building Supply 24 EA $19.99 $479.76 Tru Value # 104329
Morrison Supply Comapny 24 EA $22.19 $532.56
Plumbmaster $17.41
17 ga. 1-1/2" Chrome
Repair Trap
Line 58
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
JB PRODUCTS #109
Best Plumbing Specialties* 12 EA $8.81 $105.72 BEST #82226
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 12 EA $13.11 $157.32
Interline Brands, Inc 12 EA $17.43 $209.16 SX-86744, KEENEY MFG
Morrison Supply Comapny 12 EA $22.19 $266.28
McCoy?s Building Supply 12 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster $21.20
1/2"FIP x 3/8" Comp
Angle stop
Line 5%
Name Qry UJOM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
McCoy ?s Building Supply® 50 EA $4.49 $224.50 Orgill # 6584114 SKU 24000414
BRASSCRAFT#HR17ZC
Best Plumbing Specialties* 50 EA $14.80 $740.00 BEST #99317246
Morrison Supply Comapny 50 EA $16.28 $814.00
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 50 EA $0.00 $0.00
Interline Brands, inc 50 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster $17.59
3/8"FIP x 3/8" Comp
Angle stop
Line 60
Name QTY UOM  UnitPrice  Extended Alternate Specification  Nole to Buver
McCoy?s Building Supply? 24 EA $5.39 $129.38 Orgill # 8893935 SKU 24000160
Morrison Supply Company® 24 EA $10.89 $261.36
BRASSCRAFT #HR15Z C
Best Plumbing Specialties 24 EA $14.80 $355.20 BEST #99317245
Interline Brands, Inc 24 EA No Bid




MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 24 EA $0.00 $0.00
Plumbmaster $17.59
1/2"comp x 3/8” Comp
Angle stop
Line 61
Name QTY UCM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
BRASSCRAFT #OCR19 C
Best Plumbing Specialties* 12 EA $3.69 $44.28 BEST #99250941
Morrison Supply Comapny 12 EA $4.54 $54.48
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 12 EA $4.82 $57.84
Interline Brands, Inc 12 EA No Bid
McCoy?s Building Supply 12 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster $4.29
1-1/4" Chrome Plated
Slip Joint Nut
Line 62
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Interline Brands, Ing” 48 EA $0.24 $11.52 SX-83263, SEXAUER
Morrison Supply Comapny 48 EA $0.53 $25.44
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 48 EA $0.82 $38.36
Tru Value #226399, Brasscraft 226]
McCoy?s Building Supply 48 EA $1,09 $52.32 398 SKU# 24210188
ZURN BRASS & TUBULAR #255-
1B-PC
Best Plumbing Specialties 48 EA $1.92 $92.16 BEST #87463
Plumbmaster $0.65
1-1/2" Chrome Plated
Slip Joint Nut
Line 63
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Interline Brands, Inc* 48 EA $0.34 $16.32 SX-63321, SEXAUER
Morrison Supply Comapny 48 EA $0.65 $31.20
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 48 EA $0.97 $46.56
Tru Value 226746 Brassraft 226-
McCoy?s Building Supply 48 EA $1.69 $81.12 746
ZURN BRASS & TUBULAR #255-
2B-PC
Best Plumbing Specialties 48 EA $2.31 $110.88 BEST #87467
Plumbmaster $0.84
17ga. 1-1/4 x 8" Chrome
Slip Joint Extension
Tube
Line 64
Name QTY UCM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Interline Brands, Inc* 12 EA $3.29 $39.48 SX-76760, SEXAUER
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 12 EA $6.31 $75.72
Morrison Supply Comapny 12 EA $6.31 $75.72
KEENEY MFG CO #7668PC
Best Plumbing Specialties 12 EA $8.80 $105.60 BEST #82163
McCoy?s Building Supply 12 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster $7.02
17ga. 1-1/4 x 12"
Chrome Slip Joint
Extension Tube
Line 65
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Interline Brands, Inc* 12 EA $4.77 $57.24 SX-221341, SEXAUER
KEENEY MFG CO #7903PC
Best Plumbing Specialties 12 EA $8.79 $105.48 BEST #82168
Morrison Supply Comapny 12 EA $20.33 $243.96
McCoy?s Building Supply 12 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster $8.29
17ga. 1-1/2 x 8" Chrome
Slip Joint Extension
Tube
Line 66
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Interline Brands, Inc* 12 EA $4.18 $50.16 SX-76778, SEXAUER
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 12 EA $8.51 $102.12
KEENEY MFG CO #7670PC
Best Plumbing Specialties 12 EA $14.80 $177.60 BEST #99160329
Morrison Supply Comapny 12 EA $17.21 $206.52
McCoy?s Building Supply 12 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster $7.91




17ga. 1-1/2 x 127
Chrome Slip Joint
Extension Tube

Line 67
Name QTY UGOM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
interline Brands, Inc* 12 EA $5.52 $66.24 SX-221366, SEXAUER
KEENEY MFG CO #7906PC
Best Plumbing Specialties 12 EA $6.91 $82.92 BEST #82176
Morrison Supply Comapny 12 EA $9.99 $119.88
McCoy?s Building Supply 12 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster $9.08
17ga. 1-1/2 x 8" Chrome
Flanged Tail Piece
Line 68
Name QTY UCM  UnitPrice Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Interline Brands, Inc* 12 EA $3.18 $38.16 $X-62844, SEXAUER
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 12 EA $8.78 $105.36
KEENEY MFG CO #142PC
Best Plumbing Specialties 12 EA $10.62 $127.44 BEST #89040045
Morrison Supply Comapny 12 EA $11.45 $137.40
McCoy?s Building Supply 12 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster $4.25
17ga. 1-1/4 x 12"
Threaded Extension
Tube
Line 69
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Interline Brands, inc* 12 EA $4.18 $50.16 $X-62356, SEXAUER
KEENEY MFG CO #1773PC
Best Plumbing Specialties 12 EA $6.57 $78.84 BEST #82200
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 12 EA $6.83 $81.96
Morrison Supply Comapny 12 EA $7.47 $89.64
McCoy?s Building Supply 12 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster $5.60
17ga. 1-1/4 x 12"
Threaded Extension
Tube
Line 70
Name QTY UOCOM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Interline Brands, Inc® 12 EA $4.18 $50.16 S$X-62356, SEXAUER
KEENEY MFG CO #1773PC
Best Plumbing Specialties 12 EA $6.75 $81.00 BEST #82200
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 12 EA $6.83 $81.96
Morrison Supply Comapny 12 EA $7.47 $89.64
McCoy?s Building Supply 12 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster $5.60
T7ga. 112 x 12"
Threaded Extension
Tube
Line 71
Name QTY UOM  UnitPrice  Extended Altemale Specification  Note to Buyer
interline Brands, Inc* 12 EA $4.82 $57.84 $X-62384, SEXAUER
Best Plumbing Specialties 12 EA $7.64 $91.68 KEENEY MFG CO #1776PC
Morrison Supply Comapny 12 EA $8.60 $103.20
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 12 EA $9.22 $110.64
McCoy7?s Building Supply 12 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster $5.92
100DST Delta Kitchen
Faucet
Line 72
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Interline Brands, Inc* 3 EA $67.78 $203.34 SX-406357, DELTA
DELTA FAUCET #100-DST
Best Plumbing Specialties 3 EA $67.79 $203.37 BEST #77201
Morrison Supply Comapny 3 EA $68.97 $206.91
McCoy?s Building Supply 3 EA $78.45 $238.35 Orgill # 7292915 Della 100-DST
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 3 EA $80.11 $240.33
Plumbmaster $87.50
400DST Delta Kichen
Faucet w/ Sprayer
Line 73
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Interline Brands, Inc* 3 EA $85.35 $256.05 8X-406388, DELTA
DELTA FAUCET #400-DST
Best Plumbing Specialties 3 EA $85.36 $256.08 BEST #77203




Morrison Supply Comapny 3 EA $86.84 $260.52
McCoy?s Building Supply 3 EA $94.15 $282.45 Orgill # 5788609 Delta 400-DST
Plumbmaster $110.19
2.5gal 120v Water
Heater
Line 74
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
MARK'S PLUMBING PARTS* 3 EA $83.52 $250.56
Morrison Supply Comapny 3 EA $163.42 $490.26
Tru Value# 845667 Reliance
McCoy?s Building Supply 3 EA $210.95 $632.85 62SSUSK #23093101
Best Plumbing Specialties 3 EA No Bid
Interline Brands, Inc 3 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster No Bid
€gal. 120v. Water
Heater
Line 75
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Allernate Specification Note to Buyer
Morrison Supply Company™ 3 EA $172.08 $516.24
S$X-456818, AMERICAN WATER
Interline Brands, Inc 3 EA $183.25 $549.75 HEATER
Tru Value # 81514 66 Sums K
McCoy?s Building Supply 3 EA $214.95 $644.85 REliance
Best Plumbing Specialties 3 EA No Bid
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 3 EA $0.00 $0.00
Plumbmaster No Bid
10gal. 120v Electric
Water Heater
Line 76
Name QTY UOM  UnitPrice  Extended Alternate Specification  Note to Buyer
Morrison Supply Company™* 2 EA $245.68 $491.36
Tru Value #815116 6 10 SUMS K
McCoy?s Building Supply 2 EA $318.51 $6837.02 Reliance #23094241
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 2 EA $0.00 $0.00
Best Plumbing Specialties 2 EA No Bid
Interline Brands, Inc 2 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster No Bid
30gal. Gas Water
Heater
Line 77
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended ltern ecification Note to Buyer
S$X-459659, AMERICAN WATER
Interline Brands, Inc* 2 EA $327.57 $655.14 HEATER
Morrison Supply Comapny 2 EA $400.87 $801.74
Tru Value #122067 6 30 GORT
McCoy?s Building Supply 2 EA $403.66 $807.32 Reliance #23084201
Best Plumbing Specialties 2 EA No Bid
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 2 EA $0.00 $0.00
Plumbmaster No Bid

Line 78

20gal. 208-230v. Electric
Water Heater




Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Morrison Supply Company™* 2 EA $455.40 $910.80
Best Plumbing Specialties 2 EA No Bid
Interline Brands, Inc 2 EA No Bid
McCoy?s Building Supply 2 EA No Bid
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 2 EA $0.00 $0.00
Plumbmaster No Bid
40gal. 208-230v. Electric
Water Heater
Line 79
Name QTY UOM  Unit Price Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
SX-479102, AMERICAN WATER
Interline Brands, Inc* 2 EA $285.00 $570.00 HEATER
Morrisen Supply Comapny 2 EA $311.79 $623.58
Best Plumbing Specialties 2 EA No Bid
McCoy?s Building Supply 2 EA No Bid
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 2 EA $0.00 $0.00
Plumbmaster No Bid
199,000btu A O Smith
Cyclone XI Water
Heater
Line 80
Name QIY UOM  UnitPrice  Extended Alternate Specification  Note to Buver
Morrison Supply Company* 1 EA $4,818.56 $4,816.56
Best Plumbing Specialties 1 EA No Bid
Interline Brands, Inc 1 EA No Bid
McCoy?s Building Supply 1 EA No Bid
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 1 EA $0.00 $0.00
Plumbmaster No Bid
Discount off Catalog
Line 81 Conservation Products
Name QTY UOM PercentOff Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
BEST PLUMBING SPECIALTIES,
Best Plumbing Specialties* 1 EA 20.00% INC. CATALOG #42511
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 1 EA 0.00%
McCoy?s Building Supply 1 EA No Bid
Interline Brands, Inc 1 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster 20.00%
Discount off Catalog
Line 82 Lighting and Electrical
Name QTY UOM PercentOff Extended Alternate Specification  Note to Buyer
Interline Brands, Inc* 1 EA 25.00%
BEST PLUMBING SPECIALTIES,
Best Plumbing Specialties 1 EA 20.00% INC. CATALOG #42511
Discount may be higher or lower,
McCoy?s Building Supply EA 4.00% see atftached Price Plan A
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS EA 0.00%
Morrison Supply Comapny EA No Bid
Plumbmaster 20.00%
Discount off Catalog
Line 83 Janitorial and Painting
Namne QTY UOM PercentOff Extended Alternate Specification  Note to Buver

Discount may be higher or lower,

McCoy?s Building Supply* 1 EA 4.00% see attached Price Plan A
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 1 EA 0.00%
Best Plumbing Specialties 1 EA No Bid
Interline Brands, Inc 1 EA No Bid
Morrison Supply Comapny 1 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster 20.00%

Line 84

Discount off Catalog
Tools, Chemicals and
Sealants




Name

QTY UQOM Percent Off

Extended

Alternate Specification

Note to Buyer
BEST PLUMBING SPECIALTIES,

Best Plumbing Specialties* 1 EA 20.00% INC. CATALOG #42511
Morrison Supply Company** 1 EA 10.00%
Discount may be higher or lower,

McCoy?s Building Supply EA 4.00% see attached Price Plan A
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 1 EA 0.00%
Interline Brands, Inc EA No Bid
Plumbmaster 20.00%

Discount off Catalog

Assortments and Repair
Line 85 Boxes
Name QTY UOM PercentOff Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer

BEST PLUMBING SPECIALTIES,

Best Plumbing Specialties* 1 EA 20.00% INC. CATALOG #42511
Morrison Supply Company** 1 EA 10.00%
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 1 EA 0.00%
Interline Brands, Inc 1 EA No Bid
McCoy?s Building Supply 1 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster 20.00%

Discount off Catalog
Line 86 General Faucet Repairs
Name QIY UOM Percent Off Extended Alternate Specification  Note fo Buyer

BEST PLUMBING SPECIALTIES,

Best Plumbing Specialties” 1 EA 20.00% INC. CATALOG #42511
Morrison Supply Company** 1 EA 10.00%
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 1 EA 0.00%
Interfine Brands, inc 1 EA No Bid

Discount may be higher or lower,
McCoy?s Building Supply 1 EA No Bid see atftached Price Plan A
Plumbmaster 20.00%

Discount off Gatalog

Line 87 Bathroom Accessories
Name QTY UOM PercentOff Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Interline Brands, Inc* 1 EA 25.00%

BEST PLUMBING SPECIALTIES,
Best Plumbing Specialties** 1 EA 20.00% INC. CATALOG #42511

Discount may be higher or lower,
McCoy?s Building Supply 1 EA 4.00% see attached Price Plan A
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 1 EA 0.00%
Morrison Supply Comapny 1 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster 20.00%

Discount off Catalog

Line 88 Facets and Fixtures
Name QIY UOM PercentOff Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Interline Brands, Inc” 1 EA 25.00%

BEST PLUMBING SPECIALTIES,
Best Plumbing Specialties™” 1 EA 20.00% INC. CATALOG #42511
Mortison Supply Comapny 1 EA 10.00%

Discount may be higher or lower,
McCoy?s Building Supply EA 4.00% see attached Price Plan A
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS EA 0.00%
Plumbmaster 20.00%

Discount off Catalog
Water Fountains and

Line 89 Repair
Name QTY UOM Percent Off Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer

Best Plumbing Specialties*
Morrison Supply Company**
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS
interline Brands, Inc
McCoy?s Building Supply
Plumbmaster

1 EA 20.00%
1 EA 10.00%
1 EA 0.00%
1 EA No Bid
1 EA No Bid
20.00%

BEST PLUMBING SPECIALTIES,
INC. CATALOG #42511

Line 90

Discount off Catalog
Flushometers and
Repairs




Name QTY UOM Percent Off Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Interline Brands, Inc* 1 EA 25.00%
BEST PLUMBING SPECIALTIES,
Best Plumbing Specialties** 1 EA 20.00% INC. CATALOG #42511
Morrison Supply Comapny 1 EA 10.00%
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 1 EA 0.00%
McCoy?s Building Supply 1 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster 20.00%
Discount off Catalog
Line 91 Healthcare
Name QTY UOM Percent Off Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
MARK'S PLUMBING PARTS* 1 EA 0.00%
Morrison Supply Comapny 1 EA No Bid
Interline Brands, Inc 1 EA No Bid
McCoy?s Building Supply 1 EA No Bid
Best Plumbing Speciaities 1 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster 20.00%
Discount off Catalog
Line 92 Lavatory Repairs
Name QTY UOM Percent Off Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
BEST PLUMBING SPECIALTIES,
Best Plumbing Specialties* 1 EA 20.00% INC. CATALOG #42511
Morrison Supply Company** 1 EA 10.00%
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 1 EA 0.00%
Interline Brands, Inc 1 EA No Bid
McCoy?s Building Supply 1 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster 20.00%
Discount off Catalog
Line 93 Sink Repairs
Name QTY UOM PercentOff Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
BEST PLUMBING SPECIALTIES,
Best Plumbing Specialties* 1 EA 20.00% INC. CATALOG #42511
Morrison Supply Company** 1 EA 10.00%
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 1 EA 0.00%
Interline Brands, Inc 1 EA No Bid
McCoy?s Building Supply 1 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster 20.00%
Discount off Catalog
Line 94 Tub and Shower Repairs
Name QTY UOM PercentOff Extended Alternate Specification  Note to Buver
BEST PLUMBING SPECIALTIES,
Best Plumbing Specialties* 1 EA 20.00% INC. CATALOG #42511
Morrison Supply Company™** 1 EA 10.00%
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 1 EA 0.00%
Interline Brands, Inc 1 EA No Bid
McCoy?s Building Supply 1 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster
Discount off Catalog
Line 95 Toilet Repairs
Name QTY UOM Percent Off Extended Alternate Specification ~ Note to Buyer
BEST PLUMBING SPECIALTIES,
Best Plumbing Specialties* 1 EA 20.00% INC. CATALOG #42511
Morrison Supply Company** 1 EA 10.00%
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 1 EA 0.00%
Interline Brands, Inc 1 EA No Bid
McCoy?s Building Supply 1 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster
Discount off Catalog
Line 96 Drain and Supply
Name QTY UOM Percent Off Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer
Interline Brands, Inc* 1 EA 25.00%
BEST PLUMBING SPECIALTIES,
Best Plumbing Specialties** 1 EA 20.00% INC. CATALOG #42511
Morrison Supply Comapny 1 EA 10.00%
MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 1 EA 0.00%
McCoy?s Building Supply 1 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster 20.00%
Discount off Catalog
Line 97 Values and Fittings
Name QTY UOM Percent Off Extended Alternate Specification  Note to Buyer
Interline Brands, Inc* 1 EA 25.00%
BEST PLUMBING SPECIALTIES,
Best Plumbing Specialties EA 20.00% INC. CATALOG #42511
Morrison Supply Comapny EA 10.00%




MARK?S PLUMBING PARTS 1 EA 0.00%
McCoy?s Building Supply EA No Bid
Plumbmaster 20.00%

Discount off Catalog
Line 98 Frostproof Repair Parts
Name QTY UOM PercentOff Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer

BEST PLUMBING SPECIALTIES,

Best Plumbing Specialties 1 EA  2000.00% INC. CATALOG #42511
Morrison Supply Company** 1 EA  1000.00%
MARK?S FLUMBING PARTS 1 EA 0.00%
Interline Brands, Inc 1 EA No Bid
McCoy?s Building Supply 1 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster

Discount off Catalog
Line 99 HVAC & Hydronics
Name QTY UCM Percent Off Extended Alternate Specification Note to Buyer

BEST PLUMBING SPECIALTIES,

Best Plumbing Specialties* 1 EA 20.00% INC. CATALOG #42511
Morrison Supply Company** 1 EA 10.00%
MARK?8 PLUMBING PARTS 1 EA 0.00%
Intertine Brands, Inc 1 EA No Bid
McCoy?s Building Supply 1 EA No Bid
Plumbmaster 20.00%

Discount off Catalog
Line 100 HVAC & Hydronics
Name Extended Alternate Specification  Note fo Buyer

Best Plumbing Speciaities”
Morrison Supply Company™
MARK?S8 PLUMBING PARTS
Interline Brands, Inc
MeCoy?s Building Supply
Plumbmaster

*Awarded Vendor
** Awarded Vendor Priority 2
ADid not meet specifications

Plumbmaster submitted paper bid. This was not in accordance with the Terms and Conditions. All bids were to be submitted electronically.

20.00%
10.00%
0.00%
No Bid
No Bid
20.00%

BEST PLUMBING SPECIALTIES,

INC. CATALOG #4251




